
-:••%

Clark Free Public Library
30J »/6stif± l̂ti-AweT-
Clark, K. j . 07066

M?r P

'A Voice for Allr£mEcho for None

CLARK, NEW JERSEY,XHU^DA Y.AUGUST 5, 1982

The sale of $850,000 in
township bonds was ap-
proved on July 29 by the
Township Council to go to
the lowest of six bidders, the
United Jersey Bank of
Hackensack.

That bank bid $850,153
at an interest rate of 10%.

Other bids submitted
ranged to around 10.25%,
reports the Office of the
Township Clerk.

In order to enable
township residents to be
eligible for federal flood in-
surance, the Council also in-
troduced an ordinance
which would re-define cer-
tain flood-plain-area terms
to conform to the federal
regulations.

In particular, one section
of the flood-plain ordinance
would be modified to state
the federal insurance ad-
ministrator has identified
the flood-plain area having
special flood hazards, has
provided- water-surface,
elevations for the 100-year
flood and has provided .data
sufficient -.to identify the

Coundlmen also approv-
ed a resolution declaring a
1965 Rambler, a 1973
Plymouth Fury and a 1973
Plymouth Fury four-door
station wagon used by the
Police Dept. as surplus pro-
perty, and authorized the
business administrator to
conduct the sale of bicycles
and other miscellaneous
equipment in addition to
that mentioned above on
Saturday, Aug. 14, beginn-
ing at 9 a.m.

Also approved was a
resolution okaying an agree-
ment with the state for the
improvement of the in-
tersection of Westfield Ave.
and Raritan Rd.

The Governing Body also
gave its permission for the
late filing of the annual
audit for the fiscal year en-
ding on Dec. 31. 1981, by
Suplee, Clooney and Co.,
with three certified copies
of the resolution to go to
the Division of Local
Government Services of the
state. •

Also introduced Was an
ordinance, to amend Clark's
interload-sefvices 'agree-
ment with Union County to
aid the township further in
rece iv ing Communi ty
Development Block Grant
funding. \:;. .

The public hearings and
possible final adoptions of
th% two measures will be
held on Monday, Aug. 16,
at 8 p.m.

hiring of -Gerald
non, an attorney,

Glen-

: seritAlf^^c^scyiciipttn
-dark ;Poliee Dept '-in <scm
nection with a matter pen*
ding in Municipal Court; at
a maximum fee of $500.

Bingo licenses were ap-
proved for Temple Beth
OV, St. John the Apostle
Rosary Altar Society and
The Gran Centurions, all of
Clark.

Those receiving the
Council's approval for raffle
licenses were the Valley
Road School Parent-
Teacher Assn., the Carl H.
Kumpf School Parent-
Teacher Assn. and Clark
Lodge No. 2327 of the
Benevolent and Protective
Order of Elks.

Clark All-Stars
win tournament

In a 12-to-l victory, the
Clark Little League 12-year-
old All-Stars beat the South
Orange Villagers to win the
1982 Mountainside Invita-
tional Tournament with
three straight victories.

Righthander, George
Visconti, pitched a two-hit
ball game to beat the
formerly-undefeated South
Orange team.

The Most-Valuable-
Player trophies were award-
ed to Visconti and third
baseman, Vtnnie Gulbin,
for his two homeruns,
which, drove In six runs.
^OutBeWen. -Chris'-Ray-

mond, drove inv two. runs

WELCOME ABOARD^ Mr.;Edward J. Railowsky of Clark Is belno conaratulated on
his swearing-in as a new member of the Clark Board of Education by M "Bte M

Five year study
cites regional scores

A five-year review of the
Minimum Basic Skills Tests
results of the Union County
Regional High School
District No. 1, which in-
cludes Clark, snows an ex-
cellent pattern of student
achievement, reports- a
spokesman' for the district's
B o d C & t i ^ ^

AvitH;;^Ki$ feutthinnln£
homer.; Doubles: fey .Brian
Power and .Craig Halleck
and singles by George
Visconti, Rob Banasiak and
Doug Chinchar added to
the near-shutout game.

Trophies were awarded
the team along with the
manager. Bob Banasiak,
and coaches, Al Grady and
Joe^onway.

texte results
>tt&m£\y?B' ip I982r con-
ducted by the; New Jersey
State Dept. of Education,
resulted in state approval of
the basic-skills instructional
programs of all four high
schools of the regional
district, the spokesman add-
ed.

Included in the five-year
'review report is a statistical
comparison- of 1982
Minimum Basic Skills test?

results with 1980 results. In
these analyses students at
David. -Brcarley Regional
High School in Kenilworth
showed a significant gain in
computational skills,
students at. Jonathan
Dayton Regional High
School in ̂ Springfield show-

^ a ^ g i F ' - - ^ — ^ ^ ' - - - '

tlstydeats h>,_ . w .
:t)f/Johs^56/;R^tenal'High
School: slid wed t significant
gains in both communica-
tion and computational
skills/

Although students at
Gov. Livingston Regional
High School in Berkeley

statckiepaftffient report at
the Office of the Board of
Education Secretary at
Jonathan Dayton Regional
High School on Mountain
Ave., Springfield, Monday

yto Friday from 8 a.m. to
3:45 pjn^ he concluded.

^MAKING IT SHINE - , .... „ _ « ^PWW-
fitGlafk'sAHhur L.: Johnson R&otonai

School thte summer, Steve EtesMecyk. right,
§ft|Gunther ©ass, fett, work en th© car of an teeBn public

safety official (Please se» another picture

, .Senior citizens in Union
ajjd Middlesex Counties
Csin receive a free, publi-
cation entitled"FM«* M A&-
toe" from the Community

Relations Dept. at the
Rahway: Hospital.

'-"Psew" is published
every other month from
September to June, and
features articles and infor-
mation of interest to senior
citizens.

The May/June issue
featured a talk by Rep. Mfll-
ioent Fenwick, a question-
and-answer column from

Tank ease

Through a special grant
from. the_ Union. County

r.: of Human ,
the Union County Regional
•**'" * - ' I.Dkffks No. 1

ffiefSk2fe
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wax and bufT utomobi
vam and bases, A 1st
53.50 is 'O

V •^1.^W i"f-- I i ; ' i-
l<1" i ;W-j-

in
Sept. 28

The trial, date in
Superior Court to deter-
raise Whether the
Planning Board of the
Township Zoning Board
of Adjustment-
jurisdiction to^dete.
whether or'-hotthe
dlesex Water Co. si
be permitted :tioi.enet a
five-milbon-gaBonietQ
tank at its Madison

pumping station • » » •
set last Thnssday ;far

- Tuesday, Sept.28, at$&&'
aafumtbeUai
;Counhousein
•; AccordMg ft
swoman for

aims
seniors

the local Social Security of-
fice, travel tips, health facts,
consumer news, a trivia
quiz and general items of in-
terest

During special months,
for example National Nutri-
tion Month, recipes and
shopping strategies are
featured.

Now in its third year,
"teas" is mailed out to
senior-cit izen centers,;
libraries, organizations and
individuals in the hospital's;
service area. ";

If you would like to be
added to the mailing list,
send a postcard to ' l e a s m
Itfk?/' Community Rela-
tions, .Rahway Hospital,
865 Stone S L , Rahway, N:!
X, 07065, or telephone
381-4200, extension 352.

. The next Ksue will be out
in September.

Seton Hall
to play

The Seton Hall versus
Connecticut College bssket-
haD ggfw* win be cabtecast
today at S pm-'yit'-Sxtofc
Ibsm..' Cabkvisioa*s •;: TV-3^
This gflffle wffl played in

y, 1982» »t Sfcton
with TV3> toes

aad ~3>s.C(S»ch't:lEd ̂

Heights showed no signifi-
cant change in either area,
this is to be expected due to
the very high percent of
students passing the basic-
skills tests each year the
tests have been ad-
ministered, the spokesman ,

The Clark Board of
Education has undertaken
the task of studying the
organization of the
township's eJementary
schools.

This study is being con-
ducted by a committee com-
posed of three Board
members. Thomas Faria is
chairman of the committee,
and other committee
members are Edward
Dreyfus and James Kehoe.

The concept of re-
organizing the district's
schools is not a new idea.
Last October, there were 13
plans submitted to the
Board by Superintendent of
Schools Dr. John T.
Farinella for study and
review. The Board decided
at that time for the
1982-1983 school year, the
organizational pattern of
the schools would remain
the same. However, the
Board felt further study was

necessary, and thus the
formed the aforementioned
committee, reports Mr.
Faria.

The committee's task is
to study the overall picture
of the Clark school system
including enrollment
trends, effects of program
offerings as a result of
declining enrollment, uses
of facilities, district lines,
economy factors and
overall effectiveness of the
current organization of the
Clark school system, 'the
committee chairman added.

This Board committee
has been studying those 13
plans plus some additional
plans that have been offered
by the administration. The
committee has held
meetings with Dr. Farinella,
School Business Ad-
ministrator Philip Miller
and school administrators.
These meetings have been
information-gathering ses

sions designed to bring
many variables into proper
perspective, the Board of-
ficial noted.

After gathering most of
the preliminary data, the
committee will report to the
full Board. The first presen-
tation of this data will be
made to the full Board on
Tuesday, August 10, at the
Board of Education offices
on Schindler Rd., Clark.
The committee will be mak-
ing further reports to the
Board, Mr. Faria explained.

Toe Clark school system
currently is comprised of
the Frank K. Hehnly and
Valley Road Schools, for
kindergarten to fifth grade;
Charles H. Brewer School,
for sixth to eighth grade;
Carl H. Kumpf School, for
kindergarten to eighth
grade and the Board of
Mucation Administration
Building on Schindler Rd.

LrO(SLATlVE GONFERiENCE - Asssmbfyw&m&n Mildred Barry Garvin, toft, the spon-
sorof a New Jersey Asssmb^ motion which provides tor submission to-state voters a
norvbfndino referendum for a proposal for a freeze on the further escalation of nuclear
arms, or&ste Clark -First,Ward Cpunclhwornan and Township Council President Mrs.
Virginia ApeBan duiihQ the Annual Convention of the Mew Jersey Assn. for Elected
W o m e n Officials, of ̂ h i e h rs*tiw;ii...~«—- • — • » — * - • "
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At a session of the Union
County Board of Chosen
Freeholders in Elizabeth on
July 22 the non-profit
Rahway Landmarks group
aroused an outpouring of
praise for a presentation
seeking county support for
its efforts to acquire and
preserve the Rahway
Theatre, reports a
spokesman for the group.

On hand to issue appeals
on behalf of the Landmarks'
project were: The Rev.
James Ealey, the pastor of
the Second Baptist Church,
representing the Rahway
Ministerial Assn.; Robert
Markey, representing the
downtown business com-
munity; architect, John
Bracco, who attested to the
theatre's architectural in-
tegrity, and Sixth Ward
Councilman James J.
Fulcomer and. Mayor
Daniel L, Martin, represen-
ting the city government.

George . Argast, the ad-
ministrator of the Rahway
Hospital, was also schedul-

Jd i f i p r f
but was ;,una£fe£to ̂ attend''
due to illness. "

The presentation opened
with a showing of a
15-minute audiovisual slide
show, produced by the
Landmarks group for pro-
motional purposes, and nar-
rated by Mike Jarrnus of
station WCTC This por-
tion of the presentation was
itself applauded for the ef-
fectiveness with which it
conveyed the group's
message. To date, the
presentation has been seen
and heard on eight other oc-
casions, the spokesman
noted.

Rahway Landmarks'
president and Board chair-
man, Robert Balfour, in-
troduced each speaker,
beginning with The Rev.
Ealey.

In a plea for county sup-
port, The Rev. Mr. Ealey
characterized the Land-
marks project as a "noble
challenge," as he alluded to
the theatre's recent brief
conversion to a showplace
for ^mographic! filmr antf
the lesson.that episode con

vulheraJJflity
of the

positive impact that a
performing-arts center
could have on city real
estate values, while Coun-
cilman Fulcomer challeng-
ed the county to follow the
city's example in issuing a
resolution of support for the
Landmarks project.

Mayor Martin reflected
on the fact, shortly after
they first organized in 1979,
the Landmarks group had
approached the City Coun-
cil for its support of their
objectives. He noted that, at
that time, the Council's
position was the group
would first have to prove
itself as to its seriousness.

There was evident agree-
ment among the freeholders
and others present when the
mayor proclaimed the
group had now achieved
this important """first step,
and it was time for both the
city and county to get
behind the effort, Mr.
Balfour pointed out. •••'••

It* is expected the
freeholders, w&i issue some
sort of resolution of support
attheirtiextfegular session,-
the Landmarks spokesman
conchitledi ^h-V'l'&T.'-*

Newsletter
aims at needs

of seniors
Senior citizens m Union

and Middlesex Counties
can receive a free publi-
cation entitled "frest ea Ag~
teg" from the Community
Relations Depi. at the
Rahway Hospital." :

,*'*»e»»" is published
> every other month from
"September to June, and
features articles and infor-
mation of interest to senior

;• - c i t i z e n s . ; , " •> "•.•"'" ; • - '
The May/June, issue

featured a talk by Re|>. Mai:
'keht Feawicfc-•arquesita^
~:iut&waM&--r column fram

: tfce local Social Security <5f-

cetasoimer twws, a trivfc

nmir-Q^i Grefc\tenneneir rtohtv o*

^ > ^ fourth 6t July Sfcycte Races, finished in th«
samawtter thte year as they d& last year. Thte is a first
for R&tiw&y. Both men belong to the Central Jersey
QycKng Team/Getty; arid they tralrt together*

( j u i z a n d g e n e r a l I t e m s o f i n -
t e r e s t .>:•.•;./:-.•'•-..•••: • '••''•':'••*

Burin j special months,
for example Natkm&l Notrv
tion Month, recipes and
shopping strategies are
i ^ " ^

Jn ite thtfd year,
fe mailed « t t ̂ jo

senior-citiaen Ki
libraries;
i d i i d
libraries; tffs^ntttSom m&
individiials ia the JtespttaTs

If yoa wooH Kte t5 be
to the ffi B ^

tioro, Rahway Hospital,
865 Stoae St , Rah wayVN:
J., X)?065v or telephone
381-4200. extension

The Tiext issoe will be out
•in S e p t e m b e r . >:,:•;-.>:,--'•• ' -

- A i S&trwayssu£f%tae?j&

wiftrierbf the Intemtedtete:bbya^of^llJWrbw tw;;dl9tam5e, and; riflht, DavidiTemple

v\\'

A\ the New Jersey State
Playground Olympics held
in Tenafly, first-place
medals were won by Dave
Temple in junior basketball
foul shooting and Vin
Sprovach in the in-
termediate softball throw
for distance.
.. Second-place medals
were taken by Sam Jacobs

in the midget softball throw
for -distance and Clcnvon
Jackson in the intermediate
100-yard dash.

The junior boys 200-yard
relay team of Norman
Jackson, Cliff- Crawford,
Francis Brewer and James
Lembrick also took second
place.
-Third-place medals were

won by Kelly Warren in the
midget 50-yard dash and
Natalie Farrell in the in-
termediate softball throw
for distance.

Fourth^place ribbons
were won by Brewer in the
intermediate mile run,
Crawford in the 880-yard
run, Crawford in the junior
softball throw lor distance,
Gina Cataldo^n the in-
termediate softball throw
for accuracy and JoAnne
Rieger in intermediate
basketball foul shooting.

Fifth-place ribbons were
,won by Jackson In the
junior 50-yard dash, Eileen
Gar.riso'n in the in-
termediate 100 yard dash,
and the junior girls'relay
team composed of Sharon
Powell,. Jill Howard; Kelly
"Warren arid Shelly Farrell.
^Entrants-.from over 40
communities1 such as Pater-
son, Philipsburg, Randolph,
;t*enaflyt Manalapan and
-Asbury. Park participated,
and the Rahway youngsters
did a; great job, reports the
city summer playground
director, JimTjadley., •

next meetmg of
Rahway Republican Con-
teenoe to discuss -matters
that may cofrti before thej
Rahway,; OQT Coohcfl win"
beat the home of Anthony'

at 373 Cornell Ave-,
, on Sunday, Aug. •

-M:t3Q~ pm£ reports
n the

municipal

The Rahway Police
Dept. is investigating the
abandonment of a newborn
baby at Rahway Hospital
on July 20. The details, the
incident as reported by Det.

Sgt. Edward Tilton, are as
follows: On July 19 at ap-
proximately 8:22 &m. a
black female walked into
the Rahway " Hospital
Emergency Room and

'HAVE YOU SEEN THIS WOMAN?

• * * -
UPDATE .

Representatives of the
New Jersey Dept. of
Human Services are sear;
-ching for the mother of the'
infant wentlicwifea '^HBve.^.

The mather, who entered
the hospital under the name
of Emily Clausen, delivered
the baby girl on July 19,
and left the hospital on July
20, leaving the baby there.

The Kvision of- Yonth
and Family Services, a com-
ponent of the department,
has placed the infant in a
foster home temporarily,
while it searches for the
mother.

A composite sketch of

the .mother has been drawn
by state police artists. She is
described as~ a five-foot,
seven-inch black ^woman
with a light complexion and
f K i S h ^ l i J r o u n d

^ ^ ^
her upper right cheek* and
wore a bandana: whiletotte
hospital. She has reddish-
brown hair and weighs
about iSO pounds. The
hospital admission records
lists her as 38 years old,
from Clarkton, S. Q:>... .

Anyone with information
is asked to telephone Jim
Burke of the Division of
Yoiith and Family Services*
Plainfield District Office at
499*8*5.

City ranks in middle
in

Final figures released by
the Union County Board of

^Taxation reveal Rahway
fell exactly in the middle of
Union County municipal-
ities in tax-rate increases for
4982, according to a report
issued by City Busines Ad-
ministrator Joseph%4. Hart-
nett.

The figures include 20 of
the countyV 2 1 - muni-
cipalities since Westfield lias
a tax revaluation for the
year, which; cprapletely
altered t its tax

thus making tax-rate com
parisons inaccurate.

Of the 20, county
municipalities, Rahway tied
-with Hillside for the 10 th
lowest increase in tax rate.
Both communities had a
total tax-rate increase of
7.7%.

Three municipalities ex
perienofid decreases in their
tax,-rates. They were
Linden, Clark and Kernl-
worth. -The tax rate for
J 982 decreased by I % in
each of those munici

stated she was in labor. She
was admitted, and gave
birth to a female child at ap-
proximately 8:57 a.m. the
same date.

On July 20 it was
discovered by hospital per-
sonnel the black female had
left the hospitaPand, as of
this time police have been
unable to locate her. The
child has been placed under
the care of Division of
Youth and Family Services.
The black female is describ-
ed as light complexioned
with 1 oddish hair, freckles
on her face and a pock mark
located on the right cheek
bone near the right eye. She
is approximately in her late
thirties, five-feet, seven-
inches ancT weighing ISO
pounds with a bandana tied
around her head.

Below you can see a New
Jersey State Police com-
posite drawing of the
described person. The
department is sending
copies of this to all major
newspapers in the state in
an effort to have the com-
posite and description
publicized to assist it in
locating the individual.

If information is obtained
it .can be related to the
RaKway Police Dept.
Detective Bureau, by
telephoning <388»5£00.

• * • - . - • . •

r EDITORS NOTE: Det.
TUton told The Rahway
News-Record on Monday
all information provided at
Rahway Hospital by the
baby's mother was checked
out by the Rahway Police
Dept. and found to be fic-
titious.

The complete list of
municipalities with the
percentage change in tax
rate is as follows:

Wmfield. +20%.
Berkeley Heights,

RoseUePark, +11.3%.
Roselle, +11%.
Elizabeth, +9.7%.
New Providence,

+ 9.4%.
Fanwood, +8.8%.
CranfordV+8.6%.
Scotch Plains, +7.8%.
Hillside, +7.7%.
Rahway, +7.7%.
Summit, +7.2%.
Union, +6%.
Springfield. +5.1%.
Plainfield, +4.2%.
<3flrwooa7*i+3.5%.
Mountainside, +Z8%.

V Unden,-1%.

heft*

& ^ . t e , * o > of the
efmed to

R.A.
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County college
moves office

for admissions

MIRROR IMAGE - Bill Kimball. one of the students in
the automobile-cleaning program at Clark's Arthur L
Johnson Regional High School, makes sure his window
polishing is oi A-1 quality

The Admissions Office
on the Scotch Plains cam-
pus of Union College has
been moved from Baxel
Hall to the Technologies
Building, it was announced
today by Patricia Kurisko
of Clark, the director of ad-
missions and records.

Individuals wishing to
enter or obtain admissions
information may talk with
staff members, including
financial-aid and academic
counselors, in the new of-
fice. The office is open from
Monday to Thursday, from
8.30 a.m. to 8 p.m. and on
Friday from 8:30 a.m. to
4:30 p.m.

At the Scotch Plains cam-
pus, located at 1776 Rarjtan
Rd., technological programs
are conducted leading to the
two-year associate- in
applied-science degree and
to the one-year certificate or
diploma.

The move of the admis
sions office from Baxel Hall
is the first of several such
moves resulting from the
proposed consolidation of
U nion College and the

Wills can help
carry out dreams

By Rose Marie Sinnott
Union County Surropatc

WHAT IS A WILL?
A will is a legal document

by which the person making
the will, the testator in-
dicates to whom property
and personal belongings will
go upon the death of this

/< testator. A will can also be
". used to appoint guardians
* of any minor children.

SHOULD EVERYONE
HAVE A WILL?••••**•

: Hajry S* has major real
estate holdings and stock in
vestments. Mary L., a
widow, lives in senior
citizen housing but has kept
some of her furniture and
other possessions of real
and sentimental value. Fred
M. owns a small house,

1 lives alone and has amassed
some savings, but has no
immediate heirs. Joyce and
George R. are in their 30s.
have three school aged
children, a mortgaged
house, life insurance and
some investments Kathryn
L., 21 and single, has a new
job and no savings, but has
personal possessions.

All of these people- and
anyone who is 18 years of
age who has possessions.
assets or real estate he or
she wants distributed 10
specific individuals or
charities •• should have
valid will drawn. Otherwise,
these individuals will die
"intestate" without
legally-enforceable will
-and the state laws will

determine where ihc assets
will go. If this situation oc
curs, what the person dying
without a will wants to hap
pen with his or her propen>
and possessions may very
well not happen.

WHAT IS THE
FIRST STEP

IN HAVING A
WILL DRAWN?

We. at the Union County
Surrogate's office, recom
mend a lawyer be consulted
whenever anyone con
templates having a will
drawn. Before the lawyer is
contacted, the .rbest pro^
cedure is to prepare a finan
cial -picture of yourself
-listing everything you own

and owe. Decide to whom
you wish to leave real estate
and personal belongings.
You must also decide the in-
dividual you want to be
responsible for carrying out
the terms of your will
-known as an executoT or
executrix-and, if applicable,
the person you will name as
guardian of your minor
children. .

D O E S A W U X
SAVE M0NEY? ^

; Jt6hn, G ^ married with
two children^ wants t o "have

drawn a simple will leaving
all of his property to his
wife. If the value of his
estate is under $50,000, cur-
rent law provides his wife
would-be entitled to the en
tire estate. He is not certain
it is worth the expense of
consulting an attorney.

By consulting an at
torney, John G. may be
alerted to potent ial com-
plications which could sur-
face after his death and thus
result in his wife's being in-
volved in costly litigation.
Also, if he were to die
without a will, a surety

bond would be required by
law to be posted to protect
the estate. Such a bond can
cost several hundreds of
dollars in premiums. With a
properly drawn will, John
G. could waive this require-
ment, thus saving his family
and estate additional costs
after his death.

• • *
If readers have any ques-

tions they would like to see
answered in this column,
please write to Surrogate
Rose Marie Sinnott, Union
County TTourt house,
Elizabeth, N.J., 07207.

U nion County Technical
Institute.

Degree programs avail-
able in Scotch Plains arc:
Dental hygiene, dental-
labbratory technology,
m e d i c a l - l a b o r a t o r y
technology, medical-records
technology, occupational
therapy, physical-therapist
assistant, respiratory
therapy, accounting/data
processing, computer
science/data processing,
secretarial science, chemical
technology, civil
technology, electronics
technology, fire-science
technology, mechanical
technology and electro-
mechanical technology with
an option in laser
technology.

In addition, one-year
diploma programs are__oL-
fered in travel and tourism,
dental assisting, practical
nursing and medical
assisting. A one-year cer-
tificate is awarded to
students who complete the
clerk-typist program.

A general-education pro-
gram conducted at the
Scotch Plains campus in-
cludes studies which relate
to degree and certificate
programs, namely
mathematKsAphys ics ,
humanities, developmental
studies, and health sciences.

For further information,
please telephone the Scotch
Plains Admissions Hot Line
at 889-2109.

Surrogate gives
semi-annual report

HAND OF PARTNERSHIP - William Q. Van Buren, left, the vice president and
secretary of Merck and Co., Inc. of Rahway, congratulates Dr. Jerome M. Pollack, the
president of Falrlelflh Dickinson University, on the progress of the university's first
capital campaign. Merck"s gift of $80,000 to Partners in Education: The Fund for
Fairlelgh Dickinson University, for basic medical research at the university's Oral
Heatth Research Center In its Hackensack Dental School, helped the campaign near its
halfway point. The fund-raising has a goal of $20 mDHon.

Merck gives

to Fairleigh

Fulcomer urges
Worlcfare reform

Rahway Republican
mayoral candidate, James J.
Fulcomer. the Sixth Ward
councilman, today urged
the State Legislature to
reform the state workfare
program to enable Rahway
and other municipalities "to
pui more able-bodied reci-
pients to work more quick-
ly "

The state workfare pro-
gram permits the assign-
ment of able-bodied reci-
pients of city welfare grants
to perform municipal work
for their grant

"The deficiency with this
program is the red tape
established by the state in
order for the recipient to be
assigned municipal work.
Before our welfare director
and appropriate municipal
depart mem ca n assign a
recipient work, the recipient
must first be interviewed by
the appropriate state agen-
c> . and our welfare director
cannot assign the recipient
work until she receives a
communication from the in-
terviewing agency This red
tape haN the impact of
significantly reducing the
number of municipal
welfare recipients that are
assigned work, and prevents
ihc recipient from being
assigned work for their
grant immediately," added
Councilman Fulcomer.

The candidate noted the
backlog in mailing out state
forms to the municipal
welfare director sometimes
leads to an able-bodied rcci-.
picnt receiving no work ass-
ignment or being held up
from assigning a recipient
for as much as two months,

Ih Railway. Tic noted, an
effort was made by the
municipal welfare, director
to streamline thejproecdore
tasi weefc, and Was partial^
successful, but the stale in-

before municipal work can
be assigned to the recipient.

"The obvious solution to
this problem is to permit the
city welfare director to
assign work immediately
without any prior state in
tcrview and without any
prior state notification. This
not only would enable more
welfare recipients to work
for their grants, but also
would enable the state to
eliminate unnecessary per-
sonnel involved in the
paperwork with the
municipal welfare director,
thereby saving the tax-
payers money," he added.

The hopeful said the state
role in the program should
be limited to making sure it
is operating where feasible
in every municipality, and
to check for any inadequa
cies.

wWc do not need the red
tape that stops the im
mediate assignment of able-
bodied welfare recipients to
work. The present situation
is a classical example of
how a higher level of
governmental regulation
impedes the smooth func-
tioning of a municipal
operation, and how it easily
can be remedied,'' noted
Councilman Fulcomer.

The Republican noted
presently out of about 53
municipal welfare cases in
Rahway. four are on
workfare. Based on his in-

Adults given
chance to test

'college waters'
Adults who want to

prepare for testing the col-
legiate waters may benefit
from a special course to be
offered by Union College
this month.

"Preparation for College
Study for Adults" will be
conducted in two sessions
on Tuesdays, Aug. 24 and
31, from 7 to 9 p.m.

The course-which is be-
ing offered free of charge by
the Division of Continuing
Education-will help parti-
cipants to take notes,
develop study skills,
eliminate concerns about
writing, learn how to con
quer tests, utilize the
resources of the library and,
in so doing develop a confi-
dent feeling about doing
college-level work, Dr
Frank Dee> the division
dean said.

Enrollment is limited to
adults who have been out of
school for several years.

Dr. Donald Anderson of
Ho-Ho-Kus, a professor
emeritus of Union College,
will be the instructor.

For registration informa
tion, please telephone
Union College at 276-2600,
extension 206 or 238.

• * • • '
Luck is often the

product of attention and
ability.

terview with the Rahway
welfare director, if the state
red tape were eliminated,
the number of recipients
working for their grants in
Rahway would be at least
tripled, he said.

The municipal workfare
system is regulated by the
New Jersey General
Assistance Employability
Program of the New Jersey
Division of Employment*
State Dept. of Labor.

Mr. Fulcomer is running
with City Council can-
didates, Anthony J. Lordt,
Councilwoman-at-Large
Irene Rinaldi and Sharon
Surber.

Merck and Co., Inc. of
Rahway made a grant of
$80,000, payable over two
years, to Partners in Educa-
tion: The Fund for
Fairleigh Dickinson Univer
sity. The Merck gift is for
basic medical research at
the university's Oral Health
Research Center in Hacken-
sack.

The president of the
university. Dr. Jerome M.
Pollack, explained the grant
will go to establish a special
long-term pKsearch project
that "will explore possible
relationships among certain
pain relievers originating in
the brain, and analyze how
they may affect the activity
of the body's white blood
cells.

The research project is
being carried out by Dr. ira
Lamster and Dr. Hulon Mc-
Cain at the Oral Health
Research Center in the
university's dental school.
Dr. Lamster, a periodontist
with training in im
munology, is researching
control of the immune func
tion; Dr. McCain* a phar-
macologist trained in
neuropharmacology, is in-
vestigating the phar
macology and physiology of
the pain-relieving subst
ances produced in the brain
endogenous opioid peptides.

Early findings indicate
the relationship among
these opiates originating
within the body and
immune-cell function may
be a critical mechanism in
numerous - situations of
impaired-immune response.
This mechanism may ex-
tend from localized
disorders such as a par-
t icular 'jftain _ disease
associated with a deficit of
normal immune function,
to a generalized suppressed
immune reaction often

associated with malignancy.
Drs. Lamster and Mc-

Cain propose a five-year
plan of laboratory study
and potential clinical ap-
plicability. The Merck grant
will provide funding for
laboratory operations and
equipment, laboratory
technicians and patient
remuneration. The total
cost over five years is ex-
pected to be $198,000.

The vice president of the
pharmaceutical company
and secretary of the Merck
Foundation, William B.
Van Buren, noted there are
more than 70 Fairleigh
Dickinson University
graduates now employed by
Merck, and more currently
attending the university
part-time under the com-
pany's tuition-refund pro-
gram.

The Merck gift, along
with support from more
than 40 other corporations,
emphasizes industry's
recognition of the continu-
ing contribution of
Fairleigh Dickinson Univer-
sity to the state," Mr. Van
Buren added.

Partners in Education:
The Fund for Fairleigh
Dickinson University, the
university's first capital
campaign, seeks to raise $20
million to support building
construction, as well as $5
million for programs and
endowment.

Planned projects include
constructing buildings for
cultural and recreational
events, library expansions,
additional classrooms space
and laboratory moderniza-
tion to benefit its nearly
20,000 full and part-time
students,

• • * •
You have to take peo-

ple like you find them if
you expect people to take
yon like you are.

Auction set
for vehicles

in Clark
The Township of Clark

will hold a public auction of
surplus township equip-
ment on Saturday, Aug. 14.

The auction will be held
in the parking lot behind
the Municipal Building
beginning at 9 a.m.

Items will include: A
1965 Rambler station
wagon, a 1973 Plymouth
Fury, a 1973 Plymouth sta-
tion wagon and bicycles and
other miscellaneous items.

Items to be auctioned will
be available for inspection a
half hour prior to auction,
all payments must be in
cash, all sales will be final,
all items will be sold on an
"as-is" basis and the rain
date will be on Saturday,
Aug. 21, with the same con-
ditions.

For further information,
please telephone Police Lt.
Anton Danco at 388-8838.

Rider honors
township duet
Two Clark residents

Donna Puchalski and
Tobey J. Schoenmann
recently were named to the
spring, 1982, dean's list at
the School of Liberal Arts
and Science at Rider Col-
lege in Lawrenceville.

Union County Surrogate
Rose Marie Sinnott, in her
semi-annual report on ad-
ministrations and probates
processed by her office, to-
day made a special plea for
all Union County residents
who are 18 years or older to
write out a will.

Surrogate Sinnott
reported from June 30,
I981 ftoJune30, 1982, the
Office of Union County
Surrogate probated 2,349
wills, and administered 359
estates for which there were
no wills.

**I am certain many of the
359 deceased individuals
who left no will this past
year, upon reflection before
their deaths, would have
preferred willing their
estates to the people of their
choice. The importance of
writing a valid will cannot
be overemphasized. 1
recommend everyone con-
sult an attorney to draw up
a valid will, and each in-
dividual periodically review
his will to consider chang-
ing circumstances," said
Surrogate Sinnott.

From June 30 to Decem-
ber 31, 1981, the Union
County Surrogate's Office
processed 179 administra-
tions and 1.202 probates,

UC cites
six from area

for studies
Six Rahway and Clark

residents were among 92
ull-timc students named to

the President's List at
Union College in Cranford,
for the 1982 spring
semester, it was announced
today by Dr. Saul Orkin,
the president.

The President's List
recognizes students who
have achieved a minimum
3.5 cumulative average bas-
ed on a 4.0 scale* Dr. Orkin
said.

Rahway residents in-
ciudk"Be>tyl Balbas, Jr. of
1181 Main St., Benedict
Boyce of 1202 Broadway.
Diane Matirfcp of 2128 Pro-
spect St . and James
Obergfell of 2428 St.
George Ave.

Clark residents include:
Paul Joseli of 34 Prospect
St. and Amy Martino of

she reported. From Jan. 1
to June 30, 1982, there
were 180 administrattions
and 1.147 probates. 4

"Wrtile the percentage of
administrations to the total
number of estates processed
through my office is runn-
ing about 15* , I think it
would be much better if
that percentage were reduc-
ed. Too many times the dis-
position of estates without
wills as required by state
laws does not appear to be
what the deceased in-
dividual would have
wanted or what his state-
designated heirs consider
best. For that reason, I urge
everyone, if they have not
yet done so to have a valid
will written," concluded the
county official.

Mrs. Sinnott is running
for election to the office of
county surrogate on Tues-
day, Nov. 2. Her honorary
campaign chairman is the
former Surrogate Walter
Ulrich of Rahway, and her
campaign co-chairmen arc
County Clerk Walter Hal-
pin of Fanwood and Reg
ister Richard Hatfield of
Scotch Plains. People in
terested in helping her elec-
tion should telephone
277-3947.

Cathy Vansickle
gets degree

A resident of Rahway,
Cathy E. Vansickle of 1239
Broadway, recently was
awarded her bachelor of
arts degree from Rutgers
University.

306 West La.
Mr. Balbas is a business

major at Union College.
Mr. Boyce is majoring in

liberal arts/communica-
tions.

Miss Matirko is a student
at the Muhlenberg Hospital
School of Nursing in Plain-
Held.

Mr. Obcrgfell, a graduate
of St-'Maryof the Assump-
tion! High School,'* is an
engineering major at Union
College. ;

Mr. Joseli and Miss Mar-
tino are both majoring in
business at Union, and are
graduates of Arthur L.
Johnson Regional -High
School in Clark. i-

*FUELOIL • O i l
•WEIL McLAIM

BOILEKS

N1TES-

756-6254
Years In Rahway. N J

looking • for something ditfer&nt?
Come in dridsee; "
PERSONALIZED INVITATIONS

no matter whbt the occasion!ron 4S
(nwtt to Ftnttort Ketpwt),

S J U l H

TEACH THE CHILDREN -
Clark resident. Mary
Cerasa of 55 Hilltop Ave.,
recently receiverd her
degree in secondary
education from Seton Had
University In South
Orange.
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German festival
to display culture

Miss Gall J. Sienkiewicz

Miss Gail Sienkiewicz
fiance of Mr. Meyer

The engagement of their daughter. Miss Gail Joyce
Sicnkicwicz, to John Henry Meyer, the son of Mr. and
Mrs. Henry Meyer of 16 Kathryn Si., Clark, was an
nounced by Mr. and Mrs. Frederick Sienkiewicz of 1877
Oliver St.. Rahway.

Both the future bride and the future groom reside
with their parents.

Miss Sienkiewicz is a 1974 graduate of Rahway High
School.

Her fiance was graduated from Arthur L. Johnson
Regional High School in Clark in 1972. He is attending
the DeVry Institute of Technology in Woodbridge.

Presently employed as a guard part-time for Pinker-
ion Securities, Mr. Meyer is also a volunteer fireman in
Clark.

A wedding date has not been set.

FINANCIER - Debra Hart
of 305 Madison Hill Rd..
Clark, recently received
her degree In finance from
Seton Hatl University in
South Orange.

Mr. O'Connor
gets degree

A Rahway man, Thomas
J. O'Connor of 442 Elm
Ave., recently received his
bachelor of science degree
from Rutgers Univcreity.

Rutgers lauds
Beth D. Schmidt

A township resident,
Beth D. Schmidt of 21
Hillside Ave., recently was
awarded her bachelor of
science degree from Rutgers
University.

The
Social
Scene

Elected Women
host annual confab

MRS. ROBERT D'AURIA
(The former Miss Louise Tracey)

Miss Louise Tracey
weds Mr. D'Auria

Miss Louise Tracey, ihe daughter of Mr. and Mrs..
James Tracey of 1721 Westover Rd., Clark, was married
to Robert D'Auria of 546 E. Blancke St.. Linden, the son
of Lawrence D'Auria of 40 Furber St.. Linden, on Satur
day. July 31, in St. John the Apostle Church in Clark
Linden.

The Rev. Thomas Doherty performed the 3:30 p.m.
Nuptial Mass ~

Escorted by her father, the bride had Mrs. Patricia
Woods as her matron of honor. Bridesmaids were Kathy
Hendrickson and Clarice Maggio. and the flower girl was
Kimberly Tracey.

Russell Woods served as best man. Ushers were
Lawrence D'Auria and Joseph Sozio.

Following a honeymoon in Bermuda, the couple will
reside in Linden.

Mrs. D'Auria is a 1976 graduate of Arthur L.
Johnson Regional High School in Clark and is employed
by Maher Terminals, Inc. in Port Elizabeth. Mr. D Auna
is a 1976 gradaute of Arthur L. Johnson, and isemploycd
by Amtrak.

Miss Penny Ann Zenobla

A cultural display will be
featured in the Ninth An-
nual German Heritage
Festival at the Garden State
Arts Center, on Sunday,
Sept. 19, it was announced
by Albrecht Mater of Clark,
the general chairman, and
Robert Schoencmann of
Westfield, the cultural-
display chairman.

The display, entitled,
"The Hobby Shop," will in-
clude wood-carvings with
self-made tools by Eric
Landmesser of Toms River,
spinning and weaving by
Mrs. Wilden of Morgan,
hand-made and decorative
painted flowerboxes by
Max Mittelhammcr of Ber-
genfieid, the showing of the
art of beekeeping by Gerd
Boehnke and ironwork per-
formed by blacksmith, John
Woods, of Dover. The craft
smen will demonstrate the
making of individual pro-
jects, and finished products
will be on display.

Mr. Schoenemann also
noted thecc will be an ex-
hibition of the finest
German-made aut6mobiles,
"Der Zaubermeister Peter
Elz" will perform his tricks,
souvenirs and dirndels
made in West Germany will
be sold and German food
will be sold.

Miss Martha Stewart,
Mr. Mulligan betrothed

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Asa Stewart of Painesville.
Ohio announced the engagement of their daughter. Miss
Martha Jane Stewart of 131 W. Main S u Rahway, to
Paul James Mulligan of 3 Forrest St., Iselin, the son of
Mrs. Dolores Zipfel and the late John Mulligan. _

Miss Stewart is a 1971 graduated Riverside High
School in Painesville and a 1975 graduate of Kent State
University in Kent, Ohio. ' • • « . *

She is employed by the National State Bank of
Elizabeth as a staff assistant in the Security Dept.

Mr. Mulligan is a 1974 graduate of Rahway High
School. He attended the New Jersey Institute of
Technology in Newark.

—- He is employed by Merck and Co. Inc., of Rahway,
as a laboratory technician. .

The couple plan to be married on Saturday, Oct. 9,
of this year at the First Church Congregational m

Ohio. _ t

Rutgers cites
Miss Tevormifia
A Rahway . student.

Dense M* Tavormma of
Meadow Ave^ was

her bnchetof of
from Rutgers

recently.

ttm WM *Mi pngrtn.

Wayne Jasinski

A township man, Wayne
F. Jasinsfci of 424 Oak
Ridga Rd* received Jtfe
fochelotv^ of, arts; degree
recently from Rutgers
U n i v e r s i t y . ; ; - - ; : - : ••.:•-•

tat ft «tt
life I* <*»

The New Jersey Assn. for Reagan
Elected Women Officials would
held its annual seminar at
the George Griswold Frel-
inghuysen Arboratom in
Morris Township recently.

The opening remarkŝ
were made by Sen. John
Dorscy regarding initiative
and referendum. Soon after,
panel discussions ensued.
Speakers included Robert S.
Narus of "The New Jersey
Reporter*1 magazine talking
on initiative and referen-
dum. Assemblywoman
Joan Wright on housing
issues, and Assemblywo-
man Mildred Barry Garvin
on her bill, A-799, and
education and the
Thorough and Efficient
Education Law. She stated
"T and E" is not working,
and spoke at quite some
length on A-799, which pro-
vides in part for submission
to the voters of New Jersey
of a non-binding referen-
dum for a proposal for a
freeze on the further escala-
tion of nuclear arms.

A-799 passed the Assem-
bly on May 3. Then the
Senate passed its bill,
S-1080. The main sponsors
include: Sens. Wyona Lir>
man and Donald DiFran-
cesco, who represents
Clark. The Senate
substituted this bill for
A-799, and passed it Gov.-
Thomas H. Kean also sign-
ed it into law on June 10.

The Clark Township
Council passed a resolution,
on this issue, also on June
21. It was sponsored by
Township Council Presi-
dent Virginia Apelian, and
unanimously accepted by
the entire Council, and they
sent it to the governor.

Mrs, Apefian was afeo
told by Rep. Matthew
RmftWo, who Teprcsems
Clark, he was one of the
146 sponsors of a Confires-
skmal teotutiott ifrnto to
the-state one. Rep. RmaJdo

said Ptesidcflt Ronald

has indicated
be agreeable

h e
t o

reducing nuclear armament
by one-third.

Among other commun-
ities voting to support the
state resolution were:
Highland Park, Cranford,
Roselle, Elizabeth, Linden,
Englewood, North Arl-
ington, Princeton Borough,
Princeton, South Orange,
Tcaneck, Montclair, Fair
Lawn, Jersey City, Kearny,
Lincoln Park, Plainfield and
Piscataway.

Rachel McKay
gets masters

A resident of Rahway,
Rachel Swanson McKay of
451 Seminary Ave.. recent-
ly received her master of
arts degree from Rutgers
University.

Miss Penny Zenobia
Mr. Castellano engaged

Mr. and Mrs. Vincent J Lessa of 16 Crescent Rd.,
Pine Brook, announced ihc engagement of Mrs. Lessa's
daughter Miss Penn> Ann Zenobia. to Charles John
Castellano the sou of Mrs Carol Castellano and the late
Augie Castellano of Clark.

Mtss Zenobia is also the daughter of the late John C .
Zenobia, Jr

The future, nude is a 1477 graduate of Montville
Township High School and a 1981 graduate of Drew
University in Madison, where she received a bachelor of
arts degree in zoology She is presently attending Emory
University School of Medicine in Atlanta as a Woodruff
Memorial Fellow

Mr Castellann is a 1976 graduate of Arthur L.
Johnson Regional High School in Clark, a 1980 graduate
of Drew University in Madison, where he received a
bachelor of arts degree in political science and a 1981
graduate of the Maxwell School of Citizenship and Public
Affairs at Syracuse University, where he received a
masters degree iri" public administration. ^

He is presently a junior executive with Davison s in
Atlanta, a division of the R H Macy Corp.

A July. 1983. wedding is planned

The entire cultural ex-
hibition will be held in a
large tent on the festival
grounds prior to the 4 p.m.
stage program, which will
feature West Germany folk
and pop singer, Roy Black,
who is flying over specially
to appear in the Ninth An-
nual German Heritage
Festival.

In addition to the hand-
craft and other exhibits,
those who come early to the
festival will see a program
of vocal and instrumental
music and folk dancing on
the plaza and a soccer tour-
nament among teams from
German sports clubs in
New Jersey. The outdoor
activities will begin at 9:30
a.m.

proceeds from the Ger-
man Heritage Festival will
benefit the Garden State
Arts Center Cultural Fund,
which ^pmv^es free pro-
grams for senior citizens,
disabled veterans, the blind
and also for the school
children all across New
Jersey.

For information, please
contact Mrs. Linda Janiw,
the ticket chairwoman, at
15 Brookwood Dr., Maple-
wood, N. J. 07040. or
telephone 763-4093.

Prices range from $10 for
box seats to $8.50 for Sec-
tion "A," $7.50 for Section
"B,M and $6.50 for Section

Rutgers cite*
Joan Osdlowtki

A Clark resident, Joan
Oscilowski of 48 Tudor Dr..
recently received her
bachelor of arts degree from
Rutgers University.

Warren Nadlor
gets degree

A Rahway resident. War-
ren Nadler of 1908
Lufberry St., recently
received his bachelor of
science degree from Rutgers
University.

estauran

At the June 21 meeting,
Mrs. Apelian quoted from
Clark's resolution that
"such a freeze is necessary
to spare all of humanity the
effects of a nuclear
holocaust and with it, the
destruction of society in all
forms"

Consumer Hotline
Number is
648-3295

Janice Chapin
gets doctorate
A resident of Rahway.

Janice Lynn Chapin of 670
W. Grand Ave. recently
received her juris doctor
degree from Ru tge r s
University.

Rutgers cites
Lynn Kosinski
A resident of Clark. Lynn

M Kosinski of 4 Park St.,
recently was awarded her
bachelor of arts degreejrom
Rutgers University

The average Amer ican
man is five foot, eight
inches tall. The average
Amer ican w o m a n , f ive
feet , f ou r inches t a l l .

-7952

7lugust
Daily Dinner Specials

Veal Dips Sorrento

^ _ rlovfioet fyiattCatse

Chicken Scampi

Veal Marsala

Shrimp £brmiagarta *8.93

Sautee) Meoallion of Sirloin $895
a la Duchess

$><ilii^ &• potato or iVf/t"/tiMr fuitUvCv
f'.ii/ oth,' 'O'»»U' attnrt <it *V*ry popularpru,t • mctt *$.95 or umVr

Proper Casual Attire Reservations Accepted

Dinner Scrtet Monday - Saturday
Entertainment etory Ohunlay, Triiay ani

Valet Parking Nightly
Some men think they « •

worth more than they ff*t—
pructlcfcl men ffo out and prove it.

WashingWorth
PriceTheseOwnYour

ANY
CAR

LETTER WASH

BULLETINS
•xtftrtar

torv tee (in»id«
S i * VICE.

BRUSHLESS

POSTERS
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REPORT
FROM
WASHINGTON

Congressman

Mcitt Rinoldo
(2th District. N«w Jersey

Reform needed now
in insanity defense

The House Judiciary Committee will continue hear
ings early this month on legislative proposals to rewrite
the rules governing insanity pleas to prevent felons from
hiding behind a defense of mental incompetency

One of the bills that will be taken up by the commit
lee is a measure 1 have offered which would create an ad
ditlonal verdict «f "guilty but insane" in the spirit of a
recommendation:from President Ronald Reagan's Task
Force on Violent Crime.

Defendants convicted under this law would still be
committed to mental institutions for treatment, but
unlike present procedures, they could not be released
without court approval.

In the case of John Hinckley, Jr., my bill would re
quire the federal courts to continue their supervision of
his treatment so he could not be released from St.
Elizabeth's Hospital in Washington, C. D., without a
determination by a federal court he is no longer
dangerous to himself or others. This finding would be bas-
ed on a recommendation by the hospital, but the govern-
ment'^lso wjaujd be represented at the hearing by the at-
torney-general, who could argue against the release.

The decision to free the defendant would have to be
based on the preponderance of the evidence. In other
words, there would have to be conclusive proof the defen
dant is no longer a threat to himself and society.

Under the guilty-but-insane verdict, a jury would be
able to find the defendant to be in need of medical treat-
ment, and also find him guilty of a crime.

Another proposal being considered by the Judiciary
Committee would shift the burden of guilt so the defense
would have to prove insanity beyond the shadow of a
doubt, rather than asking the prosecution to prove sanity.
Had this been the case in the Hinckley trial, it is likely the
verdict would have gone the other way.

It is expected the Judiciary Committee will vote for a
bill this session calling for some reforms. However, it is
unclear at this point what specific changes the committee
will propose in the insanity plea. The reform of the insani-
ty defense is supported by a large number of responsible
professionals, including prominent psychiatrists, leading
professors of law, members of the Justice Dept. and a
committee of the American Bar Assn.

In my view, an overhaul of the insanity plea would
promote the integrity of the justice system, protect the
community and insure our values are more safely and
satisfactorily protected than they were in the Hinckley
case. The acquittal of Hinckley has stirred wide-spread in-
terest in legislation to re-write the Criminal Code.

Americans arc outraged-and rightly so--a man who
shot the President of the United States could be found not
guilty by reason of insanity, and is eligible for release from
medical custody in two months. It is not the fault of the
judge or the jury this travesty of justice occurred. The
legal rules under which they were operating mandated
this outcome.

If anything, the Hinckley decision illustrates it is
about time Congress and the state legislatures took action
to make sure this kind of assault on our system cannot oc
cur again.

DATELINE:
TRENTON
A Legislative Report from
Senator Don DIFrancesco

New juvenile law
is long overdue

By next fall you will begin to see dramatic changes in
the way juvenile offenders are treated.

These changes are long-overdue. They arc the result
of an exhaustive study made by the Legislature in
response to growing juvenile involvement in the crimes,
particularly violent offenses.

1 he statistics speak for themselves. In 1980, juvenile
arrests for violent crimes increased 129b in New Jersey
over the year before. Minors were responsible for 25% of
the violent crimes in which arrests were made. Juveniles
accounted for close to half--46%--of the arrests for non
violent crimes that year in New Jersey.

Clearly, the present juvenile justice system, which
was enacted at a time when the prime concern was stopp-
ing petty theft and vandalism by juveniles, is inadequate.

For instance, under present laws, the toughest penal-
ty a juvenile can receive for a crime, even murder, is an
"intermediate" three-year detention term.

The reform package signed into law by Gov. Thomas
H. Kean recently provides for longer detention terms for
violent crimes. Murder carries a detention sentence of 20
years and other serious crimes up to four years.

The new juvenile justice system, which will go into
effect next September, is designed to provide equitable
punishment for offenders.

Those who commit violent crimes or are repeat of-
fenders would be locked up for a longer time. Those
youths who commit petty crimes would be given counsel-
ing, instead of detention terms.

The other major changes arc:
-Family-crisis intervention centers would be set up

in all 21 counties to counsel troubled youths and their
parents.

-A family court would be established with authority
to order parents to become involved in the rehabilitation
of their children if the court determines the family is con-
tributing to the children's delinquent behavior.

-The names of juveniles who commit serious crimes,
including extensive property damage, would be released
to the public.

The Legislature spent more than two years develop-
ing this new juvenile justice system. Hopefully, it will
take less time to see some positive results.

County parks set
August schedule

BREATHING EASIER - Learning to breaths properly is
made easier for patients suffering from emphysema and
other lung disorders with the use of modern equipment
such as this treadmill in a new program at Alexlan
Brothers Hospital In Elizabeth. Dorothy Speak of
Rahway, under the watchful eye of Susan Felskl, a
registered nurse, receives therapy to improve breathing
techniques during walking.

Robert Sivifsky
marks 25th

A Rahway man, Robert
Sivitsky, is celebrating his
25th anniversary with the

Elizabethtown Gas Co. He
is a service mechanic tn the
Green Lane division of the
company.

Mr. Sivitsky resides on
Connor PI

He who lives at high
ten\ton uvualK bio** a
fuse

Two of summcr*s most
popular programs in the
county are roller skating at
the Warinanco Skating
Center in Warinanco Park
in Roselle and swimming at
the Wheeler Park Pool in
the John Russell Wheeler
Park on Rte. No. 1, Linden.
Spokesmen at both facilities
have announced their
August schedule, which will
be in effect until the
facilities close for the
season.

The Warinanco Skating
Center will offer skating to
rock and disco music from 3
to 6 p.m. and 7 to 10 p.m.
on Friday to Sunday.

Admission is $1.75 for

PICK-IT-NUMBERS FOR
THE WEEK OF:

JULY 26 thro JULY 31
PKUI STMI6HT ^ ^%mWk

DAT* NUMBEK PAY OFF BOX PAIR
MOIBAY 971*143
tttBMY

681
<!> vattaur
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MM-MA?
MM. 375 »1»3 *3t * l t
simty
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mm sumuxm IK
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rat tuns ifcti u trass

JUIY M

IT ALL ADDS UP • Under the direction of Mrs. Anita
Klalman Clark Summer School students gain Insights in-
to all aspects of mathematics.

adults nnd SI.25 for youth
17 years of age and under
and senior citizens 62 and
over. Skate rentals are
available for SI or skaters
may bring their own skates
provided the skates do not
have metal wheels. Skating
is on a smooth cement sur-
face, and a snack bar and
lockers are available.

The rink may also be
rented by clubs, teams or in-
dividuals for private ses-
sions and parties. The infor-
mation number at the rink
is 241-3263.

If the steamy days of July
are any indication of what
the rest of the summer
holds in store, county
residents should consider
becoming members of the
Family Swim Plan at
Wheeler Pool, also known
as Linden PooL For $50,
plan members have ex-
clusive use of the pool from
7 to 8:45 p.m. on Tuesday
and Thursdays. Member-
ship includes general public
swimming times as well.

With the Rahway Pool
closed for renovations this
yeav Wheefer Pool has ex-
paneled its schedule, and the
public may now swim from
11 aJn. to 7 fun., on Mon-
day* Tu&day, Wednesday
and Friday; from \ to 7
tun. fsn Thursday, from 10
ajfu to 6 pjn, on Saturday,
and tram H *Jft* to 6 Jun.
on Sunday.

The newly-constructed
pool, locker room and
recreation area features a
grassy picnic area, a snack
bar, showers, dressing
rooms and a baby pool. Ad-
mission is S1.50 for children
under 18 and $2.25 for
adults. Please telephone the
pool office for more infor-
mation at 862-0977.

Steve Sampson is the
manager at both facilities,
and he and his -staff are
ready to answer your ques-
tions.

The last day of swimming
at Wheeler Pool will be on
Labor Day, Monday, Sept.
6. Rahway Pool in Rahway
Park, another Union Coun-
ty Dept. of Parks and
Recreation facility, is ex-
pected to be completed for
use next summer.

The roller rink will con-
vert hack to an ice skating
and hockey facility on
Monday; Aug. 16, after 4
p : m . •

For information concern-
ing these and other ac-
tivities sponsored by the
Union County Etepu of
Parks and Recreation;
please telephone the Special
Events Hotl ine at
352*8431. A special after-
hours information number
has been set up f or canceiUh
tkms, rain dates and general
information at 352-5410,

•void tlw tamw ttat
come toyw If yea eHfj|4*

Your opinion sought
on homestead rebates

By Assemblywoman
Maureen B. Ofiden

Recently, every home-
owner in the state-all
1,471,244 or us-received
our so-called "homestead-
rebate** checks from the
state government.

The checks, drawn from
a $260-million fund which
represents about 20% of
the yield from the state's
gross income tax, are paid
each year as a means of par-
tially fulfilling the Constitu-
tional commitment that
proceeds from the tax will
be used exclusively for
property-tax relief.

Theoretically, the checks,
averaging about S190,
represent a rebate against
property taxation. Apart-
ment dwellers do not
reveive them.

The state's income tax
became law in 1976, and is
now the largest revenue
source in the tax structure.
The rebates have been paid
each year.

It is interesting to note
that, although the Property
Tax Relief Fund derives its
monies from the income
tax, the homestead rebates
have nothing whatever to.
do with trie recipients* in-
come. The only two
qualifications are a citizen
own a home as his primary
residence as of Oct. 1 of the
qualifying year, and he
reside in it as of that date.

Apartment dwellers who
own a home at the shore do
not qualify for the rebates.

Although the amount of
the checks varies somewhat
from year to year, every
homeowner in a given com-
munity receives the same
amount. The formula has
nothing to do with in-
dividual property values or
-the amount of income tax
paid, tf any. The annual
amount varies because the
formula does include the
municipal-purposes portion
of the local property-tax
rate.

Bradley bill seeks
to save aid

Game Day
to be held
at library

The Rahway Public
Library program of summer
activities for children will
feature Game Day on Mon-
day, Aug. 9, from 10:30
a.m. to noon. Boys and girls
may play checkers or chess
or bring their own games.

Children may make a
monster mobile on Wednes-
day, Aug. 1K from 10:30 to
11:30 a.m.

The summer activites will
be concluded with a
monster film and a party on
Thursday, Aug. 12, from
10:30 a.m. to noon. Sum-
mer Reading Club members
will be awarded .their
reading certificates and'
refreshments will be served.

Jewish Singles
ta donee

en Aug. 15
A Jewish Singles Dance

forthose *ted 19 to 39 win
be field on Sunday, Aug.
15, at 8 p.m. in ihe wain
fcH r t b K B d I

The Senate Finance
Committee has approved
legislation sponsored by
Democratic Sen. Bill
Bradley of New Jersey,
which would prevent a toss
of millions of dollars in
federal revenue-sharing
assistance to municipalities
in the state.

Sen. Bradley, who serves
on the committee, hailed
the decision as "a critical
first step,** and said he
would press for complete
action on the measure pro-
mptly.

"A majority of New
Jersey's municipalities are
facing a big drop in
revenue-sharing funds in
the 1983 fiscal year starting
on Friday, Oct. 1 * Sen,
Bradtey said. "In many
cases, it will be more than a
50% reduction. We have to
get this problem fixed
quickly."

The Finance Committee
adopted the senator's pro-
posal on July 1 as an
amendment to legislation
requiring cutbacks in
federal spending and in-
•creased federal taxes in
fiscal 1983.

Federal revenue-sharing
funds are provided to coun-
ty and municipal govern-
ments through a complex
formula. The amount of aid
provided to each unit of
government depends partly
on the amount of tax
revenue it collects.

The unique problem in
New Jersey stems from a
1980 change in state law.
At that time, collection of
the gross receipts and fran-

chise tax was transferred
from the local level to the
state government.

Unless the law is revised
again to make the local
governments the collectors
of this tax, there will be a
major redistribution of
revenue-sharing funds
within the state-shifting
money from most local
governments to county
governments.

Uhder the Bradley
amendment, New Jersey^
municipalities will be allow-
ed to continue counting this
as a locally-collected tax if
the State Legislature makes
the necessary change in law
by the end of this year.

Without Congressional
approval of Sen. Bradtey^s
amendment, the 1980 state
action could not be "un-
done" for another two years
even if the New Jersey
Legislature changed the law
immediately.

That is on the basis of
conditions existing two
years earlier. A department
spokesman said the 1980
change in state law would
begin to affect distribution
of federal funds this year

The rebates were
negotiated into the gross in-
come tax law in order to
gain sufficient votes for
passage by the Legislature.
Since that time, they have
been the subject of con-
siderable controversy and
debate.

Estimates of the cost to
administer the homestead-
rebate program range as
high as $6 million annually.
In 1977, the first rebate
year, one half the amount
was mailed twice during the
year causing charges former
Gov. Brendan By me had
politicized the system by
mailing the checks im-
mediately prior to the
Primary and Oeneral Elec-
tions. The program changed
to one check for the full
amount in 1978.

Many people believe the
rebates should be sent in a
lump sum to the
municipalities to be
automatically credited
against the property tax bill.

Others believe the rebates
should be eliminated
altogether or at least for
homeowners with gross in-
comes above a certain level,
say $50,000. Others believe
the money should be used
for essential state programs,
although a new Constitu-
tional amendment would be
required to authorize a use
other than property-tax
relief. Many believe the
system should be left alone.
Still others believe the
rebates should increase as
the yield from the income
tax increases.

What do you think?
Should the legislature con-
sider modifying the
homestead-rebate program,
and if so, how?

1 will welcome opinions
from my constituents on
the matter. Please write to
me at 266 Essex St.,
Millburn, NJ. 07041 or
telephone my office at
467-5153.

Human being! miy be
divided Into two great
clatiesi those who do
things and thoie who
pretend to do things.

unless legislation like that
sponsored by Sen. Bradley
allowed the state to cure the
problem retroactively.

RAHWAYI DRUGS OF
PRESCR1PTI0KS
OUR SPECIALTY

381-2000
PARKING • FREE DELIVERY

ST., OPP. ELIZABETH AVE,
J V ^ * ^ ^

y
m Kenlrworth, jttst off Exit
>l 13& of the Qstfdai

For farther

at
M*rc
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'Oklahoma'/

tomorrow
The Summer Musical

Theatre Workshop at David
Brearley Regional High
School in Kenilworth will
kick off its first season with
the musicial performance of
"Oklahoma!" This Rogers
and Hammcrstcin musical
will run,for three showings
at the high school: 8ip.m.
tomorrow and Saturday,
Aug. 7, and a matinee per-
formance, on Sunday, Aug.
8, at 3 o'clock.

Tickets for all perfor-
mances cost $3.50, and will
be available at the door, one
hour prior to showtime.

This marks the first year
for the Summer Musical
Theatre Workshop under
the Union County Regional
High School District No. 1,
which includes Clark, and
coinciding with its summer-
school schedule, the new
program is offering singing
and acting workshops to
members of the six com-
munities comprising the
district. .

Under the direction of
Jim Avidon, the stage direc-
tor, and Angelo Corbo, the
music director, the cast is
headed by Jim Stonaker in
the role of Curley, Cheryl
Federico as Laury, Barbara
Rawlins playing Aunt Eller
and Ken Sanford, cast as
Jud Fry.

Cast as Ado Annie and

Will Parker are Peggy Sag-
gese and Paul PetrucceUi,
Complicating their' relation-
ship are Bill Gonzalez as Ali
Hakim, the peddler, and
John Tenneson as Annie's
father, Andrew Carnes.

Other principal players
include: Peter.Tulley as Ike
Skidmore, Charles Dolar as
Fred, Joe Brady as Slim,
Meg Kinney as Gertie
Cummings and Milt Cortes
as Cord Elarn.

Other members of the
chorus include: Bob Volz,
Robert Fonte, Paul Scrimo,
Cindy Smith, Diane To-
daro, Donna Dunn, Jody
Payne, Michaela Kamerow,
Caitlin Haughey, Pattianne
McNamara, Adrienne Per-
fllin. Erica Kepes, Karen
DeStefanis, Shawn Tarullo,
Roscmarie Rica, Lena
Pereira, Maryclare Filipek,
Margaret Wagner, Meg
Kinney, Lois Nardone,
Jayne Jacobi, Susan Beurer,
Gretchen Trcmbulak, Rob-
in Parisi, Lisa Carddla,
Dawn Huss, Cathy
Cardella, Angela Tripodi,
Teri Shimkus, Maria
DiFabio, Kathy McManus,
Beth Herman, Chris Tom-
chak, Joanne Swayze and
Yvette Lenhart.

For further information,
please telephone either Mr.
Avidon or Mr. Corbo at the
high,school at 272-7505.

NOTHING TO FIGHT OVER - Cheryl Federlco as Laury trigs to stop a fight between
Jim Stonaker as Curtey, on the oround, and Ken Sanford as Jud Fry during rehearsals
for this weekend's performance" of ''Oklahoma!" at David Brearley Regional High
School in Kenilworth.

'No, No
Clark run

S.C.1UTI-

The Clark Summer
Recreation Program spon-
sored by the Clark Board of
Education will present the
roaring 20's comical smash
hit; wNo, No Nanette."

The cast includes Jimmy
Smith, a Bible-publishing
millionaire; hisiconseryative
wlfci Sue; the lawyer. Bill
Early; Lucille Early, the ex-/
travagent shopper; three
devious women, Pauline,
the maid; Tom Trainer, the
bumbling law clerk, and
Nanette, the young girl who

wants- to live life to
fullest.

Tunes include wTea For
Two" and MI Want To Be
Happy."

The show is directed by
Carol Willenbrock and her
assistant, Sherri Orcnbcrg.
The scenery is by Jack
Tomasovich and the
Costumet. and publicity are
iby-Airinfe: Marie JEUccf.'

f .Performances Will be held
on Wednesday and Thurs-
day* Aug; 11 and 12*-at 3
p.m. in_ Clark's Carl H.
Kumpf School auditorium.

'Sex symbol'
to be seen

on television
*A Woman's. Place," the

weekly program dedicated
to women, will be cablecast
on Wednesday, Aug. 11, at
7 p.m. via TV-3, Suburban
Cablevision*s local channel.

During the summer,
Suburban Cablevision is
repeating selected episodes
of the program, and the

*Aug. 11 guest will be Moni-
que Van Vooren. the sexy
lady from the late 1950's.
She has recently authored
her first book, entitled
"Night Sanctuary," and she"
will discuss her. book plus
her life now and then.

WA Woman's Place" will
be seen again on Sunday.
Aug. 15, at 6:30 p.m. via
Suburban's TV-3.

PRIME ASSETS
To meewd today » flrt *
ti tha flgur* of fe'v>tnu»;<ft

f • U j a i ]

Concert Band show

Echo Lake-Park in'
>V«tfjeld-Mountainside at
7;3,0^c1ocV on W«dn6sday^
Aug, 11; there wilflje;;an]
eveninB of music by the:
Garden State Concert Band;
as part of tile 1982 Summer'

L _
..JJridcr the leadership of

master. Doniiniclc Fer-
ine band will take
rs from the national

and

for the placer
m&it of wedding and eng-

ana Tlie Clark -Patriot fe S5
S % ^ picture aivd $8

are.available

pest at;21S>Central
lUll by

Sousa marches to Dixieland
and'-selections from operat-

i;Glftnnv Miller and
nfld way. musicals.
The: 1982 Summer Arts

•PiStivBl is sponsored by the
Union County Dept. of
parks and,Recreation,,and
&••; made;posib5c through
budget appropriations, a
grant from Local No. J S of
the American Ft^cmtion of

TROUBADOUR - SlnQ-
or/sonowriter,, Tom. CHa-
pln, has recently been con-
tracted to appear at the
Club Bene dinner Theatre,
located on Rte. No. 35 in
Sayrevllle, for one night
only, -tomorrow.. On this
one night there will be an
optional dinner at.7 o'clock
with the show starting ai 9
o'clock. At this perfor-

besides doinc-his
concert set, he will be "per-
forming a short tribute to
his brpther the. late Harry
Chapin, who was killed in
an auotrtrobn© accident on
his way to perform a free
concert for world- hunfler.
PoTivfurther Information or
for reservations, please
telephone the Bene at
727-3000.

"„ - , • ' • ? • :>•"
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FIRST-PRIZE FLOWERS - The Flower Garden Competition, open to Rahway
residents, businesses and organizations, came to a close on July 24. Judging took
place on July 28 and 27. The first-prize winner was Ellas Mockos of 485 W. Lake
Ave.. Rahway. Mr. Mockos, shown with his backyard garden, will receive a $100
United States Savings Bond as the first prize, which is contributed by Markey Realty
Associates of Rahway. who sponsored the first similar contest In 1 978. Other prizes
will be awarded to the following contestants: Ruth Klger, 506 Sycamore St ; Carmel
Romeo. 11 76 Jefferson Ave.; Fred Lauter. Jr., 324 Lincoln Ave.; Mr. and Mrs. Ed-
ward J. Valvano. 254 Maple Ave . and Edward L. Schwelnberg. 1470 Esterbrook
Ave. Alexander Fartnick, Jr. of the Getty Gas Station at 762 St. George Ave. and Mrs.
Edna O'Connor, representing the W. Grand Ave. Senior Citizen Building, will be
presented a plaque for their contribution to the beautif(cation of the city. Awards to the
successful contestants will be presented at the, Friday, Oct 1 meeting of the Rahway
Woman's Club.

BB Womtit
to hold

flea market
The Northern New

Jersey Council of Bfaai
B'rith Women wttHpomor
a flea market at the
Municipal Parking Lot at
1912 Morris Ave., Union,
on Sunday, Sept. 5. Thb site*
is adjacent to the tittonte
Temple Members of the 24
chapters throughout nor-
thern New Jersey will p« i .
ticipatc.

There will also he over
100 dealers selling collec-
tibles, bric-a-brac, new<and-
used merchandise, antique*
crafts and refreshments.
There will be no admission
charge, and the market will
be open to the public from
9:30 a.m. to 5 p.m.

All monies raised will go
to further the philan-
thropies of B'nai B'rith
Women, including the
Children's Home in Israel,
the Anti-Defamation
League and veterans and
youth programs. The rain
date for this event win be
Saturday, Sept. 12.

For further information
and contracts for table
space, please telephone
Mrs. Roberta Sturm at
527-9570 or Mrs. Susan
Klein at 352-1846.

Chris Nollstadt
on dean's list
A township student.

Chris Nollstadt, was named
to the dean's list for the spr-
ing, 1982, semester at the
University of Maine at
Orono.

In order to qualify for the
honor, the student had to

Richard Stefanik
gets degree

A resident of Rahway,
Richard T. Stefanik of 443
Lower Alden Dr., was
recently awarded his
bachelor of arts degree from
Rutgers University.

achieve a grade-point
average of at least 3.0 on a
4.0 scale.

Area duet
get degrees

in law
Two area residents,

Deborah A. Zyra of 41
Fulton St.. Clark, and Paul
Edward Mancuso of 317
Underhill PI., Rahway.
recently received law
degrees from Seton Hall
University in South Orange.

froni,

In cast of rain, the show
held at Echo Lake at

Qf l i v ^ y i
Aug. 12. Should ii rain on
Thursday* the concert win
moVe to tjie Visitors' Center

Science Ceftter.
£ atifd New

at. Coles

For ®wi»al mfdrmaUon,
rain dates and caftccltatiofiv
please lekphone the Vtmn

oJPftffcSBSd
Special Events

«^2#43!^Afier
telephone

. A Rahway' man, Doug
Freeberg, will play the role
of Tandy in the Foothill
Playhouse of Middlesex
production of Bruce Jay
Friedman^ play - "Steam:
'bath?? which will open an
eight-night run on Wednes-
day, Aug. i\, .
• rtht play win run from
Wednesdays- to Saturdays
to Saturday, Aug. 21vThe
curtain time for all perfor-
mances will be at 8:30 p.m.

: Mr. Preeburg was seen
|5ic«k>ufily in nThat 'Chant-
pionship Season^ *God>
Favo?itew and -Death of a
Salesman" i t th

Among h e other
are ^Way It :.Aiaain;.-SsnVk

-CSBfdtna Smte,^Last of
tftc •-, Red; •ittot̂  .UoversV?

feeently received lifer

**Chapter Two,- UA Street-
car Named" Desire** and
"Norman, Is That You?"

For tickets or informa-
tion, please telephone the
box; office from Tuesday to"
Saturday from 4 to 9 p.m. at
356*462.

• Suburban Cablevision
will, cablecast gal lery* a
weekly "'program focusing
on the artt and artBts in the
metropolitan area; on iMoh*
day, "Au&$i at 7 i i n i via

"Hie >*oat;
% i i i

designed to p
prbfiRew tlmmsh

at the YaftfvHte State
Prison in New Jersey,

*fiftm<m Tuesday, Aog-
a t t iwn.̂ v«a Tv-3,

Music Mart
THE'GOODWAY"

MAIL ORDER CATALOG

ALL FOR LOVE . . . 4O timeless lov<* sonfts.
tn a real tense the start of this collection are the musk and t*>r lyric writers
These 40 brilliant rendition* ipan time from the 40's to the 70'* . . and
include the mu&lc of Hoagy Carmichael. the Bee Gee*. Kris KristoHerson.
Don McLean, NeJI Sedaka, lohn Denver. Bert Kaempfert, Burt B.ichararh,
Bob Dylan. Some are the original recordings . . . there is only one Glenn
Miller and Mel Torme. Sometimes the publisher felt that a subsequent
recording surpassed the original and used it instead. Here then are our
chosen versions of maybe the 40 greatest love *ongs of all time.
ALL FOR LOVE is a two record set. . and it can be yours for just $10.98 plus
$2JsO postage and handling. Use the handy order form below.

I "KM* 00 NUI SI NU Ul HDHAIIUISI

«ti» it» unpM< *m olon# pa.« aunt

W I L D THING . . . 3O orl^innl cinsslc s
from 3O roc k groups
Here are 30 original recordings hv >ho ekploslvc* group*
which made (hem hits To njme |ust a few: TrogRs, Gue««
Who. King^men, MUSK Fxplosion. Los Bravo*. ? and Ihr
Mysteriom. Shadow*, of Kntghi. strangolove*. Voung H**-
cals. Human Bern/ . and 20 more
These are dedicated amateurs . . some who wont on to
continuing success «»me who had their one big till and
then retreated to regional career* These are musician* who
weren't afraid to make tools of themselves. As a conie-
quence, they created music which is unique and fascinating
.. real folk-rock. They Kad FUN! So will you with this special
two record album
WILD THING is yours for just $10 98 plm S2 SO postage and
handling. Use the handy order form below.

MOTELS AND MEMORIES . . ; is something
really different In an album.
This compilation of "cheating" songs has been recorded by some of the top
names in Nashville country music. There's Barbara Mandrel!, Conway
Twitty, Crystal Gale. Tracey & Willie Nelson . . . just for opened
You'll have a ball listening to such hits as Temporarily Yours; Talking In
Your Sleep; Married But Not To Each Other; Good Cheatin' Songs; Liars
One, Believer* Zero; Last Cheaters Waltz; Lust Affair. . . and 20 more! It is
flat out FUN . ; . and it's great musical entertainment.
This single record album is yours for just $8.98 plus $2.50 postage and
handling. Use the handy order form below.

A VERY SPECIAL BARGAIN
IF YOU ORDER PROMPTLY!

Buy all three Goodway Music Mart records and subtract 10%
from the cost"of the combination. You will remit just $27.50
plus $2.50 postage and handling for ALL THREE album.

P.O. Bo* 216d * We*lCH*mi*r, Pa. 19380 r
Rush m» tf» following Qtyotiway Music Mart albums:
AL6UU ^ . QTY. PRICE
AU. FOR LOVE \

TOTAL Pittas* Prim

5 MOTELS i MEMORIES
5 ALL TMfi£6 ALBUMS

4 •

Pa.
{TOTAL

itta e% MI«S tax

a
Enctottd Wmi cKadr tn the amount of $

MasterCard
c

——
—_

Hint of S

$10.99
V O Oft

S27.O5
, — — : • • •

- .

$2.50

Name

Address

City

State Zip

Telephone

Mp&btokno Exptrirtjon D»tfc'_.
Allow 4 to 6 wfoks tor d*ltvory.

V * v

V \
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favors homerole

HERE'S HOW IT'S DONE - Registered nurse Caryn Reszko, left, of Rahway Hospital,
explains the injection procedure to her extern, Patricia Kaercher of Avenel.

August dog days?
Mot for hikers

The calendar of wcckeigd.
events for the month of
August, for both new and
present members, was an-
nounced by a Union Coun-
ty Hiking Club spokesman.

The next weekend will
begin with the Lake
Awasting Hike and Swim
on Saturday, Aug. 7. Hikers
will meet at the Essex Toll
Plaza on the Garden State
Parkway at 8:30 a.m. for a
drive by car to the New
Paltz bus station for a 10
a.m. meeting. Participants
will park at Jenny Lake,
and hike the trail, later
swimming and lolling about
the beach. The hike will
take place rain or chine, and
the trip will feature dinner
at a German restaurant
near New Paltz.

A six-mile ramble
through Echo Lake Park
and Nomahegan Park,
Cranford, is also planned
for Aug. 7, Please telephone
862-0349 for details.

On Sunday, Aug. 8, the
23-mile Pluckemin, Pot-
terevtUe Bike Rice will take
place. Cyclists will meet at
10 a.m. in the parking tot of
the A and P on Rte. Nos.
202 and 206, Pluckemin,
for the ride along the Black
River in Somerset and
Hunterdon counties. Lunch
can be brought or bought.

• » •
The South Mountain

Ramble will be held again
on Saturday, Aug. 14. The
tO ajn. meeting place will
be Mayapple Hill in the
Sduth Mountain Reserva-
tion. Lunch will be at 12:30
o'clock after the five-mile
ramble.

On the same day, hikers
will meet at 9 a.m. at Her-
man's World of Sports in
Livingston Mall for the
Lake Ocquitunk Swim in
Stokes State Forest. Those
seeking more exercise are
encouraged to hike the
many long and short trails
there.. A stop for dinner is
planned. Rain will cancel
the trip.

* • •
On Sunday. Aug. US,

bicyclists will meet at the

Cut costs
v

of food
in summer
Supplied by the Union
County Co-operative

Extension Service
In these days of rising

food prices, consumers
are looking for ways to
cut their food budgets.
Here are some sugges-
tions from Mrs. Gwen
Waranis, the Union
County Co-operative Ex
tension Service's home
economist.

«Watch the super-
market advertisements
for specials and plan your
weekly menus around
these Horn.

-It is also a fiood idea
to ffiike a fet, mental or

, written, than follow it.
-Cfem&off coupons can

also save you money, but
oftfy If they are for an

• -. -item you need and win

_oantaka Brook Reserva
uon Duck Pond at Kitchell
Rd. off Rte. No. 24 or at
Spring Valley Rd., Morris
County An easy 18-mile
bike ride through the Great
Swamp and Loantaka
Brook County Park will
follow.

• • •
The South Mountain

Ramble will be repealed on
Saturday, Aug. 21, with the
hikers assembling at 10 a.m.
in t he Locust G rove in
Millburn for a Class "C"
hike of five to six miles.
Hikers will lunch together
afterwards.

The Sunfish Pond Hike
and Swim will take place on
Sunday, Aug. 22. The
meeting places are "the
Howard Johnson's
Restaurant on Rte. No. 22,
North Plainfield, at 8:30
a.m. or at 10 a.m. at the Ap-
palachian Trail hikers* park-
ing lot off Rte. No. 80 at the
Delaware Water Gap for a
moderate nine-mile hike.
Bring lunch and bathing
suits, but rain will cancel
this event.

The last weekend of the
month will begin with the
five-mile South Mountain
Ramble on Saturday, Aug.
28. Hikers should meet at
10 a.m. at the Locust
Grove, and bring their
lunch.

The Round Valley Bike
and Swim on Sunday, Aug.
29, will finish out the
month. Cyclists will meet at
10 a.m. at the A and P park-
ing lot on Rte. No, 22, E.,
Whitehouse, for a short ride
to and long swim, at the
Round Valley Reservoir.
Cyclists may bring their
lunch.

FIGURING HIS FUTURE -
Steven Su&zko of 103
Amelia Dr., Clark, recently
received his degree in ac-
counting from Soton Hal
Universi ty in South
Orange.

Union County Repub-
lican Freeholders Blanche
Banastak of Elizabeth,
Robert Miller of Berkeley
Heights and Bernard Yarn-
savage of Clark and free-
holder candidate, John
Kulish of Hillside, today an-
nounced their "strong sup-
port"* for the principle of
municipal homerule.

"It has been our policy as
freeholders and candidates
to respect the right of the
people of every municipali-
ty in our county to deter?
mine the character of their
community. We strongly
oppose the imposition of
any new county or state
facility in a municipality
contrary to the obvious
desires of the people of that
municipality" said Mr.
Kulish, a former Hillside
mayor.

Freeholder Yarusavage
noted many issues have
come before the Board of
Chosen Freeholders in
which it has respected the
homerule principle. For ex-
ample, on the issue of the
location of a state
methadone clinic. Free-
holder Yarusavage noted
the freeholders have been
fighting to carry out the
wishes of the people of
Elizabeth and Rahway to
keep the clinic far away
from residential and com-
mercial areas in their com-
munities.

Freeholder Miller ex-
plained in resolving the gar-
bage crisis which they have
inherited from the
Democrats, his Republican
colleagues respected the
wishes of the -people of
Linden to keep the facility

IMPROVING CLIMATE
-Thomas Scatea ol 67
Tudor Dr., Clark, recently
received his degree in In-

i dustrial relations from
Seton Hall University In
South Orange.

Miss Zdanowiez
gets degree

A Clark woman. Donna
L. Zdanowiez of 610 Good-
mans Crossing, recently
received her bachelor of arts
degree from Rutgers
University.

v. One of the peculiar
thins* tbout truth, in
general. I* that It requires
very little argument to
support Itself.

out of their city.
Instead, -he noted, they

are locating the waste to
energy plant in Rahway
where, city officials have
"roiled out ihc welcome
mat* in order to take advan-
tage of the millions of
dollars of new tax ratabtes
which Rahway would gain
from the facility.

In the establishment of
any new facility, it is the
Republican policy to con-
sult closely with the
municipal officials,
neighborhood leaders arid
residents before even con-
sidering the placement of
the new facility in a
municipality, noted Free-
holder Chairwoman
Banasiak. She pointed out
in the locating of the new
county jail, the new
Republican majority not
only held more public hear-
ings than required by-law,1*
but also mailed out copies
of the feasibility report to
all municipal officials
through their municipal
clerks.

"When other sites are
available, it is unfair to
force on a community un-
wanted facilities that only
enrage the citizenry. We
must realize new facilities
sometimes start to change
the character of a communi-
ty and, only if a community
wants such a change,
should a higher level of
government initiate, the
change,** said Freeholder
candidate, Kulish.

Mrs. Banasiak-added it
will continue to be the
policy of the new Repub-
lican majority to use the in-
fluence of county govern-
ment to fight attempts by
the state to force unwanted
'facilities on Union County
communities where the peo-
ple have voiced their united
opposition, to such facilities..

People! iatetested in help*
ing the election campaign of
tne RepuWWitiH-ffcchoWfef
candidates shouldjteiephone
their'bounty headquarters
at 241-9877,

m.• * &

- S i % m

seeks members
Horseback riding in an r MB" and "BIT-lnterme

urban county is generally | diate, and "Aw-Advanced.
d ri b t h econsidered a rarity, but here

in Union County, the lush
surroundings of the Wat-
chung Reservation create
an idyllic., setting for the
WatchunjpStabies on Glen-
side Ave., Summit, a Union
County Dept. of Parks and
Recreation facility.

Aside" from serving the
county's riding public with
a variety of equine activities
during every season but
winter, the Watchung
Stables are home for the
Watchung Mounted Troop,
a program for beginning to
advanced riders, aged nine
and up.

The troop program com
mences the first week of
September, and registration
is currently underway.
There ĵ are two sections
open>The Junior Troop for
those aged nine to 13, and
the Senior Troop, for ages
13 and up. Each section has

d p p ^ i w e 3 t g j ? ,
Inf the Junior ^roop the
ti are as"follows!

Senior Troop members
must have previous riding
experience and at least one
season as a "BB" rider, and
have the approval of a
riding instructor. Those
rated **A** need no approval.

All troopers who rode
with the 1982 Spring Troop
may register for the fall
season after receiving new
riding ratings. New
members and previous
members who did not ride
in the spring may begin
registering from 10 a.m. to
noon and 1:30 to 4:30 p.m.
on Saturday, Aug. 7, and
everyday thereafter. Riders
with previous experience
may be asked to exhibit
their ability (so they may be
placed in the appropriate
squad.

-The troop season consists
of 10 lessons of riding in-
struction, with one lesson
per week, weather permit-
ting. Although some classes
.-..;_ „ held during 'incle-
ment; weather, arid riders
are encouraged to bring rain

BLOOD DONORS HONORED • Rahway Hospital
employes who have donated one and two oallons of
blood were honored recently at the hospltalr-AI Mar-
shall, right, a laboratory administrator, presents tfplnto
Mabte (Tootle) Cummings. an operating-room techni-
cian. Waiting for thetr pins, left to right, are: Two-gallon
donor, John L. Yoder, the president of Rahway
Hospital: Richard Troast, a nurse-anesthetist; Donna
Monek. a registered pharmacist and pharmacy ad-
ministrator, and two-gallon donor Elinor Mink., the direc-
tor of community relations. Not shown Is Sandra GOES,
a licensed practical nurse. Each year the hospital holds
two blood drives under the auspices of the New Jersey
Blood Services. Gallon donors reach their goal one pint
at a time over several YQarft „ :*_.

• Equestrian Summer Camp,
lessons will be added at the
end of ihe season. Uniforms
and protective head gear are
required.

Membership in the
Junior Troop costs $75 for
county residents with proof
of residency and $85 for
those living out of the coun-
ty. Senior Troop members
will pay $80 with proof of
residency and $90 without.
Full payment must accom-
pany applications, which
may be obtained at the
stables. Checks should be
made payable to the Coun
ty of Union, and must be
submitted in person with
completed applications
Troop membership does not
include accident insurance
which can be purchased
the stable for $2. • ^

Another popular stable
actiVUy, the annual

COMMUNICATOR - Diane
Dickey of 75 Union County
Parkway, Clark, recently
received her degree In
communications from
Seton Hall Untveralty in
South Orange.

DELIBERATE AIM
Mifca thli th» f&sl of every-

day IMtif—tftdfty U tain* t» to
Uf bMt <Uy «f th* mar.

"Dw-Beg|iiner,i*Cl-VfQv'ice, j jackets, any postponed

A© §E£N QN THE SATELLITE PROGRAM NBTWOHk

has 'several sessions remain-
ing in August, and ap-
plicants may sign up at the
stables one w_eek prior to
the start of each session.
Over 200 riders have enroll-
ed in the camp this summer.
The remaining sessions are:
Aug. 3 to 6, 10 to 13, 17 to
20 and 24 to 27. Enrollment
is open to youngsters nine
to 17 years of age;with
county residents haying
priority. The cost is $75 lor
county residents. and $85
for others. ,.,,

Equestrian Camp is held
from 9 a.m. to 3. tfm., on
Tuesday to Friday. The
campers will learn
everything from the parts
and care of a horse to saddl-
ing, bridling and trail'riding.
For applications andjinfor-
mation, please telephone
the stable at 273-5547.

.V

THE
MAIL

I t UUUUVTM 1

ORDER CATALOG

ntuiiui

•Vtfntsim.wiwMMiL^

AS
SEEN QN

For information concern-
ing these and future hiking
club e v e n t s , please
telephone the Special
Events Hotline of the
U nion County Dept. of
Parks and Recreation at
352-8431. After 5 p.m.,
please telephone 352-8410
for general information,
-rain dates and cancellations
of all Parks Dept. functions.

leftovers, cut down on
the amount of food you
buy and prepare for each
meal.

-Try the lesser-known
or no-name brands. While
the size, color, and tex-
ture of these food items
may vary, they are safe
and nutritious and can of-
fer savings of up to 40%
over national brands.

Resist buying
prepared snack foods.
These arc usually high in
price and calories and low
in nutrients. Instead,
serve your family raw
fruits and vegetables.

-Use unit pricing to
compare different brands
and sizes of the same
item.

-If you are interested
in keeping your summer
food budget lower, you
may also try seasonal
fruits and vegetables,
which are in ready supply
and thus are tower in
cost.
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St. Elizabeth Hospital in
Elizabeth recently obtained
a Datex capnograph. This
device measures and
records the patient's carbon-
dioxide content in the
respiratory system on a
24-hour basis. As all living
cells of the human body
produce carbon dioxide, its
measurement can offer
valuable insightinto Die pa-
tient's functions of circula-
tion, metabolism, and ven-
tilation. Capnography will
be utilized at St Elizabeth
Hospital to monitor pa-
tients undergoing surgery,
patients who are being
weaned from respirators
and patients who show ir-
regular breathing patterns
while sleeping, reports a
spokesman.

"Having obtained the
capnograph provides the
hospital with a unique ser-
vice not available in any
other hospital in the
Eastern Union County
area,'* states Lawrence
Smolar, a registered resp-
iratory therapist* the
hospital's technical director
of respiratory services.

"The capnograph repre-

IRA eon aid
in building

Opening an Individual
Retirement Account and
contributing to it each
year is an excellent way
to accumulate money for
retirement, while saving
on taxes now. Currently,
a wagcearner may put up
to $2,000 into an IRA
whether or not they are
covered by an employer's
pension plan. In a family
where both partners are
wage earners, up to

l$4i0WKmay be put into
an IRA. Up to $2,500
may be put into such an
account by & family with
a working and a non-
working spouse.

The money put into an
IRA is available for
withdrawal after the age
of 59-VS years. Early
withdrawals will be
penalized. The money in
such an account cannot

sents a step forward in pa-
tient monitoring, thus
allowing for higher-quality
care. More specifically, this
device expands the capa-
bilities of the hospital's
pulmonary department,
since it serves a number of
functions in both treating
and diagnosing patients
with respiratbry/ventilatory
disease,** Mr. Smolar added.

In surgical procedures at
the hospital, the cap-
nograph can be used with
patients undergoing
anesthesia," explained Mr.
Smolar. "It is also used in
post-operative recovery and
the critical-care units to
continue constant monitor-
ing."

A primary function of
the capnograph is keeping
check on patients who are
being weaned from
mechanical ventilation.
With the use of cap-
nography to determine the
lowest rate at which a pa-
tient can breath safely and
comfortably, the weaning
process becomes more ac-
curate and provides* higher-
quality care, he added.

Being a simple, nonin

Rutgers cites
Jon Zientek

A Rahway scholar, Jan
Francis Zientek of 1100
Bryant St., recently receiv-
ed his bachelor of science
degree from Rutgers
University.

Miss Fernondes

A Clark woman, Denise
Femandes of 45 Tudor Dr.,
recently received her
bachelor of arts degree from
Rutgers University.

be pledged as collateral.
Is an IRA right for

you? To determine this,
you need to look ahead
for upcoming expenses.

An Individual Retire-
ment Account may not
be in the best interest of
someone who is an-
ticipating major expenses
in the near future, such as
the purchase of a house
or college' tuition.

vasive procedure of
monitoring, the capnograph
can be substituted in many
cases for arterial blood gas
samples. As a 24-hour
monitor, the capnograph
reveals a more constant pic-
ture of the patient's carbon-
dioxide content as com-
pared to intermtttant sampl-
ing. Even after being
removed from the
respirator, the capnograph
may be used to show the! pi^
tient's ability to breath on
his own, the hospital official
explained.

In its diagnostic
capabilities the hospital
utilizes the capnograph in
conjunction with pulmon-
ary-stress tests, which
assists in determining the
extent or lack of pulmonary
disease.

Additionally, the cap-
nograph can be used to
detect apnea, a temporary
cessation of breathing. As
apnea commonly occurs
during sleep, individuals are
not aware they have stop-
ped breathing and are only
conscious of waking up
several times during the
night for no apparent
reason. This waking is a
result of the brain instinc-
tively signaling the person
to resume normal
breathing.

Mr. Smolar explained
there are many forms of
sleep disturbances.

"At this time sleep apnea
is largely being diagnosed in
sleep laboratories, none of
which are in this vicinity.
Area residents exhibiting
these symptoms can now be
tested at St. Elizabeth, and
should there be a serious
disorder, the patient could
be treated here at the
hospital or referred to a
sleep-study center. We
recently detected sleep
apnea in a young woman
who had reported having
trouble sleeping, and. being
short of breath. As the cap-
nograph was able to record
her carbon-dioxide activity

- on a graph while she slept,
we were able to «ee very
clearly the woman had stop-
ped breathing several times
during the night for at one
and a half minutes at a
time," he concluded.

By Augl Lto
Giant coach, Ray

Perkins,: was right on the
money last July when he
was asked to offer a pro-
gnosis on the 1981 football
season.

.For openers, he said then
the keyword for a successful
1981 Giants* season was
competition. He believed
the Giants had more going
for them than in either of
the two previous seasons he
had been the Giants' field
bossman.

"Two years ago we had
no competition 4t any post

t ^ I 9 Y
fig to* fesvfcL competition
at every • position,** Coach
Fcrklttsi said. • ^Without
competition, the effort to
beat out a rival, .there's
never hope for:-improve-

i :

Tfce coach had based his
optifflfefrv on the fact the
Gtents had one of the best
drafts in along time.

•List year (1980) we had
to took at the wire' (the
waiver wire which lists the

. ptayea tat by « ter teams)
l for l O

p of the positive
attitude o f the ̂ players
thdwti at the min&sfrtfs of
April a&tlMty, 1981;

O t t f e f

Ti& very c&ftrr
dent well beVb&tter root-

team,** he noted.
In the interview of July,

1981, the Giant coach talk-
ed about draft choices,
Lawrence Taylor, John
Mistier, Dave Joung; John
Powers; Billy Ard; Bryon
Hunt, and Leon Bright,
whom the Giants obtained
from the Canadian Football
League.

Understandably he made
no mention of Bill Neil!
because the former Univer-
sity of Pittsburgh gridder
was going to be tried at the
nose guard spot in the 3-4
defense. Neill had never
played the position. Today,
of course, it is known Neil
came -through with- flying
colors. He was named to the
National:' Football League
All-Rookie Team.

And then with the addi-
tion of running star, Rob
Carpenter and defensive
back. Bill CuiTier,: the
return jQf certter, Jim Clack,
the blossoming -of second-
string quarterback^ Scott
Brunner, &nd & nost of
other good things happen-
ing later in the year, the
Giafits watt from 4-12 in

J
They.beat U*e Eagles' in

the fet game bt the NFL
playoils, but then lost to the
49e3Vwhb eyentualry went
cm to Wilt Super Bowl XVL^
. But whfitabsm this year,
Ray? to^-yon--believe the
Giants din keep their tan*

ttte^,
After sating tbeefcffipaK

tkm for positions is fiomg to

be even greater, Perkins
chose to speak of this year's
draft choices individually.

No. 1, Butch Wootfblk,,
the running back from
Michigan, who tmtk from
right here in Union County-
-Westfield.

uI-doirt believe all of
Butch's talents have come
to the surface yet* ferkin£-
said. **I believe he "can do
more as a pass receiver com-
ing out of.the b&ckfield.
This has to be developed as
well as his blocking skills.
He wasn't asked to do that
at Michigan. He can be a
good football player ia timft.
It is going to take aomft
time/He^s got speed."

No. 2, Joe Morris, runn-
ing back, Syracuse.

"Joe has the ability to be
a well-rounded back in the
league," the coach taid.
tfHe> only five-Toot» seven-
and-a-h&tf-inctes, but he*» ft.
big little mail. - He: weighs
202, and runs faster- (4.4
speed) than everyone else.
He's been here an the while
working.*

"He tan do many ttufigi.
We don't teak fw Joe * 4 i

tmart,; tW he> l
gooa chafia ofwinftihg the
starting spot. WootfoB: sad
M6rris are CGcning into a

r where that Hadn't

y ^ aided.

"You a » t teO moch

LEARNING BY D6INQ • Sharon Smyth, left, anuree extern from Colonta, listens as her
preceptor, Lynn Oosentlno, a f©Qls*sred nurse, explains some of the procedures of
Rahway Hospital's telemetry unit.

Extern Program
in winning re-run
Being a nurse at a

hospital is never the way it
is portrayed on most soap
•operas, and this summer, 13
senior nursing students had
an opportunity to learn that
first-hand, as Rahway
Hospital's Nursing Extern
Program began its second
season.

Accorind to Mary Jane
Meehan, the nursing-
education administrator,
the program is designed to
give students entering their
senior year of nursing
school a taste of what being
a nurse in a hospital is really
about.

"The Yeality shock' that
hits graduate "rfuTses when
they first start to work in a
hospital can really be $uit«
depressing. This program Is
designed. to cut down on
that shock, and prepare the
students for working in a
.hospital environment,"
Mrs. Meehan stated.

Each student is Assigned
to a nurse preceptor, a
registered nurse on the staff
at Rahway. Undfer the wat-
chful eye of the preceptor,
the extern can perform
many of the tasks of a
registered nurse.

The 10-week program
also allows the extents to
spend some time in special-
ty areas such as the
emergency room, the

about linemen until you put
on the heavy equipment,"
Perkins said. "But he never
missed a game in four years
atBC.w

He's strong; smart,
durable and he looked im-
pressive at the mlni-eaffips.
He's similar to Billy Ard at
this time last year." , '-;

No. 5, Rich Ufflphrey,
center, Colorado. •.. •.

"He can fin two spots i s
k center mid tep

snap," Perkins offered.
"He's a hard worker, tough
and is going to be one kind
of a player."

No. 6, Darrell Nicholson,
linebacker (the Giants have
signed 18 linebackers).

p ^ tait a little
overweight like Taylor was-
last year. He's got a
chance," Perkins said.

No, 7, Jeff Wfcka, guard,
Michigan State. .

H qul^U and can be
tnflfd «tfe^We, He

pasted /pfiiy •Beth
spots,*, the ttSch aotea. .

No, 8, Reben HuBble,
tight end, Riee.

"He did same ihincs at
mmHatmp, that teaHy im-
pf&ssd u*. He^i&triito of-
tet s6m etepemten itthe

operating room, tabor and
delivery, pediatrics and en
doscopy.

Externs participating in
the program must agree to
work for Rahway Hospital
for one year following their
graduation from nursing
school.

Last year's externs are
now returning to the
hospital as graduate nurses.
Their orientation takes
much less time because they
are familiar with hospital
procedure.

Many of this year's group
of externs feel they are
much better now at
budgeting their time. WJiile
at school they would get
assigned to one-ior two pa-
tients; butJwhi&te&rtcfhg at
'Rahway H&$itftlnhey got
used to taking care of 10 pa-
tients or more. At school, a
bed bath took about two
hours, and in real life it
shouldn't take more than 15
minutes.

An important point Mrs.
Meehan brought out is, "in
school, time is spent assess-
ing every situation, trying
to determine the best course
of treatment But in reality,
when someone is bleeding
to death in front of you,
you save your assessment
for later on. Immediate ac-
tion is tolled for."

Externs meet once a
- • - — • - " — : — — • _ . .

uHe could be a big plus,"
Perkins said.

No. 12, Mark Seale,
defensive end, Richmond.

" H e V the second
strongest guy on the team.
Mark has got speed, is
fimart and has never been
injured,* Perkins said.

After stating he had an
outstanding group of free-
agent linebackers reporting
to camp, (poach ^ Perkins
aaidfj*We are better at
evetV. position with the ex-
ception of defensive corner-
backs. We only had three
osrnerbficks last year. We
were lucky to go all the way
with them. The ideal thing
is to go with four corner-
backs and three safeties. We
-tiaVe to find another corner-
back."

week with Mrs. Meehan to
discuss their experiences
and hear guesi speakers
They are required to keep a
log of their experiences und
a list of skills they feel they
have mastered over the
summer.

Externs participating in
this year's program ure:
Margaret Oerchiaro of lsc
lin, Lynn Ann Demeter of
Linden, Chcrly DeSiena of
Parlin, Andra Hand of Ed
ison, Patricia Kaercher of
Avenel, Jeanne Kammcrer
of Fanwood, Maureen Kel
ly of Rahway, Patricia
Lauri of Avenel, Cynthia
Nichols of Wesifield, Laura
Sarno of Edison, Kathleen
Slovinsky of Edison, Sha-
ron Smyth of Colonia and
Maureen Washington of
Carteret.

Gary Chrebet
- gets degree

y residenti'Gary
L. Chrebet of 387 W.
Hazelwood Ave., recently
received his bachelor of
science degree from Rutgers
University.

Sixty-nine players, in
eluding draftees, free agents
and some veterans, reported
to the preseason training
camp at Pace University in
Pleasantvillc, N. Y-, on July
23. The remaining 41
players reported on July 30.

After opening their pre
season schedule against the
Colts in Baltimore on Satur
day, Aug. 14, the Giants
will be home the following
Saturday, Aug. 21, against
the Steelers.

One of the beneficiaries
of the Steeler game will be
the New Jersey Press Assn.
Scholarship Fund,,Inc.

Through the years; the
press association has ex-
tended scholarship grants to
college students, for-conti-
nuing education programs
and in-service training for
member newspaper staffers,
and for other educational
activities in the field of jour
naltsm.

Through the past six
years, grants totaling
549,000 have been awarded
to 65 college students
preparing for careers in
journalism. During its 56
years, the NJ-PA has award-
ed $85,000 oF scholarship
money.

No. 99 Johft
defensive kick,; Nevtda,
Lfis V e $ t t . . ' . ; .•.".'' ' V. ••'•,' •

*He hss speed-*BdV*ay»
\&9

Lawrence Plotkin, D.P.M.
and

Dennis L. Turner, D.P.M.
A Professional Association

take pleasure in announcing that
Steven B. Brook, D.P.M,

has become associated with them
in the practice of

Podiatric Medicine and Foot Surgery
y Podiatry Group

St.. Gteorgjes' Avenue
ftahway, N J . 07065

W*$tfi«ld Podiatry Group
330 £• Broad Street
Weitft&K; N^l.^07090

" , T V > , " ^

&&*»*, >*'i**5

GETTING TO KNOW YOU - "Now how can we build something to express what we
have been talking about?" In primary skills classes in Clark s Summer School
knowledge is derived using manipulative materials leading up to the development of the
abstract concept

Stopping debt
may involve

only planning
II you arc in «Jebi and

feel oul of control, there
are si ill several choices
open to you. says Ciwen
Waranis. ihe culcnsuni
home economist for ihc
I. (i ion C cm ii i y C o
operative I xiension Scr
vice

One option is ihe con
sohdation loan, where
sou lake out a large loan
to pa> off outstanding
debts youisell Since the
consolidation loan stret
ches out your payments
over a longer period ol
i i m e . i he m o n t h l y
payment s are smaller
than the toial of the other
payments But. don't be
fooled into thinking you
now have less debt in pa>
off. You still pay ihe
whole amount before you
arc debt free, and ihe
longer time involved
means you pa^ more in
lercsi.

You might try a credit
counseling service. These
agencies help individuals
and families that arc in
deep trouble to budge:
iheir money. A counselor
will study your financial
situation, and make sug
gestions for belter mone>
management. If nee
essar\, vour counselor
will speak with the
lenders . . and obtain1

j^it-enieniN f° r V()U ' °
\\*\ off the loan in smaller
installments over a longer
period ol lime. The ad
vantages of working with
u credit counseling agen
cy arc \ou avoid harrass
meni b\ creditors, and
learn discipline and

regularity in pa\ trig bills
You can also choose in

speak to your creditors
yourself, and re ncgoiiau*
your own debts Musi
creditors will agree i>»
make a d j u s t m e n t il u m
have a workable plan nt

repayment, and show you
are sincere and willing lo
pa> Be sure you have
an\ new agreement in
written as well us verbal
fi irm

Thr i-rtfK of ilmtrra* of r""!1'*"
• .cirij; It-ft i.. |̂,in<1 IK prui.f Ihul
the w n| 111 <l<>f-)i pni(;rrttii.

Fora
Future in
Computers...
The Fastest
Growing
Industry...

County College
Cranford rEiliaboth/ Scotch Plaint
OFFERS PROGRAMS IN

Computer Science/
Data Processing

Business/Computer
Information Systems

Leading to Jobs as
Computer Programmers • Junior Svslemi
Programmers • Applications Analysts

or to tour-year programs resulting In Jobs as
Systems Analysts • Protect Leaden • Data Base
Administrators • Computer Services Directors

CREDIT COURSES IN
In t rocJuClory Dr i f r j Prr>< i-sscik j • f O H O l ( M • A.,
semrniv i . i ' v . j i i ^ j c n • i ' [ . . 'Mt . - iv) ' u s i r ^ n Mt •"
1 . "itr, i ; ( ]- ,( j ! ,(HJi • • hnV •-•.: , A|j[ i II i j tn«(i fO' C W •

ur i \J . J r i i 1 A [ )( >... i j ! r ir i*! • I- „ 11 ir 1. 1, t l ,

NON-CREDIT COURSES IN

" • " " , . ) • > ' H > ' I I H • I ! , ' 1 , ] • • h U S 1 ' ' ' i i V ) r , j n n ' , , 1 Kj

1 „ j . • i- t i ,. ] . , I , . ,. | ( - , J t l T ' •• . - ! % . ! . , J • . J ' . . ! . - • • .

V .. I I it . ' " ' • 1 • I ' " j . ,. i , _ i f • I •••••> - i . l [ > i n t , i M . ] f t . . •

' • » ) ' • I I " !• > - . ) " • » ' <• 1 I " , ' • i [ , . , 1 . - r I 1 ! K . J ' ' 7 " • ' • m v 1

F uli oi Part IiFne Day o f f voning Cla«.sei
1 ,1 , 1 | ,( 1. , i t . , V II • I , .F. • , ' > l . f M . . I t - ••

I, jlh 1. . I i " l[ II ) t . . l -,[ . . . . | , )I,S[ . Ill tr-li • ' i. i t ' i ' -

276-2600 ext. 232

CONSUMER RECORD REVIEWED

l-itvi week I introduced you lomy Repub-
lican opponent, Congrcssmiin Mutihcu
Ritialdo I uild you about New Jetsc\
Monthly rating hirri the "worst" Con
grcssmnn from New Jersey und nhout Iht-
Courier News calling him "hypocritical"

,,foi hemp the cml> New Jersey Congress-
mun lo take full advantage of the $75-a-
day tax brcuk Congress voted itxclf and
then sign on as to-sponsor of the repeal ol
ihc tax break

Todny I'd like to give you two exam
pies of how my record has been reviewed
I am proud of my accomplishments »«, ihc
State Director of Consumer Affairs, and I
am proud to share m\ record with you

In July 1980. New Jersey Monthly said.
*' During his tenure the division has come
down hard on auto repair and home
improvement fraud, short-weight ing in
supermarkets, meter tampering in the
home heating oil business, false advert is•
ing. and similar offenses " They go on to
say. "Levin's whole professional being
seems trained on the task of keeping the
citizens of New Jersey from being bilked
— at bingo, at the gas station, at the
funeral parlor, through the mails, and so
on l-^rvin personifies the qualities that
the sixiies generation once promised it
would inject into public life

When I left office in February of this
year, the Suburban News, in an editorial,
cited my record and said.' ' He WHS chiefl v
responsible for molding the citizens of
New Jersey into what many consider the
best protected consumers in the country
His tenure will serve as a model for future
administrators." They lalk about the
"exemplary programs" I set up-and the
' "numerous reptitat ions coupled with

vigorous m\ csi i^itron .md enforcement
tor which I m r csponsihlc

Then thc\ >*.i\ He accomplished all
this without brinn ihc UK of business
which mosi .*t us would itssume comes
with the nib Wheievei shodd\ or illegal
business pet- tico* were designed to
defraud m rmslc.iil ihc public, he ;iful his
compcicm tr.im would cci taint> come
down h:irj tin! ( onMimci MTiitrs under
Adam Levin clcurt^ o.iis not an obstruc-
tionist agent \ miiWinp lite difficult for the
honcsl husine-ss people «»f the state We
salute Ad;tm I ev m lot u |oh well done and
wish him j*iHH.t t'orinne in whatever future
endeavors he m;t> untlertake

1 decpK iipprecuite rhesc good thoughts
and good wishes And my "future
endeavor is to take rm experience and
nbilu ICN to Washingion and give you the
qiwilitv reprcsrntation vnu

ADAM LEVIN • DEMOCRAT FOR CONGRESS

:;^J^<
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Kumpf's cogers
down Brewer

Clark's Carl H. Kumpf
School Basketball Team on
July 20 defeated the Char
les H. Brewer School
Playground Team. Brian
Sims and Mark Henry led
their team to victory, scor
ing 18 points each. Jeff
Carovillano added his
talents to Kumpfs effon by
scoring four points, whilr
Brian Carov illano scored
two points. In addition. Bob
Deisskcr carried the team
along with his defense The
final score was Kumpf, 42,
Brewer, I I

• • •
Fun her more. Melissa

Bizub and Jennifer Kuznei
competed in a hula hoop
contest. Melissa Bizub won
all three trials. Also, the
team of Brian and Jeff
Caroviilano and Robin
Deisslcr defeated Kenny
Cospito and Brad Kocsis in

whiffleball 7 2
• • •

In arts and crafis, a
K umpf recreation spok-
esman announced the ar
rival of new arts-and-crafts
projects This includes a
machine craft called Paint
n-Swirl Fifteen children
participated in this craft.
The children take ihe
specially-cul paper, place it
in the machine on a rotating
disc and then squeeze the
color paint they have
chosen onto the paper. The
rotating motion causes the
paint lo make many de-
signs

In addition, the children
may key chains from road
signs, which they later glaz
ed. Another activity the
children participated in was
the making of rainbow
bookmarks and stick yarn
weaving.

Brewer kickballers
among unbeaten

Over 200 youngsters
have registered to date to
participate in (he activities
at Clark's Charles H. Brew
er School Playground.

• • •
Brewer's kickball and bas-

ketball teams are well into
their respective seasons.
The kickball team sports a
2-0 record, and is preparing
for its big game with Valley
Road. The basketball team,
on the other hand, is cur-
rently 0-3.

• • »
A bowling tournament

was held recently at Brewer.
Pat Slowey rolled the high
game, a 118. David Brown's
111 placed him second, and
Marc Hayden's 106 was
good enough for third.

• • *
A lawn-toss tournament

was also conducted at Brew
er this week. As in the bowl
ing tournament, Slowey
captured first-place honors.
Greg Schubert finished se-
cond and Jerry McDade
placed third.

• • •
Ashbrook's Pitch-and-

Putt Course was the focus
of a trip by Kevin Shack
leton, Joe Venturella, Peter
Soudris, Pat Slowey and Bil-
ly Shacklcton. Kevin Shack-
Icton's 31 led the field.

• • «
As record temperatures

hit the area, youngsters at
the Brewer Playground
kept cool on July 23 by
eating watermelon. Over 50
pounds were devoured by
the 73 youngsters who att-
ended the playground that
day.

Green problem cuts
Galloping Hill rates
An improper mix of

normally-used grounds-
keeping solutions has caus-
ed eight greens at the
Galloping Hill Golf Course,
on the Blvd., Kenilworth, to
be closed to players.

The 27-hole course will
reipain open with some
temporary greens, and rates
have been reduced, effec-
tive on Friday, July 30, to
compensate for the inconve-
nience to golfers. It will still
be possible to play a full
18-holes by splitting play
between the three nines.

It will take from two
weeks to a month to repair
ihe damaged greens, accor-
ding to county officials.
During that time, golfers
may take advantage of a
30% rate reduction across
the board as follows

WEEKDAY RATES
GOlRt CUlKMT/tEBUCED
County
residents 54 50 S3
Non-resident
with I. D. $7 S4.50
Nonl.D. S10 $6.50
Seniors S2 50 SK50
17 &. under $2.50 Si 50
Season card$2 75 SI 75

WEEKEND &
HOLIDAY RATES

GOLRt CUKKMT/tEBDCED
County
residents $5.75 $3.75
Non-resident
with I. D. $9.25 $6
Nonl .D . SU.50 $9.50
Seniors S3.7S $2.50
17 & under $5.2$ $3.50
Season card $3.25 $2

Play was interruped in
mid-day on July 27 after the
improperly-mixed solution
had been applied earlier to
green Nos. 4 , 5 , 6 , 7 , 1 4 and
17 and, on the single nine,
green Nco. 2 and 4. County
offidaU are currently ex-
amining the course to deter-
mine the exact cause of the
damage,

PUyers who had their
g a m s halted on July 27
had their fees refunded.
«• "The unfogunate oc*

curanee will cause some
disruption of play, however,
the county would still en-
courage players to utilize
Galloping Hill at reduced
rates or the other county
courses maintained by the
Union County Dept. of
Parks and Recreation,** said
Arthur J. Grisi, the county
manager. Those courses are
Ash Brook in Scotch Plains,
telephone, 756-0414, and
Oak Ridge in Clark,
telephone 574-0139.

Williams, bats bring
city to playoffs

By Ray Hoaglnnd
Steve Williams pitched

the Rahway Recreations in-
ior the Intra-County
Baseball League playoff
with a 5-1 win over the
Westfied Police Athletic
League Team at Rahway
River Park on July 31.

The hard-throwing hurler
gave up six hits and one
run, and that came in the
top of the seventh.

The win was the first ever
for manager Bill Roesch
over a Westfield PAL team
in league play.

'Summer Strike'
to be bowled

on cable
Suburban Cable vision

will cablecast "Summer
Strike," the local bowling
scries, today at 7:30 p.m.
via TV-3. Tonight's bowlers
will be Tom Waidelich of
Clark versus O. J. Olcha
skey of South River.

This match will be part of
the men's division, and the
winner in this division will
receive $500. "Summer
Strike" is taped at the Clark
Lanes, and will continue to
the first week in September.

The first four innings
were a tense pitchers' battle
between Williams and
Kevin Morris of the PAL.
Rahway had one hit and
the visitors three.

The PAL loaded the
bases in the top of the first,
but failed to score on a great
double play that Williams
started by throwing to
Frank Urso, who made a
fine toss to first baseman,
Scott Wohlrab.

The first Recreation hit
was by Frank Jacik, who
popped a shot into right

Clark rolls
with bowling

Suburban Cable vision
will cablecast "Summer
Strike," the local bowling
show, on Wednesday, Aug.
11, at 7.30 p.m., via TV-3.
Keith Ehman of Cranford
will go against Tom Lesin-
ski of BridgewaterEast.
The match will be in the
high school division, and
the winner in this division
will receive a trophy.

"Summer Strike" is taped
at the Clark Lanes, and
TV-3 invites interested per-
sons to come and cheer.

centerfietd, and stole se-
cond, but was stranded.

With the teams deadlock-
ed in a scoreless tie in the
last of the fifth, Wohlrab
opened the inning with a
double into the trees in right
center. He was advanced to
second by Urso, and scored
on a squeeze play by Bob
Buckley, who beat the play
to first base.

Steve Marcinak walked,
then Dave Baruka drove in
a run on a single to right
and raced to third on an er-
ror by the PAL's right
fielder. Williams helped his
cause with a line drive to
right, and the locals were on
top 3-0.

Then Mike Albert doubl-
ed into the nghtfield trees,
but was left on base.

In the sixth inning Jacik
reached on an infield error,
and scorded in front of
Wohlrab's long homerun
over the top of the trees in
rightfield to close the
Recreation's scoring at 5-0.

Buckley had two hits,
and Wohlrab had a single
and a homerun.

The Recreations last
night hosted Cranford in
the second game of the
playoffs.

TO ACE FOR ACE -Patrick Murphy, who shot a hole
-In-one on the Cotonia Country Club's sixth hole, which
Is a par 3, 140 yard hole, using a No. 6 Iron, receives

RAHWAY
RECREATION DEPT.

SLOW-PITCH
SOFTBALL LEAGUE
STANDINGS USED
FOR PLAYOFF

PAIRINGS
WBTfftN OIVKIOU

TEAMS W
CreanzoA.C. 12
BuichKowaPs 12
Linden Provisions 10
Piscitelli

Excavators .* 7
DaPrile Railing 7
Apollo A C 6
Laminaire 6
TGL. . lnc 5
Waiting Room 4
Village Inn 3

OESULTS
Linden Provisions,

Village Inn, 1.
Linden Provisions,

Village Inn, 2.
Butch KowalX 12; Lam-

inaire, 11.
Butch KowaPs, 12; Wait

mg Room, 4.
Piscitelli Excavators, 9;

Apollo A. C , 5.
DaPrile Railings, S; Lam

inaire, 2.
DaPrile Railings, 29; T

G. L., I n c . 17.
Village Inn, 10; Waiting

Room, 9.
uswm on/Kiwi

TUKS « I
Dri-Prim

5
9
8
9
9

10
13

13;

7;

the trophy as the 1982 winner of the Annual William C.
HoblHzell Award from Walter Eley. the secretary of the
Greens Committee at the club.

Henry leads scorers
in Kumpf cage win

Clark's Carl H. Kumpf
School recreation team
defeated Charles H. Brewer
and Frank K.. Hehnly in
basketball. Mark Henry led
the team, scoring 17 points.
Brian Sims scored eight
points, and Philip Chen had
four points. Bob Deissler
.had four points also, and
Jeff Carovillano scored two
points. Other participants
weffe^ BriBJn--CaroViHatii6r
Scott Kousis, who assisted
with his rebounding skills,
and Rich Superak. The final
score was Kumpf, 35;
Hehnly, 25. The Kumpf
recreation basketball team
has a record of two wins
and no losses.

However, Kumpf lost its
kickball game against Curry
Field 3MO. Participating in
the kickball same were Edie
Emstein, Chris Anderson,
Gabe Grigonis, Deissler,
Ken Cospito, and Brian and
Jeff Carovillano.

In arts and crafts, awards
were given for outstanding
participation and creativity.
Robin Deissler received the
first-place ribbon for both
outstanding creativity and
participation. Edie Emstein
garnered the second-place
ribbon for outstanding par-
ticipation, and Bob Deissler
received the second-place
ribbon for his creativity.
The third-place ribbons
were given to Chris Ander-
son and Gabe Grigonis. All
of the children who par-

ticipated in Kumpfs arts-
and-crafts program received
candy.

The children have been
working on many projects
in the program. They made
Japanese kites, geometrical
thread and pin designs and
animal-shaped wooden key
chains. The children took
the animal shapes and
painted rhenvglued on eyes
and' usett -fSpe*vciainers to
decorate their projects.
Outstanding work -was
created by Bob Deissler
with his green owl, Gabe
Grigonis and Brian Caro-
villano with their multi-
colored fish, Chris Ander-
son with his elephant, Jeff
Carovillano with his pig and
Robin Deissler and his pur-
ple rabbit.

• • •
Finally, the children have

been playing a variety of
games ranging from S. P. U.
D. to basketball shooting,
kickball, Carrom pool, ping-
pong and nok hockey.

In addition on July 22
Kumpf Playground held a
candy hunt.

Slow-pitch loop
ready for playoffs

Rahway K. of C.
Market Body
Continental

Construction
Pascals Agency
CarPfiSufiOCO
MeManus StefcK

12
U

U

10
II
7

Listed below is the
schedule for this season's
inter-division single-
elimination playoff cham-
pionship in the Rahway
Recreation Dept. Slow-
Pitch Softball League. All
teams are in the playoffs.
Position was determined by
standings as of July 24.

AH games will be at 6
p.m. at the Rahway River
Park.

Erectors 6 10
. Chemicals 5 10

Huffman-Koos 3 13
Purolator 3 14

HSOITS
Rahway K. of C 17;

Continental Construction,
9.
CarTs Sunoco, 11; Huff-
man-Koos, 5.

Market Body, 5; On-
Print Foifc, Jmx, 4 .

McManus A, CX, 12;Pur-
olator, 10*

TUESDAY, AUG. 10
FWd tt*. I,Creanzo A . C

versus Pascals Agency.
FUU II*. I , Market Body

versus the winner of
Laminaire versus Waiting
Room.
ri*U Ho. S, Rahway K. of C
versus Apollo A. C
FteU N*. 4, Piscitelli Ex-
cavators versus the winner
of U. S. S. Chemicals versus
Purolator.

THURSDAY, AUG. 12
FhUlb . 1, Dri-Print Fofc>
Inc. versus DaPrfe SUik

FUU Ito. a. Linden Ptovi*
tkms verois the winner of
McManus Steel Erectors
versus Huffman-Koos.

fbUU*. vButchKowalV
versus CarTfi

fteU H*. 4 , Continental
Construction versos the
winner of T, G. L , Inc. W -

V

MONDAY, AUG. 16
FWU lid. 1, winners of

Aug. 10 on FWU list. 1 cad
1.

FtoU Me, 2, winners of
Aug. 10 on FteU MM. 3 mi
4.
FUU Ha. J, winners of Aug.
12 on FUU KH. 1 mmit.
FUU Ma. 4, winners of Aug.
12onfUUN«s.3wri4.

TUESDAY, AUG. 17
FUU tit* 1, winners of Aug.
16 on FUU Has. 1 m* J.

FUU Ha. t, winners of
Aug. 16 on R*U NM. 3 s*d
4.
WEDNESDAY, AUG. 18
FUU **. 1, winners of Aug.
17, Playoff Championship
Game.

liatla McCarthy

A woman from ttahway,
Uada A. McCarthy of 176?
Wiafield St., tscefttly
.received Its-bacfeter of arts
degree from Rutgers
Univewfcy. ~

Red Cross
sets trips

by bus
A spokesman for The

Clara Barton Auxiliary of
the Eastern Union County
Chapter of the American
Red Cross announced the
following bus trips:

-t***isf, Asa. 17, to the
Bronx Zoo; leaving at 10
a-m. from the Kean College
parking lot in Union, Jeav-
ing New York, 4 pjru, cost
$10, which includes admis-
sion,

•*$•*#**,**§. 11, to
Jons Beach Theater to tee*
•West Side Story* Buffet
dinner at the Town and
Campus Restaurant,
Union, 5 pjn-, cost $35 per
p e s s o n . ; .• , • : • " . ; • • - • . • , " • • • . • • - ' •

^tinrfafr tea, SI, to the
Ktesd&etiAdfi to tat * foot-
baH siine befweat the Sat
and the Gfasm. lave Ee*a
College %p*rktas lot ia

Union, 6 p.m., cost, S22 per
person.

-Friday, topt. 3, to the
Garden State Arts Center
to see Edyie Gorrne and
Steve Lawrence, buffet din-
ner at the Town and Cam-
pus Restaurant, Union,
5:45 p.m., show time, 8:30
p.m., cost, S31 per person.

For further information
on ad of these trips and for
reservations, which you
should make now for any or
an of these events, please
telephone Sylvia Pierre
Land? at 3533500.

Moyer

A township woman*
Margaret H. Moyer of 190
Gibson SlvdW recently
received her /bachelor of

«t

RACING NOW
thru September 4

Enjoy the fun, warmth aria personal
cartftQ that Is Mornnouthfe style of weV
com© to exciting therouohbred racing
on f he Jersey shore. ;

GouffftSft cKfl̂ nQ \t\ find fustsur&nts. -, -̂
or picnic al fresco on our aeres of

i — JO o n l inden was cum/""» - * • ^BrtrtM»t
[team 42-29- u \ , a r e . woodbrtdge, Carterei,
(Other teams competing a • ^ ^ Elizabeth, Unden
Iperth Amboy. St. I ! ? ° m

m e m b e r s ot*the Rahway squadNo.2andSumm»t.ThBrnemt>ere p e t e r s o n > Curtis'

L h o have ^ ^ ^ / n r l a n CaWwell. Joe Murray.
W e r , Dorsey W " k f n f ; J j o h n son, Rodney Perkins.
iRodney Robln&on, ^"™^ _ Burke and Stan Wo-
iTodd Walker, Sean Sm*m- J ^ n iett to right, are: Rear
lltkowskl. T o ^ ™0mf.?[!L r Burke. Wllkens. Baker andlrow, Coach L a d l e y W a ^ B u m e ^ ^ ^ J o h n 8 o n l

[assistant ^ J J ^ Z ^ N o l Shown_.are: Murray. :*--ii'. I-

FUTURE PELES-The boys who:
camp run by the .Rahway Youth S&c6fet£Adfio., under I
the auspices of the North American Soccer tiafops, are
shown. The boys were coached by former-North
American Soccer League and1 English first-division
player, Paul Quinn and former English first-division
player. Dick Jones. Fall soccer registration will be held
on Wednesday. Aug. 11 , from 7 to 8 p.m. at the Claude
H. Reed Cultural and Recreational Center In Rahway.
The cost will be $10 for each child and $7.50 for the
second child of each family.

The Rahway Hospital
Men's Softball Team finish-
ed second in the Union
County Hospital Men's
Softball-League. It had a
season mark of 7-3. The
diampionship was won by
trie Overlook Hospital of
Summit

• •
In the Elizabeth Board of

Education Summer Basket-
ball League, the Clark team
lost to Blue Magic 62-31.
Mike Karamus had 16
points for the losers.

•.» »
John Sprovack of

Rahway won one of the big-
gest boxing matches Of his
short career when he knock-

H Ron Frarier of
Rochester and the Fort;
-Bragg, N. C* team. • • ? i

The Rahway News-Rec-
ord and The Cterk Patriot
gave the Rahway youngster,
the first rounds. He dropped
the Army boxer with a right
hand for the count of eight, •
and was on top of the
Rochester,boy throughput
the fast-action round.

With two minutes and 27
seconds gone in the second
round, Sprovach sent
Fraiier reeling into the.
raps, and followed up with
a good two-handed attack
that foKed the referee to
aop t te conbst.

t l match was held tx

AIKStir taan drfeatsd ihe
Army fesm 6-5. r

Thr*e of the

played in the Union County
American Legion game at
Memorial Field in Linden
on July 26 against the
league winners from Spr-
ingfield.

Brian Wittick of
Rahway* a catcher, batted
.227.

Robert Buckley, an in-
fietder, hit .258 this year
and Steve Williams, had a
.429 average.

From Clark there was
Cr&ig Frankel, who hit
.419.

* • *
In an American Legion

game John Baumgartner
fanned 15 to lead Spr-
ingfield to a 5-0 win over
Clark.;

' T h e ^ n gave Springfield
the league title for this sum-
mer. The team had a 14^3-1
season mark, and has earn-
ed a berth in the legion state
tournament. Baumg&rtner
walked one, and allowed
only four nits.

The, Giants will open
their preseason schedule on
Saturday, Aug. 14, at
Baltimore at 8 p.m.
v They will be at home on
Saturday, Aug. 21, when
they will nost the pitt-
ibureh Steelers, then play
the New Yprt Jets on
Saturday, Aug. 28. : .
. The final preseason con-
test wpl be on Friday, Sept.
3»':/wiietr :trie Miami
Dotphms host the Giants.
- .Matty fcftft fans tol

mg forward to the
tifice Butch WooffoUc of
.Westfield

be in action.
The team will have its

opening on Sunday, Sept.
12, when the Atlanta
Falcons come to the
stadium.

• • •
The Rahway News-Rec-

ord learned this week the
Rahway High School Foot-
ball Team will play at Toms
River South High School
this fall.

The Toms River South
Indians are a member of the
Shore Conference.

There is still an opening
on the local schedule. Any
schools interested should
contact the Athletic Dept.

• • •
The Clark Little League

All-Stars, a team of 12-year-
olds, defeated the South
Orange Villagers 12-1 to
win the Annual Mountain-
side Invitational Tourna-
ment.

Righthander, George
Visconti, pitched a two-
hitter in the final contest.

He was named the Most
Valuable Player of the tour-
nament with third baseman
Vinnie Gulbin, who hit two
homeruns, and batted in six
runs.

'Put up' more
after going
to workshop

Gardeners often find
themselves with more fruit
and vegetables than they
can eat or give away to
friends and relatives.

To assist home farmers
with thk plight, a canning-
and^reezing workshop will
ibe presented by Eloise
MeLendon of the Union
County 4-H Club today
from &4S to 11:30 a,m. at
tfe TraHsste Nature and

Center at Coles
New Provkfence

Day at races
dawns at Hehnly

Clark's Frank K. Hehnly
School Playground held a
racing tournament on July
27. In the seventh-and-
eighth-grade race the win-
ners were: First place, Jon
Frankel; second place,
Larry Leone, and third
place, Chris Tierney.

Chris Weilandt placed
first in the fifth-and-sixth-
gradc race, with Kelly
O'Donnell in second, and
Mark Weilandt in third
place. In the kindergarten-
to-fourth-grade race the
winners were: First place,
John David Gross; second
place, Robyn Frank, and
third place, Stephen Gross.

ON THE SPORTS
SCENE

BASKETBALL
July 20, Hehnly. 36; Cur-

ry, 20.
July 22, Carl H. Kumpf,

35; Hehnly, 25.
July 27, Hehnly, 48; Cha

rles H. Brewer, 44.
KIOCftAU

July 23, Hehnly, 24; Val
ley Road, 23.

July 26, Brewer, 25; Heh
nly, 21.

Rd., Mountainside.
She will demonstrate

methods of "putting up" the
produce from typical home
gardens, and win answer
questions from the au-
dience, TTie workshop is
free, and literature on cann-
ing and freezing will be
made available for those
who want it for about Si.

For information, please
telephone the Union Coun-
ty Dept. of Parks and
Recreation Hotline at ,
352-8431. After 5 pjrg
please telephone 352-8410
for special events,,general
mformntkm, rain dates and
cancellations^

Wildcats creep
past Nutley

By Ray Hoagland
The Clark Wildcats held

on in the top of the seventh
to nose out the Nutley team
6-5 on July 27 at the Arthur
L. Johnson Regional High
School Field in Clark.

Dianne Grycziec of Rah
way had a perfect day at
bat. She opened the fourth
inning with a long homerun
to right center, and beat the
throw to the plate. She
singled and scored in the se-
cond, and beat out an in-
field hit to third in the sixth,
and scored on a wild pitch.

Sue Marshall pitched a
seven hitler. Her defense
made three errors, but in
the top of the seventh with
the winning runs on base,
she forced the final batter to
fly to the first baseman to

STANDING OF
LEAGUES

AMERICAN LEGION
TEAMS
Springfield*
Roselle
Union
Westfield
Elizabeth
Cranford
RAHWAY
CLARK
Linden

W
14
14
14
11
7

6
4
3
2

I
3
3
4
6
9

10
12
13
15

INTRA-COUNTY
BASEBALL LEAGUE
FINAL STANDINGS

TEAMS W
Elizabeth Yankees 12
Cranford Cobras 11
R A H W A V
R E C R E A T I O N S 10
Westfield P A L 10
Summit TJnipo 8
Roselle Park Y o o t h 7
RoseBe Recreation 3
Union V F W ~S
Hillside Recreation 4 -.'

L
4
S

6
6
8
9

11
11
12

close out the game.
The Cats went in front

2-0 in the last of the second
on three hits- l lcnc
Freeman and Dianne Gryc
ziec, were driven in by Lisa
Rever.

In the fourth the only
score was Dianne
Grycziec's homerun.

The Clark team scored
three runs on four hits in
the last of the sixth. llcnc
Freeman singled and reach
ed third on Dianne Gry
czicc's hit, and then scored
on Sue Marshall's infield hit
along the third-base line,
then Lisa Rever singled to
leftfield, sending two runs
over the plate.

Sue Marshall allowed
seven hits, struck out two
and walked one batter.

Curry Fielders
meet challenge

Youngsters at Clark's
Curry Field Park have been
involved in inter-school ac-
tivities such as softball,
basketball and kickball.

• • •
The Nok-Hockey contest

involved almost all the
members of the playground,
and the championship went
to Michael MacGregor. He
was awarded a first-prize
ribbon, and the other
children received candy for
their participation.

• .• •
The children created

various types of a m and
crafts: For example, key
rings, lint brushes, spin art
and fluffy -animals.

..• • •
They arc also involved in

a table-pool contest.

Johnson sets
schedule for

physicals
The physical examine

ttons for Clark's Arthur
L Johnson Regional
High School fall sports
program will be given at
the school according to
the following schedule:

Boy* varsity and Junior
varsity feetboll, Wednes-
day, Aug. 25, 9 a.m.

Freshmen footboll,
Wednesday. Aug. 25,
10:30 a.m.

Boys varsity and (untar
vantty soccer, Thursday,
Aug. 26, 9 a.m.

Cross-country, Thurs-
day, Aug. 26, 9:45 a.m.

Freshmen soccer and
cross-country, Th u rsda y,
Aug. 26, 10:15 a.m.

Girls, all varsity and
junior varsity candidates for
soccer, gymnastics, tennis
and cross-country, Friday,
Aug. 27, 9 a.m.

Any Freshman girl trying
out for a fall sport, Friday,
Aug. 27, 10:30 a.m.

All candidates for
physical examinations
must have a permission
slip signed by their
parents before they may
take a physical cxamina
tion. These arc available
in the main office of the
high school, reports Louis
J. Peragallo, the athletic
director.

Fishing derby
to be held
on Aug. 5

The Rahway Recrea
tion Dept. will hold its
Annual Fishing Derby at
Milton Lake Park in
Rahway on Thursday,
Aug. 5, from 5:30 to 7:30
p.m.

There will be prizes for
boys and girls in a variety
of age groups, and
registration will be held at
5:30 p.m., reports Jim
Ladley, the playground
director.
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Brewer linksters
test evil eyes

A group of 12 youngsters
rom Clark's Charles H.

Brewer School Playground
were able to test their golf
kills when they visited the

Ashbrook Pitch-and-Putt
Course. The course consists
of nine short holes.

Kevin Shackleton, the
cnior winner, utilized

strong chip shots and steady
putts to card a 32. Maureen
Kennedy, Paul MacCly-
mont and Richard Regan
inished tied for second,

seven shots behind
Shackleton. Greg Shubert,
the junior winner, carded a
36. Billy Shackleton and
Jerry McDade finished two
strokes off the pace.

• • •
Carrom pool and nok-

hockey tournaments were
conducted at the Brewer
School playground. A total
of 17 youngsters competed.
The carrom pool tourna-
ment was divided into a
junior and a senjor division.
Dave Brown fearned the
first-place^ ribbon. Kevin
Shackleton finished second,
and Natalie Migliaro placed
third. Frank Pasquale strug
gled to capture the first-
place ribbon in the junior
division. Danny and Brian

Montgomery finished se-
cond and third, respective
ly

Jerry McDade breezed
through the nok hockey
field to capture the first-
place ribbon. Bill Shackle-
ton^Lpd Pat Slowey finished
second and third, respec-
tively.

• • •
Brewer's softball and

hockey teams concluded
their seasons quite suc-
cessfully. The softball
team's final record was 2-2,
while the hockey team's
record was 3-1, good
enough to clinch at least a
tic for the inter-playground
championship. Key players
on the hockey squad were
Steve Btss, Leo Urso, Dave
Slater, Steve Washington,
Shawn McGaha, Joe Col-
ombo, Henry Falcon and
Kevin Shackleton.

Two new sports teams,
basketball and kickball,
have been organized, and
their members have been
preparing for competition.
Although the basketball
team appears to have some
weaknesses to iron out, the
kickball team seems ready
to roll.

Hehnly hoopsters
score at line

Clark's Frank K. Hehnly
School Playground held a
basketball foul-shooting
contest on July 20. The
winners in the sixth-gradc-
to-freshmen category were:
First place, Jon Frankel; se-
cond place, David Flammia,
and thirdj>lace, Chris Wei-
landt. - " - -

In the kindergarten-to-
f if th-gradc category, the
winners were: First place,
Jeff Gittlin, second place,
Robyn Frank, and third
place, Laurie Camacho.

ON THE SPORTS
SCENE

noon HOCKIY
July 15, Hehnly, 7; Charles
H Brewer. 5.

BASKETBALL
July 20. Hehnly, 36; Cur-

ry, 20.

Benefit off
New Jersey Press

Scholarship Fund

Saturday, August 21

Order your tickets today
tor this exciting preseason
game between the Giants
and the Pittsburgh Steelers

Game proceeds for
th* benefit of the
Press Association
Scholarship Fund

UMiitO:
FOOTS ALL GIANTS
Giant* Stftdlum
£ftftt Buthtrtord, MJ. 07573

1 Mftftlt

| AnnopRQ

| 1082 PRE-SEASON APPLICATION
1 TWO HOME GAMES
j AT GIANTS STADIUM

| GAMES

! . *"» 2 1

1 * PiRBburgh Sfsaton
1 Sat. Nit*
J Aug 26
1 B NY J«*
| S*t Nile

NO
SEATS

SEAT
PfltCE

to 11 00

| POSTAGE & HANDLING

! TOtJa
! CUE
• • •• to. • > • » !

UAKE'CHECK
PAYABLE TO:

M.Y. FOOTBALL
GIANTS. INC

EXTENSION

50

iiilgMi^i^S^^ '^mM^i^; &*M$J^LJL
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Religious Events

CLARK ALLIANCK CHURCH
Sunday School for all ages will begin ai 10 a.m. on

Sunday. Aug. 8, followed ai II o'clock wuh Morning
Worship wuh The Rc-v David W Arnold, the pastor,
followed ai 7 o'clock by the F.vening Service

Meeting* during the week Monday. Aug 9, 9 a.m.,
Bible School for those aged three to those in sixth grade,
Tuesday, Aug 10. 7:30 to 8:30 a m., Prayer for Power, 9
a.m.. Bible School: Wednesday Aug 11. 9 a.m. Bible
School. 7:30 p.m., Bible Study and Prayer Meeting. Aug.
12, 9 a.m., Bible Sch(x>l. Friday. Aug 13. 9 a.m.. Bible
School; Saturday. Aug 14, 7 p m . Alliance Youth
Fellowship

For further information, please telephone The Rev
Arnold at 3881272

The church is located ai the corner of Denman and
Westfield

There's
an Answer!
by Notman Vincent Peal© and Ruth Stafford Peal©

EVANGELISTIC CKNTRt OK RAHWAY
Services on Sunday, Aug 8, will begin ai 10:30 a.m

and ai 7 p.m wuh Worship and Praise, A message will be
given by The Rev. Paul F McCarthy, the pastor, follow
cd by a prayer to receive healing. Sunday School classes
for all children 12 years old and under will begin after
Worship and Praise. The 7 p.m. Service will include a
message from the Word by the pastor and a prayer to
receive healing

A Faith Teaching Seminar will be held on Wednes
day, Aug. 11, at 7 p.m. Participants should bring their
Bibles and notebooks. The pastor will offer prayer for
people with special needs ai the close of the service.

The Rev. McCarthy will be taking an 11-day lour to
the Land of the Bible, from Tuesday to Friday, Nov. 2 to
12 Please telephone the church office for additional in-
formation at 4990040.

The church is located at 2052 St. George Ave

SKCOND PRFSBYTFR1AN CHURCH OF
RAHWAY

The sermon ai Sunday Morning Worship at 9:30
o'clock on Aug. 8, "More Than Enough," will be given by
The Rev, Harold E. Van Horn, the pastor. Joining the
congregation in worship will be the members of the Trini-
ty United Methodist and the First Presbyterian Chur
ches, both of Rahway. This will be part of the Summer
Union Services.

Workshop Day for the Women's Assn. will be held
from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. on Tuesday, Aug. 10. All women
of the church may bring a sandwich. The beverage will be
provided. The women are workiing on crafts for a Fall
Boutique which will be followed by a Fish and Chips Din
ner of Friday, Oct. 15. .

The church is located at 1221 New Brunswick Ave.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH OF
RAHWAY

Services will be held at 10 a.m. on Sunday, Aug. 8.
The sermon. "More Than Manna," will be given by the
pastor. The Rev. Sara Waldron.

The church is located at 466 W. Grand Ave.

OSCEOLA PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH OF CLARK
His seriesron the Ten Commandments will be con-

tinued by The Rev. Dr. Robert R. Kopp, the pastor, at
the 10 a.m. Worship Service on Sunday, Aug. 8. Coffee
and Fellowship wilt immediately follow the worship ser-
vice.

Today and tommorrow the Vacation Bible School
win meet for the last times from 9 a.m. to noon. With the
theme, "God Speaks-We Listen." The school is being led
by James P. Stobaugh, the assistant to the pastor.

The second pre-retreat meeting for those planning to
attend the Youth Summer Camping Retreat will be held
on Monday, Aug. 9, at 7 p.m. in the Youth Room. Group
Assignments and camping and cooking instructions-will
be given.

The members of the Osceola Youth Group will go on
their Summer Camping Retreat at the Pine Barrens in
southern New Jersey from Friday to Sunday, Aug. 13 to
15. Permission slips and more information can be found
on the table in the Youth Room at the church. The direc-
tor of youth, Daniel RudyV. will be in charge.

Osceola is located at 1689 Raman Rd.

ZION LUTHERAN CHURCH OF RAHWAY
The Service of Worship on Sunday, Aug. 8, will be

conducted by Joann Serratclli, a seminarian, at 9 a.m. No
child care will be provided. Older children are encouraged
to worship with their parents

The Church Council will meet on Monday, Aug. 9,
at 7:30 p.m.

The church is located at Elm and Esterbrook Aves,
The Rev, David W Bennett is the vice pastor.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH OF RAHWAY
At the 9:45 o'clock Service of Worship on Sunday.

Aug. 8, The Rev William L Fredcrickson, the pastor,
will preach the morning sermon.

The church is located on the corner of Elm and
Esterbrook Aves.

TRINITY UNITED METHODIST CHURCH OF
RAHWAY

The congregation of Trinity will worship at the Se-
cond Presbyterian Church at 1221 New Brunswick Ave.,
Rahway, at 9:30 a.m for Summer Union Services on Sun-
day. Aug. 8.

Trinity's Fair Workshop continues to meet each
Thursday at the church from 10 a.m to 2 p.m.

Trinity is located ai the corner of E. Milton Ave. and
Main St.

ZION LUTHERAN CHURCH OF CLARK
; The main worship on Sunday. Aug, 8, will be at 9:15
• a.m.» and will continue at this hour during the summer
.months.

The Sunday School is in recess, and win resume on
Sept, \2* Children aged three and over may be enrolled in
the Sunday School for the fall term by telephoning the
church office at 3S2-7320.

The church is located at 559 Raritan Rd,
Rev* Joseph 73. KuchariV a the pastor.

Doing your best
all you can ask

PANGS OF GUILT
Q. 1 have pangs of guilt about the way my children

live. I have guilt feelings about my 21 year-old daughter
who has anorexia and is depressed. I still feel like I have to
be her mother, counselor, leaning post, friend-everything
1 always was. I want to be relieved of this ever-present
guilt feeling over the way my children have turned out.
Not one of them will go to church. My husband and I at-
tend regularly, and they were brought up to be good
Christians. Now they act like atheists. 1 find it so hard to
cope in today's world.

A.. All any parents can do in the rearing of children is
simply to do their best, setting before them a good exam-
ple, seeking to guide them to right thinking and attitudes.

If the children repudiate this when they come of age,
they arc making choices on their own. You need have no
guilt feelings about this outcome. Just be available to
them always, and surround them with your love. Concen-
trate on filling your own mind with positive, hopeful
thoughts. Visualize a good outcome for your children.

We are sending you our booklet, "The Rewards ol
Positive Living/* which is free to any reader of this col-
umn. Write to us at Box 500, Pawling, N. Y. 12564.

* * *
WEIGHT GOES UP

Q. What is the answer for obesity and overweight in
the realm of the mental and spiritual? If what we think
and believe, instead of what we eat, has the uppermost ef-
fect on our physical bodies, then what is the answer to
this problem?

In the past four years my weight has gone up
drastically, and it scares me. I'm only five-feet, four-inches
but my weight is nearly 200 pounds, and I cannot cope
with it.

A. A good medical checkup is important to begin
with. Then the main way to cope with obesity is to
change from a negative to a positive attitude toward the
problem. To do thai, picture in your mind precisely what
you want to look like, the weight you want to be and ex-
actly when you expect to attain that weight.

Affirm, **l can cope. I am coping." Make a habit of
this procedure. Then you will be able to regulate food in-
take to reach your goal.

* * *
If there is something you would like to ask Dr. and

Mrs. Pealc, write to them at Box 500, Pawling, N. Y.
12564.

* • *
THERE'S AN ANSWER! is distributed by

the Foundation for Christian Living, Pawling, N. Y.
12564

-All rights reserved-

Roselle Park
sets 'Feelings'

V^^

FUTURE CHEFS • Clark Summer School students explore all facets of cooking under
the direction of Mrs. Sherri D'Amlco. Serving breakfasts, lunches and dinners and
cleaning up coupled with learning balanced diets, .make cooking a worthwhile course.
At the "Open House" everyone takes part.

Troop No. 47 holds
Court of Honor

The A. D. A. P. T.
(Alcohol and Drug Abuse
Prevention Task) Commit-
tee of Roselle Park will
sponsor the movie, "Feel-
ings,** by Joseph Martin, on
Tuesday, Aug. 17, between
7:45 and 9:45 p.m. at the
Church of the Assumption
auditorium on Chiego PI.
and Westfield Ave., Roselle
Park.

Alliance Church
to conduct

Bible School
The Clark Alliance

Church at 2 Denman Ave.,
Clark, will conduct a Vaca-
tion Bible School from
Monday to Friday. Aug. 9
to Aug. 13, Boys and girls
from three years of age to
those in sixth grade may at-
tend the sessions, beginning
at 9 o'clock each morning,
and closing at 11:30 o'clock.

The theme this year will
be "Come Follow Jesus."
Bible stories, along with
fun, games, crafts, and
refreshments, are planned.

For pre-registration or
additional information,
please telephone The Rev.
David Arnold, the pastor, at
388-1272.

The film will be presented
free of charge. "Feelings" is
the property of the John E.
Runnells Hospital in
Berkeley Heights.

A. D. A. P. T. Committee
member, Joseph Moore,
will facilitate a discussion
following the film. The
committee encourages fami-
ly attendance.

Bahway "troop No. 47 or"
the Boy Scouts, sponsored
b'y the city's First
Presbyterian Church, held a
Court of Honor in the
Scout Room on July 20.

New Scouts, William
Hornyak, Andrew Kri-
venko, Anthony Marsella,
David Maris, Jeffrey Rivcy,
Michael Santatigelo,
Richard Shcely, Robert
Skotek, Christopher Slater,
Daniel Stone and Adam
Thomas were sworn in J>y
Scoutmaster Ed McLean.

The following boys
received merit badges

BON VOYAGE - Mr. and Mrs. Vincent J. Brady, and their son, James Brady, of 125
Hart St., Clark, are off tor the Bahamas aboard the "S. S. Oceanic," sailing out of New
York harbor bound tor a week's holiday cruise to Nassau, the capital of the Bahama
Islands and Bermuda.

Children's unit
elects Forrell
Former Clark Council

man, Joseph Farrelli the
manager of Public Rela-
tions for Blue Cross of New
Jersey, was elected as the
president of the Board of
Trustees^ of the United
Family and the Children's
Society of Plainficld.

The agency provides
family counseling and adop-
tive services.

Mr. Farrell has served as
a member of the agency's
board for more than three
years, and was active in its
auxiliary group for 10
years.

TIP TO MOTORISTS
Drive carefully—It may a»v«

the life of a child and you from
a lifetime of nightmare*.

Vail-Deane hires
Mrs. Isoksen

Wenr 1*» fttoaat tfc* fattm
«Bd sum atonl tfc* pfwunt uri
oar

than
mm

The appointment of
Clark resident, Mrs. Judith
Ann Isaksen, of Mountain-
view Rd.» as a first-grade
teacher, was announced by
Headmaster Ralph Scozza-
fava of the Vail-Deane
School in Mountainside.
Mrs. Isaksen, the former
Miss Judith Gustafson, was
certified as an elementary
teacher with a bachelor of
arts degree earned at
Glassboro State College.

Since 1966 she has been
employed by the Springfield
Board of Education. This
past year, she was responsi-
ble for administering the

8

gets degree
A Rahwayan, Lynda

Ruin Fegtey of 230 E.
Grand Ave., recently
received her master of arts
degree from Rutgers
University.

WmSt KKESRYTERIAN OttiftCH OF RAHWAY
v Xferftmjt Worship «m Suwaiiy* Aug. 8, at fc30

o'clock* will be held at the Second TO&yterian Church at
1221 "New Brunswick Ave^ ftahway* with the Firct

Presbyterian and Trinity United Methodist Church of
Rahway congregations as the guests. The Summer Wor-
ship will be conducted by Second Presbyterian^ pastor.
The Rev, Harold E, Van Horn.

Sunday, Aug. 15, Union Services win be held at the
First Presbyterian thurch.

Tuesday, Aug. 10* at 10 a.mT, the Women's Assn. will
continue with its workshops Participants should bring*
sandwich. A feev#*j& witl be served.

Wednesday* Aog, U , « 7:45:&
Edocstkwv Committee will eonvewe in the Church
L i b r a r y . ' ""• ̂ v . . - : . ;•'; , • ••••, ^ - < ';

The FifU PrcJbyterUn Chutch is located at the cor-
ner of W. Grand AVR and Church St.

The Rev. Robert C Pewlcy is the

reading program for
kindergarten to fifth grades,
and was a compensatory-ed-
ucation teacher.

Mrs. Isaksen has been an
officer/Of the Rahway Area
Junior Womatfs Club and a
member of -the Rahway
Woman's Club. She is mar-
ried and has two daughters.

The Vail-Deane School is
a co-educational, college
preparatory school, for
kindergarten to 12th grade.
The school will open this
fall in the former
Beechwood School on
Woodacres Dr.

presented by the Assistant
Scoutmasters Dave
Buchanan, John Harrigan
and Roy Kenricks, Jr.:
Mark Saliga, communica-
tions: Michael Danko, cycl-
ing; John Kline, Frank and
Christopher McGowan,
swimming; Philip Prasser,
Raymond Aleman and
John Forys, lifesaving, and
Philip Prasser and Ray-
mond Aleman, for a mile
swim.

A slide presentation of re-
cent camping trips was also
shown.

Cable
to view
itself

Suburban Cablevision
will cablecast "Suburban
Cable and You,** the mon-
thly program designed to in-
form subscribers about the
services of Suburban
Cablevision, on Tuesday,
Aug. 10, at 8 p.m., via
TV-3. Subscribers may
telephone and ask ques-
tions.

"Suburban Cable and
You** will be repeated on
Monday, Aug. 16, at 8 p-m.
and on Monday, Aug. 23,
at 8 p.m. via TV-3. During
the repeat cablecasts no
telephone calls will be ac-
cepted.

BOX SEATS
The only people who liiten to

both sidea of an arguinant ar«
Ota ntxt-docvr neighbor*.

JoffNttS *OTk In order for us to adequately prepare
the Community Calendar, all events for the following
week should be submitted by S p.a. on the WEMSBAY
before you would like them to appear.

RAHWAY
-MONDAY, AUG. v •- City Council, Regular Meeting.

8 p.tn.f Council Chambers, City Hall; 10:30 a.m. to noon,
jQame Day, Public library.

--WIDHB&A?, AUG. 11 ~ Children may may make
monster mobile, Public Library, 10:30 to 11:30 a.m.

-THURSDAY, AU0.12 - Board of Education, Caucus,
Superintendent's Office, Junior High School, 8 pjn.; sum-
mer activities at library concluded, 10:30 iLm. to noon.

-MONDAY, AUG. 16 •- Board of Education. Regular
Meeting, 8 p.m., Roosevelt School auditorium.

-MONDAY, AUG. 23 - Chamber of Commerce, El
Bodegon Restaurant, 7 p.m.

"TUBDAV, StFT. I -• City Council Pre-Meeting Con-
ference, 7:30 tj.m., Council Chambers, City HaU.

.-WEDNESDAY, SEW. I « ALL RAHWAY SCHOOLS
OPEN.
--MONDAY, SIPt. IS « City Council, Regular Meeting, 8
p.m.. Council Chambers, City Hall.

.-THURSDAY, SOT. U - Board of Education, Caucus,
8 p.m.. Superintendent's Office, Junior High School, 8
p.m.

-MONDAY, SEPT. 20 - Board of Education, Regular
Meeting, 8 p.m., Roosevelt School auditorium.

-MONDAY, SEPT. V - Chamber of Commerce, El
Bodegon Restaurant, 7 pjn.

CLARK
-NOW TO TUBOAY, AUG. 31 - Clark Art Assn.

displaying winning paintings of Spring Show at Clark of-
fice of the United Counties Trust Co., 315 Central Ave.,
viewing, Monday to Friday, 8:30 a.m. to 2:30 p.m., Satur-
day, 9 a.m. to noon.

-MONDAY TO.rtlDAY, AUG. S TO * « Osceola
Presbyterian Church Vacation Bible School, 9 a.m. to
noon.

-MONDAY TO HUDAY, AUG. 9 YO 13 » Clark Alliance
Church Vacation Bible School, 9 to 11:30 a.m. Telephone
The Rev. David Arnold, 388-1272 for information.

-TUESDAY, AUG. 10 - Elementary Board of Educa-
tion, Special Meeting, 7:30 p.m., Administration Building,
Schindler Rd., Re-organization of Schools.

-FRIDAY TO SUNDAY, AUG. 13 TO 15 - Osceola
Presbyterian Church Youth Group Summer Camping
Retreat, Pine Barrens. Permission slips and money due no
later than Aug. 1.

-MONDAY, AUG. 16 - Township Council, Regular
Meeting, 8 p.m., Council Chambers, Municipal Building.

-TUBDAY, AUG. 34 - Elementary Board of Educa-
tion, Regular Meeting, 8 p.m., Administration Building,
Schindler Rd.

. -TUESDAY, MSEPT. ? -• FRESHMAN ORJENTA
TION DAY, ARTHUft L. JOHNSON REGIONAL
HIGH SCHOOL. Regional Board of Education, Regular
Meeting, 8 p.m., Instructional Media Center, Johnson.
Township Council, Executive Session, 8 p.m.. Council
Chambers. . ,

-WEDNESDAY, SEPT. * - OPENING DAY FOR ALL
PUBLIC SCHOOLS IN CLARK FIRST DAY ^OF
SCHOOL FOR FRESHMEN AND SOPHOMORES
AT MOTHER SETON REGIONAL HIGH SCHOOL
IN CLARK.

-THURSDAY, SEPT. » » FIRST DAY OF SCHOOL
FOR JUNIORS AND SENIORS AT MOTHER
SETON REGIONAL HIGH SCHOOL IN CLARK.

-TUESDAY, SEPT. 14 » Elementary Board of Educa-
tion, Regular Meeting, 8 p.m., Administration Building,
Schindler Rd.

-MONDAY, SEPT. 20 - Township Council, Regular
MeetingT8 p.m., Council Chambers, Municipal Building.

-TUBDAY, S i n . 11 -Regional Board of Education,
Adjourned Meeting, 8 pjn., Arthur L. Johnson Regional
High School Media Center.

-YUlSfiAY, SBt. SI » Elementary Board of Educa-
tion, Regular Meeting, 8 p.m.. Administration Building,
Schindler R d . , , ,
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Marik
i
ecruit

t
The vice president of

Public Affairs of Merck and
Co., Inc. in Rahway,
Robert Marik, who haŝ
been appointed by the
United AVay. of -Union
County to serve as its
general campaign chairman
for the 19SM9S3 fundrfls-
ing campaign, .will be
responsible tor the recruit-
ment of his campaign team,
acting as a liaison between
local corporation* and the
Unite) Way *nd the super-
vision of t!be swiff

Mr; MwSk serves on the
boatd of directors «f \ht
Union County Chamber <rf

Commerce, and served the
United Way last year as a
loaned executive chairman.

Before joining Merck and
Co., Inc., he was the direc-
tor of strategic planning for
the TRW Energy Products
Group m Los Angeles. He
also served as sn assfet&nt
secretary of administration
and management in the
Dept. of Health, Education
and Welfare in Washing-
ton, D.C

TBSS XNtt tJLSf

Kopik. 52, of
Rahway, (lied Monday, Ju-
tyii«26* >n the Rahway
Hospital after a long illness.

He" was a life-long resi-
dent of Rahway.

Mr. Kopik had operated
the Rahway Electric Motor
Repair Co. for 35 years.

He had been the past
commander of Mulvey-
Ditmars Post No. 681 of the
Veterans of Foreign Wars
and had been a life member*
He bad also been a past
commander of the Union
County Veterans of
Foreign Wars.

' Mr. Kopik had also been
a judge advocate of the
Veterans of Foreign Wars
prior to his death.
" He had been a member of
Pup Tent No. 5 of the-
Military Order of the
Cooties; the American Rifle
ftish:; the Deutscher Club
of Clark and the Rabway
Republican Club.
"'•'Mr. Kopik was an Army
veteran of the Korean Con-
flict.

Surviving are his widow,

Mrs. Doris- Kroenta- Kopik,
the state president of the
Ladies Auxiliary to the
Veterans of Foreign Ware;
his mother, Mrs. Mary
Kopik of Rahway; a

Mrs. Harriet Tandy, 85,
St. Paul's member

Mrs. Harriet Little Tan-
dy, 85, of Forked River,
formerly of Rahway, died
Sunday, July 25, at the
Bayvicw Convalescent
Center after a long illness.

Born in Rahway, she had
moyed to Forked River in
1972,.

Mrs. Tandy had been a
member of St. Paul's
Episcopal Church in
Rahway.

She had also been a
member of the Rahway
-Golden" Afie-Club-

She was the widow of
Frederick Tandy, wlio died
in 195?. „

Surviving a y e a daughter,
Mrs. Ella O'fcrjco of Forked
River, four grandchildren
and five great-grandchil-
dren.

Henry Roeseh, 79,
operator

John Kopik
brother, Thomas Kopik of
Linden and two sisters,
Mrs. Anne Hunt of
Lakewood and Mrs. Marie
Lobb of Glendale, Ariz.

Zimmerman, 39,
electrocution victim

ex
Henry F. Roeseh; 79, of

Rahway, died Sunday, July
25, at the RattwaTHospital
after a brief illness.

Bom in Germany, he had
come to Rahway 60 years
ago.

Until his retirement in
1968, Mr. £o3sch had been
employed for 34 years as a
chemical operator for
General Aniline and Film
Corp- -of Linden.

He had been a member of

the Deutscher club of
Clark and the Sanger Club
of Irvington.

Surviving arc his widow,
Mrs. Mary paJ Roeseh; a
son, Alfred Rocsch of Flem-
ington; two brothers, Fritz
and Andrew Roeseh of
Rahway; three sisters, Mrs.
Eugenia Andul of Little
Silver, and ̂ r e . Elsie Rooco
and Mrs- Eva Pascale, both
of Rahway, ^ d two grand-
children.

Mrs. Foley, 77,
man's sister

^ R. Zimmer-
mann,' 39, of Rahway, died
Saturday, July 24, at
B a y o n n e Hospital in
Bayonne after being elec-
trocuted while making
eS&cgency repairs at the
Bayonne Army Ocean Ter-
rnjnal.
... JJorn in Elizabeth, he had
rhqved to Rahway 11 years
ago.''
, Mr. Zimmerrnann had
been an electrician for the
ocean terminal. '"
" He• -liad also been a.
member of the Interna-

No. 337 of the American
Legion and the 117th Na-
tional Guard Cavalry in
Westfield.

He had been a communi-
cant of St John the Apostle,
R. C. Church of Clark-
Linden.

Mr. Zimmermann had
been a scoutmaster of
Troop No. 330 of the Boy
Scouts.

Surviving are his widow,
Mrs. Patricia Burns Zim-
mermann; two sons,
William and r Christopher.
Zimrnermann* both at

• Mrs. Louise E.1 Buttner
Foley, 77, of Elizabeth, died
Monday, July 26, at the Eli-
zabeth General Medical
Center in Elizabeth after a
brief illness.

Born in Orange, she had
lived in Jersey City before
she had moved to Elizabeth
41 years ago.

Mrs. Foley had been a
communicant of St. Mary's
R. C. Church in Elizabeth.

She had been a member
of the Farley Towers Social
Club.
' Mrs. Foley*s husband.

William Foley, died in
1974.

Surviving are two
daughters, Mrs. Patricia
Kozierowski of Roselle
Park and Kjre. Mary Schir-
ripa of North Plainfield; a
son, William H. Foley, Jr.
of Brando^ pia.; A brother.
The Rev. £jsgr. Charles H.
Buttner, the pastor emeritus
of St. Marled R. C Church
of Rahway; two sisters,
Mrs. Elertort Kulzy of
Bloomfieki a nd Mrs. Loret-
ta Conroy of Roselle Park
and eight grandchildren.

tional Brotherhood of Elec- home and a sister, Mrs.

Elizabeth &..
55/ of 298 E.

Steams St., Rah way, died
July 21, at theteJy, y , h

Rahway .Hospital after a
long illness.

;.Born in Mbrgamown, N.
C î;': she had moved to
Railway 26 years ago from
Colonia;
^ Wilson had been a. ^ t l Wilson had been a
lafeoratory technician at E.
%,Sijuibb and Sons Co. of
New-Brunswick for 35
years*.; V: \ : . .

-She had been a .TOember
6f ,the .Ebehezer African
Methodist* Episcopal

technician
• • • ' . , . t

Church of Rahway, where
she had been -a Sunday
School teacher and had
been. a member of the
Celestial Choir.
..'Surviving are her hus-

band, James E. Wilson; two
sons, James E. Wilson Jr.
and Eric Wilson, both of
Rahway; her mother," Mrs.
Violet Greenley of Colohia;
a brother, Bert Chamfers,
Jr. of Heightstown and
three sisters, Mrs. Alberta
Faisonof South Plflinfield
and Mrs. Laura Jennin^
a*nd Mrs. Viyiflh Mickey,
both of Colonia.

Mrs. Hollander, 80,
born iii Germany

Mr. Sleek, 75
Benjamin Slack, 75, of

North Miami Beach, Fla.,
died Thursday, July 22, ai
the Miami Heart-Institute
in Miami.

Born in Poland, Mr.
SlaCk had resided in
Brooklyn and Newark,
before he had moved to
North Miami Beach seven
years ago.

He had been the owner
of -Gottlieb's Market of
Newark for 35 years and
had retired seven years ago.

He had also been a
member of the Workmen's
Circle of Florida.

Mr. Slack is survived by
his widow, Mrs. Betty Slack
of North Miami Beach; a
son. Jay Stack of Clark; a
daughter, Mrs. Fran Rems
of Edison; a brother, Sam
Slack of Brooklyn and five
grandchildren.

Booklet gives
tips on halting

drug abuse
Rep. Matthew J. Rin-

aldo, whose district includes
Rahway and Clark, today
announced. the availability
of a Dept. of Health and
Human Services* publica-
tion for young people on
the issues of drug-abuse and
alcohol.

The 64-page, illustrated
booklet, entitled, This Side
Up," is designed to provide
information about the ef-
fects and risks associated
with drugs such as alcohol,
tobacco, marijuana, seda-
tives and hallucinogens.

U also provides advice on
how young people can resist
peer pressure to take drugs,
according to Rep. Rtnaldo,
a member of the House
Select Committee on" Nar-
cotics Abuse and Control.

Copies of the booklet
may be obtained by writing
to Rep. Matthew J.
Rinaldo, 2338 Rayburn
Building, Washington, D.
C, 20515, or by telephon-
ing his district' office at
687-4235.

Mrs. Martha Herzig
Hollander, 80, t>f Clark,
died Sunday, July 25; at the
Rahway Hospital after a
brief illness.

Bom in Germany, Mrs.
Hollander had been
brought to the United
States as a young girl, and
had lived in New York*
Long Island and St.
Petersburg, Fla., before she

had moved to Clark in
1 9 6 8 . • ~

She Was the widow of
Frederick Hollander, who
died in l9$o.

Surviv ing are ' two
daughters, Mrs. Virginia
Hunter of VVflton, Conn.,
and Mre. Elaine Benedict of
Teaneck; & gister, Mrs. Elsie
Mettler of Clark and four
grandchildren.

Ralph Jones, 64,
62 years in Rcihwoy

Atom Tabloid

Of
\ died ^ednesd&K

July • 'r-21 *, at i Rahway
Hospjtfll after a brief illness:

Elizabeth, she
in Union GitV f oi-

iO ySifS then iftLindenfor
SO years- befdre she had
moved to Rahway six years;

her? retirementin
Aumarm had

Mr*

, at the
Sum-

it aSSrii lottg,fllrtea,
3Soe» ifl RfcnWiy, she had

TnWiBrttrife City until 1954
when she had' moved to

m̂
- y k i H ^ S h e Had been a

secretary of Local No. 330
of the fitstillera Co.-Ltd;-x

kumann had been
• Secretary of the

Stanley" A s m of Linden. -
" Surviving are her \hus-

band/ Henry- Aumahn;, a
son, Arthur Li: pustofsoaiof

a brother. Louts
Runway; six
••-. and.* three

; Ralph Jones, 64; of 1479
Main St., Rahway, died
Wednesday, July 71, at the
Rahway Hospital after a
long illness.
' Born in Savannah, Ga.,
he had been brought to
Rahway 62 years ago.
\ Mr. Jones was ff World

War n Aitny veteran.
Surviving are his widow,

Mrs. Edythe Natson Jones;
five sons, Richard, Kevin

Mr. Silyciy, 83
^Oeorgft Silvay, • 83, of

Linden, died Tuesday, July
27, at tbe Elizabeth General
Medical Center in Elizabeth
after a brief illness.
«* Born-in Bayonne, he had
moved to Linden 47 years

' a g o . - ; , ..*.. - :•••• .

otJnffl his rfcttfement in
19S7,. Mr, SDvay Ttad'been
employed for 4 0 yeais as an
opefations enpervisor' for
Exxon in Xtnden. He had

in
Steph&nfe Fissecki;

S1 ,;> of -pirfledin. Fla^
!foTffier)y -of?: Ctefk; 4ied
-Toaatey,-Jury-27. after a-
br ie f i l l f t e s . ;- •'•'",.; •. -:.;•..-C

Claric for 40 years -and in
River vTor 40 yeans

before she tad moved id

died

two

Stantey

S u r v T y i t t g • a r e
M Ki

of - linden -aftdsak Mrs.
;

Jotar griwSdiBdren wad six

S«eet!ftnr
Gfeg&ry

i

and Dennis Jones, all of
Rahway; Ralph Jones of
Elizabeth and Douglas
Jones of Linden;, four
daughters, the Misses
Patrici^ Marlene and
Tanya Jones, all of
Rahway ̂  andBarbara Jones
of Elizabeth; his mother,
Mrs. Flossfc ;Scott-of New
York; a sister, Ida Carol
Jones of New York and 11
grandchildren.

also been a member of Exx-
on's Quarter Century Club.

Surviving are^tis widow,
Mrs. Ann Toby Silvay; a
ton, George Silvay of
Rahway; a daughter, Mrs.
Marie Guerrero of St.
Augustiric, Fla.; two
brother^ prank and Joseph
Silvay, both of Bayonne; six
grandchildren and two
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Prui
Diane Madden
A Clark native, Diane R.

Madden, the daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Mad-
den of Clark, was promoted
to interior-space analyst in
the architect-engineer's divi-
sion of The Prudential In-
surance of Newark.

Miss Madden joined the
Prudential Property and
Casualty Insurance ir\-
Holmdel in 1977. After four
years there, she transferred
to Newark as the assistant
interior designer, the posi-
tion she held until this pro-
motion.

A 1972 alumna of Arthur
L, Johnson Regional High
School in Clark, she earned
her bachelor's degree in fine
arts at Kean College in
Union in 1976.

She currently resides in
West End.

trs lauds
Lisa L VHolo
A city -woman. Lisa L.

Vitolo of 483 Sycamore St.,
recently was awarded her
bachelor of arts degree from
Rutgers University.

tO A FAULT
tmxw u » hlfth, bat the

ff tax m*n p*y !• o«
view *Bd bad

All

• • • •
A poll teems accurate

when its remits are for
year tide.

The newly-renovated
" M a t i a n o Recreation
Center of Elizabeth was
dedicated by numerous
public officials, including
Elizabeth Mayor Thomas
G. Dunn and Arthur J.
Grisi, the county manager,
on July 22.

Dignitaries, including the
members of the U n ion
County Board of Chosen
Freeholders and the county
Parks and Recreation Advi
sory Board, attending the
ribbon-cutting ceremony in
front of the new park
building, which houses the
park office, gaming tables,
rest rooms and storage
space.
- The members o£ the staff
of the Union County Dept.
of Parks and Recreation,
many of whom were
responsible for obtaining
the federal monies which
financed the project, stood
in the background while the
speakers praised the com-
pleted project.

Mattano has the distinc
tion of being the last such
project in the country
financed by the "50-40-10"

..system, before recent
federal funding cuts wcrit\
into effect. Under that
system, 50%, or $372,000,
of the cost was provided by
G reen Acres, 40 %, or
$297,600, came from the
federal government and on-
ly 10%. or$8Q,076.66jiad
to be provided from county
coffers. The total cost of the
project was $749,676.66.
Site work was done by the
Mercer Contracting Co. of
Trenton.

The improvements began
with the demolition of the
existing fieldhouse. A new
wood-theme tot lot was
constructed, featuring a
spray pool and modern
playground equipment. The
senior-citizens area was
landscaped and provided
with eight game tables and
benches.

Other facilities built in
the project included- two
shuffieboard courts, two
horseshoe courts, a bocce
ball court, a baseball and

"fts Short Hflte resident,
Natan ftotmefst, 15, a
papa of Irene Abttfnof
Railway, won an Exhibi-
tion A ward from the THni-
ty College of Mttfifcinloo-
don for achieving the
highest honots marks for
hfe &sde No, 6 ptsfto tx-

Tte Swsrd consisted of a
certificate of tpeel&I

f The Short Hifo tto-
tJefit k the first American Sft

10 ye*?* to wbt

He took his examination
at Rahway .center, which is
one;of the Imndreds of ex-
amihation centers throu-
ghout the world, and is
among thousands of stu-
dent musicians who* par-
ticipated tht£ year

The examination pro-
which indudei all m-

encourages
tot aim for the

highest tbndank of perfor-
mance and rnusicianshrp.
The examiners are sent out
from the United Kingdom,
a&id tfe tpedsny trained by
hn

softball field, complete with
bleachers and backstops,
bur lighted tennis courts,
14 picnic tables, eight grills,

new parking lot for 60
vehicles and a .new pathway
system.

Mr. Grisi began the pro-
ceedings by introducing
some of those present, and
explained the initial plans to
improve the park were
begun in 1971. "This park is
for the people of Elizabeth
and the citizens of Union
County to use and enjoy,"
he said.

Mayor Dunn had only
nothing but praise for the
efforts of the county to
secure funds to rebuild Mat-
tano Park.

The mayor said, "By par-
ticipating in this facility's
grand opening today, ihe
past criticism I had about
the county's concern for
young people in urban areas
has been taken away."

He termed the park a de
mnnstration of "the ge-
nuine, sincere co-operation
which exists between local
government and the higher
echelons of government."

After the ribbon-cutting.
Freeholder Chairwoman
"Blanche Banasiak made the
closing remarks. Noting
Elizabeth is the largest city
in the county, Mrs.
Banasiak said, "There was a
serious need for such a
facility here in Elizabeth."

FOR AN EASIER LIFE - Aloxlan Brothers Hospital Of
Elizabeth therapist. Jane Fikslin, teft, and Respiratory
Evaluation and Support Program co-ordlnator. Susan
Felskl, a registered riurse. third from right, demonstrate
proper chest-percussion technique on patient, Paul
McWilliams ot Irvington Looking on, left to right, are:
Connie McWilliams of Irvington. Kay Balls of Elizabeth,
Estelle A. David of Carteret and Dorothy Speak of
Rahway.

'Y' to hold
Health Fair
on Oct. 24

Through t he combined
efforts of the Elizabeth
General Medical Center in
Elizabeth, the Eastern
Union County Young
Men's-Young Women's He-
brew Assn. and the Juvenile
Diabetes Foundation, there
will be a Health Fair on

A walking tour of the
park followed.

Area residents who at-
tended the ceremony noted
the park had undergone a
"metamorphosis" ihrough
the renovation. The day of
the ceremony the park was
filled with mothers and
their children, senior
citizens and teenagers, all
participating in the ac-
tivities designed especially

.for them.

Sunday, Oct. 24, from 10
a.m. to 4 p.m. at the Union
YMYWHA on Green La.,
Union.

Co-ordinating this day
are Barbara Byers, a
registered nurse and the
director of community and
employe education cervices,
of Elizabeth General; lay
Levin, the physical educa-
tion director of the YM-
YWHA, and Frances Del
Sordo, the president of the
Juvenile Diabetes Founda-
tion. There will be.a variety
of free screenings, lectures
and a distribution of
materials.

For further information
and/or to volunteer your
assistance, please telephone
Levin at 289-8112.

OPPORTUNISTS
Ambition, plM a fixed eounu,*

•i^ th* majpiau that gU thlngi
coming your way.

A mosquito's Idea of
the happy hunting ground
is a nudin camp.

Because we understand
Lehror-Crabiel Funeral Hone

David B. Croblsl
Jotaph D. Glbllltco

E William fiannatt,

388-1874

Clubs

Libraries

•Dance
Clubs

• Ski Clubs
The Atom Tabloid

» 574-1200

Gett ing Marr ied?
YB...WE IYER

PRINT PERSONALIZED
Nuptial Mass Books

\

75 Mass Books

55.
CAMERA READY

+ TAX
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: Jersey
needs full tax cut

The first big* dividends
from the personal income
tax cut bill approved by
Congress last year have just
started to come in and
already^there are proposals
to repeal next year's reduc-
tions, reports Rep. Matthew
J. Rlnaldo, whose district
includes Rahway and
Clark.

When Congress voted for
the cuts in a bid to pump
more money into the
private sector to stimulate
economic growth, it trimm-
ed income taxes by 59b as
of last Oct. 1, and an extra
10% this past July I. A
third cut, an additional
10%, is scheduled for Fri-
day. July 1, 1983, Rep.
RinaWo added.

Now a smalLgroup is try-
ing to generate support to
take away the final 10% cut
and, in effect, raise taxes to
cover increased federal
spending, the representative
noted.

What they fail to realize
is the average taxpayer
would bear the brunt of a
rollback. Upper-income tax-
payers have already
benefited substantially from
the immediate reduction in
the top tax rate from 70 to
50%. They would lose the
least. The third year of the

cut represents only 12% of
the three-year reduction for
the highest income fami-
lies -5200.000 plus-while it
amounts to more than one-
third of the tax cut for
every other taxpayer, the
legislator pointed out.

Furthermore, the pro
repeal forces fail to unders-
tand the connection bet
ween the increasing tax
burden and the deteriora-
tion of the economy. The
American people are
already paying, on the
average, 45' out of every
dollar1 they earn for taxes.
Last year, every American
had to work an average of
five months just to earn
enough to pay all his taxes,
he added.

"Taxpayers are fed up
with big government, big
spending and big taxes. I
have proposed Congress set
aside the first 90 days of
each session solely for the
purpose of reviewing
federal programs, and
eliminating those that are
no longer effective or serv-
ing a useful purpose. Much
can be done to reduce
federal spending and taxes
without cutting vital social
programs or hampering our
efforts to build a strong

defense," the Republican
noted.

If taxes had not been cut
lost year, and inflation con-
tiriUed through 1984 at the
annual average rate set by
the Carter Administra-
t ion-10 ,4% -a median-
income family would need
to earn $30,581 in 1984 just
to maintain 1980 real in-
come. Even though
$30,581 would buy no more
in 1984 than $20,586 would
in 1980, the family's tax
burden would jump from
$2,108 to $4,042 as a result
of the progressive tax rate
structure. Thus the family's
real after-tax income (in
1980 dollars) would have
declined by $613 in 1984
under a continuation of the
policies of the previous ad-
ministration, the lawmaker
explained.

The tax cuts will have a
profound economic impact
on New Jersey. The cuts
will mean a savings of $4.5
billion to New Jersey tax-
payers by the end of 1984,
and $9.4 billion over the
next four years, according
to a report by the Office of
Management and Budget,
he noted.

The cumulative effect
of the program will save the

average New Jersey family
thousands of dollars in
taxes during the balance of
the decade. Much of those
savings will go to the
average wage earner.
Middle-income Americans,
who pay 72% of all federal
individual income taxes,
will receive about 70% of
the tax cut, the represen-
tative said.

"The three-year, across-
the-board tax cut, afid. the
guarantee it will be indexed
to the rate of inflation,
beginning in 1985, mean
American taxpayers will be
assured tax relief for the
rest of the decade unless a
new Congress decides to
raise the rates. I am strongly
opposed to repealing the
third-year tax cut, and will
vole against the proposal if
it comes to the floor of the
House for consideration."
he concluded.

Suburban
to 'spy'
Hospice

"The Spychala Report"
will be cablecast on
Wednesday, Aug. II , at 8
p.m., via TV-3, Suburban
Cablcvision's local-
origination channel .
Tonight's repeat will focus
on death and dying.

The host, Paul Spychala,
visits the Hospice, home
care for the terminally ill.
The Hospice is based at
Mountainside Hospital.

Don't burn

from clothes
Supplied by the Union
County Co-operative

Extension Service
Summer clothes re-

quire more frequent

PUBLIC NOTICE

washing, pressing or air-
ing than clothes'for other
seasons, according to
Carolyn Y. Healey. the
Union County Co-
operative Extension Ser-
vice's home economist.

Heat-and humidity in-
crease the amount of
perspiration which is ab1

sorbed by clothing. Aside

PUBLIC NOTICE

SEALED BIDS will bo received from bidder* daHlflod uftd*r NJ.S.A.
27: 7-35.1 ot wq.. in the Hearing Room, Room 140-Mato Building,
Transportation Building, 1035 Parkway Auanut, Tmton, Now Jersey
until 10.-00 a.m. August 19, 1992 and opened and road for

Bridge Painting Contract No. 82-3. Ckantng and Painting of five {5)
bridge* on Routes 3 and 24 to tha city of Summit; Totvnsrup of
MUlbum; Boroughs of East Rutherford and Rutherford; Town of

Secaucus; B«rgen, Essex, Hudson and Union Counties. D.P. 528

Tha Department, In accordance with Title VI Chrd Rights Act of 1964."
78 Star 252.42, U.S.C.. 49 CFR,. Parts 21 and 23 Issued pursuant to
such Act, and Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 will afford
minority business enterprises full opportunity to submit bids In response
to this Invitation and u/fll not discriminate against any bidder on the
grounds of race, color, sax. national origin, or handicap In the contract
award.

Bidders are required to comply with tha roquteements of Public Laws
1975. c 127

Drawings, specifications and bid documents may be Inspected or ob-
tained for a fee of $7.50 for fuD size drawings, at the Bureau of Contract
Admftlstration, 1035 Parkway Avenue, Trenton, New Jersey, 06625,
during business hours. Names and addresses of prospective bidden for
this project may be acquired by telephoning Area Coda 609-984-6812
during business hours.

Drawftgs and supplementary specifications may also be Impacted
(but not obtained) by contracting organizations at our various Design
Field Offices at the following locations.

1259 Route 46
Parslppany-Troy Hills, NJ
201-263.5100

325 Lfroorn Avenue
Haddonflcld. NJ
609-429-6428

Intersections Rts. 1&9.21 and22
Newark, NJ

201-648-3551

1147 Ambpy Avenue
Edison, NJ

201-499-5090

NEW JERSEY DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
BUREAU OF CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION

3t...7/29.8/5.8/12/82 F«:$HM2

C

CALL
g e t t h e j o b d o n e 574-1200

CLASSIFIED ADS APPEAR THREE TIMES
WEDNESDAY, THURSDAY & SATURDAY

WE WILL ACCEPT
YOUR VISA OR

MASTERCHU16E

from perspiration, heat
-and humidity can . set
wrinkles that may be dif-
ficult to remove.

During the heat of
summer, al! garments
should be allowed to dry
thoroughly, after remov-
ing. Don't be tempted to
put damp clothes into a
clothes hamper, as
mildew stains will result.

Water soluble stains

should be sponged im-
mediately with coot water
unless the fabric water
spots. Test a.spot on an
inside scam first. Later,
complete stairT removal
treatment- may be
necessary.

With man-made fabrics
or a combination of
natural and man-made
fibers, use a fabric
softener in the final rinse.

PUBLIC NOTICE PUBUC NOTICE

This Ordinance published herewith was introduced at a Special
mooting of the Council of tha Township of Clarit, tn the County of
Union', State of Now Jersey, hold July 29,1982 and wffl be further con-
sidered for final pastaga after public hearing at Regular Masting of said
Council ot mo Township of Clark to bs held August 16.1982 flt 8:00
P.M.
AN ORDNANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND TOWNSHIP

CLERK OF THE TOWNSHff* OF CLARK TO EXECUTE AN
AGREEMENT WITH THE COUNTY OF UNION TO MODIFY THE
INTERLOCAL SERVICES.AGREEMENT DATED DECEMBER 15.

7
WHEREAS, certato Federal funds a n potentially available to the

County of Union under Tttls 1 of ma Housing and Community Develop-
ment Act of 1974, as amended, commonly known as Community
Development Block Grant*; and

WHEREAS, It U necessary tcTamend an existing tnterlocal services
agraement for the County and Its people to benefit from this program;
and

WHEREAS, an agreement has been proposed under which the
Township of Cliirk and tha County of Union, in cooperation with other
municipalities urtD modify an Intcrlocal Sendees Program pursuant to
N:j.S.A. 4O:8A1; and

WHEREAS, tt Is tn. the best interest of the Township of Clark to enter
tnto such an agreement;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE TT RESOLVED by the Governing Body of
the Township of dark that the agreement entitled "Agreement to
Modify Interlocal Soviets Agreement* dated December 15.1974, for the
Purpose of Inserting a Description of Activities for the Eighth Year Ur-
ban County Community Development Block Grant Program, a copy of
which is attached hereto, be executed by the Mayor and Clerk in accor-
dance with the provisions of law, and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Ordinance shall take effect
tmmod&taJy "P**1 l t s enactment.

lt..8/5/82

Edward R. Padusniak,
Township Clerk

Fee:$41.44

PUBUC NOTICE P U B U C NOTICE

SHERFFSSALE *H*

SUPERIOR COURT OF NEW
JERSEY

CHANCERY DMSKWU
UNJONCOUNTY

DOCKET NO. F-4439-80
DALU-GIACOBBE INVEST^

MENT CORP.., A Corporationi-of
the State of New Jersey.,Plaint iff

vs. RICHARD GEE, ct alt..
Defendant •- •-•

OVtLACTION -"
WRIT OE EXECUTION

FOR SALE of MORTGAGED
PREMISES "

By virtue of the above-stated writ of
execution to me directed I shall ex-
pose for sale by Inlbllc vendue, .In
ROOM 207, to the Court House, in
the City of Elizabeth, NJ., on
WEDNESDAY, the 25th day of
August A.D.. 1982 at two o'clock In
the afternoon of tald day.

The property to be sold Is located
to the City of Rahway, tn the Coun-
ty of Union, and State of New
Jersey. Premises are commonly
known as 1449 Main Street,
Rahway, New Jersey. Lot No. 40 tn
Block No. 96,on the Tax Map.
Dimensions of Lot 20* x 100*. The
nearest cross street ts Lewis Street.

There ts * due approximately
$52,686.05 with Interest from
February 18,1982 and costs, There
is a full legal description on (Ha tn
the Union County Sheriffs Office.
The Sheriff reserves the right to ad
Joum this sale.

RICHARD W. KOCHANSKI.
ATTY.

CX-259-02 (DJ & RNR)

RALPH FROEHUCH
Sheriff

4t...7/29,8/5,6712,8/19782
Fee:$104.16

BLUEPRINT
Naceulty may Wtfce .mother

of Invention, but s let goal in
life la the father of- raecsu.

NOTICE OF ACTION BY
RAHWAY PLANNIT4G BOARD

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE thai
the Planntog Board of the City of
Rahumy at the conclusion of a
pubte hearing held on Tuesday
euentog. July 2 7 . 1 9 8 2 to consider
the app&caiion of Ronald and
Miriam Forleo of 1 4 1 5 Campbell
Street, Rahw&y. N J . for review and
approval of a site plan covering lots
37 and 37-A. block 4 6 5 . Tax Atlas
of the City of Rahway and for
necessary variances tn connection
with the said Site Plan, did approve
the Stto Plan and did grant the
variances sought.

Ronald and Mtrtam Forleo,
applicants

1 4 1 5 Campbell Street
Rahway. N.J

It..8/5/82 FEE:$14.28

PUBUC NOTICE

NOTICE OF ACTION BY
RAHWAY BOARD OF

ADJUSTMENT
PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that

the Board of Adjustment of the City
of Rahway at the conclusion of o
public hearing held on Monday
evening, July 19. 1982 to consider
the application of Jack W. Dcnhoto
of 1181 Main Street. Rahway. N J
for review and approval of a Site
Plan covering lot 61. block 843 and
lots 1 and 3 . block 844 Tax Atlas of
the City of Rahway and a request
for necessary variances tn conrwsc
tlon therewith, did not approve the
site Plan and did not grant the
variances sought

Jack W DcnhoUz, applicant
1181 Main Street

Rahway, NJ 07065

It... 8/5/82 FEE:$13 7

HELP WANTED

WARiHOUSI

HBP

Elizabeth based firm.
Pull union benefit* &
$142 after 30 days.
Due to our expan-
sion, we are hiring. If
you ore fa»t. effi-
cient, conscientious
and willing to work,
WE WANT YOU I!, If
pot. plsase do riot

PERSONAL
Cinftte curty wm Ihit t»st Just
$15 hks/hin. btsBs'i HstntyBnc
131 Pm>iifi|AM.,Cirt«rit

M U M !
ONE MAN BAND. PirflH ft Wad-

Jlm. . .
CSS-SS9

WJUHfD

rHOROSCOPFl
READINGS

K

MSWUUIS VAIilD
TWtX3UA»COUHCfl AUTO U P A S

a AUTO tOfiv MrAit

.6S4-9786
3S1*7133(iW

IBVD'S tpWDJG

MR
AIR COHDITIONIKG-CENTRAL ft
WINDOW 4JNITS. Qusllfcj Work.
RiaainbliPrjcw. iH

CARPENTRY
Air Conditioatn. Expcrttf instilled
1hru wilb. 22 w*« Expw., ind odd
)0PL ' ~t : ^ S t ? I486

" A m o u n t a i n a n d a r i v e r
a r e g o o d n e i g h b o r s . '

George Herbert

PUBUC NOTICE PUBUC NOTICE

This Ordinance publithed herewith was introduced at a Special
meeting of the Council of the Towruhlp of Clark, In the County of
Union. State of New Jersey, held July 29 .1982 and wtD be further con
sidered for final passage after public hearing at a Regular meeting of said
Council of the Township of Clark to be hold August 16.1982 at 8:00
P.M-
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND AND SUPPLEMENT CHAPTER 8.

ARTICLE 2 OF THE REVISED GENERAL ORDINANCES OF
CLARK.

BE IT ORDANTED by the Governing Body of the Township of Clark
that Chapter 8. ArtlcW 2, of the Revised General Ordinances of Clark.
shall be amended and supplemented as follows:

SECTION 1. Article 2 shall now be entitled Tlood Damage Proven
tion Ordinance".

SECTION 2. Sections 8-14. 8 1 5 . 8-16. 8 1 7 . and 81 19. as now
shown In Article 2. are hereby deleted In their entirety

SECTION 3. The following Sections In Article 2 shall now be iden
Ufied at follows:

Section 8 12 shaD be known as Section 8-14
Section 8-13 shall be known as Section 8-15
Section 8 18 shall be known as Section 8 17

Section 4. Section 8-9. subsection (h), shall now read as follows
(h) To prevent further unwise development tn unprotected fiodd~plabnt,
thus reducing future expenditures for protective measures.
It also hereby found that the Federal Insurance Administrator hat iden-
tified the flood plain area having special flood hazards, and has provided
water surface elevations for the 100 year flood, and has provided data
sufficient to Identify the floodway.

SECTION 5.Secton» 8 10, 8 1 1 , 8 12, 8 13. and 8-16 shall now read
as follows;
8 10 Definitions

Unless specifically defined below, works or phrases used In this or-
dinance shall be Interpreted so at to give them the meaning they have In
common usage and to give this ordlance Its most reasonable applica-
tion.

'AppeaT means a request for a review of the Construction OrftctaFs In-
terpretation of any provision of this ordinance or a request for a
variance

"Area of shallow flooding" means a designated AO or VO Zone on a
community's Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) with base flood depths
from one to three feet where a clearly defined channel does not exist,
where the path of flooding Is unpredictable and Indeterminate, and
where velocity flow may be evident.

"Area of special flood hazard" is the land tn the flood plan within a
community subject to a one percent ca greater chance of flooding In any
given year

*Sase Flood* means the flood having a one percent chance of being
equalled or exceeded In any given year.

'Development" means any man-made change to Improved or untm
proved real estate, including but not limited to buddings or other struc
turev mining, dredging, filling, grading, paving excavation or drtB&ig
operations located within the area of special flood hazard.

"Flood Insurance Rate Map" (FIRM) means the official map on which
the Federal Insurance Administration has delineated both the areas of
special flood hazards and the risk premium zones applicable to the com
munlty

"Rood Insurance Study' means the official report In which the Federal
Insurance Administration has provided flood profiles, as weQ as the

Flood hazard Boundary-Floodway Map and the water surface elevation
of the base flood.

Tloodway" means the channel of a river or other watercourse and the
adjacent land areas that must be reserved tn order to discharge the bas«
flood without cumulatively Increasing the water surface «lo/&non more
than 0 2 foot.

•Mobile home" see deftnrUon of Trailer" tn Chapter 27 Zoning The
use of mobile homes is specifically prohTbitod In any district of Clark
Township.

"New Construction" means structures for which the "start of construe
tton* commenced on or after the effective date of this ordinance

"Start of construction" means the first placement of permanent con
strucdon of a structure (other than a mobile home) on a slta, such as the
pouring of stabs or footings or any work beyond the stage of excavation
Permanent construction does not Include land preparation, such as
clearing, grading, and filling, nor does it tndude the installation of streets
anchor walkways; nor does It Include excavation for a basement,
footings, piers or foundations or the erection of temporary forms, nor
does tt tncbde the Installation on the property' of accessory bulldfogs.
such as garages or shed not occupied as dwelling units or not as part of
the mata structure For a structure (other man a mobile home) without &
basement or poured footings, the "start of construction" todudes the
test permanent framing or assembly of the structure or any part therof
on Its piling or foundation For mobile homes not within a mobile home
park or mobile home subdhtskm. "start of construction" means the affix
Ing of the mobOe home to its permanent site. For mobile homes within
mobile home parks or mobile home subdMdlons, "start of construction"
is the date on which the construction of facilities for servicing the site on
which the moblc home b to be affixed Uncludlng, at a minimum, the con
strucOon of streets, either final site grading or the pouring of concrete
pads, and tnstaUlatton of utilities) Is completed.

"Structure" means a walled and roofed building that ts principally
above ground, as well as a mobile home

"Substantial Improvement" means any repair, reconstruction, or ton
provement of a structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 per
cent of the market value of the structure cither.

(1) before the improvement or repair is started, or
(2) if the structure has been damaged and la being restored, before the

damage occurred For the purposes of this deftnttlon "substantial Im
provement" U considered to occur with the first alteration of any wall,
celling, floor, or other structural part of the building commences,
whether or not that alteration affects-the external dimension!, of the
structure The term does not, however. Include either.

(1) any project for Improvement of a structure to comply with existing
state or local health, sanitary, or safety code (pacifications which are
solely necessary to assure safe living conditions, or

(2) any alteration of a structure listed on the National Register of
Historic Places or a State Inventory of Historic Places.

"Variance" Is a grant of relief to a person from the requirements of this
ordinance which permits construction In a manner otherwise prohibited
by this ordinance where spectftc enforcement would result tn un
necessary hardship.

8-11 General Provisions
la) LANDS TO WHICH THIS ORDINANCE APPLIES
This ordinance shall apply to all areas of special flood hazards within

the Jurisdiction of Clark Township
(b) BASIS FOR ESTABLISHING THE AREAS OF SPECIAL

FLOOD HAZARD
The areas of special flood hazard Identified by the Federal Insurance

Administration through a scientific and engineering report entitled. The
Flood Insurance Study for the Township of Clark." NJ. dated March 2.
1982. with accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Maps and Flood Boun
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property ownership,
insurance, and other
business affairs, says
Gwen Waranis, Exten
sion Home Economist.
Good management
means that a family
takes inventory of
these valuable papers
from time to lime.

Examples of import
ant papers are wills, in
surance policies, bank
accounts, mortgage,
birth and marriage cer-
tificates, and any
papers referring to per-
sonal property. There
are many•othercvery-
day papers that are
also important. These
include auto registrar
tion, driver's license,
checkbooks, and even
credit cards that we
may fiot carry on our
person.

As to where to keep
important papers, this
might be determined
by the difficulty and
cost of replacing them,
and how often you
need to refer to them.
Those papers that are
more difficult to
replace are better kept
in safer places.

Safe places for keep-
ing important papers
usually mean a rental
safe deposit box at a
bank and a safe in the
home. But the decision
may depend on the ac-
cessibility of the
deposit box and its
cost, which-depends on
its size. The cost is tax
deductible.

The location of im-
portant papers at
home doesn't have to
be fancy. A covered
box kept on a shelf
may be easy to carry to
a nearby table. The im-
portant thing is having
a regular place which
all the family members
know about.

Credit
Billing
Errors

As long as credit
cards are in use. there
is the possibility of an
error in billing. What
can you do to deter-
mine the possibility of
a credit card billing er-
ror? Mainly, be sure
that the amount you
sign for is the cost of
the merchandise; also,
save the receipts to
check against the bill-
ing statement. What
appears to be an error
in billing at first glance
may just be a forgotten
purchase. If there i£ a
problem m the Kate-
tnent; you should
know that the rijhtt of

..both the consumer and
creditor wet protected
under the Fair Credit
B i i r A 1 ^

dwy maps and any rovtston therto ar« hereby adopted by rctevnoe and
dadarad t o b e a part of this ordinance.

(c) PENALTIES FOR NON-COMPLIANCE-
No ttructurc of land shall hereafttt be oonstructodjocatsd, extended,

converted, or altered urtfhout full covrtptlanc* wtth tha tomu of thto or-
dinance end other applicable regulation* Violation of the provUloru of
this ordinance by talkie to comply uith any of Its nxjukamentt (Incudlng
violations of conditions and tafeaiards established In connection with
condition*) «hafl constitute a misdemeanor. Any person who violates,
this ordinance or falls to comply wtth any of its requirements shall upon
oonvtctton therof be fined not more than $ 5 0 0 or by Imprisonment for a
term not exceeding 9 0 days, or both, for each violation, and In addition
shaD pay all costs and expenses tovolved tn the case. Nothing herein
contained shall prevent the Township of Clark from taking such other
lawful acton as to necessary to prevent or remedy any violation.

(d) ABROGATION AND GREATER RESTRICTIONS-
This ordinance Is not Intended to repeal, abrogate, or frnpair any ex-

isting easements, convenanti , or deed restrictions However, where this
ordinance and another ordinance, easement, covenant, or deed restric-
tion conflict or overlap, whichever trnposei tha more stringent restrtc-
ttorts shaD prevail.

(e) rNTERPRETATlON
In the Interpretation and application of thts ordinance, all provisions

shall be
(1) Considered a s minimum requirements,
(2) Liberally construed In favor of the governing body
(3) Deemed neither to limit nor repeal any other powers granted under

State statutes
(f) WARNING A N D DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY
The degree of flood protection required by this ordinance Is con

stderad reasonable for regulatory purposes and Is based on scientific and
engineering considerations. Larger floods can and will occur o n rare oc-
casions. Rood heights may be Increased by man-made or natural
causes. This ordinance does not Imply land outside the areas of special
flood hazards or uses permitted within such areas wlQ be tree from
flooding or flood damages. This ordinance shall not create liability on
the part of the Townshfc) of Clark or by any officer or employee therof
for any flood damages that result from reliance on this ordinance or any
administrative decision lawfully made thereunder.

8 12 Administration.
(a) ESTABLISHMENT OF DEVELOPMENT PERMIT
A Development Permit shall be obtained before construction of

development begfru wlthfri any area or special flood hazard established
In Scdon 8 11 (b). Application for a Development Permit shaD be made
to the Construction Official on forms furnished by htm and may ftclude,
but not be limited to. the following plans In duplicate drawn to scale
showing the nature, location, dimensions, and elevations of the area In
question, existing or proposed structures, fill storage of materials;
drainage facilities, and the location of the foregoing. Specifically, the
following information Is required:

(1) Elevation tn relation to mean sea level, of the lowest floor (in-
cluding basement) of at structures

(2) Elevatton in relation to mean sea level to which any nonresident
structure has been flood proofed.

(3) Plans showing how any non-residential flood proofed structure u/UI
meet the flood proofing criteria of Section 8-13 (b) (2) and after the
structure Is built, a certification by a registered professional engineer or
architect that the structure as built meets the crtterta of Section 8-13 (b)
(2J.

(4) Description of the extent to' which any watercourse will be altered
or relocated as a result of proposed development.

(5) The layout ot existing and proposed public streets and the nature,
extent and location of cxlstfrg and proposed utilities servicing, and to
service the premises in question

(6) The elevation of any oxlstfeig or proposed pumping facilities and
the nature, extent and location of existing and proposed utilities, serv-
ing, and to service, the premises rn question;

(7) The location of the proposed and existing buildings on the sttc;
(8) T h e nature and extent of the construction alterations or repairs;
(9) Proof of encroachment lines obtained;
(10) The extent of filling of the land If any.
(11) The proposed finished grade elevations at the comers of any

structure or structures.
(12) That location, size and nature of all existing and proposed

drainage rights-of-way or easements and the location, size and detcrtp
tton of any lands to be dedicated to the municipality or trw county;

(13) The location, size and nature of the entire lot or lots In question
and any contiguous lots owned by the applicant or In which the appli
cant has direct or tndfrect Interest;

(14) The location, type and size of aD existing and proposed erosion
and slltatlon control measures such as slope protection, soil stabiliza-
tion, sedimentation basins, sediment traps, headuialls,aprons and the
like; and

(15) Any and all other information and data necessary to meet any of
the requirement! of this article

(b) DESIGNATION OF CONSTRUCTION OFFICIAL
The Construction Official ts hereby appointed to admhtster and im

plcmcnt this ordinance by granting or denying developemt permit ap-
plications In accordance with its provisions

(c) DUTIES AND R E S P O N S B u J T E S OF THE CONSTRUCTION
OFFICIAL- >.

Duties of the Construction shaD Include, but noHtjaltod tn. ^
(1) Permit Review;
(1) Review aU development permits to determine that the permit re-

quirements of this ordhance have been satisfied.
(Ill Review all development permits to require that aO necessary per- "

mlts have been obtained from those federal, state or local governmental. ̂
agencies from which prior approval Is required.

(2) Use Of Other Base Flood Data- —•
When base flood elevation data has not been provided in accordance, .
wtth Section 8 - U (b), BASIS FOR ESTABLISHING THE AREAS OF
SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD, then the Construction Official shall ob
tain, revirw, and reasonably utilize any base flood elevation data ,
available from t federal, state or other source, m order to administer
Soctions 8 1 3 (b) (1). SPECIFIC STANDARDS. Residential Construc-
tion, and 8 - 1 3 (b) (2). SPECIFIIC STANDARDS. Non residential Con- •
structlon.

(3) Information To Be Obtained and Maintained-
(I) Verify and record the actual elevation ( k\ relation to mean sea level)

of the lowest habitable floor (Including basement) of all new or tubstan
tlaDy Improved structures, and whether or not tha structure cantatas a
basement.

(II) For all new or substantially femproved fbodproofed structures:
(a) verify and record the actual elevation (in relation t o mean w > level,
and

(b) maintain the floodprooflng certtficarJons required In Section 8-12
(a) (3).

(III) Maintain for public Inspection aD records pertaining to the provt-
stons of this ordinance.

(4) Alteration of Watercourses
(I) Notify adjacent communities and the New Jersey Dept. of En

ufronmental Protection prior to any alteration or relocation of • water-
course, and submit evidence of such notification t o the Federal In
•urance Administration.

(II) Require the maintenance Is provided within the aHsred or relocated
portion of said watercourse s o that the flood carrying capacity is not
d&ntnlshed

(5) Interpretation of Firm Boundaries-
Make Interpretations where needed along with tha Toumshfcj

Engineer, as to tha exact location of the boundaries of the areas of
special flood hazards (for example, where there appears to be a conflict
between a mapped boundary and actual field conditions). The person
contesttag the location of the boundary shaD be given a reasonabli op-
portunity to appeal the interpretation as provided In this aritcle.

(d) VARIANCE PROCEDURE
(1) APPEAL BOARD

(I) Trw Ptflrmhg Board a s established by Clark Township shall hear
and decide appeals and requests for variances from tht requirements of
this ordfeurtce.

(fl) The Piannfrtg -Board shift hear and dodde appeals when it tt al
tagad there te a n error to any mqutosnont, decirton, or dstermtrutton
made by the Cons&ucHon Official tn the enfoTcament of administration
of this ordkuknee.

(10) Any person aggrieved by the decision of the Planning Board or any
taxpsyw may appeal, to wnttog. such dadston t o the Township Council
vJtthm 1 0 days after the date of such action.

(rv) In patt ing upon such appHcattont, the PUnnlng board t h a i con-
sider aft technical evaluation*, all relevant factor*, standards specified bt
other lacttona of t h b ordinance, and:

(a) the danger that mateftals may b e twapt onto other Unda to the tn
jury of ©than ,

(b) lh* dangar to fife and property due to floo&na or action damags;
(c) lh* futceptfe&ty of the proposed faeffity and Its contents to flood

d theefieetor such damage on the mdMdual oum*r.

00 the costs of providing governmental services during and after flood
conditions including maintenance and repatc of public utilinei and
fsrlirtty such as sewer, gas, electrical, and water systems, and »tract»
and bridges.

(v) Upon conskleratlon of the facton listed above and the purposes of
this ordinance,, the Planning Board may attach such condition! to the
granting of variances as H deems necessary to further the purpoto of
mis ortdnance.

(vt) The Construction Official shaD matrttato the records of all appeal
actions and report any variances to tha Federal Insurance Admtntstra
tton upon request.

(2) CONDITIONS FOR VARIANCES
(1) Generally, variances may be Issued for new construction and

substantial improvement to be erected on a lot of one-half acre or lest tn
size contiguous to and surrounded by toti with existing structures con
structed below the base flood level, providing Items (ak) have been fully
considered. As the bt size increases beyond the one-half acre, the
technical justification required for Issuing the variance Increases

(U) Variances may be used for tha reconstruction, rehabilitation or
restoration of structures Usted on the National Register of Historic
Places of the State Inventory of Historic Places, without regard to the
procedures set forth In the remainder of this section.

(Ill) Variances shall Not be Issued wtthto any designated floodway if
any Increase In flood levels during tha base flood discharge would result

(MVarlances shaQ only b% Issued upon a determination that the
variance is the minimum necessary, conslderrng the flood hazard, to af
ford relief ""*"

(v) Variances shall only be Issued upon:
(a) a showing of good and sufficient cause,
(b) a determination that failure to grant the variance would result tn ex

ceptlonal hartt*h£> to the applicant, and
(c) a determination that the granting of a variance will not result In In

creased flood heights, additional threats to public safety, extraordinary
public expense, create nuisances, cause fraud on or victimization of the
public as Identified In Section 8 12 (d) (I) (tv). APPEAL BOARD, or con
fltct with existing local laws or ordinances.

(vl) Any applicant to whom a variance Is granted shall be grven written
notice that the structure will be premltted to be buQt with a lowest flood
elevation below the base flood elevation, and that the cost of flood frv
surance will be commensurate with the Increased risk resulting from the
reduced lowest floor elevation

8-13 Provisions for Flood Hazard Reduction
(a) GENERAL STANDARDS
bi aD areas of special flood hazards the following provisions are required

(1) ANCHORING
(I) Alt New construction and substantial improvements shall be an

chorad to prevent flotation, collapse o i lateral movement of the struc
turn.

(II) AD moblls homes shall be anchored to resist flotation, collapse, or
lateral movement by providing overthe-top and frame ties lo ground an
choTS Specific requirement! shall be that;

(a) overthe-top tiers be provided at each of the four comers of the
mobile home, with two additional tiers per side at Intermediate locationi
and mobile homes less than SO feet long requiring one additional tie per
side;
(b) frame ties be provided at each comer of the home with five additional
ties per side at Intermediate points and mobile homes loss than 5 0 feet
long requiring four additional ties per side;

(c) all components of tho anchoring system be capable of carrying a
force of 4 , 8 0 0 pounds; and,

(d) and additions to the mobile home be similarly anchorod
(2) CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS AND METHODS

(1) AD New construction and substantial Improvements shall be con
structed with materials and utility equipment resistant to flood damage

(U) AU now construction of substantial Imporvements shall tfe con
structed by methods and practices that minimize flood damags.

O S
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(0 AO raw and replacement water supply systems shall be designed to |
minimize or eltmbnate Infiltration of flood water* tnto tha system; \

(U) Now and replacement sanitary sewage tystems shall be designed 1
to minimize or eliminate infiltration of flood u/atort Into tha systems and l

(
discharges from the systems tnto flood watftrs; and. i

(HI) On-slte watte disposal systems shall bo located to avoid impalrJ
many to them or contamination from tham during flooding.

(flS SUBDIVISION PROPOSALS "' • . \ •
ft) AD subdivision proposals shall be consistent with tha need So

minimize flood damage.
(U) Al) subdivision propoials shaQ have public utilities and fatilltUts

such as power, gas, electrical and water systems located and con
structed to minimize flood damag*.

(Ill) AD subdMaton proposals shall have adequate drainage provided to
reduce exposure to flood damaga.

(Iv) Ease flood elevation data shall be provided lor subdivision pro
posalrand'eifHar proposed development whlchi*greater than-the lesser
of 50 lots or 5 acres.

(b) SPECIFIC STANDARDS
tn all areas of special flood hazards where base flood elevation data has
been provided al set forth In Section 8 1 1 (b) BASIS FOR
ESTABLISHING THE AREAS OF SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD or
Section 8-12 (c) (2) USE OF OTHER BASE FLOOD DATA, the
followfrig standards are required:

(1) Residential Construction-
New construction or substantial Improvement of any residential struc
tun shall have the lowest floor. Including basement, elevated one foot
above the base flood elevation.
" T.2I Nan-Residential Construction-
New construction or substantial Improvement of any commercial. In
dustrtal or other non-residential structure shall either have the lowest

- Hoot, including basement, elevated one foot above the base flood elova
-Uon or, together with attendant utility and sanitary facilities, be flood
proofed so that below the base flood level the structure U water-tight
with walls substantially Impermeable to tht passage of water and urlth

'."Structural components havtag the capability of resisting hydrostatic and
.tyy îrgdyrtamlc loads and effects of buoyancy. A registered professional
engineer or architect shall certify that the standards of this subsection
are. satisfied. Such certification shaQ be provided to the official as set
forth tn Section 8-12 (c) (3) (ll).
" "iej FLCODWAYS

Located within areas of special flood hazard established tn Sectlon811
(b) are areas designated as floodu/ays. Since the floodway is an extreme
ly hazardous area due to the velocity of floodwaters which cany debris,
potontlal projectiles, and erosion potential, the following provisions ap-
ply:

(1) prohibit encroachments. Including fill, new construction, substan
ttal improvements, and other development unless a technical evaluation
demonstrates that encroachments shaD not result m any Increase In
flood levels during the occurrence of the base flood discharge

(2) If Section 8 1 3 (c) (1} Is satisfied, aD new construction and substan
ttal improvements shall comply with all applicable flood hazard roduc
tton provisions of Section 8-13 PROVISIONS FOR FLOOD HAZARD
REDUCTION

(3) Prohibit the placement of any mobile homes, except In an existing
mobile home park or existing mobile home subdivision.

(4) irraD areas of special flood hazard tn which base flood elevation
data has been provkled and no floodway has been designated, the
cumulative effect of any proposed development, when combined with aD
other existing and anticipated development. shaU not Increase the water
surfac* elevation of the base flood m m than two tenth i (0.2) of a foot
at any point

(5) Prohibit the following
(I) Placfrig. depostttng or dumptag any solid waste.gargage. rcfuw,

trash, rubbish, or debris.
(HI Oumptng or discarding untreated domestic sewage or industrial

waste either solid or Itqutd.
(Ut) The storage or disposal of pesticides.
(rv) The storage or processing of materials that are in time of flooding

buoyant, flammable or explothw,
(v) The storage or processho °f hazardous materials that could be in

Jurtous m time of floodfeng to human, animal or plant life.
(vl) The erection ot structures for human occupancy
(6) The following uses are expressly prohibited within a deltneatad

flood fringe area
(I) Placsig, depositing or dumping any solid waste garbage, refuse.

trash, rubbish or debris;
(B) Durnphg or discharging untreated domestte sewage, or industrial

wastft, either solid or liquid;
(HI) The disposal of pesticides,
<d) ABANDONMENT OF STRUCTURES
Structures tn the floadwey abandoned for 6 consacutm* months or

longer and structures abandoned f a 12 consecutive month* otlongo-lr.
th* flood fnrtge area aft» the eftectk* dart of this article. shaD not
quaWy as pre-cxlstlng use*.

8-16 FLOOD HAZARD MAP.
For the purpott of this article, tha Townshfc u hereby dtvtded and

dss&iatKl as foOows on nap entitled. •National Flood Insurance Pro-
grarn. Federal ETfW9«cp Mmaoewnt Agancy. F t o o ^
dary and Fbodway Map. rautsad dale S lumber 2.1982 Townshipof
Clark, New J e i p (Ura»<^am^VComrnunHy Panel Numbers 3452943
0001-0004. . j -

SECTION 6. Al CfdkWnsB or pattt <* ordinances incons&ient
hafvwfih a » haretw npaalod *s to such toconststencifti only. ,

SECTION 7. This ertfinanc* thai tikt arUa-ttnmadweiy upon final
pa*«SQK and pubkeatton aeoardlna to ttw. - f

_ Edward R, Psdusntak.
Toumsr$> Ctek

(Q p ffi y
msmxstt ef ft* tead wss» megmotd at th» nut and.

: ^ T - J
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'Flying gravel bank'
to hit Earth soon

isismsj

This month the earth will
crash into a "flying gravel
bank" in space-producing
what is hoped will be a spec-
tacular meteor display.

The event is a yearly oc-
currence and, while not
harmful to observers on the
earth, represents a celestial
show well worth seeing, ac
cording to Dr. Lewis
Thomas, a irusicc of
Amateur Asironomers,

Inc., and an associate with
the Haydcn Planetarium in
New York City

The melcor shower ma>
be seen at the Sperry Obscr
vatory on the Union Col
legc campus in C ranford on
Friday, Aug 13, when the
members of ihc Amateur
Astronomers will be on
hand for their regular t r i
day night public u e w m g
The assix;iation and Union

County jointly operate ihc
Sperry Observatory

There will be instruments
available for normal sky
watching, but because of
the widespread display of
the" meteors, the larger
telescopes will not be used
Association observers will
make meteor counts as the
showers progress, and will
discuss will visitors various
facets of [he phenomena

The observatory will be
open beyond the normal
c los ing time of 10
p m. probably well past
midnight for those who are
avid viewers. Dr Thomas
said

Explaining the "gravel
bank," Dr. Thomas said the
small particles of gravel
through which the earth
will pass will produce the
familiar "shooting siars" ef-
fect by burning up in the at-
mosphere about 7 5 miles
overhead The particles in
the gravel hank for the most
pan are no larger than
grains of sand, but their
speed produces intense heat

that makes them visible to
the unaided eye.

The shower will be most
intense of Thursday, Aug.
12, this year but can be seen
about five days on cither
side of this date. On the
12th, it is estimated a single
observer will be able to
count as many as 50
shooting stars an hour if
viewing from a dark loca-
tion. The Perseid meteors
are characterized by their
rapid motion and intense
blue-white light. They ap-
pear to come directly from
the constellation, Perseus,
which will be located in the
eastern portion of the sky.

ftJUIWAYSOOK
4 OFT SHOP

ULOttKttYSTfttfT
381-1770

•Hardcovers
•Paperbacks
•Bibles
•Children's Books
•Costume Jewelry
•Precious Moments

Figurines
•Gifts For ,

All Occasions

• ttKACSMlNT WINDOWS
S W O B

Touch of God
(WOOD 'H' THINGS)
Your Christian Book

And Gift Store
1S13 Main St.

Subway, MJ. 070*5
A Full Line of Christian

Books & Gifts

574-9060
We arc open 6 Days A WEEK!

P L A Q U E S
M**-, Twt, W M I . PrL 1* ••*•--» p«

toi.tiM

Slipcovers, Draperies
Bedspreads & Shades

Cutom Hull lo Ordci

H) Mtoctlon In
thl* era*
• Fltlad to yom hoota
• GuannlMil Worti-

manahtp
• Finest fabric*

vstl prtc«*

FREE ESTrMATE

388-33 tt

Rahway
Fashion Fabrics
W r U U I DCCORAVORS

Curtotni-tln»n»-Yord Good*

1431 MAIN ST., RAHWAY

TICKET
SERVICE
CONCERTS,

BROADWAY,
SPORTS

CALL FOR
CURRENT
LlSf OF
SHOWS!

272-1800
• «/APPUAMCI

REPAIR
&

SALESXfr*
•lronj»lampi*fBn$

•Collet Makers
•Authorized-

REGINA
MR. COFFEE • HOOVED

IF YOU
LIVE LONG
ENOUGH

sooner or later you II get
osteoarthniis ihe wear-
and-tear disease ot |Otnts
The tacts on how serious n 13
and what can be done about
it are outlined in a tree book-
let So You Have Osteoar-
Ihntis _

FOR U0RE
INFORMATION
CONTACT

*RTHRJT1S
i m T

1 1R Route
08009

2443 LAKE AVE.
COLONIA

382-8713

.i i

< •

i •

ATARI
fetor? Asftorlzed Service

Mil bab SL. Lhfai

925-1418
in A out of warranty

' 1 J I Off ANY SALE
0 1 SftnCE WITH THIS AD

Ronald Schofield
Florin. Inc.

105 LAKE AVENUE
COLOMIV K J .

388-6110
PLANTS FOR SALE

2M" fttgilsh lwi«Md plinh
ipproilmittlv 6" hiflh,

1 i n t old.
$.50 ssth
$3.00 flat.

* SM.W for SO
$35.00 for 100.

TK«r» wyill b* no delivery on
th«%* plant* you rnay coll o\
and w» will havt ih«m ready tor
you

PACY ASAHftft A
2'V" poH. Eitil Qround tour.

$.15 Mch $10.00 far 50
S1.5Q a«t. $17.50 far 100

i

* ; • " " * -

WESTHILL
WALL COVERINGS

271 Central Ave., Clark
388-5694

8AMTUHUI

CfiUMUl

FREE GALLON
OF PASTE

Window Shades
Verticals

Woven Woods
1" Blinds

Colt

Janet Decorators
1316 No. Broad St

Hillside, N.J
351-4966
923-6932

HOURS:
10-5

CARPENTER
WOODWORKER

REMODELING & REPAIRS
CUSTOM KITCHENS

& BATHS
THERMAL WINDOWS

& DOORS
CUSTOM

WOODWORKING
REASONABLE BATES
CHAS r. GRANT

MASTEHCRAFTSMAN

324-1033

CUSTOM
SLIPCOVERS,

DRAPERIES
and

RE-UPHOLSTERY
Guaranteed Workman-
ship. 33 years experience,
formerly of STEIN
BACH'S. Discount! lor
Senior Citizen. FREE
Shop-at-Home Service.

Call
WALTER CANTER

at

757-6655
SHORTY'S

AUTO BODY
Complete Auto Body &

Fender Refintshlng

Paint Specialist

Estimate ot

381-5790
739 Jaqutt Ave., Railway

CLARK POWER EQUIPMENT
1133 WMtttald A V W M

AIR-LAND-SEA-RAIL
INDIVIDUAL AND GROUP TRAVEL

DOMESTIC & IHT«IUTKM4AL
COMPDTEtlZS TICKIT SERVICE

382-3590

191 WMtfltM ATO. CLARK
Dunkln' Donut*)

MAC'S
MAIMTENANCE

CO., IHC.

HOT MM HEATSS
OIL B U R i e 6EPAICS
SHSTMET&l WOK
CEPAICS & SEEVICE
6AS COKVEBiOM

HEATING & AR CONS.
Uhtl»n

PAIN AND

m on* or more |Oirrts upon
arising could b« one ol the
early warning signs of ar-
Ihntis. Fina out more about
arthritis and dwfer aaSVrilrtg
signs to look for by sending
tor your lr*e copy of " Ar-

— The Basic Facts "

m m a t

Mt Route 73
Berlm. New J»n»y OKKA

PUBLIC NOTICE

Take nottoe on appbeatton has
been made to th» Murdctpa) &oanj
of ABC of Rahway, Mow Jouy to
transfer to the now Flamingo
Tavern, fr»c, t/a FbmhCP B»r far
premiies locatod et 21 Poplar
Street, Rahway, New Jersey.
Plenary Retafl CantutrqstJon bcense
No 2013-33-003-003 hwrtofoM
issued to Barry Burls, Inc., t/a
Flamingo Bar, for tha premises
located at 21 Poplar Street,
Rahway Now Jersey.

Officers, Directors and
StockhotiSTs of tha trmratow car
paratkm are Dtme Brent and
Nathan Gk»eni, Jr. of 894 Hamad
Street, Apt. 11C, Perth Ambcy,
New Jenay 08861.

Otyocttans, tf any, shadd be
made kranedteteV ̂  wTRlng to Mr.
Francis R. Sankowtity, XuMc^al
Boaid of Aleohokc 3»tm& Ctsn-
trol, Rahwcy CHy Hal. Catrm of
Main Streat and E. MUtan Avenue,
Rahouaŷ  Naw Jency 07065,

THE NEW FLAMINGO TAVERN,
-^*-'^.*"t~~ f£9C

BYXHANE BRENT.

Dr. Thomas noted the
observers should begin wat-
ching around 10 o'clock. As
the night progresses, the
turning of the earth will
cause the constellation to
move from East to West
across the southern sky.
The last-quarter moon
should not interfere with
viewing until the early mor-
ning hours, he said.

The most-intense por
tions of the meteor shower
will probably occur after
the midnight hour since
then the observer will be
located on the frontal
regions of the earth plowing
directly into the gravel
bank.

It is believed the Perseids
were produced long ago by
the breakup of a comet that
once orbited the sun. Debris
from the comet over many
hundreds of years has been
distributed in atrelongaied
oval-type orbit around the
sun. This orbit intersects
the orbit of the earth in two
spots. The intersection
reached in August occurs
during the evening, and pro-
duces the meteors, accor-
ding to Dr. Thomas.

The reason the meteors
seem to come out of the
constellation Perseus, Dr.
Thomas explained, is they
are traveling along a com-
mon path, and when they
approach us, they appear to
diverge. The effect is similar
to looking down a set of
railraod tracks which are
parallel but the portions
near us seem to spread out,
he noted.

The breakup of the an-
cient comet that produced
these meteors was probably
caused by the gravitational,
effects of the sun. Daring
recorded time, a number of
comets have been seen to
break up in this fasion.

Astronomers can predict
the time of the shooting
stars, but the weather is still
unpredictable. Dr. Thomas
explained. In the case of in-
clement weather, interested
individuals may telephone
the astronomical hot line at
the Sperry Observatory,
276-STAR, for details of
the event.

Cantaloupes
spark up

summer meals
If you are looking for a

good snack, cantaloupe
may be the answer. Can-
taloupes are high in
vitamin A and low in
calories. Half of a five-
inch cantaloupe has only
60 calories, says Ellawese
B. McLendon, the exten-
sion home economist for
the Union County Co-
operative Extension Ser
vice.

To use as a dessert, try
filling a half melon with
ice cream or chunks of
other fruit. Filled with
cottage cheese, a half
melon makes a filling,
low-calorie lunch.

Selecting a melon for
quality and flavor is
sometimes tricky, and
there is no absolute for-
mula. There arc.
h o w e v e r , several
guidelines that will help
in the selection process.

Look for jhese signs of
maturity: The stem
should be gone, leaving a
smooth , symmetrical
shallow basin. The net-
ting, or veining, should be
thick, coarse and corky.
The skin color between
the netting should have
changed from green to
yellowfeh-buff, yellowish
gray or pate yellow. The
rind should have a plea-
sant odor, and should
yield slightly to light
thumb pressure on the
blossom end
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HANDS ACROSS THE SEA - Scoutmaster Ed McLean, left, of Rahway Troop No 47
of the Boy Scouts of America, sponsored by the First Presbyterian Church of Rahway.
welcomes Scoutmaster Roger Mills of the 5th Sutton Scout Group ol Sutton. Surrey,
England Mr Mills and his leaders and Scouts, totaling 28, are being hosied by Troop
No. 47 leaders and Scouts, totaling 38. at Camp Winnebago for a week ot summer
camping While at camp the members of the two groups will participate in out-post
camping and aquatic activities The week after camp the British Scouts will be staying
at the church facilities while touring New York City, Great Adventure Park and the
Jersey shore They will be returning to England on Friday, Aug 13

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •

* • • • • * • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •

Mrs. Ogden seeks
'forward funding7

for school aid
Noting the "anguish"

caused by sudden and
severe cuts in state aid to
school districts. Assembly
woman Maureen Ogden,
who represents Clark,
wants the state to consider,
**forward funding** to assure
monies arc in hand when
figures are certified to the
school districts by the state.
She said under present pro-
cedures, aid monies certified
in November are subject to
later change during t he
state's budget-balancing
procedures.

The problem occu rred
this year when SI 8.4
million in minimum aid was
cut by the Legislature, and
was threatened last year
when former Gov. Brendan
Byrne cut approximately
$60 million, which was later
restored by the Legislature.

"The effect of cuts in
state minimum aid is to
make state aid an unreliable
funding source that severely
handicaps fiscal planning by
local school administrators
and school boards," Mrs
Ogden said. "It forces

school boards to cut pro
grams, lay off people and
cope with parents looking
to private schools for their
children."

"It results in crisis
management that weakens
our public schools," she ad
dcd.

Mrs. Ogden noted she is
preparing legislation that
would remedy the problem
by modifying school-district
fiscal years to follow the
adoption of state budgets.
She said the need for a solu-
tion to the problem was
discussed during a meeting
she held recently" with
elected municipal and
school officials throughout
her district.

**1 have written to the
chairmen of the Assembly
and Senate Education Com-
mittees urging their early
considerat ion of alter-
natives to solve these pro-
blems," the legislator noted.
**Our school boards cannot
possibly plan responsibly
without reliable funding,
and the state has a clear
responsibility to address and

correct ihe problem We
must find a way to assure
monies certified to the
school districts cannot be
changed by the governor or
the Legislature."

"My plan is only one of
several possible alternatives.
and 1 hope the legislative
committees give all the
alternatives a high priority
in their deliberations," Ass
emblywoman Ogden said.

Rutgers lauds
N.A. Drogaris
A Clark man, Nicholas

A. Drogarisof 25Ivlae Belle
Dr., recently received his
bachelor of arts degree from
Rutgers University.

EMECGENCY
SO G A L S .
T5 GALS.
100 GALS.
KLIVEfilES HIM 0M QiL w *vt)

C.O.O ONLY

line* lttt

686-1818

A dry mtn.
Crane, «f« 595

v
bachelor of
from

* many

&94 M s . Apt. 11C
Parth Ambcy. N J . G^&l

Valley Road hits
two hoop victories

Clark's Valley Road
Playground has started yet
another series of inter-
playground sporting events.
This time the playgrounds
are competing in basketball
and luckbaU games.

• • •
The Valley Road basket-

ball team defeated Charles
H. Brewer Playground 33-
27. Jimmy Bcirnc, Joey
Latawiec, Tim Dunn and
Craig Halleck led the of-
fense. Beirne scored 12_
points, and had four assists.
Latawiec scored eight
points, and had three
assists. Tim Dunn had eight
points with seven assists.
Halleck made five points,
and played strong defense.

• • •
In another basketball

game Valley Road defeated
Curry Field 34-8. Beirne ted
the offense with 18 points
and four assists. Tim Dunn
made eight points, and had
three assists. Mike Soucek
and Latawiec had four
points each. The Valley
Road team played tough
defense, allowing Curry
Field to score only eight
points.

• • •
Arts and crafts, contests

URBANO
HEATING &
AIR COND.

Alt typ«ft ol H*ot)ng A Air
Cond Syit*m» Inttatl+d

& Serviced
•CSMTUUA/C •KOTAJl
• GAi HIAT • MAT PUMPt
• «UAU • oil moam

• HOT WAT1I

BEATfflC &
i i

f*»dt. NJ. 0*443

225-2999

A&A
TREE SERVICE

636-0278
FKEC ESTIMATES
FULLY INSURED

R&R Services
. JUf o

BeMgtnitiaB
Carrier Got Furnace

100,000 BTU In*
$ 7 0 0 . bmilrt

Si5 .00 Smvte* Call
wHh 1l«U sd.

541-7973
225-3064

(Bo..

TREE SERVICE
•LOT CLEARING
ft LAWN CARE

K3N COBDB» 634-9038

ALFRED
ELECTRICAL

CONTRACTOR
Lie N«. «3M

"FIsd a la (be
' YtBew Pttt*"

OHlc» ot:
' 525 Amboy Aw».

1"' W d b l

636-9132

and other sporting events
continued to be held for the
youngsters at the
playground. An end-of-the-
week ice pop party was also
held.

Rutgers cites
F.S. Rodrigo

A city resident, Francisco
S. Rodrigo of 778 Jaqucs
Ave., recently received his
bachelor of arts degree from
Rutgers University.

Vivian Lopez
gets doctorate
A resident of Rahway,

Vivian-Lena Lopez of 1264
Pierce St., recently was
awarded a juris doctor
degree from Rutgers
University.

KPISCEMENT
WINDOWS

Aluminum or Vinyl
Storm Window*

ft boon
JALOUSIE &

AWNING WINDOWS
L & M

WINDOW PRODUCTS
Tret

Blljniti
574-3352

Rehwey (anytime)

BOATING
TOPICS

by Bob Brmntor
UUCUirr OUTOOOft CONSULTANT

PROTECT EVE8

The human eye U s wonderful
thing. It transmit! image* to the
brain enabling us to see, can
discern object! in both dim and
bright light, and is stereoscopic
so that we perceive depth of
field. Trouble is, we often ex-
pose our eyes to more light than
ii good for them.

We can see about three per-
cent of the light rays produced
by the sun. The remainder,
mostly ultraviolet (UV) and
infrared (IFR) rays, have wave
lengths we don't see. This
doesn't mean we aren't affected
by UV and IFR light. On the
contrary, these unseen rays are
harmful. Boaters, especially, are
subject to increased exposure to
both these invisible rays.

Wearing sunglasses is a com-
mon means of protecting eyes
from sunlight, but Mercury
Outboards* boating experts ad-
vise not to rely upon sunglasses
alone. A visored cap is helpful
because it eliminates exposure
to direct overhead light and
absorbs some reflected rays
which would otherwise reach
your eyes- Polarizing sunglasses
reduce glare but don't stop dam-
aging UV rays.

Although ultraviolet light,
which causes sunburn, is ab-
sorbed by water, much of it is
reflected to strike your face.
The glare is reduced by wearing
sunglasses, but only those made
with special UV screening glass
can eliminate UV rays. Too
much ultraviolet light will bum
the retina of your eye.

CAB'

FIREPLACES
WOOD STOVES

COAL-OIL ft GAS
CHIMNEYS

WIRE BRUSH
CLEANING

POWER VACUUM |
..iOSOIUBI
ova 25 vn or.
CHIMNIY CLIANINO1

$41-7(14
24 L*H*rt» Si.

Jack Giordano. Prop.
COMPltTt SATHROOM MMOOtUNG
MIW INSTAUATlOMt
ALTERATIONS ft l l f Alt*
Clf C « W M CHAN ING
WATCH MIATf * *
HIATIMG SVITlMt
OIL TO GAV CO*|Vf tltONt

2 ^ SCHOOL
2 Dai * * * S~\

9 herein &
9 Sail Dcfenst
(% AeroElcs

9 7-STAR PRAYING MANTIS K W S I
9 MwWomm ft Children ,

9 , 53 Hah St. 6 3 6 * 4 8 9 5 WwdbrMpt

9
9

lai ar 9
KunpFa. 9
Chin-iia ft 9
Weapons 9

ilPrivatau& Groop,9

BOILERS & HEATING
SYSTEMS INSTALLED
AT REAL SAVINGS!
Alt CONDITIONING SYSTtMS
SHEffT METAL tASBCATION

HUMI5IFY1N&
EtjCTtOHKT A « CttANtK

AHTOMELLO'S
RESIDENTIAL • C0HHERCI4L M I < ,

INDUSTBIAl 7 5 0 - 2 7 1 7 ]

Install a 94*. EH Idem HydropuUe BolUr
{The Most LHicmnt Boi'or Made!

GAS CONVERSIONS
HOT AIR, HOT WATER & STEAM

SERVICE DIRECTORY
Woodbridge

Siding, Roofing & Builders
- R O O F I N G -

CUSTOM SIDING
©REPLACEMENT

- WINDOWS
O00RMERS
o ADDITIONS

OFREE ESTIMATE
OHNANCING
_ AVAILABLE
t 'Id Me**/

O FULLY INSURED
O 4 0 YR. WRIHEN

WARRANTY
of a

225-0331

AFFOKDABU QUALITY WITH QUICK SERVICE

PLUMBING & HEATING

'Reroois
•Tearotls
LICENSED
& FULLY
INSURED

FREE
ESTIMATES

'Aluminum

STEEL
•Windows

Custom Bull
ADDITIONS i

DORMERS

SAL MORTILLARO

* ROOFING
T ALUMINUM

•Hot Reeling •CuH«rs*1 pc. Install.
•Storm Doon ft Replacement Windows

SIDING

• GAS & OIL HEATING INSTALLATIONS
• WATER HEATERS
• COMPLETE BATHROOMS
• SMALL REPAIRS

DOM TIMPONE 3 8 2 - 1 9 8 8
NJ. UC.
No. tapA.

Free Estimates
• Fully Insured

fttPLAOIUlff
WHMWS;

wife Vinyl Cevwrad Aluminum

dfltn Sari/
Colt Por Dsmonatrcrtlon

WORK OUAtAHTIID

DAVID 6INFRIDA
IMPROVEMENTS

4997555 rouuiONe
AVAILABU

JOIN OUR FAMILY OF SATISFIED
CUSTOMER IN YOUR NEIGHBORHOOD

COMPLETE SHOWROOM
24 ELM AVE.

RAHWAY
(cor. Molh St.)

F&P
SEAMLESS

ALUMINUM
GUTTERS

•SPECIAL-
SOMMER SALE PRICES

•CLEAN OUTS
•REPAIRS

•LEAF GUARDS
INSTALLED

5740687
Accurate Rug Cleaning, Inc.

120 Gertrude St., Clark
382-0256

Rugs Steam cleaned
by truck

mounted unit.
UphoUtery &

Drapory Cleaning

ROOFING
ASPHALT & FIBERGLASS SHINGLES

• HOT ASPHALT BUILT-UP ROOFING
• SLATE REPAIRS • TEAR-OFFS

SIDING
ALUMINUM-VINYL-WOOD

SEAMLESS HOME
GUTTERS IMPROVEMENTS

&
REPAIRS

388-3797
WILLIAM SAAELTZER

REPLACEMENT
WINDOWS

FREE
ESTIMATES

SEAMLESS
GUTTERS
• l-PIECS INSTALLATION
•HEAVY .035GAUGE
• S BEAUTIFUL COLORS
• HIDDEN HANGERS OR

SPIKES* FERRULES
Citvcfc «ur Pri«M S*J«r« Van feu?

two Olrwt S l»v»
UANUrACTUMt-INITAUIl

AlLWOIKFUUVaiMKANTttO
PUUV IHtUtlD^Hf HTIMAT11

SITTER HOMES
634-3736
WOODBRIDGE. N.J.

Kitchens-Balhrooms
Complete Remodeling

PATIO DECKS

Past customers
are ny best

recommendations

i tk

5497645
A V P TERMITE & PEST CONTROL COMPANY

FREE TERMITE ESTIMATES C L E A N - O U T S
Roaches Ants Fleas Mice

ANY APARTMENT OR ONE FAMILY HOUSE
N O W $199S

CALL
499-9505

TAGLIA
CONSTRUCTION
AritWions •Dernin

Do You Have A Problem?
We HAVE THE ANSWER

•Bet RooiRi •ftiumntt
•Roollno "Sidbio
•Ctplinmint Windows
•Pitloi *t>«cki

R*asonabl« Prices
Fr»*Est. Fully Ins.

8620903

BECAUSE W r V E EARNED A NAM
THAT YOU CAN TRUST!!

MASON GENERAL
CONTRACTOR

CUSTOM BUILT
FIREPLACES

*u am uuumy&w _
CHIMNEY-FIREWALL,

HEARTH -WOOD
&COAISTOVE

INSTALLATIONS

FOOLS &
p hislallirtloti

Swvte* ft Mater Rspalr
' Of All Vinyl Llnwl

twlmmtna PaaU
•In ground lln«rs

•Abov* ground pools
U r t M t S

HETBO
GOHSTBUCTION
paving & masonrr

Driveways, Parkino lots
Resurfadno & Patching

A U T Y P I S OF
CONCRETE W O R K

Brick Slips, Walls &
Repairs

28J-1370 .283-0753
Eil.

* BEST *
MASONS

GENECAl CONTRACTORS
Stops-Potios-

Sldowolka-Concroto
& Asphalt Driveways
Railroad Ties & Re-

taining Walls
Additions & Dormer*

bee ait telly Ins.
* 862-6429 *

MtlDDLBSK

ALLTYP
MASONRY WORK

•StaM •PlrMl
•Walks •Peltas
•Driveways •^orehw
••rick Praicts •C^Umwys

FOEE

l lawri * FaBy to.

WET
BASEMENT

Muorant*« c
I I R U M lor %hm lull !>)• ol th* haw*

at ow

FREE ESTIMATE
862-5939

634-21M

•EXPERT BATHROOM
REMODELING

A REPAIR-WORK
•COMPLETE KITCHEN

REMODELING
OIOROC TKOtKY

533 fatality An, Ptrft Aabov

324-1205
WHOLESALE BAfflBOOH BOUTIQUE

24 Hr
Svrvicc

FORDS HEATING & COOLING
CENTBJU, ME CONBmOKlNG

738-4549 S 1

FREE ESTIMATE
SALES*SERVICE*!N$TALIATION

GAS CONVERSIOMS
HOT AIR FURNACES

HOT WATER ft STtAM BOILERS
HUMIWIERS t AIR CLEANERS

WUU*w Air C*«dMMs*» Urvlecd
SHEET META1 PA1BICATI6H

New Low, LONAIT Rates (Save Up To 30%)
Lowest Bank Terms Available Now!
Schedule Work At DISCOUNT Prices Now!
Pay Nothing Until The Fall Of 1982
Free Home Improvement Consulting
Season Sale On All Work Now1.
Most Jobs Completed In 1 Week
Open Sat. & Sun. For Your Convenience
Member National Remodelers Assn.
Most Highly Recommended In Central NJ .
Free Insulation and Energy Surveys - ., - ~- --•
Insulated Vinyl Siding Sale On Now!
Lowest Rates On Dormers &
Add-A-Levels Now!
Warehouse Our Own Materials
Best Price on Replacement Windows in the State!

tt That's Not Enough-Stop In Or Give Us A CaH-We'v© Got Plenty More!

FREE ESTIMATES
Aluminum Siding
Vinyl Siding
Steal Siding

• Add-A-Levels
• Insulation
• Shell Dormers

• Windows
• Energy Ssvers
• Rooting

• Fireplaces
• Gutters
• Additions

CAU roir
FRK BtttUTl

7966
gallant ALUMINUM PRODUCTS CO.

t» lMira l )A».CtMM
Opwt baity fto*. tat * to 3

Iww IICTW—i « Mh; I'

CALL NOW

OFFICE 8 SHOWROOM

40 WOODBRIDGE AVE.
SEWAREN

n l i c "B 1° Siding E Home Improvements Specialists

(obtil fdirti Fill

Wdgs. lie. "I?

IF YOU HAVE AM FOR REAL VALUE. . -
READ ATOM
CLASSIFIEDS
REGULARLY I

CARPET &
QHUHSTiRY

CLEANM*
3 Stou *
AtlDtHsrstPriHS
D T I M * Fvralmt*

rest tutvm cwnmjur oivn
•FOR SERVICE CALL"

499-7119

TEXTURE
CEILINCS
KLOWHOH

Also Sh««t Rock,
Blocks & Plotter
541-67.5 439-3836

Coll After 6 p.m.
FRE£EST.

WORK GUAft.

SIDING
W I N D O W S
ROOFING
DORMERS
ADDITIONS

TOPS
Alt C0WHTI0HDI5

REFSSEsUTiOH
HUTW6 COHTUaOBS

•Cantral A/C
•Window Unit*
•R»(fiQ»rotor»
•Ic* Machines

•Co* Hmat
•Oil H*ot

•Hot Water H«at»r*
SERVICE A REPAIR
ON ALL SYSTEMS

574-0330

INFLATION FIGHTER
COLOR MAGIC

T.V. SEBVICE-& AIR
CONDrCBITER

•QUA1AR «PAf4A£ONlC
•SONY -SANYO
•BCA -SYIVANIA
• X A M ^ ^ E M I T H

FIREWOOD
A & A TREE SERVICE

s50 Per Truckload
(Plu*Ta«)

UNSPLITUKCUT

MAKWIMSKI BUILDERS

PORCH CNGLOSURESU
REPLACEMENT WINbOWS

SIDING-DECKS
ROOFING --SKYLIGHTS

ORAZI
RECTCICAL

KBVICE
LIC. #3649

•INDUSTRIAL
•COMMERCIAL
•RESIDENTIAL

Call 381-5173

ALUMINUM
SIDING

BENBOLLACl
AND SON

General Mason Conlinclor,
PtASTfUWO

CUUOMO ** ST
•BtOOCWOM

•CONCRfTEWO**

•AKMTIONl

fiOlowollSt.. Cortemi

541-8259 5415958

vtnyl r*ftti

FREE ESTIMATES
540 H*rtli Am. C

, HJ. 8T»*0

FUBSHMB

:CAU«AHK.Vu\zm mm

SIDING.^
TREATED DECKS.;
ADD-A-LEVELS . . .
A D D m O M i W / F D
CUSTOM HOMES :

GENERAL
COMTMCTOB

oi&TuweK

ismsem mmm

COMPLETE
ALTERATIONS
"From Carpentry

to Wallpaper"
CfrsBtc Tuc

Stifc 4 O»ff

.Bob Collins
534 3809 636741*

HOME IMPROVEMENT
# «CsHsti

«Stea« fremtJ
• 0 u n •WlasUw

Wtalswifc DAWS
I n k Fbadif (• OatEfirf

541-7966

LUMUNUM PROD
S7M »—wall Av»*v»,
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Rah way merchd nfs
Si

FREE SAMPLES - At an "Open House" during the Clark Summer School's cooking-
class students get a chance to show others what they have learned.

ON THE LEVEL - Maureen Kelly, left, of Rahway. a
nurse extern for the summer at Rahway-Hospital, wat-
ches as Eileen O'Donnell, a registered nurse, adjusts an
Intravenous hook-up. :

Area residents

at Seton Hall
Several area residents,

were recently awarded
undergraduate degrees from
Seton Hall University in
South Orange.

Those receiving the
degrees and their majors
follow: From Clark,
Maureen McMahon, 55
Harrison §$., industrial rela-
tions; Margaret Canavan,
83 Sandalwood Dr., elemen-
tary education; JamesCori-
way, 27 Bartell PI., physics;
Laurie Cosentino, 48James
Ave., nursing; Robert Gry-
giel, 320 Oak Ridge Rd., ac-

counting; Patricia Jaworski,
53 Lcfferts La., health and
education; Susan Lorenzo,
5 Sandalwood Dr., health
and education; John*
Rakovec, 78 Sweetbriar
Dr., accounting; Frederick
Rittweger, 10 Charles St.,
biology, and Joann Schi-
fano, 98 Grand St., accou-
nting.

From Rahway, Donna
Amabile, 697 Linden Ave.,
marketing;, Michael Bizzo-
zzaro, 2013 Henry St., ac-
counting; Pilar Garcia, 184
Forbes St., industrial rela-
tions, and June Meyer, 315
Dukes Rd., industrial rela-
tions.

Galf-confidtne* imi*t ba built
op from th« pact In order to afc

. a man. hejw for tha future.

Heart group
offers more

than sympathy
When the need to express

sympathy arises, many
members of the public sup-
port the Heart Assn. by
contributing to its memorial
program.

A spokesman for the
Metropolitan Chapter,
which serves the residents
of Essex, Hudson and
Union Counties, reminds
the public its tribute pro-
gram also includes, in addi-
tion to tht memorials, all-
occasion cards, fitting for
birthdays, weddings, an-
niversaries, graduations and
other happy events, and get-
well cards.

All contributions help to
advance the research,
education and community-
service activities of the
American Heart Assn., the
only organization totally
dedicated to the elimination
of premature death and
disability due to heart
disease, the spokesman
noted.

Inquires about the tribute
program or any of the other
association activities can be
directed to 789-3088 in
Union County.

Area keglers
to roll

on cable
Suburban Cablevision

will cablecast "Summer
Strike," a tournament com-
prised of local high school
students and men com-
peting in a single-
elimination style, on Tues-
day, Aug. 10, at 7:30 p.m.
via TV-3. The bowlers will
be Jim Murphy of Clark
versus Charlie DeGregorio
of Linden.

This game will be in the
men's division and the
champion of this division
will receive a S500 prize.

It'* strange how often
you get a person*! opinion
without asking for It.

Once again, the Rahway
downtown merchants will
hold their Annual Sidewalk
Sale Day event on two
days, on Thursday and Fri-
day, Aug. 12 and 13. Shop-
ping on Aug. 12 will be
from 10 a.m. to 8 p.m. and
on Aug. 13, from 10 a.m. to
5 p.m.

The downtown area,
Main St. from E. Milton
Ave. to Monroe. St. and E.
Cherry St. from the parking
lot to Main St., will be clos-
ed to automobile traffic for
the two days during the
shopping hours. The area
will be turned into an out-
side malf through which
shoppers will be able to
walk and browse among the

merchants displaying their
wares, and take advantage
of the newly-installed park
benches to rest and enjoy
the' newly-decorated
downtown area. Shoppers
will also be able to have
lunch at .the outdoor cafes
and in Che mall-like area.

Visitors during the event
will be able to find all sorts
of bargains from household
goods to personal items for
themselves or friends. It will
be a good time to stock up
on sale-priced items for gift
giving or for your war-
drobe. Merchants along the
mall area will be displaying
such things as merts', ladies'
and children's clothing.

ADDING IT UP - Leon
Ryglel of 3 Cornell Circle,
Clark, recently received
his decree In computer
science from Seton Hall
University in South
OranQe.

HIGH HOPES
A faw peoplt liv» on a strict

but most aaam to b« on
•pand Mid u«H aywtaxn.

shoes, hair ornamants, tee-
shirts, antiques, crafts and
collectibles.

SENDING THE WORD -
Elaine Czarneckl of 1
Emerald Ct., Clark, recent-
ty received her degree in
communications from
Seton Hall University in
South Orange.

Tims ffliut b* monay—other-
wise . .people without money
couldn't buy •vcrythlng on tiro*.

People find h»ppinees In many
different w.yi mini find It
Just in demanding their right*.

i SPECIAL NOTE TO PARENTS

sale, effective weight, loss pro-
i I _ i - I -J . 1 A ~ T _ i - • ._ i i . _

development of healthy bodies and
I minds.
. -MEDICALLY APPROVED •PROFESSIONALLY

ANCE PROGRAM -LIMITED ENROLLMENT

I THE CHILDREN'S
I WEIGHT LOSS CLINIC I

</•••, ,* Is a roal oducat lon,
| ' :'- learn ing to bo th innsr for I I I a . .
1 CALL m 4%. Hf • • « n an \

I 2165 Morris Ave., Union I
| .Also meet inu in |

WOODBR1PGE and Livingston

Barnogat Badminslsr Borkeley Haights B«ma«daviiie Biacttwood Bnck Town Camden Caneret Cherry H.I. Crantoro East B'unsw.o East Orange Eatontown Edison Elizabeth Elmora Fiom.ngion

THE
BEVERLY'S

1413 Main St.
iNwr iht comer of fc. Milum Aw.i

Rahway, NJ..

^ffinrnarie* r«MrkU Ave.i

Rahway.NJ.:
PAULAS .

JJ^Sod" Ave. v
Rahway, NX
aBis«ttniftaaa

Where
RAHWAY NEWS

Is Sold
••eBBaBeaaaiBBBBBB

t DUGOFF'S
i . 1 4 5 7 Irving St.
I lAi the comer of K. C V m Si.i

• - Rahway, NJ.
i 1588 Irving St.
•- Rahway, NJ.

5 370 St. George Ave.

— ^ — — ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ H ^ ^ ^BP « • • aBBi • • BBHi (Bj

©'JOHNNIE'S
170 Westfield Ave.

. (Near Abnhim ftark Schnoli

RECORD

. _JtBaBiis«ittniftaaaeawttaBaft«ii«eaaB»ne

Lincoln Sob &Dcli5 ERNIES
1 M U * « i i U 7 J -274 E; Grand Avc

4

M f g a e n A M«M*S IM

^ahway/NJ.

PIPE SHOP
62 E. Milton Ave.

Opp. Fulton SU

Rahway. N J.
• 960 St; George Ave.-
• (At iHecof. oT Mipte A«e.t

! Rahway, NJ.'
TDTiosSTcoTrfcifoTei
! S2LW- Grand Ave.
S Rahway, NJ.

! ETNA'S
• 434 W. Grand Ave.
• ' . (At the cor. ofOtMrSt.1. •..

^ • t ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ V ^ « « v ^BP ^BV • • * • ^ B * «BV BBB • • • • ^B> VBW ^BP ^ B * ^ B B I

S PORKY'S DELI
i 1064 Madison Hffl Rd.
I Clark, NJ. 49WJ069

ti

• / / " •

•963 New Brunswick Ave.l :
I Rahway • 388-9744 I
H 9 Una^ 4fii9> 'CMB>'fiBB>- ^Stm-^m >

j i t Where the
CI18K PATRIOT I s S61d

r;JD64 Madison

. ' • . . • . * \ . - . \ . . ! ' - ' : ' : ; • • : . .

. ; • - , ' • ' . . • - : M ^ y ; z ^ . - f

«i'ili'-Aiw*««iPT.'iWwf>i>.H

- r 1 • ' •

\ • • . • . ' -

u,; -• ' • •"••• ' ' : ' , • ;..• . • : : r - r - / i : ; * . ; ' ' i ; " . - . , - ; i . t - ' - . " • •


