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' PEDAL PUSHERS - Giving their all are bicycle racers
from across the United States and other countries com-

' peting in Rahway's Annual July 4 "Holiday at Home"
: Bicycle Races.

Three states win
honors in bike race

Winners came from three
states to take the laurels in
Rahway's July 4 "Holiday
at Home" Bicycle Races.

Cyclists from New Jer-
sey, Pennsylvania and
Brooklyn won three races
apiece at the 15th annual
event.

In the competition's most
trying division, the senior
two section, Brooklyn's
Brian Serchingcr look the
honors in ihe 50-kilonieter
event.

Garden State winners
were John Donnelly of So-

merville in the Intermediate
Class, for those 12 to 15
years old; Robert Perlee of
Vcrnon in ihe Veterans
Division, for those over 35,
and Lloyd Rake of Titus-
ville in the grandmaster race
for those 55 and older.

The winner of the wo-
men's division last year,
Kim Decker of Berwyn,
Pa., retained her crown. She
and Rake were the only re-
peat winners from last year.

Other Pennsylvania win-
ners were Bruce Dixon of
East Greenville in the Mid-

get Class, for those eight to
1 1 years old, and Fred Gei-
ger. of Conestoga Valley in
the senior four category, for
those 18 to 34 years old.

Another Brooklynite,
Jose Esilio, paced the junior
division, for 16 and 17 year
olds; joined by a neighbor
from the New York boro-
ugh, Ed Merryman in the
senior three category.

More than 300 entrants
participated in the competi-
tion, which is sanctioned by
the United Stales Cycling
Federation.

City Council takes first step
on sewer-separation project
By R. R. Faszczewski
If an ordinance introduc-

ed on July 11 is adopted by
the Rahway City Council
the city will be authorized
to enter into an agreement
with Union County to re-
ceive 582,500 in federal
funding under the Emer-
gency Jobs Bill.

The funding would be
broken down into the fol-
lowing projects: Housing
and commercial rehabilita-
tion, SI5,000; Rahway Day
Care, 55,000, and separa-
tion of storm and sanitary
sewers, 562,500.

The ordinance will be up
for public hearing and poss-
ible final adoption on Mon-
day, Aug. 8, at 8 p.m.

Majority members of the
Governing Body voted
against a resolution, in-
troduced by Sixth Ward
Councilman James J. Ful-
comcr, which would have
requested the State Legis-
lature to place Rahway in a
House of Representatives
district consisting mostly of
Union County.

While Councilman Ful-
comer and and First Ward
Republican Councilman
Lawrence Bodine said the
recently-proposed revision
in the state's Congressional
districts, which would place
Rahway with all Middlesex

County municipali t ies,
would detract from the
city's efforts to get someone
from Rahway elected to
Congress, the Democrats
disagreed.

Democratic Third Ward
Councilman Max Sheld said
the city is getting very good
representation from its pre-
sent House of Representa-
tives member, Bernard Dw-
yer, a Democrat, and he
saw no reason to change
that.

While Councilman Bo-
dine said he agreed the
representation is good now,
Rahway would be placed in
a weak position in the
future should the repre-
sentative change.

He also said both political
parties in Rahway would
have a hard time getting so-
meone elected to Congress
because the Middlesex Cou-
nty party organizations
would have control over
which candidates received
the official "Party lines" in
elections.

The vote tally was 5 to 4
against the motion with the
Democrats all opposed.

A resolution adopted ear-
lier this year to allow the
property on which the
former City Hall building
sits, at 1470 Campbell St.,
to be assigned to Rahway

Towne and Country Con-
dominiums, Inc. of Rahway
from the firm to which it
was originally sold, Howard
Hills Associates of Newark,
was amended by the Gov-
erning Body.

In the course of obtaining
site plan approval for the
construction of apartments
on the site, the firm had
found the existing parking
lot of the old City Hall en-
croaches on a right-of-way.

The amendment was nec-
essary to grant an easement
so the parking lot in the
right-of-way could be used
by the purchasing firm.

* * *

In other action, the coun-
cilmen:

-Unanimously congratu-
lated Municipal Judge Mar-
cus I. Blum on reaching his
80th birthday on July 15.

-Authorized the accep-
tance of a S16,470 bid from
the Electrical Maintenance
and Service Co. of Pequan-
nock for the purchase and
installation of an emergen-
cy generator for the fire
department.

-Okayed the designation
by Mayor Daniel L. Martin
of an official representative
to the Municipal Users
Committee, a group com-
posed of municipalities us-
ing computer equipment

made by the Burroughs
Corp.

-Temporarily suspended
the provisions of city or-
dinances prohibiting mer-
chandise being displayed on
sidewalks so the merchants
in downtown Rahway can
conduct their annual side-
walk sale on W. Main St.
from Lewis to Monroe Sts.,
on Cherry St. from Irving to
Main Sts. and on Irving St.
from Lewis to Cherry Sts.
from 9 a.m. to 9 p.m. on
Thursday, Aug. 18, and
from 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. on
Friday, Aug. 19.

-Authorized the accep-
tance of the low bid from
Computil of Elizabeth for
computer services for the
police department and the
municipal court.

-Approved the refund of
a total of SI 1,195.36 to
Ross Apartment Associates
for overpayment of 1981
and 1982 taxes in accor-
dance with a certificate of
judgment from the Tax
Court of New Jersey.

-Okayed the refund of
57,502.47 to 280 St. George
Ave. Corp. for overpay-
ment of taxes in 1981 and
1982 in accordance with a
tax court judgment.

-Authorized the refund
of $23,019.73 to Bernard
and Ruth Burkhoff for

Freeholders rescind support for lot;
endorse citizens' committee study

By R. R. Faszczewski
A resolution endorsing^

the work of the citizens' |
committee appointed by
Rahway Mayor Daniel L.
Martin to explore all the
ramifications of the propos-
ed temporary parking lot

for Rahway Hospital at the
Union County-owned Gre-
en Field in Rahway was
adopted by a unanimous
vote of the six freeholders
casting ballots at the Board
of Chosen Freeholders
meeting on July 14.

The resolution, intro-
duced by Freeholder Char-
lotte DeFillippo of Hillside
and seconded by Freeholder
Vice Chairman Peter Okra-
sinski of Union, also res-
cinded a resolution, passed
by the freeholders last

month, which supported
the construction of the
parking lot for 226 cars,
pending approval by the
Rahway City Council.

Rahway ' s Governing
Body voted July 11 to post-
pone any action on the lot

YMCA honors volunteers

HAPPY BIRTHDAY - Celebrating the sixth anniversary
of the Rheumatoid Arthritis Progress (RAP) self-help
group held recently at Riverview Hospital, left to right,
are: Paul Georgiou, a physical therapist at Monmouth
Medical Center; Maureen Connors, the area director of
the New Jersey Chapter of the Arthritis Foundation;
Agnes Sandberg, a RAP leader, and J. Clyde Branson,
the executive director of the New Jersey Chapter. Mrs.

Sandberg, a registered nurse, is an arthritis patient. The
RAP group meets every third Tuesday at 7:30 p.m. at
the Riverview Hospital. For information, please contact
Mrs. Sandberg at 1 72 Riveredge Dr., Tinton Falls, or
telephone 747-3224 or Jane McCosker, the public in-
formation officer of the Monmouth County Board of
Social Services in Freehold at 431 -6094.

until it receives a report
from the citizens' commit-
tee, which is expected by
Monday, Aug. 8!

The county resolution,
on which only Freeholder
Chairman Frank H. Lehr of
Summit abstained, and for
which Freeholders Virginia
McKenney of Roselle Park
and Thomas Long of Lin-
den were absent during the
vote, called on the citizens'
committee to work with the

county Transportation and
Engineering Division for a
solution to the hospital
parking problem, created by
new constructioin and ex-
pansion by the hospital, and
also told the county to sup-
port the committee in its re-
port to the Rahway City
Council and the Rahway
Board of Education on its
findings.

' The clerk of the free-
holder board told The Rah-

way News-Record about 20
people spoke on the resolu-
tion, and they were about
evenly divided in their sup-
port or opposition to the
parking lot.

She added there was a
standing-room-only crowd
of over 100 people in the
freeholders' meeting room
in the Union County Ad-
ministration Building in Eli-
zabeth when the vote was
taken.

overpayment of'1981 and
1982 taxes in accordance
with a tax court judgment.

-Approved the addition
of a 5225 senior citizen tax
deduction for 1982 for
Mabel Hooper.

-Transferred S8.843.78
in unbudgeted state school
aid to the general trust fund
balance for use as revenue

the 1984 municipalin

budget.
•Okayed the refund of

$3,942.70 for taxes paid in
error for 1983 by 12 prop-
erty owners.

-Approved raffle licenses
for the St. Ann's Society of
St. Mark's R. C. Church of
Rahway, St. Paul's Episco-
pal Church of Rahway and
the Rahway Day Care Cen-
ter.

City seniors get
housekeeping aid

Rahway is one of two
communities in the state
participating in a new state-
funded program through
which senior citizens living
in city-owned apartment
complexes who don't want
to move and are limited in
their ability to cook, clean
and care for themselves will
receive funds to supplement
their living expenses.

The Dept. of Community
Affairs aid is designed for
seniors and disabled persons
living alone with funding
directed to housekeeping,
nutrition and required per-
sonal services.

The operator of the JFK
Golden Towers on Milton
Ave., the Rahway Senior
Housing Corp.; and the
Rahway Housing Authori-
ty are administering the
funds.

According to Mayor
Daniel L. Martin taxpayers
wiir save in the long run
because they will not have
to pay for services to as
many people residing in
boarding homes.

A prelude to the city's
geriatrie'ecnter, now under
construction on Grand
Ave. near Lawrence St., the
operation of the grant
started with the state mak-
ing allotments to seniors on
a sliding scale based on their
incomes.

Mayor Martin pointed
out if a person's income did
not cover balanced meals
seven days a week, house-
keeping and personal care,
including grooming and
hygiene, he might be con-

Volunteerism has tradi-
tionally been the base of
operations for non-profit in-
stitutions like Young Men's
Christian Assns. and recent-
ly the Rahway Y. M. C. A.
saluted the many indivi-
duals, who give freely of
their time, to make the "Y"
the fine athletic community
center it is, reports a
spokesman.

Over 50 people, ranging
in age from 14 to 67, were
awarded certificates of ap-
preciation by the Rahway
Y. M. C. A.'s Board of
Directors.

Carlos Garay, the presi-
dent of the board, and a
leading local businessman,
commented the commit-
mejit of volunteers is what
sustains the "Y" on a daily
basis."

Mrs. Josephine Polhe-
mus, the program director,
also expresed appreciation

to the many local high
school students who donate
their energies in teaching
swimming, doing clerical
work and cleaning the facili-
ty.

James E. McGreevey, a
member of the board and a
Middlesex County assistant
prosecutor, organized the
volunteer banquet and sta-
ted at the event although
the certificates and light
dinner provided for the
volunteers did not compen-
sate them for their time and
energies, the "Y" felt it im-
portant to say thank you to
its many supporters.

In addition to numerous
high school students, the
"Y" recognized the efforts
of local community mem-
bers such as Simon Kabillo,
who helped to restore the
" Y ' s " physical plant;
Rahway City Business Ad-
ministrator Joseph M. Hart-

nett, who has aided in the
personal search committee,
and Cheryl Martin, a for-
mer board member and
volleyball instructor.

Also cited by the Board
of Trustees were: Michelle
Antonucci, Robert Agliata,
Joseph Atkins, Sonja Bellar-
dino, Eleanore Campbell,
Madeline Desch, Patricia
Ebron, Marcello Fiessi,
Douglas Frank, Steven
Edera, Chris Fry, Mark
Goodman, Joyce Gritschke,
Jeffery Grossman, Wanda
Holmes, Jay Janick, John
Jorgenson, Eli Kabillo,
Frank Kapus, Evelyn Kre-
isberg, Evelyn Maron,
Mayor Daniel L. Martin,
Cathy McGuire, Ronald
Miller, Bill Moran, Jeffery
Ormsby, Olga Pacheco,
Ron Parry, Bob Petraitus,
Ken Peterson, Margaret
Pollack, Del Raudelnas,
Kathy Reynolds, Lynn

Rule, Thomas Schimmel,
Debbie Sloboda, Suzanne
Supko, Anthony Talalai,
Nicki Vanasse, E. J. Vieria,
Ellen Vigilante, Red Vig-
ilante, Brian Way, John
Werbecic, Beth Wilson,
Susan Wimmer, Patricia
Wolf, Dorothy Young and
Dudley E. Painter.

Mr. McGreevey said the
Board of Directors is deeply
indebted to these indivi-
duals and urged others to
become a part of the "Y"
volunteer family.

The Rahwy "Y," located
on Irving St., Rahway, has
again established its swim-
ming, basketball, arts and
crafts and club programs.

In addition it is offering
aerobic/nutri t ional gui-
dance seminars and oper-
ates a summer day camp for
children. Special discount
summer memberships are
also being made available

sidered eligible.
Applicants must reside at

a city-owned complex, in-
cluding the geriatric center
when it is completed.

The coordinator of con-
gregate housing services ;it
the Golden Age Towers,
Sally Vanderzell, estimated
between 10 and 20% of the
residents at each facility will
participate in the program.

At the Golden Age
Towers, she said, approx-
imately 18 seniors will
receive aid.

Earlier this month an in-
troductory meal was attend-
ed by about 30 seniors and
several city officials.

The coordinator reporis
the meals will be supplied
by the Westfield Convales-
cent Center.

The other municipality
participating in the program
is Asbury Park.

Library plans
game days
next week

The Rahway Public Li-
brary summer activities for
children include events for
all children of elementary
school age.

On Monday, July 25,
Game Day will be held
from 10 a.m. to noon. Chil-
dren may play chess or che-
ckers or bring their own
games.

A Story Time for kinder-
garteners to third graders
will be presented on Tues-
day, July 26, from 10:30 to
11 a.m. With the theme of
rocks and stones, stories will
be told and a filmstrip
shown.

On Wednesday, July 27,
from 10:30 to 11:30 a.m.,
boys and girls in kinder-
garten to sixth grade mj\y
make a dragon out of clay.
They may return on Thurs-
day, July 28, from 10:30 to
11 a.m., to paint their dra-
gons. Pre-school children
may participate only if ac-
companied by a parent.
Also on July 28, volunteer
Margaret Novalany, will
read to children of pre-sch-
ool to kindergarten age
from 2 to 2:30 p.m.

Access for the handicap-
ped may be arranged if the
library is notified by tele-
phone at 381 -4110 two days
before each scheduled
event.

More news
on Green Field:

See Inside
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(ONALD'S FRIENDS - For an end-of-the-year party the
• tudents in Pam Mullins' morning pre-school class at
:i;uk's Carl H.' Kumpf School visited the McDonald's
•.•st iurant in Avenel. Ready for their guided tour, left to

, - r r.c~ f

right, are: Farah Segro, Michele Shiel, Bobby DeMarco,
Jennifer Selitto, Amy Beth Cohen, Meridith Steckler,
Julie! Perucd, Yvonne Tondera and Raymond Doss.

ONLY THE BEGINNING - At a graduation party to
celebrate their September entry into kindergarten are
students in Pam Mullins pre-school class at Clark's Carl
H. Kumpf School. With the teacher, left, left to right,

are: Farah Segro, Michelle Shiel, Amy Beth Cohen,
Bobby DeMarco, Jennifer Sellito, Yvonne Tondera,
Mrs. Marie Woznicki, a teacher aide; Juliet Perucci and
Meridith Steckler.

DAY IS DONE - Students in Helen Kunak's first-grade
class at Clark's Carl H. Kumpf School rest after their re-
cent picnic. Behind the students are the teacher and
the mother of a student, Mrs. Marietta Schott.

Union Counselors
complete program

4
liic United Way of Un-

Mii I ouniy and the Union
; IHKIIV Labor Council of
p'ie American Federation of
.' ah:': Ihe Congress of In
: us; i lal Organizat ions,
\I i CIO, co-sponsored the
''S ; liiiion Counselor's

I ' l u . i ' i ' a n i .

I he program helps Union
.lenihers act as referral

..gents for their friends,
neighbors and co-workers.
i luNian service agencies in
:!ie i.unity were featured at
:ie weekly meetings. Sup-

plied with ihis information.
I 'ni'ui Counselors can refer
, eopie in need to I he proper
.':ei:c\. reports a spokes-
. l a i i .

Representing Local No.
• 25 nl the Industrial Union

Of Lmploycs, I. U. O. E., of
the AFL-CIO were Leo Ri-
ley of Union-Vauxhall.

John Fenton of Linden.
Robert Edwards of Rail-
way, Gene Callahan of Cla-
rk, Greg Moore of Clark

and Maurice Power of Cla-
rk.

Participating from Local
No. 262 of the Interna-
tional Brotherhood of Elec-
trical Workers of the AFL
CIO were Ernest Owens of
Plainfield and Claude Sut-
ton of Scotch Plains.

Attending from Local
No. 1095 of the Commun-

ica t ions W o r k e r s of
American of the AFL-CIO
were Willie J. Briee of
Linden, Joseph Wallace of
Plainfield and John D. Fit/-
maurice of Union.

Also participating were
Janet Blazwicz of Elizabeth.
Mrs. Fannie M. Gallon of
Roselle, Mrs. Rosalyn M.
Reed and Miss Caroline

WOODBRIDGE CHIROPRACTIC CENTER P.A.

Dr. Anthony Patras
Director

COVERED BY
•Automobile Accident (no fault) 'Medicare
•Blue Shield 'Most Union Plans
•Authorized Workers Comp. 'Major Medical

Office Hours Dally
8:30 AM to 9 PM

24 Hour—7 Days Emtrgtncy Chiropractic Car*

434Rohway Ave., Woodbridge, NJ . 634-4225

Campers
urged to make

reservation

"Backpacking" to teach
those in the fifth to seventh
grades how to live in the
woods using fundamental
techniques and skills, will
enable them to camp over-
night in the Watchung Res-
ervation from Monday to
Tuesday, Aug. 15 to 16.
The fee will be S20.

For more information or
to register, please telephone
the Trailside Nature and
Science Center at Coles
Ave. and New Providence
Rd., Mountainside, at
232-5930.

Coffeehouse

to return

The "Somebody's Place"
coffeehouse will once again
take place at the Alliance
Church at Retford Ave. at
Cherry St., Cranford, from
8 to 11:30 p.m. on Satur-
day, July 23.

"Bones and Joan," a trio
from the local area, along
with the "Somebody's
Place" drama group will be
performing that night.

Admission will be free
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TOP OF THE CLASS - James Eliff, the president of the
Clark Scholarship Fund, is shown, left, with, left to right,
Eileen Tisdall, the recipient of the S800 Alice B. Flood
Memorial Scholarship; Craig Naha, the recipient of the
$1,600 Henry C. Staeger Memorial Scholarship, and

Educators hail
teacher training bill
A spokeswoman for the

New Jersey Education
Assn. today praised leg-
islative proposals intended
to relieve the shortage of
mathematics and science
teachers in New Jersey
schools.

Announced recently, the
proposal would give sub-
ject-matter instruction at
the state colleges during the
summer to experienced tea-
chers now working in fields
of surplus. The state would
pay 75% of the costs, the
local school district 25%.

"This is an ideal solution
to two problems," said as-
sociation president, Ediihe
A. Fulton. "One problem is
the layoff of teachers due to
reductions in the pupil pop-
ulation. The other is the
shortage of certified teach-
ers in technical fields. There
is no better pool from which
a local school district could

draw mathematics and sci-
ence instructors than from
teachers who already know
the students, the communi-
ty and the local schools."

The proposals come from
Assembly Speaker Alan
Karcher, who is Rahway's
director of law, and Demo-
cratic Assemblyman D.
Bennett Mazur of Bergen
County, and will be intro-
duced as a four-bill package
in the near future.

Although the written
wording was not yet avail-
able, Mrs. Fulton said she
was "delighted" the pro-
posals seem to conform
with recommendat ions
adopted in May by the edu-
cator group's policy-making
delegate assembly.

The legislative proposals
will require local school
boards to determine what
staffing changes will be-

Kean College offers
new art course

Nursing home and senior
center personnel are enroll-
ing in Art Media in Geron-
tology, a new course begin-
ning in the fall semester at
Kean College of New Jersey
in Union where it was
developed by the college
and the fine arts depart-
ment.

Classes will meet from 5
to 8:20 p.m. on Mondays in
Vaughn-Eames Hall.

Robert Famigheiti of
•East Orange, the director of
the center, said it will aid in-
stitution staffers in organiz-
ing and conducting arts and

Rovnak from Local No.
1009 of the Communica-
tions Workers of American
ofahe AFL-CIO.

All participating coun-
selors were presented with a
Union Counselor certificate
and a lapel pin.

crafts programs for the el-
derly.

Dr. Pearl Greenberg of
New York City, a professor
in the fine arts department,
will be the instructor. She
also co-ordinates art educa-
tion and graduate pro-
grams.

Dr. Greenberg is the
author of more than 45 ar-
ticles and co-author of two
books on arts and aging.
Her students have been
placed in hospitals, nursing
homes and senior centers
over a 10-year period.

Enrollment information
may be obtained from the
center, in James Townley
House at Kean college by
telephoning 527-2605.

A grain of musk will scent
millions of cubic feet of air.
Musk is the most pene-
trating and persistent scent.

CAMERA CENTER

MINOLTA XGA
Easy 1b Use
Easy Tb Afford

GREAT
VALUE

12999

Camera -i- 2.0 L«n«

The X G A is
the ultimate

point-focus-shoot
35mm SLR.

SAVE MONEY • CHECK OUR PRICES BEFORE YOU BUY

IEg?COMMUNITY Phon* 381-58M
(if CAMERA 1489 MAIN STREET

BSS CENTER RAHWAY, N J . 07065

come necessary in both the
short and long-term, forcing
every school system to iden-
tify teachers facing possible
layoff and to make known
future openings in such sub-
jects as mathematics, sci-
ence and computer educa-
tion.

"By motivating teachers
to earn certification in fields
of shortage, this will main-
tain a strong faculty," Mrs.
Fulton said. "It is fair and
prudent management that
should benefit both the
teachers and the student
body."

One possibe conflict, the
association head warned, is
a proposal being floated by
some state education of
ficials to invalidate eern
ficates that teachers hold in
fields in which they do not
actively teach, so-called
"idle endorsements."

Said Mrs. Fulton: "We
hope the legislation will
make it impossible for bur
eaucrats to void endorse
ments earned under i!n>.
legislation if the . ipcum;^
do not occur r quickly as
cxpcvjted."

The association president
also urged the bill drafters
to assure fairness in the pro-
cedure that chooses teac-
hers for the training.

"Favoritism should not
enter the selection proce-
dure," she declared. "Sen-
iority rights should be strict-
ly observed."

Otherwise, Mrs. Fulton
said, the proposals appear
"ideal" for reducing or eli-
minating the shortage of
teachers so students in New
Jersey schools receive quali-
ty education in technicalU-'
subjects.

Miss Colette Clinedinst, the recipient of two awards,
the Kiwanis Club of Clark Scholarship in memory of An-
thony Prisco for $300, and the Clark Scholar's Burse
for $300, and James Toal, the first vice president and
fund-raising chairman of the Clark Scholarship Fund.

Foster homes
sought for children

The New Jersey Division
of Youth and Family Ser-
vices, a part of the Dept. of
Human Services, is looking
for families to serve as tem-
porary parents for infants
and children under five
years of age.

According to Ellen Aro-
mando, the supervisor of
the division's Foster Home
and Adoption Resource
Center in Newark, there is a
need for foster homes for
children of all ages. At this
time, there is a critical shor-
tage of foster homes for in-
fants and children under
five years of age, she said.

The center services Essex
and Union Counties.

Qualifying to become a
foster parent involves com-
pleting a home-study pro-
cess which begins by con-
tacting the center. Those
approved by the agency will
receive training.

Applicants must be at
least 18 years of age, may
be married or single, and do
not need to have their own
home. Those applying must
be in reasonably sound phy-
sical and mental health.
•«•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••

References arc requested.
There is no income require-
ment.

The division gives sel-
ected foster parents a mon-
thly board rate for each
child, plus a clothing al-
lowance. Foster children
also receive medical and
dental care through Medi-
caid. Arrangements can be
made to provide cribs for
foster parents willing to
care for infants.

According to Ellen Aro-
mando, people often ques-
tion how a foster family can
care for a child knowing he
or she will eventually leave.

"There is satisfaction in
helping a child for whatever
time he or she is with you",
she explained.

She stated experience
with children, flexibility,
and a willingness to accept a
child for himself are quali-
ties of successful foster
parents. The -ability to work
with the agency is also nec-
essary.

"Most important," she
concluded, "is the ability to
love a child and let him go."

• • •
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MR. AND MRS. THOMAS J. MAYE
(She Is the former Miss Loretta Blanco)

Miss Bianco weds
Thomas J. Maye

Miss Loretta Bianco, the daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Alia Bianco, was married to Thomas J. Maye of 388 W.
Lake Ave.. the son of Mrs. Bonnie Maye of 1388 New
Church St., Rahway, and the late James J. Maye. Jr. on
Sunday. May 29 in St. Mary's R. C. Church in Railway.

The pastor. The Rev. Joseph Quinlan. performed the
5:30 p.m. ceremony. A reception followed at The Manor
in West Orange.

Escorted by her father, the bride had Miss Jeanie
Altadonna as her maid of honor. The bridesmaids were
Miss Donna Bianco. Miss Tammy Greenemiere, Miss
Lucinca Bianco and Miss Pamela Fiorello.

Serving as the best man was Cant. James J. Maye.
3rd. The ushers were Frank Bianco. Christopher Bianco,
Steven Fiorello and Anthony Campo.

Following a honeymoon in Bermuda, the couple will
reside in Rahway.

Mrs. Maye is a graduate of Rahway High School.
A 1978 graduate of Rahway High School, Mr. Maye

attended Rutgers University and is employed by Station
Cab, Inc. in Rahway as the vice president and manager.
He is the treasurer of the Rahway Sideliners and the
president-elect of the Rahway Kiwanis Club.

'Dresser' runs
at SUMMERFUN
SUMMERFUN, a New

Jersey professional summer
theater, will present the
state's production premiere
of Ronald Harwood's
drama, "The Dresser," to
Saturday, July 23.

This recent Broadway
success centers on a Sha-
kespearian actor's dresser
and the role he plays as
guardian and confidant to
the star.

Greg Zerkle plays Sir, the
aging actor-manager leading
his company of Thespians
through a production of
"King Lear;" Stephen Tur-
ner plays Norman, the title
character.

The supporting cast fea-
tures Lindsay Margo Smith,
Craig MacDonald and the
rest of the SUMMERFUN
acting company.

"The Dresser" is directed
by Walter Kotrba, who re-
cently directed the SUM-
MERFUN production of
"Children of a Lesser God."

The scenic and lighting
designer is Robert Klin-
gelhoefer.

"The Dresser" is the
fourth show of SUMMER-
FUN's expanded eight-
week season. The remain-
der of the season consists of
Ira Levin's "Deathtrap" and
"They're Playing Our Song"
by Neil Simon with music
and lyrics by Marvin Ham-
lisch and Carol Bayer Sager.

SUMMERFUN is in resi-
dence at Montclair State
College in Upper Montclair.
All performances are at
8:30 p.m. in air-conditioned

Memorial Auditorium. Tic-
ket prices are S6 from Tues-
day to Thursday and S7.5O
on Friday and Saturday.
Student and senior citizen
rates are availble. There is a
special student discount on
Friday evenings: Two stu-
dents with full-time identi-
fications are admitted for
55.

For reservations or fur-
ther information please tele-
phone the SUMMERFUN
box office at 746-9120.

'Junior

Scientists'

to meet

at Trailside
A "Junior Scientist"

program in which those in
the first and second grades
will experiment with com-
bustion, water, chemicals,
food and other materials to
learn basic scientific prin-
ciples on Monday to Wed-
nesday mornings in two ses-
sions: Aug. 8 to 10. and
Aug. 22 to 24, and the fee is
S10 per session.

Those in the third and
fourth grades will meeuon
Monday to Thursday morn-
ings in two sessions: Aug. 1
to 4 and Aug. 15 to 18, and
that fee is SI4 per session.

The sessions will be held
at the Trailside Nature and
Science Center at Coles
Ave. and New Providence
Rd., Mountainside. To reg-
ister and for more informa-
tion, please telephone
232-5930.

BELL DRUGS OF RAHWAY

J OUR SPECIALTY

381-2000
FREE PARKING • FREE DELIVERY

IRVING ST., OPP. ELIZABETH AVE.

Community
Calendar

EDITOR'S N0TI: In order for us to adequately prepare
the Community Calendar, all events for the following
week should be submitted by 5 p.m. on the WEDNESDAY
before you would like them to appear.

RAHWAY
--NOW TO FRIDAY, JULY 29 -- St. Mary's School, An-

nual Glad Days.
-THURSDAY, JULY 14 - Board of Education. Caucus.

8 p.m., Superintendent's Office, Rahway Junior High
School.

-MONDAY, JULY 18 - Board of Education. Regular
Meeting, 7:55 p.m.. Roosevelt School auditorium. Board
of Adjustment. Public Library, Children's Dept. Game
Day, 10 a.m. to noon.

-TUESDAY, JULY 19 - Public Library. Book Bingo.
10:30 to 11:30 a.m. for children who can read.

-•WEDNESDAY, JULY 20 -- Parking Authority. Caucus.
7:30 p.m., home of Louis Garay. 1299 Clark Si. Public-
Library, T-shirts may be brought by children from 10:30
a.m. to noon to add dragons to. Transportation for han-
dicapped, telephone 381-4110 by July 18.

-THURSDAY, JULY 21 -- Public Library, Read To Me
Story Time for those in pre-school to kindergarten. 2 to
2:30 p.m. Transportation for handicapped, telephone
381-4110 by July 19.

Rahwa\ Area Junior Woman's
p.m.. home of Mrs. Kathleen

-SUNDAY, JULY 24 -•
Club, Family Picnic, 4
Schmidt, Rahway.

--MONDAY, JUIY 25 •• Chamber of Commerce. 7 p.m..
Huffman-Koos auditorium. Si. George Ave. Public
Library, Game Day, 10 a.m. to noon. Access for han-
dicapped, 381-41 10, two days before event.

• -TUESDAY, JULY 26 -• Planning Board. Public
Library, Story Time for kindergarteners to third graders.
10:30 to 1 1 a.m. Access for handicapped, 381 41 10. two
days before event.

--WEDNESDAY, JULY 27 •- Public Library, children in
kindergarten to sixth grade to make dragons out of clay,
10:30 to 11 a.m. Access for handicapped. 381-4110. two
days before event.

-THURSDAY, JUIY 28 •- Students making dragons on
July 27 may return to Public Library to paint them. 10:30
to II a.m. Volunteer, Margaret Novalany to read to
children of pre-school to kindergarten age, 2 to 2:30 p.m.
Access for handicapped,381 -4110, two days before event.

-TUESDAY, AUG. 2 -• City Council. Pre Meeting Con-
ference, 7:30 p.m.. Council Chambers. City Hall. City
Hall Plaza.

-MONDAY, AUG. 8 -- City Council. Regular Meeting.
8 p.m.. Council Chambers, City Hall. City Hall Pla/a.

• -TUESDAY, AUG. 9 -• Railway Historical Sociel\, 8
p.m., Merchants' and Drovers' Tavern. St. George and
Westfield Aves., Liberty Square.

-THURSDAY, AUG. 11 •• Board of Education. Caucus,
8 p.m.. Superintendent's Office, Rahway Junior High
School.

-MONDAY, AUG. IS •- Board of Education, Regular
Meeting, 7:55 p.m.. Roosevelt School Auditorium. Board
of Adjustment.

•-TUESDAY, AUG. 23 -- Planning Board.
-WEDNESDAY, AUG. 24 -- Parking Authority. Mon-

thly Caucus. 7:30 p.m.. home of Louis Garay, 1299 Clark
St.. _ / - - '

--MONDAY, AUG. 29 -- Chamber of Commerce, 7
p.m., Huffman-Koos Auditorium. St. George Ave.

CLARK
--FRIDAY, JULY 22 -• Clark Jayceeettes. Summer

Splash Party For Members and Children. Information.
382-1405.

-MONDAY, JULY 25 •- Board of Adjustment, Regular
Meeting. 8 p.m.. Council Chambers. Municipal Building.
Westfield Ave.

-TUESDAY, JULY 26 •• Planning Board. Regular
Business Meeting.

-MONDAY, AUG. 1 -• Township Council. Executive
Meeting, 8 p.m.. Council Chambers. Municipal Building.
Westfield Ave.

-TUESDAY, AUG. 2 -- Regional Board of Education,
Regular Meeting, 8 p.m.. Instructional Media Center,
Jonathan Dayton Regional High School. Springfield.

-TUESDAY, AUG. 9 -- Planning Board, Executive Ses-
sion. Public Library, Fun Time for those in kindergarten
to third grade, 2 to 3 p.m.

-WEDNESDAY, AUG. 10 •• Board of Adjustment. Ex-
ecutive Meeting, 8 p.m.. Conference Room. Municipal
Building, Westfield Ave. Library Board of Trustees.
Library Meeting Room.

-MONDAY, AUG. 15 -- Township Council, Regular
Meeting, 8 p.m.. Council Chambers. Municipal Building.
Westfield Ave.

-TUESDAY, AUG. 16 -• Public Library. Fun Time,
Craft Program, for those in fourth to seventh grade, 2 to
3 p.m. Register. 388-5999.

-MONDAY, AUG. 22 -- Board of Adjustment, Regular
Meeting, 8 p.m.. Council Chambers. Municipal Building.
Westfield Ave.

-TUESDAY, AUG. 23 -• Elementary Board of Educa-
tion, 8 p.m.. Administration Building, Schindler Rd. Plan
ning Board, Regular Business Meeting.

Merck cites
Dr. Scolnick

Mr. and Mrs. Albert G. Hughes, Sr.

Albert Hugheses
mark 50 years

Mr. and Mrs. Albert G. Hughes. Sr.. residents of
Rahway, recently celebrated their 50th wedding anniver-
sary at a surprise dinner in (heir honor, held at Howard
Johnson's Restaurant in Clark on Saturday, July 2.

The dinner was given by their children and their
families: Albert Hughesof Willingboro; Loretta Decker of
Clark; Frances Wagner of Avenel and William Hughesof
Chino, Calif.

Mrs. Hughes is (he former Miss Mary-Frances
Witkowsky of New Rochelle, N. V.

Mr. Hughes was born in Staten Island.
Mr. and Mrs. Hughes have been residents of

Railway for the past 3d years.

Junior Women
seek members

The Rahway Area Junior
Woman's Club is an organ-
ization comprised of women
between the ages of 18 and
35 who volunteer their ser-
vices and raise funds for
scholarships and charities.

The club is non-political
and non-sectarian and has
been federated through the
New Jersey State Federa-
tion of Women's Clubs, a
member of the General
Federation of Women's
Clubs.

The general federation is
the largest volunteer organ-
ization in the world with
over 10 million women
members in 42 countries
dedicated to "Unity in
Diversity-Community Im-
provement Through Volun-
teer Efforts."

Among the organizations
and charities assisted by the
Rahway Area Juniors dur-
ing the fiscal 1982-1983
year were: Railway First
Aid Squad, Clark First Aid
Squad. Colonia First Aid
Squad. Edison First Aid
Squad, Rahway Hospital, J.
F. K. Medical Center in

Charges set
for articles
on nuptials
The charge for the place-

ment of wedding.and engag-
ement announcements in
The Rahway News-Record and
The Clark Patriot It $5
WITHOUT a picture and $8
WITH a picture.

The forms are available
at the offices of the
newspapers at 219 Central
Ave., Rahway, or by writing
to Box No. 1061, Rahway, N.
J. 07065 or by telephoning
the office at 574-1200.

In order to run in the
following week's editions,
the information must be
submitted, either typed or
clearly printed by 5 p.m. on
the preceding THURSDAY.

The first known use of the expression " A - 1 " was said to be by Lloyd's of
London, the British insurance organization. Lloyd's graded ships according to
the risk of insuring them and those rated " A - 1 " were thought least likely to sink.

Come to Our Summer 2 for 1

\ by Maribeth

Enjoy a free class July 20-28th
Join with a friend & pay only $15 each
for our 6 wk. program combining
aerobic dancing & slimnastics

Classes Begin Week of Aug. 1st
Rahway-Colonia-Avenel-Carteret

Call to Enroll
636-2629 or 381-4310

Edison, the Children's
Specialized Hospital in
Mountainside, Friends of
Rahway Library, Clark
Free Public Library, Rail-
way Historical Society.
American Cancer Society,
Brittle Bone Disease Foun-
dation, the Cystic Fibrosis
Foundation and the United
Slates Olympic Committee.

In addition, two scholar-
ships were given to local
area youths.

If you are interested in
helping others and serving
your community, as well as
meeting other young wo-
men like yourself, please
telephone Mrs. Audi Two-
mbly, the membership
chairwoman, at 382-6925.

Dr. Edward M. Scolnick

Named vice president for
virus and cell biology
research in the Merck Sharp
and Dolime Research La-
boratories Division of Mcr
ek and Co., Inc. of Rahway
was Dr. Fdward M. Scol-
nick.

Dr. Scolnick had been the
division's executive director
of virus and cell biology
since joining the company
in 1982. He will continue to
be based at the company's
laciliu in West Point, Pa.

The new vice president
succeeds Dr. Maurice R.
llilleman, who directed
virus and cell biology re-
search at Merck for 26
\ears. Dr. Hillcman has
been named senior vice
president of Merck Sharp
and Dohme Research La
boratories.

Dr. Scolnick is noted for
his work with oncogenes
and the processes through
which gene mutations lead
to some cancers.

Before joining Merck lie
was associated with the Na-
tional Cancer Institute in
Bethesda. Md. for 12 years,
firs I as the senior staff
fellow in the Viral Leu-

kemia and Lymphoma Bra-
nch, and from 1973 to
1982, as the chief of the
Laboratory for Tumor
Virus Genetics and the
head of its Molecular
Virology Section.

Earlier, the new vice-
president had been asso-
ciated with the National
Heart Institute in Bethesda,
which he joined in 1967
after completing his intern-
ship and residency at Mass
achusetts General Hospital
in Boston.

He received his medical
degree from Harvard Med-
ical School in 1965. A
native of Boston, Dr. Scol-
nick was graduated with
honors in 1961 from Har-
vard College, where he ma-
jored in biochemical sci-
ences.

Dr. Scolnick is the senior
editor of the "Journal of
Virology," and the author
or coauthor of more than
130 publications and the

recipient of numerous
honors, including the Ar-
thur S. Fleming Award for
outstanding science, the
Public Health Service Sup
erior Service Award and the
Eli Lilly Award for micro-
biology.

Clark Library

to sponsor

Fun Times

The Clark Public Library
will present two programs
for children during August.
Fun Time for those in kin-
dergarten to third grade, in-
cluding stories, songs and
games, will be held on Tues-
day, Aug. 9, from 2 to 3
p.m. Registration is not re-
quired.

Fun Time for those in the
fourth to seventh grades, a
craft program, will be held
on Tuesday. Aug. 16, from
2 to 3 p.m.

Since materials will be
provided by the library,
children who wish to attend
must register at the library
or by telephoning 388-5999.
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to the
Editor

Mr. Yoder replies
to hospital critics

As chief, executive officer of Rahway*-Hospital, I
would like to reply to a letter to the editor in the July 14
issue of The Rahway News-Record opposing the proposed
parking lot on Kaminski Dr., Rahway, in order to correct
several misconceptions.

Because the community has only recently been ad-
vised of the impact of the hospital's parking problem
because of an impending major construction program
over the next five years, the hospital management has
been charged with a lack of foresight in this matter.

Actually, the hospital has been trying to acquire ad-
ditional land since 1970. Within the span of the dozen
years since then, it has been able to buy 10 pieces of pro-
perty and' continues to buy property as it becomes
available. We have to be patient about awaiting such op-
portunities, of course, because owners respond to offers in
accordance with their own personal plans.

One recurring criticism is the hospital missed a
golden opportunity when it did not acquire the Searles
Estate when it was on the market. I can assure you the
hospital Board of Governors did give thoughtful con-
sideration to buying that land.

However, when the owner's asking price far exceed-
ed the appraised value of the property, the board voted to
discontinue the consideration.

Sixth Ward Councilman James J. Fulcomer ad-
vocates construction of a parking garage as the best solu-
tion to the parking problem.

In fact, that is the most expensive solution, and I am
surprised that Councilman Fulcomer would suggest it, in
view of his concern about expenditure of the public's
money.

Construction of a parking garage is the hospital's
least preferred solution-for one reason because it would
cost $3 to $4 million and the cost would have to be passed
along to our patients.

In addition, if a parking garage were constructed, it
would restrict the hospital's ability to expand to meet
future community needs. Furthermore, anyone who
visualizes such a structure will realize it would be a per-
manent non-conforming building in our suburban setting,
and therefore a last resort, not a first.

The hospital has always advocated finding a solution
that will benefit the entire community, and therefore we
look forward to participation on the committee suggested
by Second Ward Councilman John C. Marsh and im-
plemented by Mayor Daniel L. Martin for this purpose.

John L. Yoder
president

Rahway Hospital
865 Stone St.

Rahway

Consistency urged
in education system

The continuing saga of the state of our education is
beginning to take on the unreal quality of "Alice in
Wonderland." The scenario has Lewis Carroll beat by a
mile.

Edithe Fulton, the president of the New Jersey
Education Assn., the teachers' union, is still hollering
"foul" despite the schools turning out any number of kids
with the "youknow" syndrome. Not only are these
students consistent, but they can say "you know" in two
languages. —~

Mrs. Fulton, on television, claimed the public is be-
ing given misinformation and non-passage of the recent
bill giving unions wider bargaining rights is unfair to
teachers.

If Edithe Fulton is really concerned about teachers
perhaps she can explain why she is willing for the tax-
payers to pay all kinds of money for the incompetent
teachers while the truly dedicated, competent ones con-
tinue to knock themselves out amidst permissive, sub-
standard academic curricula.

If you try to pin down exactly whose fault it is
Johnny cannot read, or write, or add and subtract you
will find yourself facing an impossible situation. It is a
watered-down system composed of bits and pieces of in-
formation dispensed through scores of mini-courses. It is
also a system which is built to be "accountability-free."

With small class size NO CHILD SHOULD GET
LOST IN THE SYSTEM which is one of the latest
reasons for a child being graduated who cannot read.

Since merit pay has been mentioned as a method of
improving the teaching skills there has been much said by
the teachers' union about the impossibility of evaluating
teachers. They consider it impossible.

Suppose the schools used the "trolley system"
through the lower grades, whereby the same teacher
would be with the children for several years. Immediately
you have accountability!

If the administrators and/or the department heads
decide upon what material is to be covered during that
term and at the end of that term devise a test based upon
such material, you would know exactly what the perfor-
mance of a teacher was.

Even more important, non-readers and students poor

Does your house
have a taproom?

By Rahway Fire Chief James T. Heller
Altogether too many American homes have several

"tap rooms"--that is, rooms where a vast horde of electric
appliances are connected to one hapless electric outlet by
means of those handy little plastic taps.

"Tap rooms" are only one sign of the kind of elec-
trical foodhardiness that can lead to deadly fire. Then we
get involved with another kind of "taps." The kind that's
played on a bugle.

Here are ideas for conducting a quick inspection of
the electrical equipment in your home. Taking time to
evaluate the way you use electricity can be a very fire-
wise thing to do.

First off, how many appliances do you have tapping
into a single outlet? Two? Five? More? Here's how to
calculate how many appliances are too much for a single
outlet. Most household electric circuits are rated 15 amps.
Use more power than that and the circuit breaker pops or
the fuse blows.

As a simple estimating guide, figure each amp equals
about 100 watts. In that case, you can use up to 1,500
watts of power on your 15-amp line; 15 100-watt
lightbulbs or one 1,500-watt space heater or a 1,000-watt
hair dryer, a 250-watt lightbulb and a television set draw-
ing 250 watts...or any combination of electrical ap-
pliances whose total wattage does not exceed 1,500.

If you're popping fuses frequently, you're trying to use
more power than a line can provide. If you switch to a
higher-rated fuse, you'll be able to draw more power than
the line is rated to deliver.

Result: The line will heat up and perhaps cause an
electrical fire.

The way to deal with fuses and circuit breakers that
keep "popping off is to re-distribute your electrical de-
mand. Figure out what outlets are on which lines and
move your appliances around so demand is more evenly
distributed.

Remember wiring in older homes may be badly
deteriorated and incapable of carrying even its rated load
without prohibitive heat build-up; it's a good idea to avoid
drawing the maximum available power from any one line
for a long period of time.

Once you've reshuffled your appliances, you should
find you no longer need those cumbersome taps with their
dangers of shock and circuit overloading.

Then again, you may find all your available outlets
are fully used-or you can't reshuffle your appliances
without running power from room to room with exten-
sion cords, never a good idea.

If that's the case, your home may not have enough
electrical service to accommodate your family's electronic
lifestyle. Rather than court electrical fire, consider hiring
a licensed electrician to install the additional service your
home needs.

It's an investment both in good living and in life
itself.

in other basics would not get lost in the system. With the
"trolley system" too, you would have no gaps in the
students' education. A good month each term would be
saved while a new teacher and the students would other-
wise be getting to know each other.

One argument against this system might be the child
not getting along with the teacher. Isn't this an ideal time
for a youngster to learn he has to get along with all kinds
of people in this world? If the clash is serious then the stu-
dent could always be changed to another class.

The taxpayer can no longer afford to reward or pay
for incompetence! It is too costly. Unfortunately, the ones
paying the highest price for incompetence arc the
children.

On television and in some newspapers you are seeing
a flood of programs and pictures of children dancing,
children singing, children with flags, children par-
ticipating in arts and crafts and other visibly-enjoyable oc-
cupations.

One would hope, however, the school system would
not use the children's natural cutencss and ability to per-
suade the public everything is "hunky-dory." Frequent
references to those wonderful youngsters in the "gifted-
and-talented" group are fine, provided one remembers
their "gift" is inborn and is not necessarily present as a
result of the superiority of the educational system.

Very often, when addressing a particular problem,
because you are focusing on just that, the subject takes on
a very negative feeling. Not so. There are many extremely
fine, competent teachers in our midst, just as there are
many extremely successful teachers.

The numbers on the other side of the ledger are get-
ting too large, however. What is happening today makes
"thorough and efficient" stick in your throat.

Betty A. Schroeck (Mrs. John)
56 Hutchinson St.

Clark

Congressman

Bernard
Dwyer
Reports

Nursing home law
faces strengthening

Ensuring elderly and handicapped nursing home
residents high quality care in a safe setting is the goal of
legislation currently pending in the Congress to halt the
implementation of proposals put forth by the administra-
tion last year ihat could weaken current nursing home
standards.

Last year the administration proposed rules that
would have diminished federal and state oversight of nur-
sing homes by reducing the frequency of inspections and
weakening the requirements for the correction of defi-
ciencies.

Both the Mouse and the Senate did not believe

•---justified :aiid-rrthvcd'truiclchjrro' csiablisTfaYiioratorium on
these proposals.

This year's bill, the "National Nursing Home Stan-
dards Act of 1983." would establish a 13-member com-
mission under the auspices of the Institute of Medicine of
the National Academy of Sciences to evaluate the total
body of current nursing home regulations and report to
the Dept. of Health and Human Services and the Con-
gress by September, 1984.

The bill would also extend the current moratorium
on any rule changes until six months after the Commis-
sion reports, giving Congress and the Dept. of Health and
Human Services an opportunity to act on the recommen-
dations of the Commission.

II.R. 2997 is patterned after a bill introduced during
the previous Congress to which I also lent my support as a
co-sponsor. Under the provisions.of the bill the commis-
sion would be composed of nursing home residents or
their representatives, providers of nursing home care,
along with members of the Institute of Medicine which
has been working on plans for the study.

There are 1.3 million people in our country living in
approximately 18.000 nursing homes. Nursing homes are
one of the major growth areas in the health sector.

The Congress has consistently recognized the poten-
tial for abuse m such a fast-growing industry caring for a
comparatively unprotected population and has pressed
for stronger standards and oversight.

Currently, both the federal government and the
states are involved in supervising both the quality of care
offered residents of nursing homes and the health and
safety of thrtse residents.

The House Subcommittee on Health has begun
markup U.K. 2997. and it is hoped the department will in-
itiate the study in the near future.

The Congress and the administration are responsible
for assuring strong and effective enforcement standards
arc in place to assure nursing home residents and their
loved ones the quality of care provided meets the highest

-Standard. —

DATELINE:
TRENTON

A Legislative Report from
Senator Don DiFroncesco

Job-training bill
forms partnership
Gov. Thomas H. Kean is expected to shortly sign in-

to law a hill I sponsored that will train several thousand
New Jerseyans for guaranteed jobs in private business.

This would be a unique state program involving a
partnership between government and business in prepar-
ing workers for available jobs.

Although New Jersey's unemployment rate is below
the inrtronal average and much lower than other nor-
theastern states unemployment remains a major problem.

There are 272,000 New Jersey residents out of work.
Many of them have spent months fruitlessly looking for
work. In addition, there are many New Jerseyans work-
ing at jobs that do not pay enough to meet family ex-
penses and are forced to seek public assistance.

This job-training program is aimed at these residents-
•the long-term unemployed, those who lost their jobs
because of plant closings, and the economically disadvan-
taged.

The program would provide on-the-job training,
classroom instruction and customized training for
workers, depending on individual needs.

Business would pay at least 25% of the cost of train-
ing workers. When on-the-job training is involved,
employers would pay half the cost.

Unlike past federal jobs programs, this will not be a
make-work project. Workers will be taught the skills they
need to fill identified job openings.

This program will make a good start at putting New
Jerseyans who are eager to find jobs back to work.

In addition, the state will be receiving S80 million in
federal funds in October to greatly expand our job-
training efforts.

The governor has appointed a special advisory com-
mittee, the New Jersey Job Training Coordinating Coun-
cil, to make recommendations on how the federal funds
should he used to best serve the state's unemployed.

So far the council has recommended regional boards
be established to develop job-training programs that meet
area needs.

Combined the federal and state programs should pro-
vide training for 14,000 residents to prepare them for jobs
with a promising future.
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COUNTY CONGRATULATIONS - Union County Freeholder Walter E. Boright, second
from left, a teacher in the Clark school system, sponsored a resolution which was
passed by the Union County Board of Chosen Freeholders congratulating Lori Lux-
enberg of Clark, center, upon her selection to participate in the "Girls' State" govern-
mental project. Miss Luxenberg is a senior at the Arthur L. Johnson Regional High
School in Clark and is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Alan Luxenberg of Clark. With
Freeholder Boright and Miss Luxenberg, left to right, are: Union County Freeholder
Thomas W. Long of Linden and Mr. and Mrs. Alan Luxenberg.
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WASHINGTON
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I2th District, New Jersey ,

House bill offers
homeowners help
The skyrocketing cost of housing over the past few

years has made it virtually impossible for many people,
especially young couples, to come up with the money for
a down payment on their first home.

In fact, the President's Commission on Housing
reported last year the inability of potential home buyers
to obtain enough capital for a down payment is one of the
principal obstacles to home ownership.

The following facts and figures bring the problem in-
to sharper focus:

-In 1977 45% of all home buyers were first-time pur-
chasers. Today that number has dropped to 40%.

-In 1976 first-time buyers spent 23% of their annual
income for housing expenses. Today they spend about
36%, including utilities, which have jumped from an
average of S360 a year to about 51,250 annually.

-The median price for a first-time home has risen
from S23.400 in 1970 to about S70.000 annually.

-The annual income required for first-time pur-
chasers has more than quadrupled from 510,258 in 1970
to more than S42.000 today.

-Average monthly payments, including utilities, for
first-time buyers have risen over 450%. from S2O2 in
1970 to more than S 1,250 today.

To help first-time homebuyers. I have joined a bi-
partisan group in the House in sponsoring the
Homeownership Incentive Act of 1983. Structured after
the successful Individual Retirement Account concept,
the bill would permit individuals to accumulate the
money for a down payment by placing some of their earn-
ings in an Individual Housing Account (IHA).

Under the measure, tax-deductible contributions up
to SI.000 for singles and 52,000 for couples could be
made annually to the account. The maximum amount of
contributions to the IHA could not exceed SI0,000 and
all interest would be tax free.

To minimize the revenue loss to the Treasury, all
withdrawals from the account would be recaptured as or-
dinary income at a rate of 10% per year for 10 years.

In addition to limiting the program to first-time
homebuyers, the bill provides if the funds are not used to
purchase a home, the account holder would be subject to
a 10% penalty on top of the regular taxes that would be
due.

The National Assn. of Realtors and the National
Assn. of Homebuilders, both of whom have endorsed and
are strongly supporting the bill, have estimated the enact-
ment of the measure would reduce from six to three years
the average time required for a young family to save for a
down payment on a home. As many as three million first-
time purchasers could be aided by (he program.

Besides helping families fulfill the American dream
of homeownership, the legislation also would serve to fuel
the economic recovery. The National Assn. of Home-
builders estimates the construction of each 1,000 single-
family homes generates more than S32.5 million in wages.
The total economic impact of 1,000 units is estimated to
be close to SI49 million, generating SI04 million in taxes.

This bill provides a cost-effective means of assisting
millions of Americans who want, but cannot now afford,
to purchase a home.

YWCA camps
add week

Camp Runamok and the
Wilderness Camping Unit
of the Westfield Young Wo-
men's Christian Assn. will
be extended an extra week,
Aug. 22 to 26, according to
Donna Newman who noted
this week was added due to
the numerous requests of
working parents. Registra-
tion is being accepted for-
this week and any number
of remaining weeks of
Camp Runamok and The
Wilderness Unit.

Camp Runamok is a sum-
mer program for children
four to 12 years old. Daily
activities include nature
study, arts and crafts, hikes,
swim lessons and team
games. Watchung Reserva-
tion and the Echo Lake
Park are the outside activity
locations. The camp day
will be from 9 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Child care will be available
from 8:15 a.m. for a nom-
inal fee if sufficient interest
is shown.

The Wilderness Camping
Unit for children 10 to 14
years old is composed of
two days per week, Monday
to Friday, at the YWCA
with the remaining three
days spent at Camp Tall
Timbers in Tuxedo, N. Y.
Campers will sleep in tents
and have one daily meal
cooked over a campfire.

Camp grounds in upper
New York state and Massa-
chusetts will be the sites of
the final special week of
Wilderness Camp. Activi-
ties will include swim les-
sons, hiking, sports, nature
study and canoeing.

Reservations may be
made at the desk of the
YWCA at 220 Clark St. or
by telephoning 233-2833.

'Touch of Nature"
to be felt

at Trailside
A repeat of Gerald

Zelenka's animal show, "A
Touch of Nature," will be
held at the Trailside Nature
and Science Center at Coles
Ave. and New Providence
Rd.. Mountainside, at 1:30
p.m. on Wednesday, July
27, as part of the "Wed-
nesday Matinee" series.

For an admission price of
51.50 children will be able
to see and touch a variety of
native and exotic mammals,
lizards, spiders, frogs and
snakes at the Union County
Dept. of Parks and Rec-
reation facility.

Hospital endorses freeholder decision
Rahway Hospital Presi-

dent John L. Yoder wel-
comed the Union County
Board of Chosen Freehold-
ers' July 14 decision to sup-
port a committee approach
to the parking dilemma fac-
ed by the hospital and the
community as being consis-
tent with the hospital's pro-
posals and goals.

'The freeholders' reso-
lution actually fulfills our
desire to co-operate with the
citizens of Rahway to find a
mutually acceptable solu-
tion to the parking problem.
We have always favored
such a method and are look-
ing forward to working with
the mayor's committee and
and also with the Union
County consultants."

Rahway Hospital offi-
cials have stated at the pre-
sent time there are three op-
tions open to them in their
efforts to provide the 650
parking places mandated by
the city of Rahway when it
approved the hospital con-
struction program just un-
derway.

One proposed solution is
to use property the hospital

already owns on St. George
Ave. between Kaminski Dr.
and Hamilton St. and pro-
perty adjacent to the hos-
pital on Trussler PI. Up to
this time variances have not
been granted for such use,
and hearings concerning the
St. George Ave. property,
which was formerly owned
by the Young Men's Chris-
tian Assn. have been ongo-
ing since January.

The second proposal is
construction of a temporary
parking lot on a portion of
the Union County property
known as Green Field, the
subject of the freeholders'
Thursday night meeting.

George E. Argast, the
associate director of the
hospital, also approved the
freeholders' decision to
leave the use of Green Field
open to discussion.

"We honestly feel we can
help to alleviate the parking
problem and improve the
facility to meet the needs of
those who use it.
Therefore, it is appropriate
we meet with everyone in-
volved to develop a plan
that will be beneficial. I do
want to clarify one point.

The most ambitious pro-
posal ever made by the
hospital was to use 1.8 acres
of Green Field, and even
that was simply a starting
figure. Misleading figures
that have been used have
distorted the hospital's pro-
posal for a complementary
parking lot and related im-
provement of the playing
area," Mr. Argast pointed
out.

The third option
available to the hospital, ac-
cording to Mr. Yoder, is a
parking garage.

"There are several
reasons we are reluctant to
build a parking deck and,
therefore, it would be our
last choice as a solution.
Construction of such a
structure between the
hospital building and
Madison Ave. would pre-
vent further expansion in
that direction. In addition,
it would be a non-
conforming structure in a
suburban setting and would
be very permanent. The
cost of such a structure,
estimated at S3 to 4 million
would have to be passed

along to our patients. Other
hospitals int he county seek
surface parking. The only
two hospitals in the area
with parking garages are
Overlook and Perth Am-
boy, and in the latter case,
the city built it and leased it
to the hospital," the hospital
president pointed out.

Mr. Yoder made the poi-
nt at the freeholders'
meeting the lack of parking
space affects many people
in addition to the hospital's
900 employes.

"Those searching for
parking places include
12,000 inpatients plus their
families and friends; over
20,000 outpatients and
33,000 emergency center
patients plus their families
and friends, all on an an-
nual basis, as well as 325 in-
service volunteers, 300 aux-
ilians, 25 board members,
300 physicians and 25 mem-
bers of the clergy, all on a
regular basis. Many of the
patients and visitors are
elderly or handicapped and
find it very difficult to walk
a long distance," he conclu-
ded.

Fulcomer hals county
The Union County Boa-

rd of Chosen Freeholders
was commended today by
Rahway Sixth Ward Coun-
cilman James J. Fulcomer
for rescinding county
resolution No. 40283,
which had granted Rahway
Hospital provisional permis-
sion to build a 226-spacc
parking lot at Green Field,
also known as the Madison
Ave. Tract.

"The freeholders' latest
action makes it extremely
unlikely a gigantic section
of the park will be taken
over by cars. This action

makes the promise 'little, if
any parkland,' will even
temporarily be surrendered
to parking cars," said Cou-
ncilman Fulcomer.

The councilman noted
only a recommendation
from the mayor's commit-
tee to do so could lead to
the temporary takeover of
any part of the park for
hospital use, and such a
business use would be far
less than the original pro-
posal.

He described the free-

holder action as "a very
substantial, though not
total, victory for main-
taining the integrity of
Green Field."

The new county legisla-
tion also authorizes the
county to work with the
Rahway mayor's citizens'
committee, Rahway City
Council and Board of Edu-
cation in helping to resolve
the matter, to provide any
required technical advise
and directs local authorities
to submit their recommen-
dations to the county ad-

repeal
ministration and freehold-
ers for review and consid-
eration for approval, re-
ported the Sixth Ward rep-
resentative.

The new freeholder ac-
tion was in response to com-
plaints from Rahway resi-
dents about the proposed
226-space parking lot and
was adopted at the Free-
holder meeting of July 14
after hearing from Rahway
residents and hospital
employes, the councilman
concluded.

Protestors organize against parking lot
The Green Field Preser-

vation Organization has
been organized to fight a
Rahway Hospital request
for a 226-space parking lot
at Green Field, it was an-
nounced.

Thomas Calabrese of
Rahway has been co-ordin-
ating the organization.

Mrs. Diane Carvalho of
Rahway was appointed the
head of the group's com-
mittee to organize a petition
drive against the parking
lot.

"This proposed 226-space
parking lot is equal to 26
housing lots and longer
than any baseball has ever
been hit. The hospital wants
to place this gigantic lot in
the most heavily-used park

Stable
enters ph

Bids from firms interested
in performing preliminary
grading and site work to
prepare the location of the
new Watchung Union Cou-
nty Riding Stable for con-
struction will be accepted
Tuesday, Aug. 2, on the
sixth floor of the Union
County Court House Ad-
ministration Building in
Elizabeth.

The request for bids was
made in early July, imme-
diately after the Phase No.
1 plans were approved by
the New Jersey Dept. of
Transportation and the
Federal Highway Authori-
ty-

According to county offi-
cials, the actual ground-
breaking for the new stable
complex could take place by
September if the prelim-
inary site work proceeds as
planned. Once construction
has begun, the new complex
is expected to be completed
in about one year.

The existing Watchung
Stable, one of 25 parks and
facilities operated by the
Union County Dept. of
Parks and Recreation, will
be displaced from its present
location on Glenside Ave.,

in Rahway. This lot would
damage our public educa-
tional program, rob our
children of needed park-
land, pollute the park with
more lead and carbon-mo-
noxide poisoning, jeopar-
dize the safety of our
children, increase the condi-
tions for vandalism and pos-
sibly even increase down-
stream flooding," said Mrs.
Claire Adams of Rahway,
one of the coordinators of
the organization.

"We are opposed to any
cars on Green Field. We
want to keep Green Field
all green. We are deman-
ding the freeholders rescind
county resolution No.
40283 which granted provi-
sional approval for the lot

project
ase No. 1

Summit, by the completion
of Rte. No. 1-78 through the
Watchung Reservation.
The last 5.5 miles of the
highway through the Wat-
chung Reservation had re-
mained unfinished for
years, but it is now being
constructed with comple-
tion expected in four to five
years.

As part of a monetary
and land-swap agreement
between the New Jersey
Dept. of Transportation

and we demand the City
Council adopt Resolution
AR-133-83, which would
put. the cityof Rahway of-
ficially in opposition to the
lot," said Mrs. Adams.

A resolution to rescind
the county's approval of the
lot was adopted at the July
14 freeholder meeting. City
Counci l Resolu t ion
AR-133-83, which opposes
the lot, is pending before
the Rahway City Council.

Sponsored by Sixth Ward
Councilman James J. Ful-
comer and co-sponsored by
First Ward Councilman
Lawrence Bodine,
AR-133-83 attracted the

and Union County the state
will replace the stable with a
new, "state-of-the-art" fac-
ility about one mile away
from the present site.

The new site, by agree-
ment, must include all fea-
tures of- the old facility,
built with the newest mat-
erials and equipment in a
modern design. Among the
features to be included are
an upper-level schooling
and paddock area, a lower-
level school area, a stable
building, barn, hay and
grain building, silo, garage
and equipment storage and
an administration building.
The projected cost for the
new stable complex has
been set at some $3.6 mil-
lion, depending on the
amount of the bids received

support of about 130 Rah-
way citizens at the last City
Council meeting and will be
up for a vote on Monday
evening, Aug. 8, at the
Rahway City Hall.

Mrs. Adams pointed out
the hospital can solve its
parking problems through
other means, but would
rather take land away from
Green Field because it
would cost the hospital less
money.

People interested in help-
ing with the petition drive
or in some other way should
telephone Mrs. Carvalho at
382-6637.

by the county.
According to Armand

Fiorletti, the county engi-
neer, the department of
transportation must ap-
prove the Phase No. 1 bid
accepted by the county be-
fore the preliminary site
work can begin. As soon as
Phase No. 1 is started the
county can advertise for
bids on Phase No. 2, the ac-
tual stable construction.

In addition to some 500
area residents, primarily
youngsters, who belong to
the Watchung Mounted
Troop at the stable, many
hundreds of other eques-
trian enthusiasts frequent
the stable and adjacent
trails annually.

There had been some
concern on the part of the

UP TO 3 5 % OFF Regular Retail Price

Selling Direct To The Public At The Same Prices
Builders & Dealers Pay! !

Complete Bathroom Remodeling at Wholesale Prices!!
Get, Your Best Price Then Visit Our Beautifully Decorated

Showroom For An Extensive Selection of Foreign &
Domestic Ceramic Tile for Kitchens & Bathrooms.
. Large Selection of Vanities & Medicine Cabinets
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POOLING THEIR RESOURCES - The benefits of ride-sharing and the increasing
number of employes using van pools were topics discussed at a July 6 conference
organized by the New Jersey Depts. of Energy and Transportation and hosted by Mer-
ck and Co., Inc. of Rahway. Among those speaking were Assemblyman George J.
Otlowski, left, and June Mercer, right, van pool administrator for Merck's Rahway site.
Assemblyman Otlowski, who also is the mayor of Perth Amboy, spoke about the traffic
congestion at Rte. No. 1 and Gill La., Woodbridge. Representatives of state, county
and local government provided an update on traffic and mass transit in Union County.
Industry representatives cited the advantages of their ride-sharing programs.'

County, state aides
boost van, car pools

A total of 24 companies
in Union County operate
148 van pools for their em-
ployes.

The vans run every work-
day, carrying 15 to 21 em-
ployes over the same route
for a monthly charge. Often
one person is appointed the
driver and is responsible for
the maintenance of the van.
The driver usually rides for
free.

Corporate and govern-
ment representatives learn-
ed these facts on July 6
along with other tips on
how to get their employes
to and from work more easi-
ly each day and the planned
improvements for the area's
road system at a conference
hosted by Merck and Co..
Inc. of Rahway.

The morning conference,
which lasted for four hours,
involved a discussion of van
and car pooling first and
then a discussion on traffic
problems and improve-
ments hosted by Union
County Freeholder Chair-

public remaining trails
might be cut off through
the construction. Just last
week, however, Union Cou-
nty Manager Arthur J.
Grisi, in several telephone
conversations with state of-
ficials, reminded the state of
its obligations.

"It is the responsibility of
the department of transpor-
tation to provide contin-
uous stable operations and
access to all trails," Mr.
Grisi said. "We have dealt
with the problem and the
department has given us
their assurance of contin-
ued access."

Meanwhile, all programs,
lessons and camps at the
Watchung Stable will con-
tinue as planned, throu-
ghout the reconstruction
and subsequent relocation.

man Frank H. Lehr.
The head of plant ser-

vices for Bell Laboratories,
Charles Briggs, pointed out
his firm has about 130 vans
in New Jersey traveling an
average of 62 miles a day,
charging an average of S40
a month and eliminating an
estimated 95 tons of pollu-
tants each year. The com-
pany also uses computers to
match car pool riders, Mr.
Briggs added.

The county's Board, of
Chosen Freeholders, which
co-sponsored the confer-
ence, is backing more to the
van and car pools because
they save gas, lessen pollu-
tion and ease congestion in
company parking lots and
on the road.

Officials from the New
Jersey Depts. of Energy and
Transportation, also con-
ference co-sponsors, are also
very much in favor of the
expansion of the pooling
idea.

According to Sylvia
Schultz, the senior trans-
portation planner for Union
County, of the 235,000
county residents who work
83.9% take cars, 8.8% lake
mass transit and 5.3%
walk.

She added of the 195,000
taking cars, 40,000 car pool
and 73% of the car poolers
ride with one other person
while J 6 % ride with iwo
other persons.

The transportation aide
added Union County has
5200,000 available in stale
and federal funds to lend to
companies interested in
buying vans and starting a
van pool program. The
money is lent interest-free
and must be paid back with-
in four years.

Routes and applications
are studied by the county to
make sure the proposed van
pool routes don't coincide

with mass transit routes and
that they have enough ri-
ders to make them feasible.

According to the trans-
portation planner the only
company in the program,
Sea Land of Elizabeth, has
borrowed $100,000 over
the past two years.

The keynote speaker,
State Energy Commissioner
Leonard Coleman, said
"Government has not been
aggressive enough in fin-
ding solutions to energy
problems. We've got to do a
better job in providing in-
centives for conservation."

The largest traffic im-
provement in the county
now underway, according
to Freeholder Lehr, is the
completion of Rte. No. 78
through the Watchung Re-
servation, which he said
should be finished in 1986.

The county is also put-
ting up street signs giving
the route numbers of coun-
ty roads to match the num-
bers on maps, and is half-
way through a 15-year pro-
gram of posting signs at in-
tersections listing directions
to municipalities.

Mr. Lehr also listed
several intersections where
signals would be improved
and lanes added.

Starting in September or
October work to improve
the Bayway Circle in Eli-
zabeth may begin, reported
Freeholder Thomas Long.

Roads will be cut through
ihe circle and signals in-
stalled.

In addition, he pointed
out, work may begin by the
end of the year on widening
Wood Ave. in Linden from
Rte. No. I to the railroad
station.

The original tales of Mother
Goose —before the nursery
r h y m e s — w e r e moral tales
warn ing of the dangers of
c u r i o s i t y and trespassing.

Rebuilt Vacuum Cleaner Sale
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Power T e a m s 9 1 2 5 $ ] A gModel 1205

Hoover, Eureka,
G.E. Sunbeam,

Canisters &
Uprights

39 & up

SEW/VAC CENTER

1558 Main Street
Rahway •574-3106

RELIABLE SERVICE
IS OUR

GUARANTEE

Franks: Close
toxic spill loophole

Despite the wealth of en-
vironmental legislation en-
acted in recent years, the
current statutes that require
an owner or operator of an
industrial site to report
chemical discharges to state
authorities are very vague
and unclear. Even more
disturbing is the fact that
there are absolutely no pro
visions for the notification
of local officials. Assem-
blyman Bob Franks, who
represents Clark, revealed
today.

Assemblyman Franks in-
troduced legislation July I 1
to close that loophole by re
quiring the owner of any in-
dustrial site to report the ex-
istence of any toxic or haz-
ardous discharge within 10
days of its discovery.

Under provisions of the
bill, a business would be re
quired to notify the Dept. of
Environmental Protection,
the municipal governing
body and the local board of
health.

"I was appalled when I
learned of this deficiency in
the law," the assemblyman
said. "The ramifications of
such an omission are fright-
ening,"

"New Jersey leadnlie na
tion both in drug and chem-
ical production and is ;i
leader in environmental
protection. But for all of our
new environmental laws,
there is no comprehensive
requirement for the repor-
ting of all known or sus
pected hazardous spills."
the legislator added.

The Franks bill would re
quire an industrial site
operator, or the current
owner of a site once used in-
dustrially, to report any in
cidence, real or suspected.
of an on-site hazardous
waste discharge. Failing to
report, or making a know-
ingly false report, would in-
cure a maximum fine of
$50,000.

"With environmental of-
ficials learning more each
day about the dangers of
substances once thought to
be harmless, it is essential to
put a mandatory hazardous
spill-notification require-
ment in the law," the law-
maker noted.

"New Jersey residents
need to know as early as
possible what kinds of
chemicals they arc sharing
their environment with, and

public officials need t"
know about any poicntialh
hazardous substances so
that they can institute
cleanup procedures. Thi^
legislation will not only
assist the Dept. of Environ-
mental Protection in deve
loping a cleanup plan for
each site, but it also will
provide an essential tool in
our overall fight to rid New
Jersey of illegally-dischar
ged toxic and hazardous
chemicals." he concluded.

College course
to quell

anxieties
Adults who may be feel-

ing anxious about returning
to college after a number of
years out of the classroom
may find a two-day session
being offered by Union
County College will alle
viate some of their anx-
ieties.

The course, "Preparation
for College Study," will be
conducted on the college's
Cranford campus on Tues
days. Aug. 23 and 30, from
7 to 9 p.m.

Offered free of charge b\
the college's Division of
Continuing Education, the
course is aimed at adults
considering enrolling for
college in the fall.

Topics to be covered are
taking notes from texts and
instructors, learning to con
quer the fear of tests, eli-
minating the anxiety of
writing papers, developing
study skills and utilizing the
resources of the library. En
rollment is limited to adults
who have been out of sch
ool for several years.

The preparation session
will be taught by Dr. Don
aid Anderson, a professor
emeritus at the college.

While there is no charge
for the program, registra-
tion is required. Further in
formation may be obtained
by telephoning the college
at 276-2600, extension 206
or 238.

Live teeth give off fluorcs-
cence, where.is dead teeth
do not.
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EXPLORING OTHER LANDS • Israeli students, Amos Liberman, left, and Ayah Barlev,
right, visited social studies classes at Jonathan Dayton Regional High School in Spr-
ingfield as part of a cultural exchange program.

Israeli students
"exchange" cultures
A 56-mcmber delegation

of Israeli students visited
New Jersey schools and
organizations last month as
part of a cultural exchange
program promoted by the
Israeli ministers for foreign
affairs and education.

Amos Liberman and Ay-
ah Barlev spoke to Jona-
than Dayton Regional High
School in Springfield social
studies students about their
culture, food, dress and
customs.

According to the Union
County Regional High Sch-
ool District No. I's social
studies coordinator, Dor-
othea Hooper, the visit ser-
ved as a "prelude" for the
regional's pilot program on

the Holocaust which will be
studied during the coming
school year in freshman
World Cultures classes.

History teachers, {Cathe-
rine Venditti and Edward
Jasinski of Dayton; Ronald
Fernandez of David Brear-
ley Regional High School in
Kenilworth and Donald
Lloyd of Arthur L. Johnson
Regional High School in
Clark, met for a five-day
workshop last week to de-
vise a guide of selected ac-
tivities for the regional
district's World Cultures
teachers.

"The teachers reviewed
filmstrips and movies,
poured over textbooks and
heard survivors recount

Holocaust events in an at-
tempt to provide document-
ed material for the others,"
said the social studies co-
ordinator.

"The subject is a sensitive
one but it is too important
to treat with kid gloves,"
she added.

In the 32-page guide the
teachers recommended 20
learning units including
tracing the origins of anti-
semetic laws, viewing slides
entitled "The Holocaust"
and "The Distorted Image,"
and role-playing activities.
Also provided is a list of
audio-visual materials and
supplementary readings.
Recommended are dialo-
gues and discussions with
actual survivors.

The pilot program will be
evaluated at the end of the
school year to determine its
effectiveness.

Warning: Don't eat
batteries

ON WITH THE SHOW - "Billy Bartley's Circus Party,"
an original play with songs and music is currently runn-
ing at The New Jersey Public Theatre. The play is part
of The Childrens Theatre series, and is presented on
Saturday and Sunday mornings at 11 o'clock. "Billy
Bartley's Circus Party" is a play about an evil villian who
hates the sound of laughter and uses a wicked
sorcerer's magic spell to destroy the circus party. Billy

Bartley must find some way to save the circus, but he
needs the help of all his friends both in the circus and in
the audience. The play will run to Sunday, Aug. 7.
There will be no performance on Sunday, July 31 .
Tickets may be purchased at the door or reserved by
telephoning 272-5704. The New Jersey Public
Theatre is located at 118 South Ave., Cranford.

The director of the Union
County Division of Consu-
mer Affairs, Ellen Bloom,
warned consumers, "An
estimatec! 500 to 800 button
(miniature or disc) batteries
are swallowed each year,
allowing for possible inter-
nal damage."

The Consumer Affairs
Division, within the Dept.
of Human Resources, has
received a strong warning
issued jointly from the
United States Consumer
Product Safety Commission
and the National Capital
Poison Center of this possi-
ble hazard.

Technological advances
in electronic miniaturiza-
tion have increased the
availability of miniature
(but ton) ba t te r ies in

'Space Art'
to take over

Trailside
Those in the seventh to

ninth grades who want to
make scientific and science
fiction representations of
other worlds in tempera and
acrylic paints will be able to
participate in "Space Art"
from Monday to Thursday
afternoons, July 25 to 28, at
the Trailside Nature and
Science Center at Coles
Ave. and New Providence
Rd., Mountainside.

To register for the pro-
gram, which carries a fee of
SI5. or for more informa-
tion, please telephone Trail-
side at 232-5930.

Mrs. Berlin
back from tour
A Rahway resident, Mrs.

Marjorie Berlin of 79 Co-
Ionia Blvd., recently re-
turned from a two-week
tour of the Canyonlands,
encompassing Colorado,
Utah, Wyoming and Ari-
zona.

BEFORE THE FINAL ACT - Greg Zerkle as Sir,
prepares himself for a dramatic moment in "The
Dresser" by Ronald Harwood, receiving its New Jersey
premiere to Saturday, July 23, at SUMMERFUN
Theater. SUMMERFUN is a professional summer
theater in residence at Montclair State College. Perfor-
mances are at 8:30 p.m. in Memorial Auditorium. For
further information or reservations please telephone the
SUMMERFUN Box Office at 746-9120.

homes...in watches,T calcu-
lators, cameras, hearing aids
and games.

Although the vast ma-
jority of these button bat-
teries, when accidentally
swal lowed, will pass
through the person without
any problem, occasionally
severe complications and
even fatalities have been
reported. Batteries may
become lodged in the eso-
phagus or intestine, slowly
leaking alkaline electrolytes
and causing an internal
chemical burn, the con-
sumer unit head pointed
out.

Battery -ingestions are
preventable. Important
prevention and treatment
information is available bas-
ed on preliminary results of
a National Button Battery
Ingestion Study conducted
by Dr. Toby Litovitz, the
director of the National
Capital Poison Center.

Of 62 button battery in-
gestions reported to the Na-
tional Capital Poison
Center in the past nine
months, 59% involved bat-
teries that were left out
loose rather than properly
discarded or stored; 39% of
the batteries were in the
product they were intended
for and removed from the
product. Half of these bat-
teries were in hearing aids.

Accidental ingestion of
button batteries is not
restricted to children. In
this study only 66% of pa-
tients were under the age of
five and 10% were 18 years
or older. Twenty-four per-
cent were in the five-to-12-
year age range.

Many of the major Uni-
ted States battery manu-
facturers have voluntarily
placed warnings on the bat-
tery packages, which are
routinely sold in blister
packing which forms an ex-
cellent ch i ld- res i s tan t
closure. The success of this
packaging is supported by
the National Capital Poison

Center study, which shows
fewer than 2% of batteries
ingested were obtained
from the manufacturers'
original packaging.

Recommendations to
help prevent button battery
ingestion are:

- 1 . Keep button batteries
out of your child's reach.
Discard them carefully.

-2. Do not allow children
to play with button batter-
ies.

- 3 . Never put button bat-
teries in your mouth for any
reason. They are slippery
and easily swallowed acci-
dentally.

-4. Always check medi-
cations before swallowing
them. Adults have swallow-
ed batteries mistaken for
tablets.

--5. Caution hearing aid
users to keep hearing aids
and batteries out of the
reach of children.

If a button battery is
swallowed, please telephone
your poison control center,
your physician, or the Na-
tional Battery Ingestion
Hot Line at 202-625-3333.
Dr. Litovitz cautioned the
vast majority ingested will
pass through the intestine
without any difficulty. In
the absence of symptoms,
an x-ray and laxative are
usually all that are required.
If symptoms are present or
the battery is lodged in the
esophagus, complications
are more likely and imme-
diate removal is usually in-
dicated.

Mrs. Bloom reminded
readers, "Our Toll Free
Poison Control telephone
number is New Jersey is
800-962-1253. If you have
reason to believe someone
has swallowed such a bat-
tery, telephone immediate-
ly, don't take chances!"

If you have been unable
to resolve a problem re-
garding a retail transaction,
write: Consumer Affairs,
Post Office Box 186, West-
field, N. J. 07091.

Puppet show
to open

at college
A New Jersey profes

sional summer theater
SUMMERFUN, will pre
sent the Pandemonium
Puppet Company in "Fa-
bula" as the final produc-
tion of this season's SUM-
MERFUN Sampler for

'Nature Crafts'
to be studied
on Thursdays

"Nature Crafts," for
those in the third and
fourth grades, will meet
Thursday mornings this
month and next month at
the Trailside Nature and
Science Center at Coles
Ave. and New Providence
Rd., Mountainside. The fee
will be S2.50 per session.

The topic on July 21 will
be "Off-Loom Weaving,"
that on Aug. 11 "Beach
Creatures" and that on
Aug. 25 "Nature Prints."

For further information
or to register, please
telephone Trailside at
232-5930.

Children.
This puppet theater ex-

perience is recommended
for those aged four and up.

The Pandemonium Pup-
pet Company's perform-
ance of "Fabula" can be
seen on Wednesday, July
27, at 1:15 p.m. in the
Memorial Auditorium lo-
cated on the Montclair
State College campus in Up-
per Montclair. Tickets are
$3 each.

For further information
regarding group sales rates
and reservations, please
telephone 746-9120.

Marionettes
to perform
at Trailside

Jean Rapicano and her
marionettes will teach
youngsters how to make
'.heir own puppets from
•ecyclables then allow them
to enjoy a puppet show in-
volving hand and rod pup-
pets plus marionettes on
Wednesday, Aug. 10, at
1:30 p.m. at the Trailside
Mature and Science Cen-
er's Visitors Center at

Coles Ave. and New Pro-
idence Rd. in Mountain-
ide.

Admission will be $1.50.

Free concert
to be held

at Echo
An evening of free clas-

sical music, marches and
popular tunes in the park
awaits those who attend the
Wednesday, July 27, install-
ment of the 1983 Summer
Arts Festival, a weekly
event held in Echo Lake
Park in Westfield-Moun-
tainside.

The Union County Con-
cert Band will be conducted
by Herb Steier. The concert
will begin at 7:30 p.m.

Those attending should
bring lawn chairs and picnic
baskets. A refreshment
truck and dance floor are
always available. The Un-
ion County Parks and Rec-
reation Information Van
will have pamphlets and
brochures available free of
charge.

In case of rain the show
will be held in the park at
7:30 p.m. on Thursday, July
28. If its rains July 28 the
show would immediately
move to the Trailside Na-
ture and Science Center at
Coles Ave. and New Provi-
dence Rd., Mountainside.

The festival is sponsored
by the Union County Dept.
of Parks and Recreation
and made possible through
budget appropriations, a
grant from Local No. 151 of
the American Federation of
Musicians and donations
from local industry.

For up-to-the-minute in-
formation on rain dates,
cancellations and infor-
mation on other activities of
the parks department, ple-
ase telephone the 24-hour
parks hotline number at
352-8410.

Roosevelt cites
Anna Halkias

A Rahway sixth grader at
Roosevelt School, Anna
Halkias, won the Youth
Fitness Award for achiev-
ing between 50 and 79% on
all items.

* * * *
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for 3 10 WEEK TRAINING COURSE
STARTING THURS.,

July 28, 1983
7:30 PM

VFW POST 7343
H i l l 6 BROADWAY

C U M , N.J.

233-5584
DOG TRAINING SCHOOL WITH

23 YEARS OF QUALITY TRAINING
ALSO

ioviaas MfxicE cusso. wxt oi
iinws mncno« UIWK. wran

(IUCIK

MAMOHCBEST aoiwnwa.

Any 3 Garments
Cleaned & Pressed
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FREE
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Sale effective 'til July 31

: FABRIC CARE CENTER
1212 ST. George Ave.,Avenel
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TORO'S
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}l oi Regency Wedding Invitations z
& Social Announcements Including:'

• BAR MITZVAHS
• BIRTHS

• MATCHES • STHtRERS
• NAPKINS • MENUS
• PLACE CARDS • ETC.
Looking for something different?

Come in and see Elten for
PERSONALIZED INVITATIONS
no matter what the occasion!

% MINIMUM
ORDER: 50

Stop in today...
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574-1200
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THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED • Displaying the resolu-
tion citing Memorial General Hospital in Union as a
model of hospital nursing practice are, left to right, Sen.

State aides cite
Memorial General

Memorial General Hospi-
tal in Union, which during
the past year has won na-
tional acclaim in the field of
nursing, was recently cited
in a resolution sponsored by
Republican Sen. Louis Bas-
sano, and presented by
Gov. Thomas Kean prais-
ing the institution as a
model of hospital nursing
practice, reports a hospital
spokesman.

"All of us at Memorial
General are extremely pro-
ud to receive this honor,"
said Patricia Lynch, the
hospital vice president, "and
we are very grateful to Sen.
Bassano and Gov. Kean for
their encouragement and
support of our endeavors in

the field of nursing."
Due to its leadership role

in the recruitment and re-
tention of nurses, Ihe
hospital was cited last year
as one of 31 hospitals na-
tionwide chosen by the Na-
tional Commission on Nurs-
ing to share its successes in
dealing with its nursing re-
sources. The health care
facility was selected because
of its distinctive record in
experiencing far less than
average difficulties with the
current nation-wide nursing
shortage.

The hospital's achieve-
ments have been published
by the commission and
disseminated to health care
nstitutions across the coun-

Louis Bassano, Gov. Thomas Kean, Patricia Lynch, the
hospital's vice president, and Victor J. Fresolone, the
hospital president.

Sheriff's Office
gets vest donation

A check for 51,218.35,
earmarked forlhc purchase
of bullet-proof vests, was ac-
cepted by Ralph Froehlich,
the Union County sheriff.
The money was donated by
the Elizabeth Police Re-
serves at a recent meeting.

According to Sheriff
Froehlich, the funds will
buy some six to seven vests
for his officers.

"We already have six
vests," the sheriff said.

He explained out of a
total of 87 sheriffs' officers
18 work on the street, in the
Warrant Squad and assign-
ed to other activities, and he
feels these persons must get
the vests first.

The rest of the officers
work as court attendants,
and Sheriff Froehlich would
like to see all 87 officers
wearing vests one day soon.
He pointed out each vest
must be fitted to the indi-
vidual officer, so each per-
son must have his or her

own vest.
The president of the

police reserves, Patrick
Pryor, said, "The funds
were collected for the
specific purpose of protec-
ting our officers."

Since the reserves in Eli-
zabeth are about to be dis-
banded, they decided to
turn the money over to the
Sheriffs Dept. because She-
riff Froehlich was a former
lieutenant with the Eliza-
beth Police Reserves, an or-
ganization which has been
in existence for 44 years.

Sheriff Froehlich express-
ed his appreciation to the
reserves, saying, "The
Police Reserves have served
the city of Elizabeth admir-
ably at airplane crashes,
mass arrests, parades, floods
and fire scenes, the most
notable being the explosions
of Standard Oil and at the
Chemical Control holoca-
ust."

try.
Additionally, earlier this

year. Memorial General
was one of only 41 hospitals
nationwide and only one of
two in New Jersey to be
termed a "magnet hospital"
for nurses by the American
Academy of Nursing. Mor-
ristown Memorial Hospital
was the other New Jersey
facility cited in the study.

"Both studies have re-
cognized Memorial General
as one of the most satisfying
places in the United States
for nurses to work." added
Mrs. Lynch. "Our superior
retention record in the field
reflects the fact our nurses
arc allowed input into hos-
pital policy and are afforded
provisions for professional
;rowth, thus creating a

positive environment for
nurses and a high quality of
care for our patients."

Mrs. Lynch noted she has
traveled to numerous loca-
tions across the country to
share Memorial General's
proven record of success
and to provide counsel to
other hospitals seeking to
improve their nursing pro-
grams.

Commenting on the hos-
pital's achievements, Victor

County calendar
to appear soon

The third publication of
the quarterly Union County
Calendar of Events is about
to hit the stands.

The booklet, which is
published and sponsored by
the Union County Dept. of
Parks and Recreation, was
made possible through a
grant from the United
States Dept. of the Interior's
National Park Service. It
lists not only events spon-
sored by the county, but
schedules and information
from area organizations, in-
cluding senior citizens,
Young Men's and Young
Women's Christian Assns.,
local colleges, Scouts and
special-interest groups.

Each edition covers a
three-month period. The
next Calendar of Events
will have a yellow cover and
will include activities
county-wide for July,

August and September. It
will appear this month at
local convenience stores,
libraries and municipal
recreation departments.
The calendar can also be ob-
tained at the offices of the
department of parks and
recreation, located in the
court house complex in Eli-
zabeth from Monday to Fri-
day from 9 a.m. to 4 p.m. or
by telephoning 527-4900.

If your organization
would like to be1 included in
the next calendar, October/-
November/December, ple-
ase telephone" Ellen Unger
at 527-4913 or mail her
your group's listings by
Wednesday, Aug. 10, at:
Dept. of Parks and Recrea-
tion, Union County Admin-
istration Building, Eli-
zabeth, N. J. 07207.

Late schedules cannot be
accepted.

J. Fresolone, the hospital

Dancerobics
sets date

for signups
Dancerobics registration

for the second session,
Monday to Wednesday,
Aug. 1 to 24, is now in pro-
gress at the Westfield
Young Women's Christian
Assn. at 220 Clark St. The
four-week session will meet
twice weekly in an air-con-
ditioned room. Sneakers are
needed for this fitness pro-
gram, designed to increase
your heart-lung capacity
while performing lively, yet
uncomplicated dance move-
ments, reports a spokeswo
man.

Please telephone the
YWCA at 233-2833 for
times and fees.

Registration for the YW-
CA's Summer Aquatics
Program second session,
from Monday to Friday, Ju-
ly 18 to 29. is currently con-
tinuing.

Baby and Me, Mommy
and Me and Beginners
Swim No. 1 and No. 2 will
meet daily during the two
week session.

Baby and Me is for chil
dren six months to two
years old while Mommy
and Me is for children walk
ing to three years. Both
classes teach water adjust-
ment and some basic swim-
ming skills.

Beginners Swim No. I, a
class for children six years
old or in first grade and up,
u|es the progressive swim
teaching method introduc-
ing breath control, front
float, kick and elementary
crawl along with safety
skills. Beginners No. 2 .in-
troduces rotary breathing
and increased swimming
distances.

Additional information
including class times may be
obtained at the YWCA or
by telephoning 233-2833.

president, said, "Memorial
General Hospital is proud
to have brought national
distinction and recognition
to Union County. We will
continue bringing quality
health care to the com-
munities served by our
hospital."

Dinosaurs
to be explored

at Trailside
A program, "Dinosaurs

and Other Reptiles," in
which youngsters will be
able to discover which dino-
saurs lived where they live
now and the snakes and
turtles that live in the area
today will be held at the
Trailside Nature and Sci-
ence Center at Coles Ave.
and New Providence Rd.,
Mountainside, from Tues-
day to Thursday mornings,
July 26 to 28.

Openings are for those in
first and second grades and
the fee is $9. To register'and
for further information,
please telephone Trailside at
232-5930.

Air Force enlists
Doris DeCecco
A Clark resident, Doris

DeCecco of 603 Goodman's
Crossing, recently entered
the Air Force Delayed En-
listment Program.

The 1975 graduate of
Union High School is sch-
eduled to leave for basic
training at Lackland Air
Force Base near San An-
tonio, Tex., on Tuesday,
Aug. 16.

Plans are for her to re-
ceive technical training in
the administrative career
field for which transferrable
college credits will be
awarded.

— i * L . — i — i i i i i i i i i

t
GRAND FINALE - The Rahway Summer Band School
will present its concert finale this evening at 7 o'clock in
the Rahway Junior High School auditorium. The Dept. of
Recreation's program this year enrotted 120 young
musicians in grades four to 12. The students will be
performing classics and jazz including "Victory at Sea,"

— "Slaughter on Tenth Avenue," "Hey Jude" and "Night
Train." Sponsors of the school include the Parent-
Teacher Assns. of Rahway's Cleveland, Madison,

— FranWin and Roosevelt Schools, the Parent-Teacher
Organization of the Junior High, Rahway Italian-
American Club, Kiwanis Golden "K" of Rahway, Coun-
cil No. 1146 of the Rahway Knights of Columbus,
Rahway Lodge No. 1075 of the Benevolent and Pro-
tective Order of Elks and Rahway Local No. 33 of the
Firemen's Mutual Benevolent Assn., among others.
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Raised letters
Business
Cards

Black Ink
White Index

500
only s 16 9 0

plus tax 1,000 only $ 2 0 oo
plus tax

Other papers and colors available-
Come in and see our samples...

Fast service guaranteed

™£ATOM TABLOID
219 Central Ave., Rahway, N.J.

574-1200

J W E N E L - I S E L I N
MEDICAL GROUI? RA.

Extended
Office
Hours

Slnrf

July 2()ih

7 P.M. to Midnight
M o n d a y through I'r id;iy

t
. , • v • • * • ' . •

' ; . '
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*ReguUr Hours, by Appt.
Mon-Frl 9AM (o 7PM
S«L 9AM to 1 PM

1 P.M. to (i P.M.
Saturdays

<) A.M. lo (i P.M.
Sundays

. . . plus our rcKuhir hours'

NO APPOINTMENT NECESSARY
In an effort to servo the needs of the
community, and especially todays working
family, we are extending our office hours. \'n
appointment is necessary. A memher of our
medica staff will see you and provide tin;
medical attention you need.
If you are not a regular patient of the
Avenel-Lselin Medical Ciroup, we will send ,i
report on your visit to your regular physh.kin.

AVKNEMSEI.1N MEDICAL GROUP
415 AVENEL ST. AVENEL ii'Mi-M] 1
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BATTER UP - Judy Knecht, rear, the recreational co-ordinator for the Union County
Chapter of the Assn. for the Advancement of the Mentally Handicapped in Elizabeth,
umpires a practice Softball game prior to a Wednesday, Aug. 10, benefit game with the
WNEW-FM all-star team in Elizabeth. At bat is Vernard Porcher, right, of Linden, and
Kenneth Dickman, left, of Elizabeth is doing the catching. The site for the game will be
announced shortly. Among the WNEW personalities taking part will be Richard and Dan
Neer and Jim Monaghan.

Radio soffballers
to join benefit

The WNEW-FM all-star
Softball team will play a
benefit game in lili/ubeih
on (Wednesday, Aug. 10,
with a team made up of
clients and staff members of
the Assn. for [he Advance-
ment of the Menially Han
dicapped, it was announced
today.

The benefit game is sch-
eduled for 8 p.m. at a site
still to be announced, ac-
cording to Judy Kneclii of
Union, the recreation co-
ordinator for the non-profit
social service agency.

The WNEW contingent
will be led by disc jockey,
Richard Nccr, along with
his brother, Dan Neer, and
Jim Monaghan and Ken
Dashow, among others.

Making up the associa-
tion team will be Mercedes
Altieri, the coach; Martin
Borbely, Kenneth Dick-
man, John Drcscher, Joe
Ricke, John Hargrove,
Stefan Jakomowycz, Roy
Johnson, Ann-Marie Kelly.
Daryl Nelson, Debra Poli-
//MW, Vernard Porcher,
Mark Straka, Cathy Sala,

Ray Hoagland

Steve Williams, a resident
of Winfield Park, who is a
member of a Rahway team
of the Intra-County League
All-Star Baseball Team that
played in Union on July 17.

Eight Rahway Recrea-
tions players were selected
for the Ferguson Division
team, including Williams,
Bob Buckley, who's hitting,
394; Frank Jacik. .500;
Scott Wohlrab, 357; Mike
Gabel, 478, and Brian Wii-
tek, with pitchers. Bob Sek-
ley, 4-0, 1.09 earned run
average, and Fred Stinner,
1-0, 2.86 earnedrun aver-
age.

Rahway won its first 13-
games of league play thus

far.
* # *

A Rahway team contin-
ued to upset the playoff
field on July 15 in the West-
field Summer Basketball
League semi-final round ac-
tion at Cranford High Sch-
ool.

Rahway, the seventh-
seeded team, which recently
won over second-seeded St.
Peter's, upset third-seeded
Roselle 40-38. Rodney Per-
kins and Luther Johnson
led the Rahway team that
has a season mark of 14-5,
with 13 points apiece. Greg
Moody led Roselle (15-2)
with 14 markers.

Rahway played Metu-

Chris Wythe, Ted Zlobecki
and Judy Knecht.

"It should be a real fun
affair," Judy Knecht said.
"Admission is by donation
and all the money raised
willbe used To further" the
programs of the association,
which helps mentally-hand-
icapped adults lead inde-
pendent lives in the com-
munity. It's a worthwhile
cause and we know it will
be well attended. The
WNEW team members are
well known and play good
ball."

Tickets for the game may
be picked up at the asso-
ciation office at 60 Prince
St. or by telephoning
354-3040. Tickets also may
be obtained at the gate on
the night of the game.

chen on July 18 for the title.
* * *

In an American Legion
baseball game Roselle was
leading Rahway 6-5 before
rain postponed the game.

The game was made up
on July 18 at the point the
game was rained out. Rah-
way had two men on base
with two down and Dan
Andren at the plate when
the rains came.

* * *
At the Oak Ridge Golf

Club in Clark, the 13th An-
nual Union County Wo-
men's Public Links Tour-
nament was won by Char-
lene Tatz with a 70, fol-
lowed by Roberta Potter
with a 78 in the champion-
ship flight.

In the "A" Flight, Au-
drey Young had a 86 and
Pat Kukal 88.

In the "B" Flight Rose
Autenrieth had a 95 and
Iris Fisch 96.

Winning Kickers on July
16 were Roger Hornsby,
Dennis Pipala and Jerry
Nichols with 76.

Winning Kickers on July
17 were Al Davinus, Al
Vastano, Mario Orlando
and Aaron Segal with 75.

* * *
At the Colonia Country

Club in the President's
Trophy Tournament gross
was taken by Lou Petroz-

OOPS! - One of the competitors in Rahway's July 4 bicycle races tries to right himself
after a spill near the Rahway Post Office as another cyclist has his eye on the finish
line.

Clark tallies victory
on four-run rally

by Ray Hoagland
The Clark team in the

Union-Plainfield Twilight
Baseball League rallied for
four runs in the last of the
sixth to score a 6-3 win over
Metuchen in a game played
in Springfield.

With Metuchen on top
3-2 Clark, winning its 11th
game in 20 starts, registered
five hits in its winning.rally
and in four of them, sent in
by Jeff Evanylo, Robert
Madden, Mark Whiicomb
and Ned Panfilc, scored

zietlo with 14.
The Vice President's

Trophy net was won by Joe
Cleary at 134.

In the Birdie Tournament
on July 16 Class "A" was
won by Ernie Hobbie, Ma-
ury Ycgian, Bill McEntee,
Irwin Josephs, Petrozziello,
John Zaccaro and Richard
Bladis; Class "B" by Bob
Goodman, Charles Schwen-
tzer, Ray Giacobbe, George
Pctronella, Santo Monaco
and Glen Marlon, and Class
"C" by Al Oslislo, Vito
Toscano, Tony Raia, Frank
Meola, Schwenzer and Joe
Coleman.

In the Women's Buddy-
Buddy on July 15 Rose De
Falco and Irene Brenner
won over Ginny Werbeck
and Barbara Bladis.

On Women's Guest Day
on July 14 net was captured
by Carol Sica, Mickey Hill,
Rose De Falco and Val Tri-
berti at 129; gross by Con-
nie Petronella, Sue Reilly,
Evelyn Zaccaro and Edna
Gentile at 168.

# * #
The Roselle team in the

Intra-County Baseball Lea-
gue broke the Rahway Rec-
reations' 13-game winning
.streak by 7-6 on July 16.

In the afternoon the Rah-
way team scored a 10-7 win
over the Westfield Police
Athletic League in eight in-
nings. The team was down
by a 5-0 count early in the
game and came back when
Frank Jacik hit a two run-
batted-in homerun to tie up
the game in the last of the
seventh. In the last part of
the extra inning Fred Stin-
ncr hit a three-run homer
down along the first-base
line into the rightfield cor-
ner.

Stinner was the winning
pitcher.

* * #
The Totin twins, John

and Peter, and Dan Euph-
oria of the Clark Patriots
were selected to play in the
Annual Union County and
Essex County All-Star Base-
ball Game on July 17 at
Swanstrom Field in Union.

runs.
Whitcomb won his four-

th game with one loss.
Brothers, John and Peter

Totin, and Evanylo were
selected for the league all-
star team that met a similar
squad from Essex County
in an all-star game on July 9
at Swanstrom Park in Un-
ion.

* * *
Coaches Bill Roach's and

John Bodnar's Rahway
Recreation team rolled to
its 13th consecutive win, a
16-8 decision over the Un-
ion VFW at Weber Field in
Union.

Trailing 6-5 entering the
sixth inning, the Recrea-
tions scored 10 runs by sen-
ding 14 batters to the plate
and never trailed after that.

Scott Wohlrab, pitching
in relief of Fred Stinner,
struck out 11 in four inn-
ings to pick up his second
win of the season.

Frank Jacik led the way
with three hits in four trips
to the plate and drove in
three runs. Mike Gabel had
two hits including a homer
and Steve Cibrowski had
two hits and three runs
driven in.

* * *
Clark's American Legion

team scored its fourth str-
aight win, a 17-6 decision
over the St. Mary of the
Assumption team of Eliza-
beth.

The Clark team had 14
hits for its 17 runs.

Mike Dispenziere hurled
a complete game for the
win, and Tom Ameen and
Scott Orenburg led the win-
ners at bat.

Sekley hurls
for champions
Freshman, Bob Sekley of

Rahway, was a member of
the 1983 national champion
Marietta College Baseball
Team of Marietta, Ohio.

The Pioneers, under head
coach, Don Schaly, conclu-
ded their season with a 49-9
record, the most wins com-
piled by any National Col-
legiate Athletic Assn. Divi-
sion No. 3 baseball team
this year. They also cap-
tured their fourth consecu-
tive mideast regional tour-
nament title enreute to
their second national crown

4n three years.
Sekley, a pitcher, was 1-0

with an earned-run-average
of 5.52 in eight games.

A 1982 graduate of Rah-
way High School, is the son
of Mr. and Mrs. Ronald
Sekley of 728 Moses Dr.,
Rahway.

Orenburg had four hits,
scored three runs and drove
in three runs, while Ameen
added two hits and four
runs batted in. Bob Bothe
also had three hits.

Seven runs in the fourth
inning was the difference in
the game. There were four
more runs in the fifth, two
scoring on Al Scherb's dou-
ble.

St. Mary's had a dozen
hits, two each by Willie
Soler and Jim Ortel.

RAHWAY
RECREATION DEPT.

SLOWPITCH
SOFTBALL LEAGUE

STANDINGS

WESTERN DIVISION

TEAMS W I
Creanzo A. C. 9 0
Armando's Angels 10 2
KowalY 8 "' 4
Piscitelli Excavators 7 4
DaPrile Railing 5 8
Bachmann's Tavern 5 8
T.G. L.Inc. 4 7
Waiting Room 5 10
American Legion

Post No. 5 3 8
Laminaire 3 8

RESULTS
Bachmann's Tavern, 8;

Waiting Room, 7.
Waiting Room, 5; Bach-

mann's Tavern, 3.
Kowal 's , 18; DaPrile

Railing, 16.
Creanzo A. C , 15; T. G.

L., Inc., 0.
Bachmann's Tavern, 13;

American Legion Post No.
5,5.

Piscitelli Excavators, 20;
Waiting Room, 8.

EASTERN DIVISION

TEAMS W L
Rahway K. of C. 11 1
Market Body 9 1
Dri-Print

Foils, Inc. 10 2
Continental

Construction 9 4
U . S . S . Chemicals 6 6
Carl's Sunoco 5 6
Purolator 3 7
Yurgel

Construction 3 10
Pascale Agency 3 10
•Partners Pub 1 13

*McManus Steel has'
changed its name to Part-
ners Pub.

RESULTS
Continental Construc-

tion, 20; Purolator, 5.
U. S. S. Chemicals, 4;

Pascale Agency, 10.
Market Body, 8;

Partner's Pub, 5.
' Rahway K of C, 14; Pur-

olator, 0.
Rahway K of C, 10; Pur-

olator, 4.
Market Body, 14; Pascale

Agency, 5.
U. S. S. Chemicals, 22;

Yurgel Construction, 6.
Rahway K of C, 13;U.S.

S. Chemicals, 3.
Continental Construc-

tion, 18; Partners Pub, 9.
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Deadline
almost here
for tourney

County residents have
until Wednesday, Aug. 3, to
register for both the Union
County Senior Men's Dou-
bles Tennis Tournament
and the Senior Women's
Doubles Tennis Tourna-
ment.

Play is scheduled to take
place on Saturday, Aug. 13,
on the clay courts in War-
inanco Park in Roselle-Eli-
zabeth. The entry fee is S5,
and prizes will be awarded
to the winners and runners-
up. Players must furnish
three regulation tennis balls.

To register or find out
more, please telephone the
courts at 245-2288 or the
offices of the Union County
Dept. of Parks and Recrea-
tion at 527-4900.

Young rabbits are known
as kits or kittens.

LOOKING FOR THE GOLD - Bicyclists in the July 4
race in Rahway keep their eyes pinned to the course as
they head for the finish line after passing the Rahway
Post Office.

Clark
Pop Warner Football

Season Starts Aug. 1

6 PM

Curry Field

Ages 8-13

For Further
Information

Call:

272-6426

New Jersey Press Association
Scholarship Fund Football Classic

Giants - Dolphins
Friday, August 26 • 8 P.M.

Order your tickets today
for this exciting preseason
gamebetween the Giants
and theMiami Dolphins.

Game proceeds for
the benefit of the N.J.
Press Association"
Scholarship Fund.

Mail to:

FOOTBALL GIANTS
Giants Stadium
East Rutherford, N.J. 07073

Bill Cummlngs/The GIANTS Newaweekly

NAME

ADDRESS

[ 1983 PRE-SEASON APPLICATION
1 THREE HOME GAMES
• AT GIANTS STADIUM

| GAMES
| Aug 7
( A New York Jets
' Sun Nite

' Aug 20
1 B Baltimore Cotts
| Sat Nile

1 Aug 26
| C Miamt Dolphins
• Fn Nito

NO
SEATS

SEAT
PRICE

at$11 00

at 111 00

at $11 00

1 Postage & Handling •

• TOTAL DUE ' — »

MAKE CHECK
PAYABLE TO

N.Y. FOOTBALL
GIANTS. INC.

EXTENSION^

.50

Rahway hooters
travel to fame

The Rahway Youth Soc-
cer Assn. just concluded its
most successful traveling-
team season ever.

The association entered
nine teams in the Mid-New
Jersey Youth Soccer Lea-
gue and came away with
two league championships,
three division champion-
ships and one second place.

In the post-season Soc-
cerama Tournament five
teams won division cham-
pionships and captured the
first-place medals.

The following clubs com-
peted this spring season:

Division No. 1
The Rahway United, coa-

ched by John Blair, compil-

ed a 7-2-1 record for second
place in its flight and also
won its division in Soc-
cerama. The team also went
to the quarter finals of the
state cup.

The Rahway Wildcats,
coached by Tom Woodrow,
Sr. and Tom Porter, com-
piled a 10-1-1 record, and
won their division and lea-
gue championship by beat-
ing Hazlet 2-0 on goals by
Bucky Buckman and Steve
Wisk.

Division No. 2
The Rahway Rockets,

coached by Don Convery,
captured the Division No. 2
Soccerama medals.

Division No. 3
The Rahway Celtics, coa-

ched by Tom Woodrow, Jr.
and Bill Schweitzer, cap-
tured their flight and also
the league championship
with a 1001 record. They
defeated state cup cham-
pions, East Brunswick
Pegasus 3-2 in the final
game.
The Rahway Rangers, coa-
ched by Carl Hauschild and
John Harrigan, compiled a
6-3-1 record and placed se-
cond in Soccerama.

Division No. 4
The Rahway Rowdies,

coached by Jim Meehan
and Ed Me Lean and spon-

Recreations total up
lucky victory 13

By Ray Hoagland
The Rahway Recreations

took their 13 consecutive
win in the Intra-County
Baseball League when they
defeated the Union VFW
16-8 on July 13.

The city team is trying to
set a league mark by winn-
ing all of its league contests.

The team is coached by
the veteran Rahwayites,
William Roesch and John
Bodnar.

Roesch said the reason
for the success of the team,
sponsored by the Rahway
Recreation Dept., is that it
has players who play or
played for winners in high
school and play for winners
in college.

For example, Bob Sekley,
a good high school pitcher
for Coach Bill Dolan at
Rahway, received more
grooming at Marietta
(Ohio) College, which won
the Division No. 3 World
Series this past spring.

"The pitching coaches
taught me a lot," said
Sekley. "I'm pitching smart-
er and I'm using a change-
up."

Sekley leads Rahway in
victories with five, has fann-
ed 39 batters in 33 innings
and has a 1.48 earned-run
average.

"We can hit," the coach
said.

As a team, the Recrea-
tions are hitting approx-
imately .400 and scoring 8.6
runs per game. Opponents
are averaging 3.4.

On July 13 Rahway's
winning rally challenged
every baseball cliche in the
book. The Rahwayans sla-
shed ropes, dumped bloop-
ers and poked seeing-eye
base,hits through and over
the.Union defense, which
hastened its demise by com-
mitting five errors in the
game.

When the game was over
Rahway had its second-
highest run total of the
season, and the 10 runs it
scored in the sixth inning
was the most in one inning
all summer.

Shortshop, Frank Jacik,
who entered the game as
the team's leading hitter
with a .500 batting average,
had three hits in four trips
against the VFW. He leads
the league in hits, runs
scored and stolen bases.

The only reason we mov-
ed from Rahway River
Park to Veteran's Memorial
Field is you hit better there
than I do," Jacik said in jest
to Scott Wolhrab.

As for Veteran's Field,
according to the coach, the
team moved there because
the field drains better, is bet-
ter suited for its left-handed
hitting prowess and it has a
grass infield.

In depth Rahway lost a
lot of hitting when catcher,
Frank Urso (.545) and out-
fielder, Mark Ciccotelli
(.435) were sidelined by in-
juries, but Joe Petula has
stepped in well behind the
plate and the outfield, led
by Jeff Gerhart and Mike
Gabel, who hit a homerun
in last week's game, has
contributed offensively.

Another reason for the
success is clutch hitting. In
four of its last six games
Rahway has been tied or
behind in the last inning
and won.

Rahway has won five
games by one run, including
a 6-5 contest over Westfield
at Tamaques Park, the first
time Rahway won there
since Roesch became coach
in 1976. Some believe the
team, and certain indivi-
duals like Wohlrab, are too
good for the Intra-County
League.

"Guys have told me

THIS PAUSE REALLY REFRESHES - Pacer, Graduate
Boy, takes time out from his training schedule at
Freehold Raceway for a cooling bath on a hot summer
day. Applying the tender loving care is Debbie Allen of
Atlantic City, whose Job it is to keep Graduate Boy in the
peak of condition.

about being above the lea-
gue," said Wohlrab of Lin-
den, a left-handed pitcher
who struck out 11 in four
innings July 13. "I'm used
to different pitching on the
college level. But I don't
think I'm above anybody."
He attends Kean College of
New Jersey in Union.

Last year Rahway won
the league playoff, but the
city team had two ineligible
players on its roster. West-
field, which lost to Rahway
on Jacik's homerun, lodged
a complaint in September at
a league meeting not attend-
ed by Roesch.

A week before the Union
County Hot Stove Dinner
Roesch found out his team
had been stripped of its title
and the Police Athletic Lea-
gue was given the trophy.

League rules forbid indi-
viduals from playing if their
20th birthday occurs before
July 1. Teams had gone by
the honor system Jn the
past, but because of the
violation, the league passed
an amendment to the con-
stitution by-laws requiring
teams to send a roster and
copies of birth certificates to
league president, Chuck Ar-
chdeacon.

"It's unfortunate it hap-
pened," said Roesch, "and if
there is any blame, I have to
be responsible. Until this
year, I never checked the
birth certificates. People
around the league were say-
ing we have 25-year-old
players, but we had taken
players who were two, three
months or six weeks over.
We didn't try to deceive
anybody. But we wanted an
investigation of the whole
league."

League secretary-trea-
surer, Walter Pulchlopek,
said minimal damage was
done and no ill feeling per-
sists.

Roesch says he doesn't
harbor any resentment.
After 13, he and his team
have few obstacles left.

RAHWAY
RECREATIONS

INTRA-COUNTY
BASEBALL LEAGUE

SCHEDULES
TODAY

Roselle Park at Rahway,
6 p.m.

SATURDAY, JULY 23
Rahway at Summit, 10

a.m.
MONDAY, JULY 25

Cranford at Rahway.
WEDNESDAY, JULY 27

Westfield at Rahway.
AMERICAN LEGION

RAHWAY POST NO. 5
SCHEDULE

TOMORROW
Springfield at Rahway.

SUNDAY, JULY 24 -
St. Mary of the Assump-

t ion of El izabeth at
Rahway, 10 a.m.

CLARK WILDCATS
W O M E N ' S FAST-PITCH

SOFTBALL LEAGUE
WEDNESDAY, JULY 27

Middletown at Wildcats,
6 p.m.

sored by A and M Indus-
trial Supply, compiled a 91
record to win their flight.

The Rahway Strikers,
coached by Bud Bertram
and Andy Kupka, finished
with a 6-2 record and won
their division title in Soc-
cerama.

Division No. 5
The Rahway Arrows,

coached by Bill Schappert,
Jim Robinson and Bruce Ei-
tel, finished 5-4-1 and also
won their division at Soc-
cerama.

The Rahway Kicks, coa-
ched by Steve Smith and
Bob Guarino, finished 6-2-1
and also won their Soccer-
ama division title.

Girls' Division No. 1
The Rahway Cosmos,

coached by Colleen
Sweeney, competed against
some of central Jersey's fin-
est teams and compiled a
2-7 record.

Girls' Division No. 2
The Rahway Angels, coa-

ched by Blair, finished at
1-8.

The players and coaches
will be honored at an
Awards Night in December.

Anyone interested in
joining the Rahway City
Soccer League is asked to
telephone 388-2659 or
382-7914 for further infor-
mation.

NO FISH STORY - James A. Smith of Clark, left, and
Clark's Mayor Bernard G. Yarusavage, right, hold their
catch for the day, which included Land-Lock Salmon
and Large Mouth Bass, while vacationing in Danforth,
Maine. ' , ..

A. A. U. WINNERS - Rahway's Craig Montgomery,
right, and Fran Brewer, left, both 13 years old, placed
third in their respective events at the New Jersey
Amateur Athletic Union Junior Boys Division Olympics
held recently in Lawrenceville.

Montgomery, Brewer
win state honors

Two 13-year-old Rahway
boys placed third in their
respective events at the
New Jersey Amateur Ath-
letic Union Junior Boys
Division Olympics held in
Lawrenceville on Saturday.
June 18.

Both Craig Montgomery
and Fran Brewer arc in the
eighth grade at Rahway
Junior High School, and
both aspire to someday be
in the Olympics.

Montgomery placed third
in the 110-meter run with a
time of 12.4 seconds. Al-
though the competition was
good and training was lack-
ing, he felt he put "120%
into his effort and owes his
mother for his success."

His other interests in-
clude basketball and foot-
ball, and he is a member of
the Rahway Recreation
Dept. Wrestling Team. In
the future he hopes to enter
the Marines.

Brewer also placed third

in the 400-meter run. This
former playground Olympic
champion hopes to see more
people become active in
track and field in the city.
He also participates in bas-
ketball and football and
would like the people of
Rahway to "remember me
for my athletic achieve-
ments."

Dixon Deranek
tosses near top

A Rahway resident, Dix-
on Deranek, throwing a
55% pitching average, fin-
ished third in the Middlesex
Memorial Horseshoe-Pit-
ching Tournament on July
9 at Mountainview Park in
Middlesex.

A walrus can easily sink
a small boat with his tusks.

» : - ; • • . • • •

NECK AND NECK - Two entrants in (he Rahway Fourth of July "Holiday at Home"
Bicycle Races are right at each other's backs during the contest as they pass the
Rahway Savings Insitution on Irving St.

Ask about our

ROAD HAZARD
GUARANTEE!

TM

Steel Belted Radials
Whitewall
165/80R13
17570R13
175/80R13
185/80R13
205'70R13
175 75R14
18575R14
195/75R14

Price
S39.95

45.95
46.95
47.95
49.95
48.95
49.95
53.95

Whitewall
205 70R1-1
205 75R14
215 75R14
225 75R14
205 75R15
215 75R15
225 75R15
235 75R15

Price
S54.95

55.95
57.95
59.95
56.95
59.95
60.95
6695

PlusSI 64lo$2 9GF E T

SALE!

RADIAL
BUY!

tow Priced
Steel Radial
$2895

Wliilcw.'iH

-•/,- ,<'••••/.-•

Whitewall Price Whitewall

185/75R14
195/75R14
205-75R14
21575R14

'40.95
41.95
44.95
47.95

Price

205 75R15
215 75R15
225 75R15
235 75R15

•46 95
.1/ 95
49 95
51 95

Free mounting
of new tire purchase

P l u s S i S O I O S ; ' ' in I

^ a i c ^ Electronic Ignition Tune-up,

*45* $55* *65*
MoilOomcVic Toyota ,, < y>„„),.( .. , ? ,..
Daliun VW and Hood a e tc ,
Wo'M install n e w f o s i 5 t o f s p a r k p ' .uys , adjuM iciii; SPL-IM! -.*•'. inning
tost bartory a n d c h a r g i n g aybUim. m s p e d msor, (U;U\iniU)i c;.ip.

m PCV valvo, ignition cab le ; , , air M!<;r c a n k c a s o ^ c n t Irlcr ,intj vapor
I camstor filter <t1 H r\ff
I Super Saver ij) I U L l l I price shown coupomEipin

AirConditioning

I c r w i e e
=*^5 j Wr; u check your •,yr,!<.>rn mrJutJing pressuro anrj 'oak tosi'j. di3-

Ĉ  chjirqe. ov.ic.ijrile iinM r(;cfiiirrj(> thf.- syMom II noocJod rclngcidnt

J1 "rr___ * r j
Super Saver *J> 1 U OTT price shown CP

Deluxe
CHAMPION

Polyester Cord

2095

Blackball P"-<-

A78 13 S/-1 •'•
155 80D13 / - •'
B78
D78
E78
F78

13 ill) •''
M <•} 'c
l.t - , j '
M 1') V.

H'.r

1 , i ' H

', '>()

' , ' ) ' :

r, ;n
1 i ,*M
1 ,'f.

.V . I " > ' " . . •

| . l 5 " •

r , • -

T.

1S ''
r,
i s

SOMERSET TIRE SERVICE

RaOi.ll Ply Hlii'.•

165 80R13 1
175 BOH f i :

iBsaonin ;
!7S 75H1-1 ;
I85 75H1-I :
195 / ' jHl ' l ;
?05 75H1', .

' ( i

.v.,:l

s ' . l

|1 , • , ) ' • , ^ N U M W . l l l

II/H.I ( ." ' " i t ' l
( :H. l'. .•'i.'S'l'i
I ,-i..i- .•'"• iS'i

CHESTER
Rl 20G

879-4000

GREENBROOK
Rl 22Ea51tX>unr.l

469-5500

DOVER HOCKAWAY
Rl -lfi

HACKETTSTOWN
R l - 5 ( . I t . f . t o ' l t > v / ' . :

EASTBRUNSW1CK
Rl 18

?5<1 0151

HAKLET
Ml 35(Ni;xl loRioKuls)

739-3'tOQ

PRINCETON
ROUIB 206

lf.09|921-«?00

FLEMINGTON
Rl 202-31 f>cln

7B?-?M0

LAWRENCEVIl.il
Brunswick PikrfUl I1

(609)813? 8W.

ROSELLE PARK
Westlieicl* lo t ii',I A.i

.'Ml.-iBOO

I HI I MOID
H> ) i r r > . ' ' ( . " ' v

MAWSON

"SOMLKVII.l.L

WESTFIELD
Soulh Avl! E

P32-1300

•I

I

l * - ' v - ;

rVi.V
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Religious News
S E C O N D PRF.SBY TF.R1AN CHURCH OF

RAHWAY
The Sunday Morning Worship will be at y:30 o'clock

on Sunday. July 24. Worshipping with ihc congregation
of the Second Presbyterian Church will be the f-irst
Presbyterian Church and the Trinity United Methodist
Church congregations, both of Rahway. as part of the
Summer Union Services, at the First Presbyterian
Church.

The guest preacher, leading the congregations in
Worship will bo The Rev, Hibbert W. Moss, Jr. from
Summit. The Rev. Moss is a graduate of Princeton
Seminary, and is the pastoral-large of the Elizabeth
Presbytery and a professional librarian, currently
associated with Employment Anonymous of New Pro-
vidence, an organization giving spiritual support and
guidance to the unemployed.

Church-time nursery care for those up to five years
old will be provided by the hosi Church.

The Church is located at 1221 New Brunswick Ave.
The Rev. Harold E. Van Horn is the pastor.

EBENEZER AFRICAN METHODIST EPISCOPAL
CHURCH OF RAHWAY

At the 10 a.m. Worship Service on Sunday. July 24,
The Rev. Rudolph P. Ciibbs, Sr.. the pastor, will deliver
the sermon. The Sunday Church School will commence
at 9:30 a.m. At 4 p.m. the Rev. Albert Fuller, the pastor
of the Progressive Baptist Church of Rahway, will be the
guest preacher, accompanied by a Choir and the members
of the congregation. This Worship Service will be spon-
sored by Mrs. Callie Watson for Women's Day.

Meetings during the week: Today, Prayer Meeting,
Church, 8 p.m.; Tuesday. July 16. Celestial Choir and
Men's Chorus. 8 p.m.; Wednesday, July 27. Men's Club
Meeting and Bible Study. 7:30 p.m.

The Church is located at 253 Central Ave.

UNION COUNTY BAPTIST CHURCH OI CLARK
The Main Worship Service on Sunday, July 24, will

be at 1 I a.m. and the Evening Worship Service will begin
at 7 o'clock. Children and Youth will attend Sunday
School at 9:45 a.m. The Adult Sunday School will begin
at 10 a.m.

On Wednesday. July 27, the Mid-Week Wednesday
Evening Prayer Service will begin at 7 o'clock. Nursery
care will be provided at all the Church Services.

Please telephone the Church office for transporta-
tion to and from the Church. For additional information,
free counseling, Church services and functions please
telephone 574-1479.

There will be a guest speaker preaching at the Sun-
day Services and on Wednesday while Dr. Frank Papan-
drea, the pastor, is away on vacation.

The Church is located at 4 Valley Rd., at the
Parkway Circle at Exit No. 135 of ihe Garden State
Parkway.

OSCEOLA PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH OF CLARK
Preaching at the 10 a.m. Service of Worship on Sun-

day, July 24, on the topic, "Children of Hope," will be
The Rev. James P. Stobaugh, the temporary supply
pastor.

Those three years of age to those in sixth grade are
eligible to attend the Vacation Bible School at the Church
from Monday to Friday, Aug. I to 5, from 9 a.m. to
noon. The theme will be "The Sonshine Patch: Growing
God's Way." There will be Bible studies, music, crafts and
recreation. A closing program will be presented by the

.- children on Aug. Sat 6:30 p.m.-Mr. Stobaugh is the direc-
tor of the school.

This August about a dozen members of the Senior
High Youth Group of the Church will take a mission trip
to Drift, Ky., an impoverished Appalachian area which
has a population of about 500 living in remote areas of
the mountains. The youth will do carpentry, plumbing,
electrical work, painting and other forms of manual labor.
About half of the money needed for the trip has been
raied through fundraisers. Those on the trip will leave
Osceola on Saturday morning. Aug. 13, and return on
Sunday evening, Aug. 21.

The Annual Church Picnic will take place at Tania-
ques Park in Westfield on Sunday, Aug. 28, from 1 p.m.
to dark. There will be foixl. games for all ages, prizes and
Fellowship. The admission will be S2.50 for adults, $1 for
those five to 11 years old and free to those under five
years old.

The Church is located at 1689 Raritan Rd.

ST. PAULS EPISCOPAL CHURCH OF RAHWAY
The congregation will observe Sunday, July 24, as

the Ninth Sunday after Pentecost. The Church is now on
the Summer Schedule with one Liturgy only, at ft;-30 a.m.,
with the Celebration of the Holy Eucharist with The Rev.
Joseph H. Gauvin, the rector, as the Celebrant and
homilisi.

The Church School classes and Sunday Breakfast are
discontinued to September.

The Church is located at the corner of Elm Ave. and
Irving St.

The Rev. Joseph 11. Gauvin is the pastor.

ZION LUTHERAN CHURCH OF RAHWAY
The Service of Worship on Sunday, July 24, will be

conducted by Dale and Jean Rice at 9 a.m. Children may
Worship with their parents.

Meetings during the week: Tuesday, July 26, Music
and Worship Committee Meeting, 7:30 p.m.

The Church is located at Elm and Esterbrook Aves.
The Rev. Thomas J. Donahue is the pastor.

ZION LUTHERAN CHURCH OF CLARK
The Main Worship will be at 9:15 a.m. on Sunday,

July 24.
Sunday School and Bible Classes in Christian Educa-

tion for all ages is in recess for the summer months.
To enroll children aged three and over for the fall

term, please telephone the Church Office at 382-7320.
The Church is located at 559 Raritan Rd.
The Rev. Joseph D. Kucharik is the pastor.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH OF RAHWAY
The congregation of the First Presbyterian Church

will unite in Worship with the members of the Second
Presbyterian and Trinity United Methodist Churches at
9:30 a.m. on Sunday, July 24, in the Second Presbyterian
Church Sanctuary at 1221 New Brunswick Ave.,
Rahway.

The "Old First" Church is located at the corner of
W. Grand Ave. and Church St.

The Rev. Robert C. Powley is the pastor.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH OF RAHWAY
The Rev. Army Chaplain Donald W. Gover from

Fort Monmouth will preach on Sunday, July 24, at the
Service of Worship to begin at 9:45 a.m. Special music
will be offered during the Worship Service by James R.
Lenney, the director of music.

Child care will be provided.
The Church is located on the corner at 177 Elm and

Esterbrook Aves.
The Rev. William L. Frederickson is the pastor.

TRINITY UNITED METHODIST CHURCH OF
RAHWAY

The congregation of the Trinity United Methodist
Church of Rahway will unite at the Second Presbyterian
Church, located at 1221 New Brunswick Ave., Rahway,
with Ihe First Presbyterian Church at 9:30 a.m. on Sun-
day, July 24, for the Summer Union Worship Service.

The Fair Workshop will meet today from 10 a.m. to
2 p.m. at the Church.

The Church is located at the corner of E. Milton
Ave. and Main St.

The Rev, Donald B. Jones is the pastor.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH OF
RAHWAY

The Church Worship Service will be at 10 a.m. on
Sunday, July 24. The Rev. Sara B. Waldron, the pastor,
will preach on the sermon "Is Polite Prayer Proper?"

The 10 a.m. Hour of Worship will continue through
August.

The Church is located at 466 W. Grand Ave.

CLARK ALLIANCE CHURCH
Sunday School for all ages will be held at 10 a.m. on

Sunday, July 24, with Morning Worship at 11 o'clock.
Choir Practice will begin at 6 p.m. The Evening Service
will commence at 7 o'clock.

Meetings during the week: Tuesday, July 26, Ladies
Bible Study, 12:30 p.m.; Wednesday, July 27, Bible Study
and Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.

For further information, please telephone the pastor,
The Rev. David W. Arnold, at 388-1272.

The Church is located at 2 Denman Ave.

Better co-ordination
needed in programs
for elderly: Rinaldo
The ranking Republican

on the House Aging Com-
mittee, Rep. Matthew J.
Rinaldo, whose district in-
cludes Clark, today called
for improved coordination
of programs serving elderly
residents of the nation's
30,000 boarding homes.

Rep. Rinaldo is introduc-
ing legislation permanently
establishing a unit within
the Dept. of Health and
Human Services to oversee
departmental activities
relating to board and care
homes that house an esti-
mated 300,000 citizens na-
tionwide.

"These efforts have been
disjointed in the past," the
representative noted, "with
the result the elderly resi-
dents of these facilities have
not always received the pro-
tections that Congress in-
tended."

A majority of the board
and care home residents de-
pend on Supplemental Se-
curity Income (SSI), the
federal welfare program
enacted in 1972. Many
benefit from various other
federal programs such as
food stamps and Medicaid.

Among the Health and
Human Services divisions
who share responsibility for
these programs are the Ad-
ministration on Aging,
Health Care Financing Ad-
ministration, Administra-
tion on Developmental
Disabilities and Social
Security Administration.

Rep. Rinaldo reported
during a 1981 aging com-
mittee hearing held at his re

quest, David Swope, former
Health and Human Service
undersecretary, testified
departmental efforts re-
lating to the residents of
board and care homes had
been fragmented and a cen
tral office was needed to co
ordinate these activities.

Subsequently, in April
1982, former Secretary
Richard Schweiker des
ignated the Office of Hu
man Development Service;
as the focal point for co
ordinating departmental ac-
tivities and established the
Board and Care Coordi-
nating Unit within that of-
fice.

Rep. Rinaldo cited an in
ternal department mejnor
andum from Dorcas Hardy
assistant secretary fo
human development, which
indicated the unit would
finish its work and b
disbanded this September.

The representative's bil
would legislatively establish
the office so it could not b
administratively eliminated
He said improved co-ord
nation of federal respon
sibilities would help strc
ngthen the efforts of the
states in regulating boarding
homes and protecting the
health and safety of the el-
derly residents.

Communities where the
homes are located could ex-
pect to benefit because the
increased oversight would
provide greater assurance
the facilities arc operating in
compliance with various
local and state standards.

KIWANIS HEARS FEMALE MINISTER - Ralph Smith,
right, a member of the Kiwanis Club of Rahway, is
shown with The Rev. Sarah Waldron, the pastor of the
First United Methodist Church in Rahway. The Rev.
Waldron is reported to be the first female minister to
serve a Church in Rahway. Her message to the group
was "The Things We Search For In Life Are The Things
We Already Possess." The Rahway Kiwanis Club
meets on Wednesdays at 12:15 p.m. at the Columbian
Cfub in Rahway.

Hospital conducts
childbirth classes

As women enter the later
months of pregnancy,
preparation for the child-
birth process becomes an
mportant concern. To

assist expectant mothers
during this time, St. Eli-
'.abcth Hospital in Eliza-
beth offers "Preparation for

hildbirth" classes.
The classes will begin on

Monday, Aug. I, and con-
inue for six consecutive

weeks from 7:30 to 9:30
p.m. in the hospital cafe-
teria. Participants may
enroll in either the Monday
or Thursday evening ses-
sions.

The classes are open to
women in their fifth month
of pregnancy and a coach
who will remain with them
during childbirth. Under
the direction of registered

nurses certified as child-
birth educators, expectant
mothers and their coaches
learn and practice body
mechanics, the Lamaze
method of natural child-
birth and simple breathing
and relaxation techniques.

Additionally, participants
visit the hospital birthing
room, a special hospital
facility which provides an
atmosphere similar to pa-
tients' homes during child-
birth. Audiovisual pre-
sentations are also included
in the program. '

"Preparation for Chi-
ldbirth" classes are limited
to 25 couples; the fee is S30.
To register or for more in-
formation, please telephone
the Nursing Education Of-
fice at St. Elizabeth
Hospital at 527-5390.

Two area students
receive key awards

TRUMPETING THEIR SUCCESS - Gina DAddario and
Justine Danatos of Rahway perform their tap dance to
"Boogie Woogie Bugle Boy" during the Rahway Golden
Agers' picnic.

Two area residents were
among 26 Union County
College of Cranfurd and
Scotch Plains students who
were awarded Union Coun-

St. Patrick's
to hold

annual picnic
Part of St. Patrick's R. C.

Church of Elizabeth's 125th
anniversary will be the An-
nual Parish Picnic, to be
held on Sunday, Aug. 7, on
the east lawn of the church
on Second and Court Sts.
from 2 to 8 p.m.,

In case of rain the picnic
will be held in the church
basement. There will be
clams, hot dogs, chowder,
homemade cakes and cof-
fee, sausages, hamburgers,
ethnic foods, soda, beer and
mixed drinks, adult games,
children's games and prizes.

Tickets are. 52.50 in ad-
vance and are available at
the rectory at 215 Court St.,
Elizabeth, N. J., by tele-
phoning 354 0023, or by
paying S3 at the gate on the
date of the picnic. These
prices include S2 worth of
food tickets.

ly College Keys for their ac-
tive participation in extra-
curricular activities during
the 1982-1983 academic
year.

Union County College
Keys are awarded on a
point system developed by
the Student Government
Assn., which serve full-time
students, and the Part-time
Student Government, whi-
ch serves part-time stu-
dents.

Points are won by serving
on the student govern-
ments, on student publica-
tions and by assuming lead-
ership roles in other student
organizations or for par-
ticipating in community ser-
vices projects.

Area residents who have
been awarded Union Coun-
ty College Keys are: From
Rahway, Rose Henderson,
and from Clark. Maureen
Callaghan

The mockingbird has been
known to change its tune
87 times in seven minutes.

Henry Apelians help
welcome church head
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READY FOR OVATION - Rahway's Gina D'Addario per-
forms a tap solo number to the music of "Applause"
during the June 22 picnic of the Rahway Golden Agers.

Two Clark residents, Mr.
and Mrs. Henry Apelian of
Rutgers Rd., were invited to
a special reception June 3 at
the Lebanese Embassy in
New York City by the Con-
sul General of Lebanon to
meet and greet His Holiness
Karckin II, Catholicos of
Cilicia. Only about 50
couples and other guests
were invited from all over
America, including Canada,
according to Mrs. Apelian.

His Holiness is the head
of the Eastern Orthodox
Church, Sec of Cilicia. the
equivalent of the Pope in
the Roman Cathol ic
Church. He appeared on a
television show on June 19.

His Holiness speaks num-
erous languages fluently.
He"" was born in 1932 in
Kessab, an Armenian vil-
lage in northern Syria. He
was admitted to the Cilician
Seminary in Lebanon after
he was ordained deacon in
1946.

After continuing his
theological and Armenian
studies for another three
years, he was ordained a
monk in 1952. While serv-
ing on the staff of the
Seminary, where he remain-
ed after graduation, he com-
pleted his Armenian
Church doctorate. In 1957
he attended Oxford Univer-
sity in England, where he
received his B. Liu (OXONl
in 1959.

In the following years,
until 1967, he served as
director of the Cilician Sem-
inary and editor of its

periodical, "Hask." Under
his leadership, the seminary
took on a new vitality and
the number of Seminarians
increased dramatically, ac-
cording to Mrs. Apelian.

During this lime he re-
presented the Cilician See in
various ecumenical meet-
ings in Athens, The
Vatican, Lisbon, London,
Geneva, Venice and Vien-
na. He was ordained bishop
in 1964, and then he was
elected Prelate of the Julfa-
Isfahan Diocese in Iran, a
post he held until his elec-
tion as Prelate of the Ar-
menian Apostolic Church
of America in 1973; and on
April 26. 1973, he was or-
dained archbishop. His
Holiness served the United
States and Canadian com-
munities for four years, and
it was during this time the
Armenian community he
served became acquainted
with their youthful Prelate
who was destined for a posi-
tion of greater leadership.
His election and consecra-
tion as Catholicos-
Coadjutor "took place in
Lebanon in May. 1977.
Hence, with the death of
Catholicos Khoren I this
past February Karekin II
assumed the full duties as
Catholicos of the Sec of
Cilicia, Mrs. Apelian noted.

His Holiness has display-
ed an active interest not on-
ly in the Armenian Church
and national affairs but in
the ecumenical movement
as well, an interest which
first began in 1955 when he

PRIZE WINNER - Joyce Jacobus of Hillside is shown,
left, presenting her painting, "Daisies," to Grace T.
O'Connor, the director of the Clark Public Library. The
painting won the Purchase Award at the Clark Art
Assn.'s annual show in June.

participated in the Middle
Eastern Christian Youth
Conference in Beirut, and
culminated in 1975 when at
the Fifth Assembly of the
World Council of Churches
in Nairobi he was elected
vice moderator of the coun-
cil's executive committee
for a seven-year term, she
added.

The Armenian Apostolic
Church in America had its
beginnings during the late
19th and 20th centuries. It
was during this period a
large number of Armenians
emigrated to America, seek-
ing refuge from the Turkish
massacres.

Thus, the Armenian
Church in America was for-
mally organized in 1898. In
1915 the first Armenian
Cathedral in America-St. Il-
luminator's, wa j con-
secrated in New York City.
It stands today at 221 E.
27th St.. and is the Mother
Church of the Armenian
Apostolic Church of Amer-
ica.

Up until 1933 the en-
tire Armenian diocese of
the Armenian Church exist-
ed under the jurisdiction of
the Holy See of Etchmia-
dzin, located in Armenia in
the Soviet Union. Both Sees
have been in existence for
centuries, each with its own
jurisdictional areas. Both
Sees adhere completely and
without deviation to the
fundamental canons and
doctrines of the American
Apostolic Church, the for-
mer Clark Township pres-
ident pointed out.

Throughout its history
the Armenian Church has
paralleled so closely the
history of the Armenian na-
tion it is difficult to explain
one without touching upon
the other. The two, nation
and church, are so closely
meshed it appears the
phrase 'national church'
was specifically coined for
the Armenians. Conse-
quently, since its inception
the church has been the
center of political and social
controversies," she added.

On June 16 His Holiness
Karekin II was invited by
President Ronald Reagan to
the Oval Office. Since then
His Holiness has traveled all
over the United States and
he will be attending the
Sixth General Assembly of
the World Council of Chur-
ches in Vancouver, B. C ,
Canada. He is also vice
moderator of the Council's
Central Committee.

His Holiness, the spiritual
head of 350,000 Armenians
in the United States and
Canada arrived in New
York City for his goodwill
tour on June 2, and will end
his visit on Tuesday, Aug.
16.
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OBITUARIES
Mrs. West/65,

messenger at bank
Mrs. Annie McLawhorn

West, 65, of Rahway, died
Tuesday, July 5, at Rahway"
Hospital after a brief illness.

Born in Greenville, N. C ,
she had lived in Long Is-
land, New York, before she
had moved to Rahway 16
years ago.

Mrs. West had been em-
ployed by the National
State Bank, where she had
worked for the last five
years as a messenger. Prior
to that, she had worked as a
supervisor for Valco Elec-
tronics in Orange.

A member of the Second
Baptist Church of Rahway,
Mrs. West had also been a

member of its Golden Rule
Club.

She had been a member
of the Ladies Auxiliary of
the James Mackie Post No.
499 of the American Le-
gion.

She was the widow of
Melton West, who died in
1973.

Surviving are three sis-
ters, Mrs. Velma Rawlerson
of St. Albans, N. Y., Mrs.
Artensie James of Newark
and Mrs. Lillian James of
Rahway and two step-dau-
ghters, Mrs. Florence Hines
in Long Island and Mrs.
Genova Barnes of Brook-
lyn.

Mrs. Osienski, 74,
ex-library director

Mrs. Helen K. Osienski,
74, of Clark, died Thursday,
July 7, at Rahway Hospital
after a long illness.

Born in New York City,
she had lived most of her
life in West New York
before she had come to
Clark 12 years ago.

Mrs. Osienski had been a
library director for the West
New York Public Library
for 15 years until her retire-
ment 12 years ago.

She had been a communi-
cant of St. Agnes R. C.
Church of Clark.

Mrs. Osienski had been a
member and past president

of the Senior Citizens of
Clark and had also been a
member of the Ladies Aux-
iliary of Clark Post No.
7363 of the Veterans of
Foreign Wars.

She was the widow of
Joseph Osienski, who died
in 1950.

Surviving are two sons,
Joseph of Brooklyn and Ro-
bert of Fanwood; two dau-
ghters, Mrs. Dorothy Ralti,
with whom she lived, and
Mrs. Loretta Bodtmann of
Wayne; a brother, Edward
Keogh of Lompac, Calif.;
seven grandchildren and
four great-granchildren.

Mr. Adams, 74,
Merck supervisor

Stephen Adams, 74, of
Rahway, died Saturday, Ju-
ly 9, at Rahway Hospital
after a brief illness.

Born in Poland, he had
been brought to the United
States and Rahway 70 years
ago.

Mr. Adams had been em-
ployed by Merck and Co.,
Inc. of Rahway, where he
had worked 48 years as a
supervisor in its Millhouse
section until his retirement
in 1973.

He had been a communi-
cant of St. Mary's R. C.
Church and had also been a
member of its Holy Name

Society, both of Rahway.
Mr. Adams had also been

a member of the Rahway
Council No. 1146 of the
Knights of Columbus, the
Washington Knights of Col-
umbus General Assembly
and a member of the
Alhambra with that organ-
ization.

Surviving are his widow,
Mrs. Helen Glagola Adams;
a son, Stephen Jr. of Lin-
den; a daughter, Mrs. Bcr-
nice Canterella of Rahway;
a brother, Charles of Car-
teret; a sister, Miss Sophie
Adams of Clark and two
grandchildren.

Mr. Poznanski, 79,
maintenance aide

John S. Poznanski, 79, of
Clark, died Sunday, July 10,
at Rahway Hospital after a
brief illness.

Born in Poland, he had
lived in Newark before he
had moved to Clark 42
years ago.

Mr. Poznanski had work-
ed for Bell Laboratories in
Murray Hill as a mainten-
ance aide for 20 years until
his retirement in 1970.

He had been a communi-
cant of St. Theresa's R. C.
Church of Linden.

Mr. Poznanski had been
a member of Ihe J. T. Kos-
ciusko Assn. of Irvington
and the Polish National
Home of Linden.

Surviving are his widow,
Mrs. Wanda Sokolowicz
Poznanski; a son, John E.
of Clark; two brothers, Ed-
ward of Whiting and Stan-
ley of Short Hills; eight
grandchildren and four
great-grandchildren.

He was the father of Mrs.
Lorraine Tami, who died in
1979.

Mrs. Martin, 86,
Gold Star Mother

Mrs. Melva N. Martin,
86, of Rahway, died Satur-
day, July 9, at the Birch-
wood Nursing Home in Edi-
son after a long illness.

She was a lifelong resi-
dent of Rahway.

Mrs. Martin had been a
member of the Ladies Aux-
iliary of Rahway Post No. 5
of the American Legion.

Mrs. Martin had been a
member of the Trinity Uni-
ted Methodist Church of
Rahway.

She was a Gold Star
Mother. Mrs. Martin's son,
Pvt. Clifford A. Saladin,
had been killed in action on
Iwo Jima in 1945.

She was the widow of
Howard Martin, who died
in 1973.

Surviving are a son,
Charles E. Saiadin of Col-
onia; a daughter, Mrs. Eve-
lyn Granitzki of Manteo,
N. C ; a sister, Mrs. Ruth

Bartlett of Lakewood; seven
grandchildren and three
great-grandchildren.

Mrs. Gilbert, 957

ex-Rahwayan
Mrs. Emma M. Gilbert,

95, of Linden, died Mon-
day, July 4, at the Elizabeth
General Medical Center in
Elizabeth after a long il-
lness.

Born in England, she had
come to the United States
and had settled in Newark.
She had lived in Rahway
before she had moved to
Linden 42 years ago.

Mrs. Gilbert had been a
member of the Emmaus
Chapter No. 183 of the
Order of the Eastern Star.

She was the widow of Al-
bert N. Gilbert, who died in
1972.

Surviving is a son, John
of Linden.

Joseph Learsch, 55,
ex-special policeman

Joseph Learsch, 55, of
Rahway, died Tuesday, Ju-
ly 5, at St. Elizabeth
Hospital in Elizabeth after a
brief illness.

Born in Elizabeth, he had
lived in Rahway the last 11
years.

Mr. Learsch had worked
for the Public Service Elec-
tric and Gas Co. in Spring-
field as a rneter reader for
29 years.

He had been a member of
St. Mark's R. C. Church in
Rahway.

Mr. Learsch had been a
former member of the Rah-
way Special Police and the
Rahway Police Auxiliary.

He was a World War II
Navy veteran.

Surviving are his widow,
Mrs. Mary Bettinger Lear-
sch.

Mrs. Jagentowicz, 68,
in Clark eight years

Mrs. Louise A. Jagento-
wicz. 68, of Clark, died Sun-
day, July 10. at Rahway
Hospital after being strick-
en at home with an appar-
ent heart attack.

Born in Newark, she had
lived in Clark for the last
eight years.

Surviving are her hus-

band, Alexander Jagento-
wicz; three daughters, Mrs.
Barbara Brown of Keans-
burg, Mrs. Patricia Mills of
British Columbia, Canada
and Miss Janet Jagentowicz
of Maplewood; a sister,
Mrs. Ida Vreeland of Ir-
vington and three grand-
children.

Miss Lunzer, 80,
telephone firm aide

Miss Anna Lunzer, 80, of
Rahway, died Saturday, Ju-
ly 9, at St. Elizabeth Hos-
pital in Elizabeth.

Born in Newark, she had.
lived in Union 25 years and
had resided in Railway the
last year.

Miss Lunzer had been
employed by the New Jer-
sey Bell Telephone Co.,
where she had worked as an
examiner in the revenue ac-
counting department for 43
years in offices in Elizabeth,

Mrs. Dolin, 76
Mrs. Paula A. Dolin, 76,

of Hillside, died Wednes-
day, July 6, at Overlook
Hospital in Summit after a
long illness.

Born in Bremen, West
Germany, she had been
brought to the United Sta-
tes in 19 J 4, and ±ad settled
in Wooster, Mass. She had
later moved to Irvington
and had lived the last 12
years in Hillside.

Mrs. Dolin had been em-
ployed by Bamberger's De-
partment Store in Newark
for 40 years as a floor lady
and had retired in 1977.

She was the widow of
John P. Dolin, who died in
1972.

Surviving are two sons,
John H. of Cranford and
James P. of Playa Del Rey,
Calif.; four brothers, Henry
Schror of Kittatiny Lake,
Peter of Clark, Paul in New
York and Drew of Fan-
wood; two sisters, Mrs.
Anita Mason of Hillside
and Mrs. Rosemarie White
of Morris Plains; five grand-
children and two great-
grandchilden.

Mrs. Haskins
Mrs. Estelle A. James

Haskins, 38, of North Edi-
son, died Saturday, July 9,
at Perth Amboy General
Hospital in Perth Amboy
after a long illness.

Born in Newark, she had
lived in North Edison for 32
years.

Mrs. Haskins had been a
member of the National
Assn. for the Advancement
of Colored People in the
Metuchen/Edison area.

She had also been a
member of the Mt. Pleasant
Baptist Church.

Surviving arc two dau-
ghters, the Misses Michelle
James and Stephanie Has-
kins, both at home; a son,
Michael James at home; her
mother, Mrs. Gertrude Ja-
mes of North Edison; five
sistrs, Mrs. Mollie Smith of
Somerset, Mrs. Sarah Till-
man of Elizabeth, Mrs.
Mary Minus of Iselin and
the Misses Letha and Rea-
tha James, both of Rahway
and five brothers, William,
Harry and Amos James, all
of Plainfield, Nicholas
James of North Edison and
Abner James, Jr. of Rah-
way and a grandchild.

Irvington, Roselle and Ne-
wark until her retirement
18 years ago.

She had also been a mem-
ber of the H. G. McCully
Chapter of the Telephone
Pioneers of America.

Mrs. Schweitzer,
ex-Rahwayan

Mrs. Olga S. Schweitzer,
95, of Scotch Plains, died
Tuesday, July 5, at the Villa
Maria Nursing Home in
North Plainfield after a
long illness.

Born in Germany, she
had come to the United Sta-
tes in 1913 and had lived
most of her life in Rahway
before she had moved to
Scotch Pains a few years
ago.

Mrs. Schweitzer had been
a member of.the.Zion Luth-
eran Church of Rahway
and had also belonged to its
Ladies Aide Society.

Her husband, Leonard
Schweitzer, died in 1960.

Surviving are a son, Al-
bert of Scotch Plains; two
granddaughters and four
great-grandchildren.

Mr. Colo, 86
Pasquale Calo, 86, of

Colonia, died Tuesday, July
5, at Rahway Hospital after
a brief illness.

Born in Italy, he had
come to Newark in 1924
and then to Edison five
years ago before he had
moved to Colonia last
month.

Mr. Calo had worked as a
tailor for Hy Fashion Inc.
in East Orange for about 30
years and had retired in
1961.

He had also been a com-
municant of St. Agnes R. C.
Church in Clark.

He was the husband of
Mrs. Gelsomina Calo, who
died in 1976.

Surviving is a son, Gae-
tano of Clark; two dau-
ghters, Miss Mary Calo,
with whom he lived, and
Mrs. Angie DeVeau of Edi-
son and seven grandchil-
dren.

Frank Androvich
Frank T. Androvich, 76,

of Linden, died Thursday,
July 7, at Rahway Hospital
after a long illness.

He was a life-long resi-
dent of Linden.

Mr. Androvieh had
worked for the Simmons
Co. in Elizabeth, as a fur-
niture upholsterer for 50
years until his retirement 11
years ago.

He had also been a com-
municant of St. John the
Apostle R. C. Church of
Clark-Linden.

Mr. Androvich had also
been a member of the Re-
tired Men's Club of Linden.

Surviving are his widow,
Mrs. Lottie Eska Andro-

Rosemary Steinbaum

WNET honors
area teacher

WNET/THIRTEEN's
annual "Utilization of Tele-
vision in Educat ion
Award," presented to teach-
ers in the tri-state area for
effective and imaginative
use of television in the
classroom, was given to
Rosemary Steinbaum of
Gill Saint Bernard's School
in ceremonies at THIR-
TEEN's New York Broad-
cast Center on June 8.

To qualify for the award,
teachers arc nominated by
their colleagues for creative
activities pursued by their
students as a result of ex-
posure to televised educ-
ational programs.

Mr. Connington
Herbert J. Connington,

who had resided in Hillside
longer than any other resi-
dent, died last week.

Eighty-six years of age,
Mr. Connington was born
in Elizabeth and had moved
to Hillside in infancy,
before the township had
been incorporated, when
the area was called Lyon's
Farms and had been an
agricultural area.

He had worked for many
years in the construction
business, had become a car-
penter and then a construc-
tion executive.

Prior to World War II he
had built houses and after
the war he had gone into
bridge construction. He had
worked on many of the
Garden State Parkway and
New Jersey Turnpike brid-
ges, principally as an ex-
ecutive for J. F. Chapman
and Son of Hillside.

During his entire con-
struction career, Mr. Con-
nington had maintained his
membership in Local No.
155 of the United Broth-
erhood of Carpenters and
Joiners.

He had also belonged to
Post' No. 681 of the Vet-
erans of Foreign Wars of
Rahway, the American
Assn. of Retired Persons
and the Company "A"
104th Engineers Assn. for
the 29th Division in World
War I.

He had served in Com-
pany "A" of the 104th
Engineers from 1917 to
1919 and he had partici-
pated in the defense of the
Haute Alsace, the Mcuse
Argonne campaign and the
actions about Verdun.

He was discharged as a
first sergeant, and was
awarded the Victory Medal
and other First World War
decorations.

In 1963 he was awarded
a certif icate by the
township of Hillside for his
residency of more than 50
years.

• Mr. Connington is sur-
vived by his widow, the
former Miss Mildred De-
wey, and two sons, Herbert
James, Jr. and Richard
Dewey Connington. He has
four grandchildren.

vich; two daughters, Mrs.
Joseph Elaine Grygotis Jr.
of Redlands,Calif, and Mrs.
Eric Joyce Ann Siegal of
Colonia; a brother, Peter of
Rahway and four grandchil-
dren.

Projects are evaluated on
applicability to the class
curriculum, adaptability to
other classrooms and ability
to challenge students to cri-
tically analyze television
programs.

Since the award's incep-
tion three years ago, pro-
jects have included video or
dramatic presentations, re-
search or fund-raising pro-
jects and museum and art
gallery lours.

To gain insight into how
the first amendment opera-
tes and what the press
thinks of itself, the award
winner's class viewed "The
Constitution: The Media
and The Law."

The annual award pre-
sentations provide an op-
portunity for teachers to ex-
change ideas about how
best to incorporate tele-
vision into the learning ex-
perience, reports a station
spokesman.

. « . » . - . » • - •

ONE OF THE ORIGINALS - President, Marie Munnger, of Rahway Unit No. 5 of the
American Legion Auxiliary, left, presents Mrs Marion Hoeft with the American Legion
Auxiliary Gold Membership Achievement Medal, at Ihe post and unit's installation of of-
ficers, held at the post home recently. Unit No. 5 was organized in 1 926, and has two
charter members left, Mrs. Hoeft being the last active charter member. She has served
the unit in many ways, such as unit president for three years in a row, 1932, 1 933 and
1 934; unit secretary, treasurer, historian, Chaplain, and for 1 5 years as the member-
ship chairwoman, retiring from that position last year. She is still the active music chair-
woman and the constitution-by-laws chairwoman for the unit and a life member. Not on-
ly has Mrs. Hoeft served her unit all through the years, but she also served the county
American Legion Auxiliary. She was the county president from 1 940 to 1 941, and she
is still playing the piano for the county conventions.

City Federal merger
adds $5.5 billion

A spokesman for the City
Federal Savings and Loan
Assn. said the association's
merger with the Home Fed-
eral Savings and Loan of
Palm Beach, approved by
the Federal Home Loan
Bank Board, will boost its
assets to more than S5.5
billion and more than dou-
ble the availability of its
multiple services to con-
sumers and business in
Florida.

City Federal now has a
total of 37 offices in South

'Music Man'
to open

in Linden
Meredith Wilson's "The

Music Man" will be present-
ed by the Linden Summer
Playhouse on Thursday,
Friday and Saturday, July
28, 29 and 30, at the Linden
High School auditorium on
St. George Ave., Linden.

The playhouse is in oper-
ation due to the generosity
of the Linden Board of Ed-
ucation, area-wide business-
es and industry and the gen-
eral public, reports a spo-
kesman.

The production will be
directed by Tom Pedas.

Assisting Mr. Pedas arc
Jack Byrne, the technical
director, and Cheri Gonor,
the choreographer.

For further information
please telephone 925-9068
or 486-3852. Curtain time is
8:15 p.m.

Pvt. Ritchie
completes basic

A Rahway resident, Ar-
my Pvt. Linda L. Ritchie,
the daughter of Mr. and
Mrs. Thomas A. Ritchie of
2324 Ward Dr., completed
basic training at Fort Me-
Clellan in Alabama.

The private is a 1982
graduate of Woodbridge
High School.

Florida, adding 20 to the 17
it has been operating since
its late 1981 merger with
the Boca Raton Federal. It
now operates 118 full-ser-
vice branch offices in New
Jersey and Florida and 112
mortgage and consumer-
lending subsidiary offices in
20 states nationwide, in-
cluding a branch office in
Rahway.

"To many banking cus-
tomers in South Florida,
this merger means the in-
troduction of an entirely
new spectrum of financial

services," noted City Fed-
eral chairman and chief ex
ecutive officer, Gilbert G.
Roessner. "It also means
Ihcse services will be
available with a very high
convenience factor."

One of the 50 largest
diversified financial service
companies. City Federal of-
fers a broad range of ser-
vices to both consumers and
business: High-yielding sav-
ings and checking plans,
money management accou-
nts, consumer loans, "City
Affordable" mortgages, real
estate development, pension
management, appraisals, a
full range of personal in-
surance plans and a cor-
porate relocation service
which includes home pur-
chases, property manage-

ment and transportation
service crosscountry, accor-
ding to Mr. Roessner.

With the merger City Fe-
deral will move into- Flo-
rida's Hrevard, Martin, In-
dian River and St. I.ucie
Counties, in addition to
Broward and Palm Beach
Counties.

Its new branches are
located in: Boca Raton.
Boynton Beach. Century
Village, Deerl'ickl Beach.
Forest Hill West. Jog Road,
Jupiier/Tequesia. Lake
Worth, Palm liay. Palm
Beach, Palm Beach Mall,
Palm Coast Pla/a, Palm
Springs, Palm Beach (iar
dens. Port St. I.ucie, San
dalfoot Cove, South Dixie.
Stuart, Vero Beach ami
Vero Beach Mall.

I
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Colonia
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Getaway weekends offer NJ panorama
1 he drive home seems to

"ci lunger ever> night, and

\ 'ui've iripped over the toys

in (he den for the umpteen-
r!i lime.

Ii's time to get away for

the weekend to let someone

eKe make the beds and

'A.ish the dishes. Hotels in

e \ m region of New Jersey

!i;ive getaway plans to make

\>u forget your troubles as

vim drift in a healed indoor

; uiii. and forget the prcs-

, >ures \mi left behind as

..whirlpools loosen knotted

neck muscles.

" I f vou want to gel away

from ii all. then look to

.New Jersey." said Vietoria

I). Schmidt, ihe director of

•jiie New Jersey Division of

'. Travel and Tourism. "New

.Jersey hotels offer a variety

• of inexpensive plans that

• nllow you to_enjoy yourself

'In the pleasant surround-

ings of our state."

For those who want a

quiet weekend in a seashore

community, the country

, inns of Cape May offer the

peace and solitude of the

.••southern shore at reason-

•able rales. Crackling fires

.ajicl quiet libraries can be

\ours along with breakfast

in the morning within an af-

"furdable $70 to SI50 per-

weekend price. Larger ho-

.-icK offer the use of swimm-

'ii)g pools and sauna as part

of their special weekend

packages.

A little farther north, and

a little less relaxing. A l -

lantic City offers excite-

ment all year round with

big name entertainers and

the thrill of casino gamb-

ling.

Most casino hotels offer

special discount packages

for one or two-night stays

during the week. Two ho-

tels, however, offer week

end getaway packages that

range from S90 to SI 10 per

person per nigh I. The

packages include meals or

coupons good lor meals,

baggage handling and park

ing.

Mid-week specials from

Sunday to Thursday in At-

lantic City offer a variety of

meals, entertainment oppor-

tunities and visits to hotel

health clubs. They range in

price fom SI 35 to S2I5 per

couple for u two-night slay.

The shore is the perfect

place to get away from it all

and after a brisk walk on

the boardwalk, you can re-

turn to a candlelight dinner

and a bottle of wine.

You can take advantage

of the beach and the coun-

try setting of Monmouih

County in a hotel in Free

hold, which offers a "Coun-

try Overnight" plan for S37

per person per day. The

plan includes a 15"!) dis-

count on meals, two free

cocktails and a country

breakfast.

Or, you can have an

"Overnight Fl ing" at a hotel

in Toms River. The plan

provides a dinner for two, a

cocktail and breakfast or

brunch al a cost of S95 per

couple per night.

A Cherry Hi l l inn offers

three package plans for

visitors who want to make

i use of the proximity of Phil-

adelphia and Atlantic City

j or simply warn to enjoy a

; quiet weekend alone.

j The showtime package at

the inn includes two nights'

lodging, two meals and tic-

kets and transportation to

the Riverfront Theatre in

Philadelphia, at a cost of

SI39 per person.

The inn's casino weekend

offers the same accom-

modations and meals with a

trip to Atlantic City. That

plan costs SI64 per person

for a two-night slay, but

S25 is refunded after the

j trip to the casinos.

For those who want a

quiet weekend to explore

the Delaware River region,

the hotel offers a getaway

package that includes lodg-

ings, cocktails, breakfast

and a copy of The New

York Times.

If the excitement of har-

ness racing or professional

sports is what you want

when you gel away, the

hotels near the Meadow-

lands Sports Complex have

a plan for you.

One in Hasbrouck Hei-

ghts offers a getaway plan

that includes dinner for

two, champagne and passes

to the nearby Meadowiands

Raceway, at a cost of

S99.90 per night.

Another hotel, close to

the raceway and the Mea-

dowiands Arena, has a rain-

bow weekend plan that pro-

vides a couple with a wine

and cheese box, breakfast

and Sunday brunch. The

price is SI57 per couple for

two days.

Three hotels nlong the

Garden State Parkway at

Rte. No. 80 offer weekend

plans and a chance to take

advantage of the historic

sites and shopping centers

of north Jersey.

One, in Saddle Brook, has

a two-night getaway plan

that includes Saturday and

Sunday breakfast, a prime

rib dinner and use of the

pool, plus use of a nearby

health spa for a small add-

itional cost. The plan costs

S89.95 per couple for two

nights.

A nearby inn offers a

special weekend rate of S42

per couple per night that in-

cludes breakfast.

And, you can while away

the afternoon at poolside at

another hotel in Saddle

Brook and enjoy a relaxing

Sunday brunch for S109 per

couple.

The northwestern sky-

lands of New Jersey are at

their best in winter when

the weather--or snowmak-

ing machines--coat the

slopes of mountains with a

white blanket.

A resort in McAfee offers

a package for skiers of all

levels.

For a beginner, the first

night costs S98 per couple

and includes lessons, equip-

ment rental and a limited

lift ticket. A second night

costs S40 per couple.

A hotel in Parsippany-

Troy Hills and one in Con-

vent Station boih offer

weekend packages for

guests who want to explore

the historic sites of Mor-

ristown and Morris County

or simply get away from it

all.

The rainbow weekend in

Parsippany includes wine

and cheese, use of the

hotel's facilities and the

chance to enjoy a gourmet

restaurant at a cost of SI06

per couple.

Couples arriving al the

Madison hotel can enjoy a

champagne toast, a contin-

ental breakfast on Saturday

and a Sunday brunch, all

for SI 10 a couple for two

nights.

For more information on

getaway weekends and

other winter activities in

New Jersey, coniaei the

New Jersey Division of

Travel and Tourism, C N

Workshop
to boost

S. A. T. scores
A "High Scores Scho-

lastic Aptitude Test and

Preliminary Scholastic Ap-

titude Test Workshop" will

be offered by the Fanwood-

Scotch Plains Young Men's

Christian Assn. on Mon-

days, Aug. 1 and 8, and

Wednesdays, Aug. 3 and

10, to prepare students for

the fall semester tests. The

workshop will meet from 7

to 9 p.m. at the Grand St.

facility in Scotch Plains.

The workshop will re-

view key concepts in the

mathematics and verbal

areas and emphasize under-

standing of the types of

questions asked on the test.

Also featured will be test

taking, timing and con-

fidence building strategics.

"High Scores" S.A.T.

workshops have been con-

ducted at Rutgers Universi-

ty, Northwestern Michigan

College and colleges and

community centers throu-

ghout New Jersey, reports a

spokesman.

For a registration flyer,

please telephone the " Y " at

322-7600.

"Human felicity is produced not so much by great pieces of good fortune that seldom
happen, as by little advantages that occur every day." Benjamin Franklin

Some used to consider it bad
luck for women to look at
trumpets.

384, Trenton. N. J. 08625

or telephone number (609)

292-2470.

BUSINESS ENVELOPES
CUSTOM PRINTED

Top quality 24 Lb. White Wove Envelopes printed
with your firm name and address in black ink.

FAST SERVICE - TRY US

Quantity

500
1,000
2,000
3,000
4,000
5,000

No 10 Reg
Block ink

22.00
35.50
62.50
87.00
111.50
136.00

No 10 Reg.
Plus 1 color

40.50
58.50
103.50
140.50
177.50
214.50

No. 10 window
Black ink

23.00
37.50
66.50
93.00
119.50
146.50

No. 10 window
Plus 1 color

41.50
60.50

107.50
146.50
185.50
225.00

All price-
plus ti)X

500
1,000
2,000
3,000
4,000
5,000

No 6 -'.'» Reg
Block ink

21.50
34.50
60.50
84.00
107.50
131.00

No 63/« Reg
Plus 1 color

40.00
57.50
101.50
137.50
173.50
209.50

No,63/« Win.
Block ink

22.50
36.50
64.50
90.00
115.50
141.00

No 6% Win.
Plus 1 color

41.00
59.50

105.50
143.50
181.50
219.50

THE
ATOM TABLOID

219 Central Ave.,
Rahway, N.J. 07065

574-1200

CALL
get the job d o n e 574-1200

CLASSIFIED ADS APPEAR THREE TIMES-
WEDNESDAY, THURSDAY & SATURDAY

WE WILL ACCEPT
YOUR VISA OR
MASTERCHARGE

master charge
1 FHf INUftlAMK C*»0

GUARANTEED
READER

TO
READER
ADS

3i3l$5
Wed., Thurs., Sat.

The Atom Tabloid :

Rahway News Record/Clark Patriot
The Atom Tabloid Weekend Magazine
CALL WHEN ALL ITEMS ARE SOLD

USED CARS & TRUCKS

CHF.CK OUR RATES-AS LOW AS 20
PtRCENF DOWN QUOTES GIVEN 9
a m 9_p m • 494-8999

IS ITTRUEYOU CAN BUY JEEPS FOR
$44. THROUGH THE U S GOVERN-
MENT 'GET THE FACTS TODAY!CALL
( 3 1 2 ) 7 4 2 - 1 1 4 2 . EXT. 6 3 2 2

Guaranteed Reader lo Reader want ads are

lor non-commercial advertisers only. Hems for

sale must not exceed SI,000. Price and

phone number must be in ad. Aulos. real

estate, garage sale & babysitting not ac-

cepted in Guaranteed Reader lo Reader Sec-

tion.

NO PHONE ORDERS ACCEPTED. ADS MUST BE MAILED
IN OR BROUGHT TO THE OFFICE.

ALLCITY
AUTO

INSURANCE
Lowest rafos available*,
Small down paymont. Im-

modioto covorago.

574-1622
9.9

MISC. FOR SALE

MOVING -Col dinette. Custom
liv.rm., Sola & Chrs. Drapes. Master
Bedim. , MUCH MORE1 Also,
Wheelchr. commode, grab bars. All
excel, cond Make Oiler Call al l
5_30Xla^j___ _ 381-2528

T.V. Test Gear, large supply ol tubes,
etc Rjtit inslrom service work Best

"Offer_ 381-5942
Time Share Vacation lor sale. Vaca-

I lion anywhere in U.S. A Abroad
Very reasonable

For all details Call Alter 6 00 p m
„ 862-3657

Dming rm 6 chrs. China Bulfet
5600 Kilch Set4chis.Gray.J75,
LivRm Set-Make Offer- 381-5226

FURNITURE FOR SALE

Living Room, French Pioi.. 4 pes
plastic covers. 1 coffee tb l . 2 end
Ibis. Like New. 388-9304

Living Rm Set, sofa A love seat,
S450 3 pc.wafl unit. J95O. end tb l ,
$100. coflee tbl.. 5100. STIFFEL
lamp. 5100 WATERFORD ALANA
water goblet. S25 75O-1JI53

BOATSFOR
COBIA -24' Frying Bridge. All
fiberglass, twin I/O. 120 HP Eng.
All Equipped lie. Cond. PRICED TO
eUY'Call 388-2147

PETS

DO« TRAINING
Monocrtil Dog Training School
will t>* Darting New B*glnn«r
Clanat . Thuri Jury 28

V.F.W. HALL
6 Broadway. Clerk

Alto, Advanced Ob«dl»nc»
Protected Training

233-5584

FLEA MARKET

- • READER TO READER

18000 B T U 5170.
r wh| J300 ApL gas

6 3A!!3Z

A.C--l
'in/;!

A/C'/WO B1U h t cond Almost
'!<•«• 1100 Mini Sec1 Priced lor
'JuifV Sale Firm 636-27U

A.C. 11.000 BIU.J200 Propano
Link: 20 lb w/regjhose. $25
MpC t̂ Uh,indefier J85 _ 486-2986
A.£• 'Gf 11.400 BTU $375~map7e
;»b. fled Frame. J45 Aller 7 pm

382-4676

ATARI 800-100 computer names
'..i'tri:)j»sJ?Oej cnll jlter 6 pm

499-0824

BUMPER POOLTBL."NO or B/0 7
S J-Vntemp Cuuch S100 or BO
v-iyGd Ccnd 382-6030
DR.SEThg :J 6pc ?nlTt)l7?7mpT
S ' v f i l Set !DI < 4 chr 5150
•••II/Wi 382-0948 or 3827744

CARSEAT SI 5 Valern cloth s: M
' ! -.-• t'3!n cloth •.;0-I8mo SI
• •••thyhf. 541-9388

HEADER TO READER

DESK Qn Anne $45 Sola 535
Gauge dr. $35 Leather chr $15
Rug$10 _ _ 388-7736

DINETTE Oak Formica. 6 high bacfc
Chans. Oval table, eic condition
$250. 283-1280

FIREWOOD Seasoned 0a k $40 Call
After 5 30

388-9479
HONDA '78 Mtrcyc 400CC Auto
mag wheels backpost. peif cond
6.000mi,EXTRAS'5800 388-0584
UV.RM. Set 6 pieces contem Zyis
old peif cond 5495 or best oiler

382-6120
LOVE SEAT 4 Chair. Colonial. Biowii
&White.$95 gld dbl drapes lined
$15_ 541-5895

HOPED '81 Peugeot undei 1000
miles perfect condition $399.

sT )„ Gold Sculptured
' K i j - F.rt-I ,:ond 5500 Callatt 5
i> -"•• W 1 6 5 4

CHRS. UaMiJ60 D'ess(2)J60ea"
iVCe: S Cstrj $495 Walnul J
r u i_i.tlressJ250 Alt 4 634-5903

COUCH oh- dr.
; , ;:.K!d'-i V
.'•: 55'J.M

< '; ni-utrdl eclcr.
'cur.jasslo.e

382-2171

USED CARS 4 TRUCKS |

y . H «,]( ' h i l l A f . A M - F f i ' i

. •!•• t > , ' • ! T . n c $ 4 8 0 3 i

381-6050 •
'h I"*3N- • (,trj,!.i IH-IUI'; Auto

' ' ? ) « • « i;'iMtB-.(.it$2,'0O
- •:• 754-0055 i
•" i " ( " ' ' . ' t t n ' ' p e l .'u'cH.'iA C Good

•;• • :•• n'.- • OO'J mi1'.-' After 5 p m .'

574-2202 !

' ; pMi1:a; Suntind Aulo a c 4 n e * ;

'•.•"•.1
J0.O0Limiie:51995 750-3554 j

o f'li.-fi V:^,-e:>'.onv 4bpde ipen i

• •• .'"' i-o v . t e n : i l l cond B ' 0

388-9338 j
' ;G Pontuc Grand Pru Bucket |
*>iSConsolep/s p/b a/c am/lm I
SU:rro$2750 548-8828 j

r f , 'J'ev* Nyvi) j ' C p s amradio j
'• ".:••• tinted glass 70 000 mi
S - V J 382-0126"
"f": i i fOt j Corolla 5 :pd 2 dr I

•T: '•::; radn Good ball 99 000
r - SHOO Call aft 5 pm

y_
.'5 firebird, 6 C)l . a u t o 6 4 0 0 0 m i

•••,Mv:$2595 541-4098 I

MOPED '82 5-Star General Black
w/WhL oms&ipinj Many eifraj
Helmetinc.»25/B0Cill63t-»31
MOPED Ysmafia Chapp,. 1800 mi"
eic cond call after S p m •

5484432
OUTBOARD 10 HP iohn'on wild
tank Very good cond SIOU

634-5512
POOL 4 i lS all ace me $400 Soil
57b TtjkS40e,i 7 pee bd im set
5300 Bab/items J8ca 381-2695
POOL sand (liter J coleco pump"
545 liner 24M rnd 530 .icce^i'
a[ter6_00 499-9565

POOL- 18' e ict l cond New Co»er
and All accessories $4 50 Call after
5 pm 3J8-8O78

USED CARS & TRUCKS

75 Ford LID A'C. AM fV In
cond Ked Call All 6 pm

283-2923

75 Monte Carlo, new brakes new
Ir.ins very clean Chrome whech
tilt «heel P.'S I"B. runs eic
$1700 or B.'O Call bet*n 5 t, 7pm

382-3889
74 Ncnra 2 doois good cond 69000
miles ashing S1400 or best oiler

283j3879or 278-6300
73 Safari Station Wajjon good rub
ber needsworK$300 969-3130

73 ford Gran torino $300 or best
oiler Call before 3 00 Ask lor Scott

3821794
73 Chev, Step Van 350 motor. 8
C(l. Good Condition 1 Owner asking
54000 Callatler6pm 862-3351
12 Mercury Monlejo. A'C. pur

locks/windows. AM/TM 8 track
69.500 Needs work $700 Call

634-5616

7?PI>moulh Duster. 62.000 m i . 3
spd 6 cyl. 1-owner snows Asking
$850 382-2774

READER TO READER

POOL 18' Rd i48 'H All alum
H.iy*ard pcilli-i lilt ni'w Ijddei.
auto wallskmimer 5300 3S1-2484
REFRIG. good norkinj; condition
$75 or bestol lc ic i l l

3819194
SEIYMACR Sears /ig .'a,: ocellant
condition $150

283-2708

SOFA 1929 CjmelbackantiqiicAsk-
ing $400 Good Condition

Cjll634-8023or727-1665
SOFA $150 B 0 Wing Chi . $125
B 0, Wd I rim Rerun StyW.ilrmt
CaivedCof Tbl $110 548-8731
TABLE fil.iss S Chtomf »,4 beaut
ch.iirs like ni'w $450 or Hesl Oiler
Call 7501328

TBL. Cockuil Dnllwu)d rustom
matle 5 kidnev sh.ipcd glass
br-.TiifrfuiSi 75 548-6504

TBLCockMil (Iriltwn).! 5'high .it
tached l.impBeaulilul SI75

54S-6504
TRUMPnBundy$75 Drapes. $10
Airline Pet Carrier (med ) 5?5 Col
oiedChandelier$25 382-5966

TV M u t h .'J1 Consoli1 I: w. 560
CnlorsDort [Ifctinmc I ̂  llarm-
$10 Hairdner $7 541-9388

WASHER f. relng apt s w 5150
t'acheu' cui'di|i(in

499-7979

WED.COWNwithTi.iin MjtwithVi'il
« Slip $225

486-2499

USED CARS & TRUCKS

'72 Datsun 510 W.ig 4 spd . needs
Mk'njls good trans $500 f irm Call
f.es 381-4167

70 Monte Carlo 8 ci l an A lot ol
up* parts $J95 Call.Wr 4634-5903
69 Charger V8 auto p s a c
bucketsejts 9? (100 mi $800 C.ill
alt 5pm 925-6706
69 PlymouthVjl iai i i .6ryl. 7 j 000

mi, good cond. $450 Coll all 6
388-1150

68 Chevy Nova $.100 388-1412
'68 Dodge Van. 6 cyl 80 000 miles
runsgood $801) 574-3338

Lincoln Continentals (2' 4 dr
Sedans both loaded. 1977 54000.
1979 57500 388-2587

Truck Camper sleeps 6 call Friday
Sat. or Sunday J»J-« 126 Van or
Camper Air Conditioner used 2 mu
Phoenix Brokerage famous for low
costauto&cycleinsurance Bigsav
ings for truckers contiaclors store
keepers Compare free qunte by
phone Iselin 21} -1440 . Toll li»e
8 0 0 - 6 6 2 - 3 0 4 8 t i l l 8 p m

MOTORCYCLES ~ "
'80 Yamaha 400 SX Special. 2
helmets sissy bar. crash bai 2404
miles Muslsell.51250 388-342_7
76 Harley 1000 cc I-owner, lots ol
chrome Muslsei'1 _ _ 38_1^669
75 Suzuki RM 125 Runs good.
Depi-ndabl- $300 f irm Callbelore
noon I8Ll°.y

81 HarleyO.wdsonSportsler2.800
miles iicellent condition $3200
Call 251^781^7
81 Black hawasaki. wind visei.
brand new helmet. Mintcond Must
Sec1 $1500 Call 382-9774

78 CB400CC Honda Hawk. 3.500
mi good Cond . $850 w B 0 call
bt'lwn9«6 382-2939
" /8 Hond.i 5D0 1 Good parts Bike
.iOOmi nnmotor B.'O C.ill&askfor
Vic 388-8217

CLOSE OUT SALE

AT WAREHOUSE
M,,,' S..II I,,.,, „

INTEREST RATES
AS LOW AS 12%

Contact Frank

636-7772

MATTRESSES
Motol'Hotol Quality

Full SUM
Q. . .n OIJO
Sold >n S«n

H»odboaid» dr«n«

S49 nd u

. Fii. Stt
I2SPJI

SU > n Iruiwkk An
Firfc, 0(ut ti (kMltri

Z
Typewriter-; New S Used Sales.
Hi 'pjus Hf/sl.jh low Rates

38M454
CLASTIC SI i(" COVERS"

Cuslom made pm fitted Expertly
cut in your home Any sola A 2
chjus ,v j pr sectional $150
NVfi!l,-ciall ,865-6300
(ngiiletto Irurkmg Fill. lop Soil A
StoiieC.ill.iltei5pm 388J75O
VLT> old single poster bed $5(J
firown French Crov couch $150
Veiy old Dininj; Rm Bullet $100
L.illlordjjpt 574-1579
Pecan cnNir armorre good condi-
tion 550 or b o call anytime

3819M4
Rcfrigi'Mtoii Washers Dryers.Color
TV's good cond Will guarantee

754-7209oir 756-1433
MOCfn" "!979"M"olobeca"ne 50V
Votjylette Under 2000 mi $400

CARPETING
LinaJium & Tilt
Thr.ltr p*«ft1» don i par lot high
o*«rh*ad With Monuloc'u'i' »
CUA*ANT([ - • . .N t , n . i . | |
ONIY FlftlT QUAUTV carpaling

WOVEN WOOD SHADES
LEVOLOR &
VBtTKAL BIMDS

at 20% OFF
NOT INflAHO (.($! PRtCf

SHOP AT HOME SEB7ICE
Don t b« (oaltd by f)mlt«r odt

tOU KNOW US FOR 24 YEARS
DON 1. YOU'

OUR PRICES CANT K BEAT
H«rlm«rth Carpatlnf

Isolin 634-2417

HOMES FOR SALE
flAHWAr Sn im colonial, enclosed
poich. Ih balhs. basement attic.
«as - l ical . -AC. W/W carpetmj.•
Detached gaoge. Merck Area

M8-4377

FOR SflLE OR RENT

Notice to prospective renteis Any
rents advertised herein foi qualified
teal rental may be subject to any
rebate or credit required by State
law(N J S54:4 6 3ctseq,) tl

Yearly Parking Rental Available. 2J 9
Central Ave , Rahway $15 p/space
monthly 574-15759-Sonly.

Wheelchair-$25/month Call
574-1577

1 Bedroom Available Imed . Call for
information^ 634-4386

APT. WANTED

Mature European Speaking woman
seeks moderate rent 1 bedroom
apartment or efficiency in Linden
area. Impeccable references

968-7060

MORTGAGE
No money down. Rank repossessed
lot. Take ovei payments. Private lake
community Pa Pocono Mts Call
Mr. Rue eves 1-800-233-8160

AMERICAN MORTGAGE
HOME OWHEBS LOANS
i o ' Ony wo r fKtvJ/ i• 1 *̂ p y / p o i O ^ n '
Hointi Impiovnuicp' loon* Qili

pfoval Ofol ijirt" • law RQ'UI
Wo laro out p.-( pie w.ll vurk

Woodbridg* N.J.

750-2770
800-272-1399 loll Free

MISC. EVENTS
CHRISTMAS IN JULY, 24 A 25 Hand-
made Gifts - 11 am. • 4 p m . 68
Homes, Palk Ave. Iselin, N.I

j
Clean Guaianlecd-Big Selection

; REFRIGERATORS
! Speciali/mg in Frost Free Sales
, SServio' Mr Cool 225-5272
1 Wtoilen Kitchen Nook. Bench A 3

Cria-rs. Gold Check EicellentCond•
lion 5150 549-1358

: HONDA'.'6 Dirt fJrkeCR 125 Runs
giiMt $300 Cj l la l l 6 pm

; A}
{ POOL Above ground with deck ac
| cessones included. Best Offer

969-3370
Radul 10 ' Seais. Arm Saw Legs &
extras Excel cond. $300. Air
Cond . 15.000 BTU. 220». Bradford
Eic cond. $150. Dining Rm , 6
chrs. Tbl A Hutch. $225, Stereo
Phono floor model. AM/FM. $50.
Octagon tbl w'dooi. $40 Call

188-7516
Sectional Couch, $400 . 2 Tbls.
$75 e.i. Oval kitch tbl A 6 chrs
125 Chest frceier. $125 3-pc
Maple den sel A coffee Ibl $150
Call after 5 634-0762

COUNTRY CRAFT BOUTIQUE
July 10 - July 23

Opon : Sundays 11-4
Daily 9:30 • 5;3O
CANDLEWYCK

85 £ Ch.icy Si
Rahwo, N I

381-7717

IHE CLARK ALLIANCE CHURCH

Denman Ave.

School Com* hova fun 4 l«am
about J*%<J*

July 25-298:45-12:00

388-1272

ATTENTION:
ALL ORGANIZATIONS!
Earn up to J1000 or more

Sponsoring a Circus

CALL 686-3729

VACATION RENTALS
POCONOS A-Fiame Aug. 20-27.
Close to lake at State Park Suitable
for small family $150. Call aft 11
am 925-2174

PETS
Old English Sheepdog. FREE to good
home. 8 yrs old Call eves.

7509173

FURNITURE FDR SALE
BEDROOM 5 PC LIVING ROOM,
BOTH ARE NEW-J295

CAU73MS4O

WAGGIN WHEELS
GROOM MOBILE

PROFESSIONAL

CROONING

GRAND OPENING

CELEBRATION
FREE

Flea Shampoo

w/Grooming

Call Deborah

826-5537

flea Market eiery Tuesday. New
Dover United Methodist Church.
690 New Dover Rd , Edison. 6am-
2pm DealcisS6,?8,S9. 381-9478

VILLAGE COMMON
FLEAMARKET* SHOPS

ODcn Wed.,Sat Sun-Ant tqoesr
Crafts. Produce, Plants. Furniture
Re finish i ng. Clothing
1490 RahwayAve . Ayenel W4-8599

GARAGFSALE _ _
CARTERET81 Daniel S t . t n l Sat
July 22 4 23. 9 til 3. EVERYTHING
PRICED TO SEJLL'
CARTERET 11 Gmda Avenue" (off
Poplar) (Shorecrest) Lawn Mowers,
bikes, hoses, lanterns trams 7/23
9 • 4 _

COLONIA 80 Lancaster Rd , Tilly 22
4 23. 9-). Summer clothing. HH
i tems & M i s c

COLONIA39MorninEside Road July
22. 10-4 Clothes Household Items,
Mr>£^__R_aKi Date 7 / 2 3
COLONIA352CofonTafivd .July20,
21.423.9-3 Organ. Bike, Curtains.
Toys. Gaj GnJJ

COLONIA 44 Patricia Ave. Tnes 4
Wed. July 26 4 27. l l - 4 . R n d t
7/28 A 29 SOMETHING FOR
E_V_E_R Y 0_NJ_ '
C010NIA "302 Cypress Dr' Fn S
Sal. 7/22 S 7/23. IOam-4pm
Clothes bedsprds. drapes. 4 misc
HH i tems
EDISON 5 FAMILY BIOCK'SALE - FoT
Hill Rd toff Wood 4 Livingston A»e)
Toys, Bikes Clothing Sport Pquip .
HHitems lUU2l.22.Z3.-9-3ym
FORDS 90 Buinham Dr (off Ford
Ave) July 19 4 20. 10-5 Lots ol
Goodies ANYTHING 4
E V E R Y T H I N_GJ

ISELIN 39 Wilson Ave (nearCorreia)
Fn Sal Sun. July 22 23,424.9-4
T_HjUE FAMILIES 1

ISELIN 104 Pine si". Sat July 23.
9J_^-Fami[res ^Rainjn.. July_24

LINDEN 120 Bradford Ave. July 23.
24.4 25,9-5. Eum. Clothes. Lamps.
Brie Brae HH items. Appliances,
Books. Toys, etc. CashOnly NO EAR-
LY BIRDS!

MENLO PARK TERRACE 131
McGuireSt. July20-21.10am-2pm
Dining Rm. 4 6 Chans, Kitchen Set
CoachCairiage. Chilfaiobe LOTS OF
ODDS 4 EN£S_

RAHWAY 1130 Plymouth Dr Iuly22
& 23. Child's cloth, inf-sz 8. adult
cloth . varied sizes. HH items, tape
deck, speakers, etc SOMETHING
FOR LV-I?2P_flL'
RAHWAY114JonesPI.Juiy23.9 4
(olf Elizabeth Ave) Small appli.
tapestries, campei. lecords 4 misc
RAHWAY 20 !2TnceSi (otfW Scott
Ave ) July 23. 9 5 Baby equip (ex-
eel cond ) Misc i t ems
RAHWAY534 WestInmanAve .Sun"
July 24-Yard Sale Moving to Arkan
s as J

RAHWAY 254 Rudolph Ave . July 22
i 23. 10-4. Clothes, child's items.

port t.v 4 misc

GARAGE SALE

Call me before garage sale or mov-
ing Old 4 collectible items also
wanted. Fan prices paid

634-7742

HELP WANTED

SUNDAYS 6-9 a m. Newspaper ear-
ners w/car. $20-530 per day ' 2 5 1
bonus. No collecting. __233-03_10
Start an exciting career in Advertis-
ing. Our rapidly expanding
newspapers have sales positions in
oui Advertising DepL Applicants
must be: Responsible, have owncar,
must be 18 yrs or older F/T posi-
tions Call 574-1578 foi appoint-
ment or apply in person at 219 Cerv
tral Ave, Rahway. Mon-Thms 9• 5
TRAINEES. Jo in a progressive sales
organization We will train you Cara
must Call lor interview between 9

HELP WANTED

Hairdressers, share the adventure
Modern, prestige shop in Clark.
Money no obiect lor person with
following. Call Rich at 381-7929

$100 per week. Part-time at home
No experience necessary

Cill805-687-6000EiU-2105

$100 Pei Week Part Time at Home
Wetottf. - America's fjvoiite die-'
tionary company needs home
workers to update local mailmglists
Easy Work Can be done while wat-
ching TV All ages experience un
necessary Call 1-716-842-6000

Eit8178

TELEPHONE SOLICITOR"
EXPERIENCED Speak1 Speak'
Speak1 Money! Money! Money1 In-
telligent, mature minded individual
with incentive to earn money work-
ing pan time, earning full time pay
Salary plus commission Call Jolene

574-8535

HOUSEKEEPER 3 days/week. Must
have references. Pleas call 9-5, Ask
forPhyllisorEileen 324-1200
HOUSEKEEPER Clark Area lull
lime, live-m Duties mcl light
housekeeping, cooking 4 shopping
for single person. Master-sue fur-
nished bedioom provided Must
haveieferences Carpieferable Pis
callbtwn 9412 or 447 only

SECURITY GUARDS

Guardsmark has on im-
modiato full fimo and
part f imo posi t ions

available? in tho;
Hobokan
Clifton

Oakland
aroos. Must havo own
phono, own car, and no
polico record. Apply in
porson at:

1455 Broad St.
Bloomfield, N.J.

or call

338-5511
for on appointmont. .

SWITCHBOARD
OTfRATOR

EXPERIENCE PREFERRED.
BUT WILL TRAIN THE
RIGHT INDIVIDUAL.

Coll &«r*r««n 1-4 p.m.

273-1114

MORTGAGE
Loading Mortgage Co.
has opening for mor-
tgago closer with FHA,
VA & FNMA oxporionco.
Gonorous company
bonofits. Contact:

Mrs. Siege I

688-3322
LUMBERMAN

MORTGAGE CORP

RAHWAY Multi-Family Gaiage Sale
Hulick Place. 2 Weekends. )uly 22 4
23_i_NIy 29 4 30 9 3
WOODBRIDGE272MjinSt.Thuis.
July 21.10 3pm . Old cuckooclock
Old matchbook coll, paintings,
pipethreader 4 Misc Rndt 7/22

WOODBRIDGE 22 Vanderbill Pis
(olf Ridgedale) July 22. 23. 104
Moving Sale- EVERYTHING MUST
G 0 '

DEMONSTRATORS NEEDED For
Toys/Gifts No investment Fiee
Kit/Training More Information Call

232-7047

CRUISESHIPS.ARE HIRING' $15
$29,500! Cambean. Hawaii. Work)
Call for Guide. Directory, Newslet
ter (9 I6)722- l l l lEnt

Atomtibloid

Real Estate Sales • Full or part time
new real estate ofjice needs sales
associates outstanding opportunity
to jet in on ground floor • attractive
comp. split and allocated floor time.
Inquires held in strict confidence
Rahway Realty 38U455
NURSE-RN-LPN. Part time.. Take
limited medical inform and tests
for insurance purposes in your area
CallMissCetti 664JJ083

SALES ORDER CLERKShould be
phone oriented Ordei handling S
processing, attention todetail Clark
office. EOE M/F Contact-Rick

^ . H ! ?
Haagen Dazs Ice Cream Shop in
WestfiekJ seeking person tobe tra m
ed for management position Day 4
night hrs avail Call for appt

233:8101
SALES PI time, flex hrs No door to
dooi or telephone solid Call 94
C0RS0N4G0LTRY 754j0J2O

LEGAL SECY-Linden La» firm seeks
exp legal sec'ys. Full and/or part
time Salary based on expr Pis call

4SS-94OO

SALES PERSON Peim position
P/T daily. 9 30 130 or 1 30 5 30
Curtain Corner. 1119 W. St Geioge
Ave. Linden 925-6050

Excellent income lor part time home
assembly work For info call

504-6414003 E«t.g|99
MACHINIST-Piecision short run
wort Must bt able to work from
drawings S sketches. Must be a
perfecbonist in use ol machines,
tools £ all measuring instruments
Minimum 2-3 jrj exp. Located in
Rahway. Good benelits. mcl. profit
j t unn j Call btwn 9 £ 4 foi inter
tew 382-11M

Diabetes
"The Effects of

Diabetes on the Eye"
describes and depicts
stages of retinopathy,
how it is treated or
monitored, and in-
cludes advice for the
diabetic about self-help
steps to be taken. The
47-page booklet (54
each) has full-color
prints and a listing of
medical centers offer-
ing expertise in the
treatment of diabetic
retinopathy. and the
slide/cassette version
(57 color slides) further
illustrates this informa-
tion.

Like many diseases,
diabetic retinopathy
caught early has the
best chance of suc-
cessful control. Laser
treatment is proving
an effective tool in

I retarding or stopping
the progress of blood-
vessel damage in the
eye's retina so vision
can be preserved.

j Retinopathy specialists
among ophthalmol-
ogists have recently
been able to place
retina vessel changes
into clear stages, and
to confirm the benefits
of laser treatment.
Now they can offer
definitive guidelines to
other doctors and
health professionals
who provide care or
counsel to diabetics.

To order "The Ef-
fects of Diabetes on
the Eye," specify
booklet (S4) or
slide/cassette, (S60), in-
clude a check or
money order and write
to: National Society to
Prevent Blindness
•New Jersey, 303

HELP WANTED

AVON
ATTENTION!

SICRETARtlS «
«KIPTK)NST$

W« con oHtr you o b«tt*r oppor-
tunity. Com oood tit ond do
iom»thlng drf7»r»nt tvary doy.
S*ll Avon, No «xp*rl«nc« r*>
quired. Coll for mor» Information:

351-3390

CLERICAL
P*nonn*l Offlc*

I M trpinj ikili rttiirid. Hnl b«
vil̂ orĝ nUid nd abk lo kllov ip on
•mi iklili. Driy to«i 8.-00-4-15.
Sjrtijlitk) loulioo. For firfcir nkii-
Mlioo cnlicl:
Chart** Bauman, An ' t .
Sup*r lnl*ndant, Union
County Region H.S.,

'Dlff(I4* ^fciJ* rJbnathon
Dayton Raglon H.S.,

Mountain Av».,
Sprlng(l«ld, N.J. 07081

376-6300

BOOKKEEPER
North Control J*r»«Y iub«idlary

ol multl-maooiln* publishing
company •*•«> Boohk*«p«r to
hondl* all coll*ctlom and (allow-
up of company's account*
ntctlvobl* Including working with
outitd* collection avrvk* and
prsporlng collection reporti. Alto
\nch6t proc*«iW>g of company*
Incoming poymenf*. molntalnlng
coiK rvcelpti |oumal, monthh/
bonk reconciliation* and billing

i

3 years expefienc* needed
with a good knowledge of book-
keeping theory, partkulorty In
the oreo ol occountt r c ^ b l
Accyrate h/plng obiliry ( p ) .
•peed ona occurocy on oddkng
machine calculator, •xcalUnl
Mtephone tktlli and the ability to
compote own correspondence
are wienttal. Cspertence on on«>
write bookkeeping tyitemi a
plui. College credit* In accoun-
ting an o**et.

Good starting salary, excellent
company paid benefit* Including
denial ond convenient location
right ocrovs the *tre«t from Con-
roll and only 2 miles from the NJ
Turnpike and Garden State
Parkway. Pleaw *end retume
and/of letter with salary history
ond requirement* In confidence,
to:

KPT. 3127M
1501 0ro<x*wcy. N.Y.. NY 10036

if! '

SANK

C M M W C M
Irvsff C i w y y
OPEN HOUSE

Exptritnctd
Ttlltrs

Telltr Trimns
a WMk Ink* fntnt)

WE CAN OFFER YOU:
Utkt Saltrits

Bttftr Bmfib And l i t
0»poftwftr lo Mori Up!

W ^ M r 20-6-8:30 ?M.

UU Jvfr 23-9 AJM2 NOOQ
at

Roselle Branch
221 OtsM S*. Ul 3rt An J

U Swrtd

N«
We have full-time ond part-

time posltloW* available to our
UMDCN. RO5SILE and RAHWAY
•ranches. H you or* on ex-
perienced Teller or enfoy work-
Ing with the public, hove figure
aptitude and cashier ex-
perience we would be In-
terested In «*elng you al our
Op*nHous«.

Some of the excellent
benefit* that could be available
to you Inc'ud* a matching thrift
plan, dental and medkol
coverage, ond a 100% tuition
reimbursement program.

If you connot attend ond
would Ifce on interview at
another llm«, plea** call:

CATHY SARDONI
434-5100, X-475

f 0 E

George Street, New
BrunswidkT--^^New
Jersey 08901.

SITUATION WANTED

Eip seamstress available, does ex-
pertise woik on all better ctoNiinf
callafter3pm 969-J466

Housecleming woman seeks work
everyday in different houses, with
references.Callanytime 499-7260

TYPING-Exp. Secretary will type
resumes, term papers, dictaphone
work, Pickup 4 del. avail.

322-8216

BABYSITTING
Elementary School Teacher seeking
part time child care foi 3H yeai okJ
boy. Starting in Sept.

Cal842-S235or338-0SZ2

Reliable babysitter wanted in my
home, Monday-Friday 8am-4pm, in
Coloma.Call 499-5546

BNgfflllNMENT

THrSERENA0£S.-4,po:ljand
Music for All Occasions;

Reasonable -382-3046
3 Piece Band "The Chimes" (or par-
ties. Weddings, all occasions-Music
for all age groups S300/ni£M

634-5239

LOST AND fQUHP

LOST. Male Dog, Brown-Blach/Gray
Nose-Seminary Ave. Area. Ans. to
"Dngum".Call 574-1134or

381-4 2OO.X-2022

PERSONAL

Receive VISA/MCI
Bad credit ok! Guaranteed. Foi fiee
brochure send S.A.S.E.. Capitol
Financial, Box 821428. Dallas, h
75382,callanytime 214-243-6252

Curly or Body Peims, Thai Last. Just
J15. Estelle's Harrstyling 131 Per-
ihingAve.CarteieL 541-6342.

NEW CREDIT CARD! Nobody refus-
ed1 AtsoVisa/Masttrcanj. Call

305^87-6000 Ext C-2105
Waldo The Magic Clown

Live Rabbits and Doves. Free
1 Balloons. For Information

Call Today676-7856
WANTED-Someone to make personal
wedding gown Relerences.'

738-7700

Tfour fantasy in Video • Star in your
own VCR production. Wedding)', pat-
ties oi Ihe ultimate fantasy! Call

353-3028

Going on Vacation?:

Will caie for Pets in your home.
References Call 3 J K 5 2 0

HOROSCOPE - by'
READINGS Mn. Kay.

Reodar 8 Advisor. Card.
Palm, Crystal. Available
for Private Parties 8
Gatherings. ' • ' !

$2 reading w/lh'u ad

•IAJK • H I flrTUTI I H
It IBCUUUT10I

M55ST.GEOHCE AVf.. RAHWAY

574-M93 - • •

MRS. FATIMA
CAN SOLVE A N Y

PROBLEMS. SUCH AS
LOVE. HEALTH,

MARRIAGE. 8 BUSINESS
S 5 " WITH THIS JUJ
17 BRANT AVE.,

CLARK !

574-0649

SINGLES ONLY
Attractive widow, executive
secretary, seeking intelligent per-
sonable gentleman. 55-65. for shar-
ing and canng. Pis. reply • Atom
Tabloid. POBoi 1061 EIB. Rahway.
«.J. ' 07065

PRIVATE INSTRUCTION
Learn popular piano, harmony &
theory. Ed?appula636-27»1 t)
Tutoring by public school teacher.

' Math & Readmg.gndes J-8. Call a f t
4p.m. 2*3-1349

CUITM PIANO 0 K M aUTE i all
other instruments at your home.
Anytime 3H-3US

PIANO All Ages, all levels.
Irene Afsttr, B.Mus.M.Mus. :
Mantiattangrad, 3I1J056

Clarinet Flute. Saxophone. Piano
(Fustlessonfree) 75O-ll5»or

719-1444
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Children learn property rights quickly
Remember the ritual of

"show and tell" from your
kindergarten days, when
the teacher told you to br-
ing in an item from home to
exhibit and describe to your
classmates?

Do you remember feeling
ridiculous showing off your
possession so formally? Or
did you enjoy the attention?

However you felt, a ques-
tion arises about "show and
tell": How did educators
come up with an exercise
that encourages students, in
effect, to brag about their
dolls or toy trucks or marble
collections? What is the
point?

Dr. Myra Bluebond-Lan-
gner, the chairwoman of
the Sociology and Anthro-
pology Dept. at Rutgers
University's Camden cam-
pus, has spent a year, four
months at each of three
Philadelphia-area prescho-
ols, intensively examining
72 children in their every-
day dealings with posses-
sions.

This, combined with ot-
her research on children's
concepts of property rights
and values, has led her to
some intriguing conclu-
sions.

On the "show and tell"
concept, for instance, Dr.
Bluebond-Langner noted
the idea is "to help children
develop public-speaking
skills, not to raise little

GIMME! IT'S MINE! • Children's concepts of property rights and values will be the sub-

ject of a book by Dr. Myra Bluebond-Langner, the head of the Sociology and An-

thropology Dept. at Rutgers University's Camden campus. As part of her research,

she observed preschool classes of three to five year olds in their everyday dealings

with possessions.

capitalists."

But, she emphasized, the

exercise suggests more to

children than the necessity

of being able to speak to a

crowd.

"While the routine seems

naive, it actually places im-

portance on private proper-

ty and emphasizes to chil-

dren that what they own is

of special interest to their

peers," the Rutgers-Camden

sociologist observed.

She also pointed out

"show and tell" sessions

mean "one time a week the

child displaying the object is

guaranteed the undivided

attention of the entire

group. This places addi-

tional value on the object."

A n associate professor of

anthropology at the State

University of New Jersey,

Dr. Bluebond-Langner ob-

served another approach

children lake lo property in

general, " I have found." she

noted, "children as young as

two and a half can dis-

tinguish private from school

or public properly. Children

use privale properly to call

attention to themselves.

They do not use school or

public properly to do this."

Furthermore, she said,

"Whi le children arc often

admonished by teachers to

share school or public prop-

erty, they arc not urged to

share t he i r p r i v a t e

property."

The professor emphasiz-

ed she doesn't fault teachers

for demanding respect of

private property.

After all, she said, "a

child's doll or truck is as

sacred to them as our stereo

or Cuisinart is to us. Would

you, as an adult, let your

adult visitors play with your

stereo or Cuisinart? Why,

then, should a child be forc-

ed to share a prized poss-

ession with another child?"

What the sociologist is

concerned about, however,

is undue emphasis seems to

be placed on personal pos-

sessions. She offered an ex-

ample, " I found when a

fight broke out between

students, teachers broke it

up but had no lengthy dis-

cussion with the fighters.

But when an . argument

about an object began, the

teachers held long dis-

cussions on the importance

of property. What docs this

say to a child."

So aware of property

rights are children, "they

use different rules to gain

access to another child's

private property than they

do to communal property,"

the educator maintained.

"For example, children

don't tend to negotiate to

get a piece of private pro-

PRIVATE INSTRUCTION

DRUMS Paul Burylo accepting
jtud»nt3 foi summer enrollment in
homt.Allltrert. 2 I3-0OI

Guit»f Lewns At my Home Begin-
ntrs ind Visually handicapped
Students. By Experienced Teacher.
Cjl 213-0271

Singing. Piano. Flute, Saxophone.
Clirinet New York experience.
Rlhwty rites. Jules Smill,

3115941

TUTORING-ffeiding. English. Basic
Mith, Social Stud resell grtdes-12
yn.e»p.Callirt.4pm 3C-1H3
Mitt) i Spanish Tutoring this Sum-
mar - Preparation for College All

»iSO758

PRIVATE PIANO INSTRUCTION
Specialising in Beginners. Certified
Music Teacher, BX Degree. Callaft.6pm,Mr».V. 31240(5

WANTED
J unk Can » Trucks VYinted. We piy
MO.l50,J50,J704J8000picked
U0.3W457. H
Lhwd Ptsannr cv tires Wanted.
AnHgt.Hl'0102. «
Aid to pay high prices for gd. run.
uHd an k trucks. No Junk Cars

• OuiiFort 7217100.

AUTO WRECKER
BigSanngionused parts 4cars. We
buy disabled t wrecked cars.

341-4252.
JUNK CARS WANTED

CW2457H
LbntliFryei Toy trams.older model
trphne meton, Mttchbax, Dinky.
G U t 721-3W.

Junk Cm t Trucks, J25-J100.
7-0iv pick up. Call anytime,
M M M * . t t
Armando wantj your worn or wreck-
•dcir.Goodpricespad. 5744772
CO.0R Portible TV J WANTE0 to buy
AujCoodit)0n-Days753"7333£v«-.

M4-749C

ANY junk or running cars. Top dollir
paid. 7 days i w»*k pick-up.

USED TOOLS WANTED &
RELATED ITEMS

CALL 541-2174

JUNK CARS WANTED
Running or dead. 1304500 paid.
Ont-hr. sere, with casJi. Call 24 hrs.

I3M1H

Cull Paid for toots and equipment
Cri(ift5pmJ 73M5S?
BatrrirttJr/Hoiuetotper for prof.
coupk 1 3 r old, own home, Mon.
tttfu FrL 8:30 »m - 6:00 pm
WtxtfleU. Must hire car/ref/wiitt
Yoffr«317VemonPI.Westfield. N.J.
0 7 0 9 0

BRICK, TILE, CEMENT
CERAMIC TILING

Bathrooms remodeled
Jim Moyet 8344643

Tile Bithroom repaired
Remodtled-Misonry

Emery Glagoli.3114307
Ceramic Tiling, bathrooms remodel-
ed t repaired. Free Estimates. Call
John. 3l24492prS4l4722
J 4 J MASONS Brick, Block. Con-
crete. Repairs & Home Im-
provements. No iob too small.

574-1442

Concrete driveways, patios,
sidewalks. All types of buck 4 block
work.FreeEst 213-3491

Monteverde Cons't Co.
Steps, patios, stone fireplaces. Free
Estimates. «5-2051

PORCHES. PATIOS. SIDEWALKS,
PADS for Metal BuiWingj. Call (of
Free Estimate 3O-151I

BATHROOMS
REMODELED

COMPUTE-PARTIAL
EXPERT REPAIRS

ftft 1ST. INSUnO
ALL WORK GUARANTEED

CUSTOM VANITIES

KEN 738-8771

CERAMIC TILE
•BATHROOMS 4 SHOWERS

(ccmant walli-rot proof)
•tfPARS (larg. or .mall)

(Loot* til*, grouting)
•SlOWtt DOORS iSUUED

•11016 SMCE 1931

382-0085
Mr. Valvano

, ' MMJOD 1 OUAIAKTOD

DRAPERIES
SLIPCOVERS

UPHOLSTERING

KITCNEI ft DINETTE

Dinettes
Mide

To
Order

AL-IEE DINETTES
FACTORY WAREHOUSE

382-2141

REUPHOLSTERING
OVFJt 30 YEARS EXPfRIMCE

MACKIE &
REEVES
283-2626

\UI Oak Im t l . lufa

CLEANING SERVICES

CLEAN W» AMCRKA
Th« pe>nonollitd Kout«<l»onlng
*«rvk« that m—t\ your ip^ctal
n—dt, r«»ld»nllol A oHka ele>on-
Ing (rtgutar A occoikjrwl) Fully in-
•urMl t b d l

or Cryital.

3t 1-9386

GARDENING AND

LANDSCAPING

MEW LANDSCAPMC

SERVICES, INC.
•LANDSCAPE

DESIGN/PLANTING
•LAWN MAINTENANCE
•SODDING/SEEDING

382-9620

HAULIHG t CLEANUP
Attics, cellars, garages cleaned
Disposal of contents Fiee esl.
311-7295. tf

Rubbish removal, demolition work
sheds, gauges, houses. Free
Estimate 381-2624

Appliances & furniture moved.
reasonable rates. Call Ray

3l27O58or381-81S7

Pal's Tiucking. Demolition ol
garages, clean up work, yards,
cellars, & houses. Fully ins.

388-7763

CARPENTRY

mm THE MMUUN
Scrap Iron & Metals

Pick Up Service
CALL

•34-309*

AUTO REPAIR

T. Z. TOPS
Vinyl Tops Replaced $95
S up. Body Side Molding.
*2S.

Call Tom

•42-3179

APPLIANCES
/Uton'jWajJier-OrjefRepairSenice.
Specabt on Whirlpool. G.E. & Ken-
more, aod on most makes S models.
S74«2 t l «
Reptin on waJh.. drjers, dslmrshrs.
f t ] < elec nnps 541-72*1 or
fafrMM Day * Mite calls. 20 yrs.
exptf.

Appliance Repairs i Paris.
Microwam, air conditioning,
amriof machines & vacuum*. Ex-
perienced, courteous, reliable ser-
vice «iy time any da? or night

AIR CONDITIONING and
KUHGERATKWSenriceaod Repair
fcactaitial I Commercial. Call Jim
at OH337«r72H04«

Jack's Appliance Service - Specialist
oo GE and Hotnoifll Refriferator,
Utaker. Dryer. Rotfe. Dtshmiher.
Ca l MMH3

Expert Carpentry, additions,
dormers, kitchens, baths,
basements, etc. No job too big or too
small. AsKotAI- 217-5101 tf.
Any carpentry work. Small pbs in-
eluded. Freeest 3 3 4 W tf
Air conditioners expertly installed
thruwalls.23yrs.e»p. 3 M 4 I S
Custom decks built with all types of
lumber. Additions, dormeis.
garages FreeEstimites. 213-3491
Decks. Porches. Windows, gutters,
roofs, doors, Sheetrock, Paneling,
Basement. Cabinets. Kitchens, Ceil-

ings. Bathroom. 8344351
All Types of Carpentry, Quality Work-
Lowest Pncej FREE ESTIMATES
CallLou 634-5201
Call John for all types of carpentry,
no iob too small, free estimates

3U430C

All types Priced to Fit. Your Budget.
Free Estimates.. Guaranteed. CaK
Anytime 574-190S

CARPETING

CARPET Why pay retail? Buy direct
from Mill Representative. Carpet &
installation • fully guaranteed. Fiee
Estimates. Can for complete infor-
mation Eves! 3H-2354

FENCING * ERECTING
All Types • Chain link, vinyl, wood.
Residential, commercial, industrial
?Oyrs.e»per.Freeest 3 1 1 4 2 4

LIGHT
TRUCKING

Appliances A Furntturo
Romovod S Dolivered

Goragei & Collors
Cleaned

l)ie<l Appliances

::r;,̂ ' 381-0001

9Ga. Vinyl wire48"H.U99/ft.ln.
stalled mcl.. everything except
git»,6 colors 381-1044

ACCURATE FENCING - All Types
•Quality Work - Reasonable Prices.
AskForMike 635-45*4

• i Z FENCE
CHAIN LINK 8 WOOD

DOG RUNS
I

SWIMMING POOLS
COMMERCIAL a INDUSTHIAL

ALL SIZES
F«tE ESTIMATES

381-2094 925-2567

FLOOR CARE
Hardwood floors installed, sanded,
finished. Free Est A. Mefchoir.

434-1105 tt

aOORSANDING
Floors sanded S finished. Call
Frankcar. 311-2537

(XS0N CARPET CLEANING -
Steam Cleaning, 3 Rooms & Hall
$35.95 3814511

. irmsniT aurare
SKCUl

CUKTCLUM6
•ML'IM I-

HAROLD STEMER

241.7070 ^

DRAPERY

SLIPCOVERS

UPHOLSTERING
UPHOtSTERING-reasonable prices
guaranteed work 60vrs in business
Sermayan 634-1217
DON'T REUPHOLSTER! WE REPAIR
& RECOLOR VINYL FURNITURE &
CAR SEATS AT YOUR RESIDENCE.

352-3649

Too Many

Wh»t worries me is
that there are so many
people in this country who
are willing to watch the
same kind of television
junk I do.

-Advocate, Cumberland.

GARDENING AND

LANDSCAPING
LAWH MAIRTERAJICC

Sod, RiR Ties, Shrub & Tree
Trimming-Removal and much more.
Local and Reasonable. Joe,

S344940
SL LANDSCAPING

Mow, Fertilising, seed intshrubbery
Planted Insured. Free Estimates

3124451

BILL'S LAWN SERVICE • Cutting,
trimming, edging, sod. eiotic
gardens. Very reas. rates. Free Est.

73*4310

Cleanups, Lawn Care. Tree £ Stump
Removal. Sod. Shrubbery, etc
Firewood i 100/cord 213-1311
RON'S LANDSCAPING Uwn care:
Trees: Stump Removal; Shrubbery;
Sod; Fertilizing; etc. LOW PRICES!

2134(04

PATSUWIMAIHTEIIAaiCE
Mow, fertilize, t ru th , edge, shrubs
trimmed. Free estimates. Fully in-
sured. 541-7115

JIM PETB0SII
LANDSCAPE DESIGNER

S CONTRACTOR

•34-S549

CHRtSTO M O S . HAULING
YOU CALL...WE HAUL

Attlci. B o u m t n l t Gorogat
Yardl. Conn S>i«t [Hote l
ClvanxJ Dsmo Work Apt t
HamtWoving Po.nKng |lnt ( a l |
Floor! Sandad I r,n,th«d

TOM
312-9439

HOME IMPROVEMENT

All types of home improvements.
K i t / B a t h s , Basements, att ics,
alum.siding.paneling.Freeest Call
Dominick.3»2-9514. t l

Ceiling 4 Walls Repaired. Sheetrock
& Taping CalHCdnon) 5494754

Frank Laubtnei-General Contractor.
Carpentry, Masonry, Aluminum
siding, Roofing 4 gutters, storm
windows, doors & screens. Wdbg

634-1768

All Carpeting 4 Tiling Installed. &
Repaired. Free estimates Insured
CallJim. 752-0524

C G Home Remodeling • E»pert
carpentry work. 25 yrs. eiper. in al
aspects of const . , addi t
basements, decks, masonry
cabinets, etc. Excellent references

574-3514or2977080

AJ.UMINUMSIDING* INSULATION
VINYL S I D I N G . ROOFING
REPLACEMENT WINDOWS. ADD!
TIONS, DORMERS S ADD-A LEVELS
LOW PRICES NO DOWN PAYMENT
FINANCING ARRANGED AT LOW
RATES. CALL FRANK FOR FREE
ESTIMATE. 634-3900

PROGRESSIVE GEN'L CONTR. INC
HOME IMPROVEMENT SPEC.
M.UMINUM I VINYL SIDING

R00FIR6JID0rTK)NS.P0«CH ENC.
f H I T IHSj826-306O>FREE EST.

ALTERATIONS • Complete Remodel-
ingService.Call 957-0557

CARPENTRY. SHEETROCK.
EXTERIOR PAINTING

2 4 1 - 8 0 9 1

Bathroom Tile Repairs -
Tiles Cleaned Tiles Grouted. Tubs
Recaulked - Rich • 381-3716 (dan)

8623521(eR>|.

KITCHEN REMODELING
KITCHENS REMODELED

CUSTOM FORMICA
COMPLETE OR PARTIAL

FREE ESTIMATE 738-8771

PAINTING AND
.DECORATING

Painting. Eipeiienced Interioi/E
tenor. VERY REASONABLE FreeEs!
Fully Ins. 24 hr ans sve 499-923

LENNY'S PAINTING AND ROOFINI
INTERIOR * EXIERIOR MISSING
ROOF SHINGLES REPLACED INS
3813841
Bill's Painting 4 Papeihangin
Average room, sidewalls. $12 Ce
jn|sJ5 634-5760
John's Painting SContractlnt/ E«l
Bonded 4 Ins Light Carpentry,
Repairs Wallpapering 4 Samt
Hung.AIICallsans 574O08

DECORATING

Frank's Painting Int/Ext. Free Est.
AverageRoom»5. 636-3161
Experienced Painting 4 Paperhang-
ing. Int/Ext Fiee esL Guaranteed.

Call Jo«, 738-726901634-9164
G.BEUINO

Intenor/Eiterior Painting
283-3065 Fiee Estimate

SUSAN'S WALLPAPERING/STEVES
PAINTING 283-1911 or 56W887
Int./Ext. Low Rates. Free estimate.
C 4 C Wallpapering - reasonable
rates Expert workmanship. Noiob
too small1 549-2789oi437-<736

Exterior. Interior Industrial Painting
4 Papeihangmg Free Estimate.
Wall Paper Removal Ask for John.
Cal lunt j l l lpm. 925-3107

PAPER HANGER
Flocks, Foil!. Wtl look Vinyls

PAINTING
Interior and Exterior

Fullf lmur#d ' * • • lilimotvi

c/m sirvf 634-6157

PAINTING

PAPERHANGING
by Sol Clroto
Coll Anytime

388-8876

WOODBRIDGE PAINTING
A Home bnprovemtnt

Intorior, extorior, fully
insured. Free ostimato.

442-1430

PLUMBING & HEATING

Emergency sewer cleaning. Plumb-
rng4HeabngRepairs FieeEsLHot.
Water Heaters Lenny Grieco, State
Lie.6249 574-0480

Expeit plumbing 4 heating repairs
Water heaters, drain cleaning. St
lic.CallCailGates.382-1785. tf

Svc. 4 Installation on central a/c.
humid ifiers 4 any typed heat Cafs

634-3746

J.BASCOKA PLUMBING
SewerCleanmg. Repairs 4 Remodel-
ing. Sentor Crtifen Discounts. Fits
Estimates 6344952

BOB'S
PLUMBING
& HIATING
•orati «NIIS t in.

• 8 1 IH 1 KII KJUU.
•HOT W/.H8. STUN HUn«G

SYSTEM! «IHrB HUTntS
•SfWTI I M i l * CLUKINC

24 Hr. An>. Svc.
r.^.fn SI. Ik. No. tilt

634-0354 494-2998
ROOFING

Roof repairs, siding, leaders, gut-
ters Noiobtoobigortoosmall Ask
tor Stan the Man-287-5100. tf

WE STOP LEAKS New roofing 4
repairs. Work Guai Clark Builders
Inc.Uyrsexp 381-5145

SMALL JOBBER

HANDYMAN
COMPLETE HOME REPAIRS

636-0886

Rent Us call Jim 283-2745 Yard
cleanup, lawnscut. light hauling.at-
tics, garages, basements cleaned.
HANDYMAN-CARPENTER lor al l
lobs-celler to attic. Painting, ceil-
ings, closets All minor home
repairs Call 636-7344

SERVICES

SEWER & DRAIN CLEANING
• FREE ESTIMATES

634-4987

ACCOUNTING 4 TAX SERVICES In-
dividual 4 Business. Licensed AccL;
M Fox 232-4855

Professional Electrolysis, Newcom-
putemed equipment, insulated pro-
I* . by appt only Call 925-4037

Jims A/C 4 Refng Guaranteed
work at low prices Service and in-
stallation 541-8082

SERVICES

Benjer Pools • New pool sales. Ser-
vice 4 repairs, Pool opening: \iyn
Exp.-Fullylnsured. 245-8098

8 4 E Air Cond, • Refrigeration, Gas.
4 Elec. Heating, Hoi Water Tanks.

9*9-3*09
We WASH, SIMONIZE. 4 WAX Your
Car. All Work DonebyHand.J30.Lg,
$25 sm.CallRon- 388-0404

JOE'S A/C Central An Installation.
Also, repair of window units. Pickup
4deliver- Call381-4417

MOVINGT
EXPERIENCED MEN

FULLY INSURED

RITTENHOUSE
TRUCK SERVICE

241-9791
ELECTRICAL SERVICE

A4J Electric,Lie. No.5207. Quality
work, low latts. Free Est Aft 4.
549-3878 tf

ALDAWN ELECTRIC
Commercial, residential, industrial
Bonded, insured. Lie 5217.
574-3861 tf

John W. Pauhkas - no iob too small.
Lic4283 283-2194. tf
Need an Electrician? Call WUNDER
ELECTRICLic.Bus PeimitNo.5736
388-0835 tf
Rodriguez Electrical Contractor.
Licensed4 Bonded No.3894. Noiob
toosmall. 636-3297

PRIDE ELECTRIC CO.
Induslriol, Commercial.

Residential
Insured & Bonded
24 Hour Service
Fre« Estimates

574-1175

perty, as if they realize the

child holding private pro-

perty has certain rights to it.

But when they're trying to

get communal (school-own-

ed) property, they use a

variety o f strategies:

Physical attack, threats,

moral persuasion (such as,

'Well, you know we have to

share these things'), and ap-

pealing to the teacher for

help, (what Dr. Bluebond-

Langner called 'third-party

arbitration')."

She found, therefore,

"children's disputes over

private property are shorter

than those over communal

property. With the latter,

there's an expectation in

both children's minds that

it's open to what I call

negotiation. Whereas, with

private property, the kid

owns it and that's it. There

are more options with com-

munal property."

The professor pointed

out she didn't come up with

her findings by interviewing

children.

"Obviously, if you asked

a child for descriptions of

private and school property,

for example, you wouldn't

get an answer, and that may

be why researchers haven't

made the distinction. One

important thing about my

methodology is the way you

understand children is not

through questioning them

but by observing their be-

havior in a natural setting."

She said the children she

observed, who were bet-

ween three and five years

old, quickly grew accus-

tomed to her presence, and

even approached her with

different questions and

comments about their daily

activities.

Besides the findings

already described, she dis-

covered during her visits to

preschools that children:

-Use private property to

draw attention to them-

selves when there is a lull in

the conservation.

-Actually discuss proper-

ty rights and differences

with each other.

-Show pictures and crafts

to adults to get their at-

tention but, when they

want the attention of other

kids, they show their own

new things, as if they know

that is the "currency."

••Form bonds based part-

ly on how they make use of

and share private and com-

munal property.

Using her findings, Dr.

Bluebond-Langner wi l l

spend the next two years

writing a book to be titled,

"Property in the Preschool:

Rights and Values." Before

she completes it, she intends

to return to the schools

where she conducted her re-

search "to make sure what I

saw was actually there. To

test my hypotheses in more

detail."

One thing she knows for

certain is children are

"willful, purposeful beings

who are able to forge a line

of action toward one an-

other"-often using property

to make their point.

SPECIAL SERVICES
DOM'S ENTE1F1ISES

"TM I M lt..Vi fc IT
«trri> . tr*« r»nv A pnjn.. gut-
clnd. 1 lnatoll*d. K I W I

lr*d d*ckt. howling, odd
moionry. underground

969 0469 i".*
E
(IT

-SOFA CNAIM-
* « 388-5280 *•
SAGGING SEAT •OTTOMS
RE1UILT IN YOUR HOME.

SPRINGS RETIEO-
NEW LINING. NEW
HEAVY W E M I N G

SUNSHINE UPHOLSTERY

LEANT BROTHERS CO.
Goneral Contractors
Pointing. Popmr Hanging.

Paneling. Celling! Attic Fam.
Replacement Window*

Fr»» Eitimatet

K«vln BUI

541-8116 213-0479

TELEVISION SERVICE

JOES TV-ZENITH •
VICE 634-2524.

SALES 4 SER-
H

NORMAN'S TV SERVICE • Exp. serv.
lor?Oyrc Reas. rates.494-0898or
276-1776 days and eves

IT'S A FACT!

ATTIC FANS
INSTALLED

RELIABLE & REASONABLE
CALL KEN 687-5013

OR

WAYNE-750-0732

EDISON GARDEN CENTER
SCHftNED TOP SOU

FILL DI»T
STONE

NURSERY STOCK
P.£k«<J Up or D»l<var«f

549-0669

CARPET INSTALLATION
& REPAIRS

PROFESSIONALLY DONE
AFTER 4:00 i Weekend
Appointments Available.

K. Frai. 169-05M

MIVEWAT
HAL COATM*

•Oil B O M *
•Pr»«»ur* Jproyex*"

rtOTKTS & BEAUTIFIES
Fr*« Ettlmat*.

, « 3M-3404
AfMr 6:00 p.m.

Sodium — a major com-
ponent of table salt— can be
found in drinking water.
Amounts of sodium in wa-
ter vary across the country,
but wherever water soften-
ers are used, the sodium
content of drinking water
is higher.

Many Americans con-
sume two to three times or
even more sodium each day
than they need to in order
to live healthy lives. This
excess sodium in the diet is
believed to contribute to
several diseases, including
high blood pressure or hy-
pertension. About 1/4 of
your sodium intake comes
from the salt you add to
food. The experts at the
Food Marketing Institute
recommend that you check
with your doctor to find
out if you need to cut down
on the sodium in your
diet. If so, always check
the labels of the foods you
eat for the words "salt,"
"sodium," or "soda." In
general, fruits and vegeta-
bles contain less sodium
than meat, poultry, fish or
dairy products. And try
different seasonings, such
as lemon juice, garlic, basil,
bay leaf, paprika or nutmeg.

J. CUTUGHO & SON. INC.

Trenching & Excavating
Grading And
Land Clearing

Residential, Industrial.
& Commercial

3534073
er

925-9164
Fully Insured

KISTLER
PAVING INC.

Parking Lots
Driveways

Repairs
Seating

636-0655

Bob

fully lntu

Gary

Too Many
What worries me is

that there arc so many
people in ihis country who
are willing to watch the
same kind of television
junk I do.

•Advocate, Cumberland.

C A W
LANPSCAPINC

• lown Molnfenance
•Seed.ng Sodding

•Ro'o Tilling
"Tr»« removal Pruning
•Creohve Landicapmg

Fr*« liHm*t*»

738-1719

METRO CONSTB.
ASPHALT DRIVEWAYS &

PARKING LOTS
Summer Discount
Prices. Call now for
free estimate.

283-1370
Fully Insured

J J B
CONSTRUCTION iNC.

•Asphalt S
Concrete Driveways

•Backhoe Rentals
•MASONRY WORK

•GEN. CONTRACTING

382-3370
382-S877

HANDYMAN
CALL ANTHONY

lo fIM tt ceplote it o' rebuild ii
Both room* hitchem A boiementt
remodelad Carpentry A

283-O733

KITCHEN CHAIRS
RECOVERED 5 1 5

BAR STOOLS

TV CHAIRS-DINETTES

BOAT CUSHIONS

CAJ UPHOLSTERERS
549-5414

P I C K U P * DELIVERY
F'M Ect.-AII Wort Cv«r«nfv«d

STUMP
&TREE

•I4MVAL
•f Ajr SCIIVKE LOW KATES

CAROL'S LANDSCAPE
RAHWAY

5744)861

ASPHALT DHIYEWAYS
DHIYEWAY SEALDfC

FREE ESTIMATE
FULLY HSU1ED
341-8516

F U Z E & SON PAVING

SPECIAL SEBVICES
FOB SPECIAL

PEOPLE
»
ktJbl. Halt*, akwr aim*!. »»•
tm tuMjMAuteii. r
dMM» a* tU Jrti faM-l
• " tfc.

ECONOMICALLY AffOKDABlE

CALL . 574-1056

' BATHROOM ̂
REM0DEUN6
A NEW BATHS

M. GIORDANO

PLDMNnC&HEATnC
634-9190

W» Ar» A LtKOl Concern

t toui iftucpian
Sroiv L«*n t *Na 017

ft!irr'Oi»l rully ln
WOODBRIDCE

Property may be used to

start a friendship ("Want to

see my new Felix the Cat

doll?"), get others' at-

tention, or pressure some-

one into doing something

(I'll give you this blue

crayon if you'll give me

your pretzel at snack

time.").

Whatever value they at-

tach to property, children-

even by the age of three-

arc, according to Dr. Blue-

bond-Langncr, very much

aware of rights connected

to possessions.

Communicators
accredit

Richard Bennett
Clark resident, Richard

Bennett, the director of

communications at Hobby

Industries of America in

Elmwood Park, was award-

ed accreditation by the Pub-

lic Relations Society of

America.

Accreditation is granted

after successful completion

of written and oral exam-

inations designed to dem-

onstrate the candidate's

knowledge and competency

in the practice of public

relations.

Candidates must have at

least five years experience

in professional practice

before taking the day-long

written and oral examina-

tion.

Mr. Bennett joined the

society in 1982, and is a

member of the New Jersey

Chapter.

He received an associate's

degree from Middlesex

County College in Edison

and a bachelor's degree in

English from Montclair

State College in Upper

Montclair.

PUBLIC NOTICE

'Few know how to be old."
La Rochefoucauld

PUBLIC NOTICE

SHERIFFS SALE

SUPERIOR COURT OF
NEW JERSEY

CHANCERY DIVISION
UNION COUNTY DOCKET NO.

F 9037-81 NEW YORK
GUARDIAN MORTGAGE CORP.

PLAINTIFF
vs. JOHN HARRIS. ET AL.

Defendants
CIVIL ACTION

WRIT OF EXECUTION
FOR SALE OF

MORTGAGED PREMISES
By virtue of the above-stated writ

of execution to me directed I shall
expose for sole by public vendue, In
ROOM 207, In th Court House. In
the City of Elizabeth. N.J . on
WEDNESDAY, the 3rd day of
August A.D., 1983 at two o'clock In
the afternoon of said day

Municipality: City of Rahway
Street address: 1113 Fulton

Street, Rahway, New Jersey
Tax Lot and Block: Lot 50 Block

659
Approximate dimensions: 100

feet by 215 feet
Nearest cross street: Hazcrwood

Avenue
There Is due approximately

$53.821.33 with Interest at the con
tract rate of 14 per cent from
November 7. 1983 to April 19,
1983 and lawful interest thereafter,
and costs.

There Is a full legal description on
file In the Union County Sheriffs
Office.

The Sheriff reserves the right to
adjourn this sale.

ALVIN D MILLER. ATTY
CX 448 02 (DJ & RNR)

RALPH FROEHL1CH
Sheriff

4t...7/7. 7/14. 7/21. 7/28/83
Fre:$117.8O

SHERIFFS SALE

SUPERIOR COURT OF
NEW JERSEY

CHANCERY DIVISION
UNION COUNTY DOCKET

NO. F 7774-80
FORMAN MORTGAGE CO.

Plaintiff, a Corp.,
vs. WILLIE S. DAVIS,

et ux., Defendants
CrVIL ACTION

WRIT OF EXECUTION
FOR SALE OF

MORTGAGED PREMISES
By virtue of the above-stated writ

of execution to me directed I shall
expose for isle by public vendue. In
ROOM 207, In the Court House, In
the City of Elizabeth, N.J., on
WEDNESDAY, the 3rd day of
August A.D., 1983 at twooclockln
the afternoon of said day.

The property to be sold Is located
In the City of Rahway In the County
of Union, and State of New Jersey
Commonly known as: 202O Henry
Street, Rahway, New Jersey Tax
Lot No. 9 and 10 In Block No. 124.

Dimensions of Lot (Approximate-
ly) 67 feet wide by 100 feet long.

Nearest Cross Street: Situate on
the Westerly side of Henry Street
105 feet from the Southerly side of
Bamett Street.

There Is due approximately
$41,543.49 with Interest from
November 30. 1982 and costs.

There Is a full legal description on
file In the Union County Sheriffs
Office.

The Sheriff reserves the right lo
adjourn this sale.

ZUCKER. GOLDBERG, BECKER
& WEISS, ATTYS.
CX-447 02 (DJ & RNR)

RALPH FROEHLICH
Sheriff

4I...7/7, 7/14. 7/21, 7/28/83
Fee:$ 120.28

PUBLIC NOTICE

SHERIFFS SALE

SUPERIOR COURT OF
NEW JERSEY

CHANCERY DIVISION
UNION COUNTY

DOCKET NO. F 594 83
CITY FEDERAL SAVINGS AND

LOAN ASSOCIATION, an
association organized and

existing under the laws of the
United States of America, Plaintiff
vs. VINCENT N. CAVIGLIANO,

et.als. Defendants
CIVIL ACTION

WRIT OF EXECUTION
FOR SALE OF

MORTGAGED PREMISES

By virtue of the above-stated writ
of execution to me directed 1 shall
expose for sale by public vendue, In
ROOM 207, In the Court House, In
the City of Ell2iibethrN.J.. " on "
WEDNESDAY, the 10th day of
August A.D., 1983 at two o'clock In
the afternoon of said day.

The property to be sold Is located
In the City of Rahway In the County
of Union and State of New Jersey.

Premises are commonly known
as: 2012 Henry Street Rahway,
N.J.

Tax Lot No I I & 12 in Block
No. 124

Dimensions of Lot (Approximate-
ly) 41.67 feet wide by 100 feet long.

Nearest Cross Street: Situate on
the Southerly side of BARNETT
STREET. 173.07 feet from the
Westerly side of HENRY STREET.

A full legal description of the
premises can be found In the Of-
fices of the Register and the Sheriff
of Union County

There Is due approximately
$48,188.13 with Interest at the con-
tract rate of 10% from March 29,
1983 to May 17, 1983 and lawful
Interest thereafter, and costs.

The Sheriff reserves the right to
adjourn this sale.

Michael Howard. Ally.
CX 456-02 (DJ & RNR)

RALPH FROEHLICH
Sheriff

4t .7 /14. 7/21. 7/28. 8/4/83
Fee $137.64

PUBLIC NOTICE PUBLIC NOTICE

WRIT OF ELECTION AND PROCLAMATION

STATE OF NEW JERSEY
NEW JERSEY GENERAL ASSEMBLY

WHEREAS. Raymond Lesniak was. at the general election held In the
month of November. 1981. elected by the voters of Legislative District
20 to represent the district In the New Jersey General Assembly and did
subsequently qualify as a member of the New Jersey General Assembly
from that district and after his election and qualification was elected and
is serving as a member of the New Jersey Senate for that district and
thereby a vacancy happened In the New Jersey General Assembly; and

WHEREAS, By resolution of the New Jersey General Assembly, duly
adopted on June 23, 1983, the Speaker of the General Assembly, was
authorized and directed to Issue a writ of election as of this date In Ihe
manner and form hereinafter set forth;

THEREFORE, I, Alan J. Karcher, Speaker of the General Assembly,
pursuant to law and to said resolution, do hereby Issue this writ of elec
tlon and proclamation directing an election to be held, according to ihe
laws of the State of New Jersey, In Legislative District 20 on August 2.
1983, for the purpose of electing a member of the General Assembly (or
Legislative District 20. to fill the vacancy caused by the election and
qualification of Raymond Lcsnlak as a member of the Senate, and that
the candidates for this office to be voted upon at the election be selected
or nominated in the manner provided by law.

Given under my hand and seal
this 23 day of June, In the year

of our Lord 1983 and of the
Independence of the United States. 2O7lh.

Alan J. Karcher
Speaker of the General Assembly

Attest:
John J. Miller. Jr.
Clerk of the General Assembly

5t...6/3O, 7/7.7/14, 7/21,7/28/83 Fee:$229.40
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CHAMPIONSHIP STYLE - Former Rahway High School
star athlete, Joe Androvich, reports Laura D'Alessan-
dro, a five-foot, three-inch 15-year-old sophomore
golfer from Toms River High School South, won the
New Jersey State Junior Women's Tournament at Col-
onia Country Club. She played last week at the Optimist
Junior World's Tournament in San Diego.

Post No. S upsets
Scotch Plains

By Ray Hoanland
Coach Bill Dolan's Amer-

ican Legion Post No.5 Base-
ball Team upset the Scotch
Plains team 8-7 at Veteran's

Ringer Classic
to be held
on Aug. 7

The Warinanco Horse-
shoe Pits in Warinanco
Park in Rosclle-Elizabelh, a
Union County Dept. of
Parks and Recreation facili-
ty, will host the Warinanco
Ringer Classic, an annual
event of the .Union County
Horseshoe~Pilcliers' Club,
on Sunday, Aug. 7.

The tourney will begin
with a 10:30 a.m. sign-in
and the entry fee is S3. Par-
tiicipants must be club
members and cards can be
purchased at the tourna-
ment site. Prizes will be
awarded.

For additional informa-
tion please telephone the
parks department offices at
527-4900.

Memorial Field on July 1 1.
Railway struck for five

runs in [he sixth inning to
overturn the Scotch Plains
[lost. Dan Andrcn had a
two-run triple and Scott
Durkin had a two-run single
for Railway in that inning.

Scoicli Plains had taken
the lead in I he fifth with
three runs to assume a 7-3
lead. The run-scoring hits in
thai inning were by Jim
Flauraiid and Dave De
Hart.

Scotch Plains received a
three-run homer from Jeff
Grimmer in the first inning.
Railway's Joe Petula had a
homer for ihe home side.

Rahway is now 2-12.
while Scutch Plains is 6-7.

* * *

The Westfield American
Legion, aided by four Rah-
way errors, rolled to a 15-3
win over Post No. 5 last
week.

Westl'ield had 12 hits,
scored four limes in the first
and scored in every inning
but Ihe second to win its
fifth straight. In ihe first in-

ning Joe De Rosa walked
and went to second when
Dan Hauck was safe on a
sacrifice attempt.

Al Ashmont was hit by a
pitch before Jack Falla
walked with the bases load-
ed to bring in a run. Sean
Carter's grounder went
through the legs of the
Rahway shortstop, scoring
two more runs, and after Ed
Sot walked, a fielder's
choice on Mike Parrish's
grounder scored the fourth
run of the inning.

Westfield is 8-2.

Roosevelt cites
Rudy Rivera

A Roosevelt School of
Rahway fifth grader, Rudy
Rivera, was given the
Youth Fitness Award for
achieving between 50 and
79% on all items.

Rahwayan
gets award

A sixth grader at
Railway's Roosevelt Sch-
ool, Kim St. Andrassy, was
given the Youth Fitness
Award for achieving bet-
ween 50 and 79% on all
items.

DIAL-A-
SERVICE

AUTO INSURANCE
PREMIUMS

oaring you up? / \

$ •? ? $ %y )

We'll ffjori Vow Bill Prid
Wilt Our Nit ,

RATING COMPUTER
FREE TELEPHONE QUOTES

388-8080
208 W. MILTON AVE.

RAHWAY

^APPLIANCE;

REPAIR
&

SALES

•Toasters*VacuumJ
•lron$»lamps«Fans

•Coffee Makers
-Authorized-

REGINA
MR. COFFEE • HOOVER

443 LAKE AVE.
COLONIA

382-8713
Slipcovers, Draperies
Bedspreads & Shades

Custom Made To Order

1-arflett trlcctlon In
this arm
' Flltrd |n yourhomr
• Guaranteed Work-

manihlp
• F-'Incil fnbrlr*
" Lownl prlcrt

FREE ESTIMATE

388-3311

Rahway
Fashion Fabrics
INTERIOR DECORATORS

Curtains-LinonvYard Goods
T421MAINST., RAHWAY

This Spot
Could

Be Yours
$25
For

7 Weeks
574-1200

WANTED
•SCHOOL RINGS

•CLASS RINGS
•OLD GOLD

JEWELRY
CALL:

381-8243
BETWEEN 7:30AM AND

11:30AM WEEKDAYS
AFTER 11:30AM

PLEASE
LEAVE MESSAGE

A
ATARI

REPAIR CENTER
FOR ALL ATARI
VIDEO GAMES

AND HOME
COMPUTERS

SR Data
2141

WOODBRIDGE AVE.
EDISON

985-5017
IK OR 0U1 OF WARRANTY

rouc f

Specialists
on all

Kinds of Jobs
•Asphalt
•Concrete

and Masonry
NEW OR REPAIR

Fully Insured
Free Estimates
Call 484-1695

INTRODUCING
THE WATCHBAND THAT ADAPTS
TO ITS NATURAL ENVIRONMENT

Spoidol '. now Sell S./ing collodion ol
e x p a n d a b l e w a t c h bands . is
availoblo in either stainless stool or
rolled gold plate Look lor tho name
Spoidol on every piece

EXPERT JEWELRY
& WATCH REPAIRS

A FULL LINE OF
QUALITY JEWELRY

' •QUALITY JEWELERS
y KENNEDY JEWELERS

TJV 84 E. Cherry St.
W Rahway 388-1667

NEED LOW-COST STORAGE?
Let us show you how you will spend less with us
than you would with any major moving and storage
company--and have 7 day per week access to your
things at no extra charge...by the month...drive
rightup...you keep the key to your own cubicle!

135 Amboy Avenue
(Hwy. 35, V4 mi. south ol Him St., 1 mi. nwtt or Rl«. 440)

Woodbridge 750-1440

~7

WIGS NATURALLY
Proudly Announces The

"GRAND OPENING"
Of Their New...
DEPILATROH

ELECTROLYSIS
WAXINC CENTER

INTRODUCTORY OFFER

This Ad 1 0 % OFF

By Appointmont Only
Cortifiod Tochnician

Comploto Privacy

1144 Raritan Rd., Clark

381-7069
Parking *n Prcmliti

DRIVE A NEW VEHICLE
OF YOUR CHOICE ...

ANY MAKE OR MODEL.

NO DOWN PAYMENT
LOWER MONTHLY

PAYMENTS

CALL FOR FREE BOOKLET
R-721

fun* WJIIef. jn .lulhofilfid In
drpendenl Eng.ico A Car Broker

241-5519 382-4048

A [irn[ev.H)nal A itHxlern Real !-\Uie-
I i>riip.inv Mieculi/ifiK in itic vile ami
.ippf.nvjl of Rurmav liortm A huuncw
prnpcrhe^

208 Cantral Avtnu*
Rahway • 388-0154

HOME IMPROVEMENT

'1981 N J . Contractor of the Year'
TALK to us first and SAVE $

"Additions •Roofing
•Add-A-Level 'Siding
•Bathrooms •Dormers
•Kitchens •Replacement

windows

138 Westfield Ave., Clark
Call for » j A A r _

Free Estimates 5 7 4 - 9 0 5 7

x

Mackie
&

Reeves, Inc.

UPHOLSTERING

1349
Oak Tree Rd.

Iselin

283-2626

LAWNMOWER

WE CAN FIX IT...FAST!
NEW SNAPPER MOWERS IN STOCK

Repairs On All Makos

CLARK POWER EQUIPMENT
1132 Westfield Avenue, Clark

Hours: 9AAA to 6PM Daily 381-37771

272-3527

PROFESSIONAL ;
OFFICE

CLEANING j
WE DO IT ALL... j

for Doctors, Dentists, |
Lawyers... !
Industrial- f

Professional or (
Commercial

SO GIVE US A CALL...

FREE ESTIMATE FULLY INSURED
272-3527

Building bnricei Company

Fishing derby set
Aug. 3 in city

Rahway director of rec-
reation, Richard Gritschke,
announced the Annual
Rahway Fishing Derby will
be held at Milton Lake Park
on Midwood Dr., Rahway,
on Wednesday, Aug. 3.

The tournament is open
to residents of Rahway 14
years old and under.

Registration at Milton
Lake is scheduled for 5:30
to 6:15 p.m.

Fishing time will be from

6:15 to 7:15 p.m. The prizes
will be awarded at 7:30 p.m.

Fishing poles and worms
will be given to each regis-
tered boy and girl.

Prizes will be awarded to
boys and girls eight and
under, nine and 10, 11 and
12 and 13 and 14.

The rain date for the old-
est fishing derby in Union
County will be the ne.xi
night, Thursday. Aug. 4. at
the same time and location.

Time running out
for garden contest

"There's still time to
enter," reports Mrs. Math-
ilda Knecht, the president
of the Rahway Woman's
Club, referring to the gar-
den contest the club is spon-
soring with the co-operation
of the Markey Realty Asso-
ciates, the donors of the
SI00 United States Savings
Bond offered as the first
prize.

Plaques and certificates
will be awarded in various
categories: Container gar-
dens, patio gardens, win-
dow boxes, front-yard gar-
dens, back-yard gardens and
hanging plants.

Participants may be resi-
dents, businesses and or-
ganizations of Rahway. Ap-
plications are available from
the Markey Realty Asso-

PROTECTING WETLANDS - Assemblywoman Maureen
Ogden, whose district includes Clark, during a press
conference in the New Jersey Senate Chamber last
week, discusses the "Freshwater Wetlands Act" she
introduced in the Assembly. Democratic Sen. John A.
Lynch of the 17th District concurrently introduced the
bill in the Senate. The bill would protect about 200,000
acres of freshwater wetlands from indiscriminate
development. About 400,000 acres of other wetlands
are protected by existing statutes.

Federal payments
last less long

for unemployed
The maximum number of

weeks payable under the
Federal Supplemental Com-
pensation Program dropped
from 10 to eight on July 10,
in keeping with the con-
tinuing decrease in insured
unemployment, Commis-
sioner Roger A. Bodman of
the New Jersey Dept. of
Labor announced.

Commissioner Bodman
said when the federal pro-
gram was extended in April
Congress tied the benefits-
payable factor very closely
to the individual state's rate
of insured unemployment.

"At that time, our rate
was about 5%, making 12
the maximum number of
weeks compensable," he
said. "At the end of April
our rate dropped below 5%,
decreasing weeks payable to
10. At the close of June our
rate went below 4%, caus-
ing the number of weeks
payable to drop to eight.

The commissioner ex-
plained only those people
who have exhausted their
rights under the regular
state unemployment system
are eligible to file for pay-

ments, under the Federal
Supplemental Compensa-
tion Program.

Those who qualify for
federal aid may be paid
55% of the maximum amo-
unt of their regular un-
employment insurance
claim or the payment lor
eight weeks, whichever is
lesser. All federal program
benefits are funded by the
federal government.

"To be eligible for the
federal benefits, claimants
must make a systematic and
sustained work search for
work," the commissioner
said. "They must be willing
to accept any work they are
capable of performing, pro-
vided the rate of pay meets
the minimum wage require-
ments and exceeds their
weekly benefit rate."

According to Commis-
sioner Bodman, the depart-
ment's computer is being
programmed to recalculate
each claim that is in current
status. As soon as it is com-
pleted, individual notices of
the re-determinations made
under the new formula will
be mailed to each claimant.

BEE
Nursery/
Kindergarten
School
•Reading Readiness
•Skills & Concepts

•2-3 & 5 Hall Day
Sessions

•Day Care Program
Available-Open

7:30 am to 5:30 pm

1155 a 2153 St. Georges
Ave., Railway
381-6640

dates at 208 Central Ave..
Rahway. j

The deadline is Monday i
July 25.

Serving on die committee
of the Rahway Woman's
Club are: Mrs. Kenneth A
(Madeline) Kirkbright. Mrs.
John D. (Barbara) Markey,
Mrs. Philip (Sandra) Pras-
ser. Miss Lorraine Smarsch,
Mrs. Tor (Stephanie) Ccd-
ervall and Mrs. Knecht. ex
officio.

Mrs. Markey serves as
the club's community-im-
provement chairwoman.
The theme of the garden
contest is city beautifica-
lion.

A similar contest was
held last summer, receiving
very favorable response, ac-
cording to Mrs. Markey. .

This Spot
Could

Be Yours
$25
For

7 Weeks
574-1200

BAD FEET?
Call us
LINDEN

PODIATRY GROUP
Your Complofo

foot caro Contor

486-3338
(DIAL 486-FEET)

Dr. Eric M. Deufchman
Surgoon* Podiatrist

Consulfant'Pharmaclst

706 W. St. George Ave.
dxni i Ircn St Georqe Dir.ei)

Linden, NJ.
Daily HF in. £ Sals Avail.

OB-GYN
Group of Mefuchen

W.H. AINSLIE, M.D.
L.A. CARLSON, M.D.
W.H. AINSLIE, JR.

M.D.
J. PELLICANE, M.D.

announce the
opening of a branch

office. Beginning
March 17th, 1983.
795 INMAN AVE.

(Near Wood Avo.)
Colonia, N.J. 07067

BY PHONE
APPT. 381-3538
ONLY 548*0698

'K.N. CHATTERJEE, M.D., M.S.. F.C.C.P"

179 Main St. Woodbridge
(Tho lato Dr. Frodorick's Offico)

634-2678
A Walk-In Office

NO WAITING—NO APPOINTMENT
— Loss Expensive Than An Emergency Room—

Most Convenient Hours:
Monday thru I rid.iv I:.108

Saturday ') I
Complete Medical Services

•X Ray»I.jh<iratnry«l)i.itlienin
•Minor Surfery*l'roci()sa>p)

•I'rocuisiuinoidoscoin »l'ap Smear
Senior Citizens Welcome

Medicare & Medicaid Accepted

HOSIMi Al. ADMISSIONS OK YOl'R
k C HOIC K ARRANCiKI) I OR YOU

County group helps
many conquer fear

Arc you afraid of being
alone, riding in a car, brid-
ges, tunnels or elevators, be-
ing in large open spaces, fly-
ing or any other activity
that interferes with your
daily life?

Do any of the following
symptoms describe your
condition? Fright for no ap-
parent reason, hyperventil-
iation associated with feel-
ings of being trapped, fear
of losing control, dread of
going places that interferes
with your ability to travel
outside a small local area?

The above symptoms arc
characteristic of a disorder
known as agoraphobia. It is
not a mental illness, and
persons can be taught how
to break out of this cycle of
fear.

The Phobia Release Edu-
cation Program, which is
known as PREP, was or-
ganized by the Mental
Health Assn. of Union
County in 1980 to provide a
local treatment and edu-
cation program for persons
with agoraphobia.

PREP has combined sev-
eral of the current behav-
ioral methods claimed to be
effective in work with pho-
bics. with graded exposure
practices where participants
go out to face the feared
situation. The professional
team actively participates
in these outings to shopping

Magician
to appear

at Trailside
"Great Scott It's Magic,"

featuring a comedy magi-
cian for all ages, will be the
Wednesday Matinee pro-
gram on Aug. 3 at the Trail-
side Nature and Science
Center's Visitors Center at
Coles Ave. and New Provi-
dence Rd. in Mountainside
at 1:30 p.m.

Admission will be $1.50.

malls, airports or wherever
it is necessary to start to
help' phobics overcome var-
ious resistances.

PREP consists of 15 ses-
sions on a weekly basis after
which many of the partici-
pants meet on their own on
a monthly basis. Applica-
tions are being processed
now for the September
courses.

This support group, de-
signed as a self-help con-
cept, has been found useful
in sustaining the level of
progress attained by the
members in the intensive
15-week session, reports a
spokesman.

For more information
please telephone'272-0303
or 2720304 from Monday
to Friday from 9 a.m. to 4
p.m.

PUBLIC NOTICE

NOTICE OF ACTION
BY RAHWAY

BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that
the Board of Adjustment of the City
of Rahway at the public hearing
concluded on Monday evening, July
18, 1983 to consider the applica-
tion of Rahway Hospital for review
and approval of a Site Plan covering
lots 9, 10, 19, 21, 23. 25. 27, 28,
29 and 30, block 894. Tax Atlas of
the City of Rahway and a request
for a variance to permit the tem-
porary use of the said lots by the
Rahway Hospital as a parking lot
and a request for approval of a sub-
division of lot 78, block 894. Tax
Atlas of the City of Rahway In con-
nection with the request for use of
the aforementioned lots as a tem-
porary parking lot, did disapprove
the said Site Plan, did deny the re-
quest for a variance to use the said
lots as a temporary parking bt and
did deny the request for the subdivi-
sion In connection therewith.

John Pisansky of Magner,
Abraham, Orlando, Kahn &

Pisansky, attorneys for
the applicant,

Rahway Hospital.
840 Wood Avenue North,

Unden, N.J.

It...7/21/83 Fec:$22.94

REACHING FOR GOLD - Reading Rainbow, the Clark Public Library's reading club, for
those aged four to 13, began with a musical book talk by Judy Freeman, shown talking
to a group of youngsters and their parents.

John Runnells Hospital
marks 70 years

Editor's Note: John E.
Runnells Hospital of Union
County recently celebrated
its 70th anniversary with a
gala benefit dinner at the
Town and Campus Rest-
aurant in Union.

• * •

In 1910 one of every 50
citizens died of tuberculosis.
In the early part of this cen-
tury progressive medical
professionals recognized the
need not only to modernize
the treatment of tuber-
culosis, but to bring patients
closer to their homes and
families.

Prior to the time, tuber-
culosis was treated primari-
ly in remote institutions and
patients' morale, a vital fac-
tor in treatment, was low.
When the New Jersey
Legislature enacted a law
authorizing the establish-
ment of county hospitals for
the care and treatment of
what was then termed the
"white plague" Union
County got to work plann-
ing the construction of the
first such facility in the
area.

In D e c . 1910 the
freeholders adopted the
recommendation to locate
the new hospital in Berkeley
Heights, known as New
Providence Township at
the time. Construction
began in 1911, and the cor-
nerstone was set in Oct.
1912.

Selection of that site was
not without opposition
from area residents, fearful
of much of the erroneous
folklore surrounding the
disease at the time. One
man living adjacent to the
site even went so far as to
have a carpenter board up
his open bucket well, in an
effort to keep the germs of
the communicable disease
from seeping into the well.

For the bargain price of
S100 per acre, the farm land
of Henry S. Fullerton, a
popular businessman and
gentleman farmer, was pur-
chased by the county.

Air conditions at the site,
some 350 feet above sea lev-
ed, were deemed "perfect"
for patients with lung trou-
ble. The site also had
southern exposure and two
springs, and was protected
from the northwest winds
by a mountain range.

The new facility was
christened the Bonnie Burn
Sanatarium in 1912, after
the Scottish phrase for
"pretty stream," one of
which flowed in front of the
hospital property.

With eight buildings
housed on 63 acres and a
bed capacity of 60, the
hospital was opened for
business, serving patients
from Union County as well
as Somerset, Morris and
Middlesex counties, until
those counties could
establish their own facilities.

Dr. John E. Runnells was
named the first superinten-
dent and medical director

and his guidance, dedica-
tion and untiring work
caused the Freeholders to
rename the hospital in his
honor, calling it the John E.
Runnells Hospital for Chest
Disease in 1955, reports a
county spokesman.

In its first 40 years Run-
nells Hospital had the treat-
ment of tuberculosis as its
primary concern .
Throughout the years, addi-
tions and improvements
were made, and the bed
capacity increased. A
Children's Preventorium
was built in 1916,
laboratory space, as well as
housing for the hospital's
employees, was erected, and
a swimming pool was added
for children. By 1933 there
were 370 beds, 100 for use
by pre-tuberculosis
children.

With advanced drugs and
trea tments , pa t ients '
hospital stays began to
reduce, and the demand for
beds lessened. In 1955 the
State legislature responded
to the changing needs of the
public by passing legislation
which permitted county
hospitals to admit patients
suffering from non-
tubercular diseases. This ac-
tion gave Runnells Hospital
two units, a tuberculosis
Unit and a non-tuberculosis
unit.

The admissions policy
was further expanded in
1961 when the hospital was
authorized to admit chronic
patients such as stroke vic-
tims and cancer sufferers.
Needless to say, the demand
for beds rose dramatically.
Construction of two 50-bed
units was begun, and they
were opened in 1963 and
1965.

Admission to the Tuber-
culosis Unit continued to
decline until 1966, when
the Board of Managers at
the hospital and the
freeholders closed the tuber-
culos wing-, transferring the
remaining patients to the
state sanatorium.

Meanwhile, the need for
beds for the chronically ill
resulted in Rose Hall, a doc-
tors' and nurses' residence,
being converted for patient
use in 1967, the same year
the Dube' Children's Shelter
opened.

A consul t ing firm
surveyed the hospital and
the needs of the community
in 1967. Their recommen-
dation was to close the
facility, but the freeholders
decided there was an urgent
need in the Union County
community for the facility,
and continued operation
with a final change in the
name of the facility to the
John E. Runnells Hospital
of Union County in 1969.

Ninety-three additional
beds were added in 1971,
and the long waiting list of
nursing-home patients
began to dwindle. At the
same time, two new
primary needs among

Union County residents
became apparent-treatment
and rehabil i tat ion of
alcoholics and inpatient and
outpatient services for the
mentally ill. Approval for
these new programs was
granted in 1973.

Today, 70 years later,
Runnells operates 22
buildings on 146 acres in
the Watchung foothills, and
is licensed by the New
Jersey Dept. of Health as
both a hospital and nursing
home with 343 beds.

For some four decades
John E. Runnells Hospital
of Union County has been
fully accredited by the Joint
Commission on Accredia-
tion of Hospitals and is a
member of the American
Hospital Assn., the New
Jersey Hospital Assn. and
Union County Hospital
Society.

Project A.I.D.E.

to continue
through summer

Middlesex County Col-
lege's Project A. I. D. E.,
located in the New Bruns-
wick Career Preparation
Center at 100 Albany St.,
will be open throughout the
summer.

Project A. I. D. E. pro-
vides an open learning cen-
ter for Middlesex County
adults to help improve their
basic skills in reading, spell-
ing, writing and mathema-
tics.

Study at A. I. D. E. may
lead students to high school
completion, entrance into
vocational training, par-
ticipation in college-level
programs or qualifying for a
job.

Students choose their
own study time-morning,
afternoon or evening, in an
informal adult setting. In-
structors from the college
provide each student with
individual help. There is
also a library of study
materials to use.

The service is free. In-
terested adults may walk in
or they may telephone for
further information at
249-6207. The summer sch-
edule is from 8:30 a.m. to
4:30 p.m. from Monday to
Friday and from 6 to 9 p.m.
from Monday to Thursday.

Project A. I. D. E. is
sponsored by Middlesex
County College's Division
of Community Education.

Cancer tally
triples

city goal
A spokesman for the

Union County Unit of the
American Cancer Society
announced Rahway exceed-
ed its goal of SI,500 in the
city's annual door-to-door
campaign against cancer.

Although the campaign
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SERVICE DIRECTORY
Heating • Air Conditioning

Solar Energy
750-2717

535 Amboy Avenue, Woodbridge 07095

REPUCEMENT
WINDOWS

Aluminum or Vinyl
Storm Windows

& Doors
JALOUSIE &

AWNING WINDOWS
L & M

WINDOW PRODUCTS
Free

htimile
374-3332

Rahway (anytimo)

FUEL OIL
Premium Grade

5.93
150 Gal. Min.

Service available

S 541-2787

BOLDfSKY LANDSCAPE
AND

THEE SEHV1CE

Landclearlng
Stump Removal

LANDSCAPE DESIGN
Sod

Lawn Malntonanco
Froo Est.

Z3S..
EPA \ J 7R J ^ \

381-1494'or 382-8872

BATHROOM^
MAGIC

i r C T ^ T C A N BE BESUHf ACEDA
^ AT A FBACTKDN OF THE COST

OF REPLACEVtNI
CALL THE

f WSUIIfAClNO SPECIALISTS
NIW r u i CUAXANTf!

20 YEAR l l f l

L
* TWF nmSHlNC TOUCH < I

634-4236 *
851^)981 1

KITCHENS
Cabinets A Counterlopj

• Savingv to 3 5 7D
• Free Shop at Home

Service 6V Coniultontloni
• Bathroom Cebinelry
• Financing Arranged
• 20 Ycorl of Meticulous
Craftsmanship

CHAS.F. GRANT
CcrpMtry I Wcxxiwofiln<j

321.0099

cao
TREE SERVICE
TREE REMOVAL

8. TRIMMING
.STUMP REMOVAL

FULLY INSURED
FIREWOOD

FREE ESTIMATES
CALL

388-6742

TOPS
CENTRAL

AIR CONDITIONING
WINDOW UNITS
REFRIGERATORS

& FREEZERS
WE SERVICE
ALL MAKES

AND MODELS
SAME DAY

SERVICE

574-0220

EXPERT
t u tti p

TREE SERVICE
•LOT CLEARING
& LAWN CARE

FUUY INSURED
FRfl ESTIMATES

RON CORDERO 634 -9038

A&A
TREE SERVICE

636-0278
FREE ESTIMATES
FULLY INSURED

J.T.M. t IIST
PAVIN6 A MASON

CONTRACTORS
New & Rosurfacod

Driveways
Asphalt or Concroto
Curbing & R.R. Tios

Stops, Patios
Sidewalks

Rotaining Walls &
Drainage Hipo

REASONABLY PRICED
FREE ESTIMATE

862-8169

J & D
General Contracting

Summor Prico Spociols

DECKS UNLIMITED
Redvood/Preuure Treated,

Term tie & Bo I Reslslanl
Wood

Cnilon work at cospelilifi
Prices

"FREE BUG ZAPPER"
With Each Deck

276-3527 382-9514

Th» Luggago King
PACK-N-CO BOUTIQUE

1258 ST. GEORGES AVE.
AVBIEWJ4-6331

WHOLESALE E RETAIL
•WMntli HMI bf BumiiiiHn
Hifftp lM*kvftM Est.
•hboiikg « luft«< ( VkTl Etc
•iHlM t*dr Otki WIICMI
Custom B*ad*d J«w*lry

Mad* To Ord«r
•My b t M tnalth
*m, Inctkf! UtM
H.it*, Ten NtdUa
sr JoatoKctd Logo bttKi
H«t« br Cbti I Offlutton

MASON
GENERAL CONTRACTOR

CUSTOM IUIIT

FIREPLACES
STEPS, PATIO
NEW GARAGE

WATERPROOFING
SUM P i q luUJktlra

NIW HOMO 1 AOOmoNS

MASONRY REPAIRS
WOOD STOVE, fltf WAU

HU8IM.

27 Yean Exp«rl«nc*
lmur»d, Llc«n»*d

Call 983< 1882
T. B«r«nctl

You
'find somo
roal '^tools'

. (You'll fool
liko a burglar

whon you
ditcovor how

tttlo Roador
ods cott)

"From Carpentry
to Wallpaper"

Ceramic Tile
Slate & Quarry Installation

mi ESI. • fullr Insured
MAIL YOUR

AD IN TODAY!

Ritemp
Central

Air Conditioning
Window Units
Refrigerators

& Freezers
All Hakes & Models

Expertly Repaired
Service S Sales
574-2734

ESPO'S
TREE

SERVICE
POWER SPRAYIHG

FEEDING

PRUHINGCEHOVAL

AERIAL LIFT TRUCK

LAND CLEARING

S T U M P 6 R M D I N F
FREE ESTIMATE

889-4191
INSURED

G & O
INSTALLATIONS
EXPERT INSTAllATIONS
Sorvico & Mojor Repair

Ol All Vinyl Linod

SWIMMING POOLS
Cullan Ir.m <AII Work Guinnlfed

•In ground Pooll •Fullr Iniutcd
>0pcnmgl & Closingi •fi l inll l i
We repair and rebuild all

types ol
In ground Foots

BOB! GRIFFIN ROSELLE.PARK
352-3489 241-2910

SIDING-ROOFING & BUILDERS
'REPLACEMENT * DORMERS

WINDOWS 'ADDITIONS

A SWEET \P OF A JOB
•frM

•Mr
hand M..IJ

225-0331
j A I I O I

• lU ' . 'O iCo

•financing

•<0 f t l r
Wrilten Wantn

CARPET &
UPHOLSTERY

CLEANING
3 Cleaning Systems

• Shampoo • Steam • Showcase

At 3 Dillertnt Prices
Drap*a * Furniture

• Walla • Floon
rut junvir j CH« HFULLY GIV(N

-FOR SERVICE CALL"
Servpro ol Clark/Weslfield

499-7119

IHELSEA
IMNEY

1WEEP8
CHIMNEYS

PROFESSIONALLY CLEANED
FREE INSPECTION

• Fireplaces
• Wood Stovos
• Oil & Gas'
• Caps & Screens
Installed

,'„"."',«. 283-2624

-ROOFING-
CUSTOM SIDING

AFFORDABLE QUALITY WITH QUICK SERVICE

Aluminum

STEEL
•Vinyl
•Windows

Custom BuHt
ADDITIONS &

DORMERS
ALL WORK OUARANTI ID (In Writing)

DAVID GINFHIDA
HOME IMPROVEMENTS CO.

•Reroofs
•Tearoffs

LICENSED
& FUUY
INSURED

FREE
ESTIMATES

499-7555 FINANCING
AVAILABLE

JOIN OUR FAMILY OF SATISFIED
CUSTOMERS IN YOUR NEIGHBORHOOD

OFFICE &
COMPLETE SHOWROOM

24 ELM AVE.
RAHWAY
(cor. Main St.)

PTL

381-6311

SIDING
WINDOWS
ROOFING
DORMERS
ADDITIONS

CARPENTRY
•Romodallng S Repairs
•Vinyl S Aluminum

Siding
•Thermal Windows

& Doorj
•20 YoarJ of Meticulous

Craftsmanship

CHAS. r. GRANT
Corpan

321.0099

ALFRED
BRESSAW

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTOR

"lind us in ihi1

Vi'llntt (Vines"
Ollico ai

525 Amboy Avi>
Woodbridgo

636-9132

SAL MORTILLARO

ROOFING 4
ALUMINUM SIDING "

•Hot Roofing • Guttors-1 pc. install
'Storm Doors & Replacement Windows

•Dormers •Additions "~
SIDING

382-1362

Addition!, Attention!,
Dornen, Garages,

Kitchen S Bathroom
Remodeling

Decki, Pilfoi,
Storage Barns

All Types of

Home Improiement
Roofing S Siding

K & C Builders
General Contractors

738-8442
Call onytlm* for FREE Eifimat*

ROOFING
• ASPHALT & FIBERGLASS SHINGLES
• HOT ASPHALT BUILT-UP ROOFING

• SLATE REPAIRS • TEAROFFS

SIDING
ALUMINUM-VINYL-WOOD

SEAMLESS HOME
GUTTERS IMPROVEMENTS

&
REPAIRS

388-3797
•WILLIAM SMELTZER

REPLACEMENT
WINDOWS

FREE
ESTIMATES

ROOFING
Call An Expert I,

IX. ROOFING /
SIDING — HOME IMmoVSMEKIl I I

636-2221 11
.CALL ANYTIMlf/jL

Josoph Casalo
laiMtsci ntr-uni ^

omci URTICI

Fullf uiared
1 IM*!1"1""' ^
GumnlMd IOO\ / / ,

ALL TYPtiOf HtPAIflS
FREE ESTIMATES

RADIANT WOOD HEAT
687 RT. 27 ISELIN • 283-0029

Wt OFTCR COMP1TTE INSTALLATION SERVICE AND
ALL TYPO Of MASONRY REPAIRS

WED-THURS 10-8:30 FRI 10-600 SAT 10-5
CALL FOR FREE ESTIMATE

"5*
189Installed

POWER ATTIC VENTILATION
MAKES THE DIFFERENCE!

WITH
ENERGY
SAVING

ATTIC FANS
DON'T GIVE YOUR
PAYCHECK TO THE

UTILITY COMPANIES

•Remove the Blanket of Heal from Your Ami:!
•Save on Air C'ondilioning Costs!
•No Plastic: All Aluminum Construction!
•Thermostatically Controlled Energy Efficiency!
•1290 cu.ft. of Air Movement per Minute'
•Increase Your Comfort Level While Sauni; Itnergy!

Accurate Rug Gleaning, Inc.
120 Gertrude St., Clark

382-0256
Rugs Steam cleaned

by truck
mounted unit. {
Upholstery & S

Drapery Cleaning '

; *

WJfm
CflVNEH

OPEKATEO

CuidtMiil 4 Connitniil flood Slnki 4 BIK) Beptii

ALUMINUM PRODUCTS CO
S7t *ooM»v»lt Avt. Cort»r«t
Op«n Doily 9 to 6 Sol •) 10 7

Slots Lic»ni«d 2 Fully ln»or#d.

HOME IMPROVEMENT!
•Alterations •Hoofing •Callers

•Siding •Stone Fronts 'Masonry
•Doors •Windows •Awnings
•Garage Doors •Carpentry
•Prime Windows & Doors

•100 % Bank Financing to Qualified Bayers

541-7966

HERE ARE 16 REASONS
TO START!!

New Low Seasonal Rates (Save Up To 30%)
Lowest Bank Terms in the State!
Finance Through Our Own Company; All Types
Of Financing Plans Available

Pay Nothing Until the Job is Completely Finished.
Free Home Improvement Consulting & Est.
Season Sale On All Work Now!
Most Jobs Completed In 1 Week
Open Sat. & Sun. For Your Convenience
Member National Remodelers Assn.
Member Chamber of Commerce & BBB.
Free Insulation and Energy Surveys
Warehouse Sale On All Siding Now!
Lowest Rates On Dormers & Add-A-Levels
We Warehouse Our Own Materials-Wholesale
Best Prices on Replacement Windows
in the State!
Work Done By Our Own Skilled Craftsmen

II Thar i Nol Enough Stop In Or Givo Ub A Coll-Wo'vc Gol Plonly More!
FREE ESTIMATES

Aluminum Siding
Vinyl Siding
Steel Siding

• Add-A-Levels
• Insulation
• Shell Dormers

• Windows
• Energy Savers
• Roofing

• Fireplaces
• Gutters
• Additions

ALUMINUM PRODUCTS CO.
578 Root«v*lt Avtnui, Cart*r«t. N.J.

Optn Dally f lo i Sot. f to 2 Slot* Lk»nft*d and Fullr >"»

will end on Wednesday,
Aug. 31, the crusade, di-
rected by Rahway residents,
Ronald and Lorraine Matu-
saitis, has already raised
$4,200 toward the county's
residential goal of 582,000.

The Matusaitises stated,
"We could not have sur-

passed our goal without the
diligent help and commit-
ment from the volunteers
and residents of Rahway."

Money raised in the resi-
dential fund-raising drive,
and other special events,
helps the society to support
programs in national re-

search, professional educ-
ation, public education and
patient services.

The crusade directors ad-
ded, "We thank everyone
for their support and hope
everyone will work with the
society each and every year
until the fight against can-
cer is won."

robert CALL NOW
634-3900

n OFFICES & WAREHOUSE
40 WOODBRIDGE AVE.

JSI^J^M^ SEWAREN

IKKis Mon-thru Fri-96
mm^~^^W ^* SO, 9.3 s u n n o o n t o 3 p.m.

56810 Siding R Home Improvements Specialists wd8# Ue " 7

U

I
tew •'
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PASSING THE GAVEL - Talking over Clark Rotary
activities for the new year are some of the newly
installed officers, left to right, Phillip Vecchione,

p treasurer; Charles Walano, treasurer; Dr. Jim Collins of
f;Dunellen, the new District No. 751 governor; George
' R. Roache, president, and John Voynick, vice
'• dent.

Public Service seeks cut in penally
Public Service Electric

and Gas Co. July 6 re-
"TJucsied the Nuclear Reg-
ulatory Commission reduce
an S85O.OOO civil penalty
the commission proposed as
a result of the failure of the
reactor trip relays to
automatically shut down
i he No. I unit at the Salem
Generating Station on two
occasions in February.

The company cited a
number of reasons for a
reduction in a letter to the
commission.

Although the conditions
leading to both trips and the
prompt corrective action of
the operators turned the in-
cidents into little more than
routine shutdowns, the im-
plications of the events are
significant and far-reaching
for the entire industry. A re-
cent commission document
identified such problems as
common in the industry,
reports a Public Service
spokesman.

The utility spokesman

said the significant generic
implications should not be
allowed to obscure either
the nature of the actual
events or what constitutes
an appropriate enforcement
action.

In its letter to the com-
mission the company out-
lined three basic reasons as
to why the civil penalty
should be reduced. First,
the company said its own
actions undertaken since
the events in February,
clearly demonstrate an
awareness of the signifi-
cance of the incidents, a
commitment to rectify any
problems and an effort to
continuously comply with
commission regulations.

"The proposed penalty is
unnecessary in that the
significant, corrective ac-
tions described in the letter
were either completed or
were committed to as a
comprehensive remedial
program prior to the is-
suance of the notice of

violation," the company
said.

Second, the company poi-
nted out the conditions sur-
rounding the first event,
which occurred on Feb. 22,
obscured the fact there was
a relay failure and, taken in
conjunction with the pro-
mpt operator response,
should be considered in
mitigation of the penalty.

The promptness of the
operators in manually shut-
ting down the unit acted to
mask the failure of the re-
actor trip relays, it noted.

The firm said it had taken
the initiative in having a se-
quence-of-events recorder
installed without which it
would not have been possi-
ble to reconstruct the details
of the Feb. 22 event. The
company believes it should
not be penalized for this in-
itiative. A formalized post-
trip review procedure has
been instituted by the com-
pany to assure a similiar oc-
currence will not happen

Visiting nurse
updates specialty

The enterosiomal thera-
pist on the staff of the
Visiting Nurse and Health
Services of Elizabeth, Anne
Marie Griffin, a registered
nurse, recently attended a
four-day national confer-
ence in Kansas City to add
to her knowledge in this
specialized field of nursing.

Enterostomal therapy
deals with care of patients
with colostomies and rela-
ted surgeries for intestinal
and bladder diseases. This
nursing specialty is only 15
years old and there are only
1,700 qualified enterosto-
mal nurses in the country.

Miss Griffin took her first
intensive (two months for
seven days a week) course
on the subject in 1972 at
the Cleveland Clinic, at a
time when only 88 nurses
were qualified in that field
in the United States. She
has returned regularly to
national conferences to
keep abreast of new devel-
opments in enterostomy.

The focus of the recent
conference was an update

on skin care. This is of the
utmost importance to a pa-
tient's ability to use the ap-
propriate equipment and
function independently of
nursing assistance as much
as possible, according to
Miss Griffin.

The Visiting Nurse and
Health Services, which pro-
vides home health care ser-
vice to 16 communities in
Union County, has had this
service since 1972 when
Miss Griffin was named as
its enterostomal therapist
following her specialized
training.

"Management of these
patients has improved great-
ly in the last 10 years," she
stated. "Ostomy equipment
and products available for
skin care are now much
more sophisticated."

In addition to performing
care for patients with a var-
iety of other diagnoses, she
also provides a consultant
service to fellow health ser-
vice nurses who request
assistance in customizing

the care and equipment
needed for a patient when a
problem is encountered.

As a part of their orien-
tation, new staff nurses of
the service participate in a
class conducted by Miss
Griffin to provide them
with a greater understand-
ing of enterostomal patient
care. They gain some of
their expertise in this way.
Miss Griffin also discusses
with manufacturers the ef-
fectiveness of their new and
old products that are
available for these patients.

An Elizabeth resident
and a graduate of St. Eli-
zabeth Hospital School of
Nursing in Elizabeth who
has a bachelor of science
degree from Jersey City
State College, she has been
a member of the visiting
nurse staff since 1967. The
United Way agency, has
been serving the public for
more than 70 years. Ser-
vices are provided in 16
municipalities in Union
County including Clark and
Rahway.

Registered nurse, Anne Marie Griffin

again.
Third, the utility said

there were a number of add-
itional facts that should be
considered. The investiga-
tion into the events has in-
dicated the relays them-
selves contributed substan-
tially to the occurrence.

Neither the company, the
nuclear industry nor the
commission was aware of
various facts regarding
these components, as re-
vealed by the commission's
consultant, Franklin Re-
search Center. The com-
pany's new test procedures
will benefit the entire in-
dustry in confirming the an-
ticipated operating life of
the circuit breakers.

In conjunction with an
investigation by the com-
pany of the classification of
work orders as a result of
the February events as to
whether or not they are
safety-related, only 35 of
15,000 were found to be
mis-classified, but absolute-
ly none affected safety, the
letter continued.

The company objected to
the alleged duration of the
technical violation which
the commission has asserted
to be four days of operation
with failed reactor-trip
breakers: ~

The company said it
would be unreasonable to
assess a civil penalty for
more than two days, since
the total elapsed time was
less than 51 hours. The
company also questioned
the classification the events
were severity level No. 1
which carries the higest civil
penalty.

As a result of the events,
the company has under-
taken an extensive investi-
gation of maintenance prac-
tices and adherence to pro-
cedures. The company also
has embarked upon a com-
prehensive remedial action
to assure the events do not
recur and all necessary im-
provements are made or
committed to, including the
development of a new test
program for the compo-

'Deathtrap'
to open

at SUMMERFUN
SUMMERFUN, a New

Jersey professional summer
theater will present Ira
Levin's mystery-thriller,
"Deathtrap," from Tuesday
to Saturday, July 26 to 30.

This story deals with a
once-famous playwright
and his "plight" to create
another successful murder-
thriller.

"Deathtrap" will be the
fifth of six productions to
be presented by SUMMER-
FUN Theater, now in its
12th season. SUMMER-
FUN is a professional stock
theater in residence at
Montclair State College in
Upper Montclair.

All performances are at
8:30 p.m. in Memorial Aud-
itorium. Ticket prices are $6
from Tuesday to Thursday
and $7.50 on Friday and
Saturday. Student and sen-
ior citizen rates are avail-
able.

For reservations or fur-
ther information please tele-
phone SUMMERFUN at
746-9120.

Trailside
to launch

'Spaceship'
"In Spaceship Earth," to

enable those in the fourth to
sixth grades to discover the
world from ecosphere to
microcosm and learn res-
pect for the living system of
our planet, will run from
Monday to Wednesday af-
ternoon, Aug. 8 to 10, at
the Trailside Nature and
Science Center at Coles
Ave. and New Providence
Rd., Mountainside.

The fee will be $10. To
register and for further in-
formation, please telephone
Trailside at 232-5930.

Albright cites
Robin L. Sims

A township student,
Robin L. Sims of 179 Jup-
itor St., was named to the
dean's honor list for aca-
demic achievement during
the spring semester at Al-
bright College in Reading,
Pa.

The list includes all
students who earn a cum-
ulative average of 3.5 or
above.

nents involved.
The overall effect of

these steps will benefit the
entire industry. In addition,
the company is working to
properly identify any addi-
tional areas for improve-
ment so as to strengthen
overall performance, the let-
ter stated.

"Irrespective of any civil
penalties, this company has
taken and will diligently
follow through on strong
remedial measures with
respect to the equipment
responsible for the
February failures, the
related operating and
maintenance procedures,
and the execution of such
procedures by personnel,"
the milky concluded.

%

DID YOU MISS
THAT IMPORTANT

CAL1 TODAY??

b 1
.

i
/

If you're on the road
or out of your office during

the day, let us make
sure you get that

important message.

Pat's Secretarial
Service

381-7272

Stamp show
to be held

in Clark
A monthly stamp and

coin show. The Clark Show,
now in its ninth year, will
be held on Sunday, Aug. 7.

The event will take place
at the Ramada Inn at 36
Valley Rd., Clark, at the
Garden State Parkway Exit
No. 135.

The show will run from
10 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. Admis-
sion and parking will be
free.

A wide, range of United
States and world-wide
stamps, coins and covers
will be on display and of-
fered for sale.

In addition, members of
the public may bring any
material they may have for
sale, since the participating'
dealers, which include
members of the American
Stamp Dealers Assn., will
be ready to purchase any-
thing they need for their
stocks.

A Clark Show Souvenir
Card will be issued, and
given free to all attendees.
This card will only be
available at the show.

Further information may
be obtained by telephoning
247-1093.

Junior Women
to hold

yard sale
The Rahway Area Junior

Woman's Club will hold a
yard and bake sale on Sat-
urday, Aug. 6, at 10 a.m. at
616 Jefferson Ave., Rah-
way.

Army trains
Denzil Williams
A city man, Army Re-

serve Pvt. Denzil E. Wil-
liams, the son of Mr. and
Mrs. Ronald K. Williams of
570 E. Grand Ave., Rah-
way, completed training at
Fort Knox in Kentucky.

He is a 1982 graduate of
Rahway High School.

zzz Goodyear National
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= 1381-0100
• HI SPEED COMPUTER BALANCE
• TUNE-OPS • WHEEL ALIGNMENT
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Drum Brakes or
Disc/Drum Combo

We'll replace 1K001 or due
pads brako fluid brake
vprmgj and (roni oil seal*
Turn and Iru drum* Of roto'i

WE'LL ALSO REPACK FRONT BEARINGS

WHEELS

99
C

Front-End Alignment

Lube & Oil Change
INCLUDES UP TO 5 QUARTS MAJOK
BRAND 10/40 OIL. OIL FILTER EXTRA
IF NEEDED. CAS OR DIESEL ENGINE.

c.ill tor -ippoiniment •
Includes hghi trucks

SO999
Atlantic Illfei
|1430 St. Georges Ave.

AVENEL
— Hours: Daily 8:30-5:30 381-0100

IF YOU WAIT, YOU LOSE...HURRY NOW TO
MARTIN'S FURNITURE

67 WESTFIELD AVE., CLAR K, N.J.

EMERGENCY SALE
OUR FIRST & ONLY

MAJOR SALE
IN OVER

40 YEARS

WE ARE
DESPERATE

TO SELL OFF
EXCESS

INVENTORY

ACT NOW &
GET THE MOST

FANTASTIC DEALS
MARTIN'S

HAS EVER
OFFERED

SAVINGS
HUNDREDS OF THOUSANDS OF DOLLARS 01

FINE FURNITURE AT EMERGENCY PRICES

ALL BEDDING
BACHELOR CHESTS
Man Size RECLINERS
CURIOS fruitwood
3 Pc. Living Rooms
5Pc. DINETTES wood
6 Pc. MASTER BEDROOMS

DEEP PRICE CUTS ORDERED BY
MR. MARTIN on ENTIRE STOCK OF BRAND NAMES
Burlington, Bassott, Kincaid, Ridgeway, Thomasville,

Broyhill, Williams, Stanley (We Go On and On)
Every: SET IN STOCK ORDERED SOLD! NOTHING HELD BACK!

Emergency Price

from
from
from
from
from

from
from

$ 5 9 eo
$ 5 9 ea
$119
M49
$599
M19
$749

SIMMONS & SEALY
500 SETS up to
NO PHONE 1 /

QUOTES /

GRANDFATHER CLOCKS
LAMPS up to

ACCESS. V*

MARTIN'S FURNITURE
DAILY 10 to 9 - SAT. 10 to 6 - SUN. 12 to 5 MSBM V

67 WESTFIELD AVE.
CLARK, N.J.

"1 381-6886
*OFF LIST PRICE


