
islands braced
for hurricanes

Boat owners began preparing for a possible
strike from Hurricane David as early as last Friday.
By Saturday most boats had been either moved up
the Caloosahatchee River or pulled from the
water for safekeeping Rex Moon, and
his son Rex, Jr. did just that, and, for good measure,
chained their craft to a tree

(See page 12 for more information)
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by gwen Stevenson

In a special City Council meeting last
Thursday, the Council accepted a revised
budget from City Manager Warren Hyde
that calls for a total millage assessment of
3.094 for Sanibel taxpayers. The budget
now goes before the public for their input
next Wednesday before it is officially
adopted.

Sanibel Mayor Duane White emphasised
that the Council's action did not mean that
the budget or the millage was "cast in
concrete. All we're doing today is ac-
cepting the budget from the City Manager
- w e aren't adopting it," he stated.

The new millage represents a total in-
crease of 14 percent over last year's
assessment, The City maneuvered around
the five percent cap the State has imposed
on increases in general operating expenses
by removing over $158,000 in Tax
Anticipation Notes from the general
operating budget and imposing an addition
millage of .064 to generate that revenue.
The State Department of Revenue has
advised the City that they can legally do
this. Prior to this move, Sanibel had been
facing a serious problem meeting their
projected expsenses.

The revised budget showed cuts in some
departments at City Hall and increases in
others. The position of Council Secretary
was eliminated for an overall reduction in
the Legislative Department of almost
$13,000. That department handles the City
Council's business.

Another cut was made in Planning
Department. personnel as Hyde's
recommendation to to drop a Planner )
position was accepted by the Council.
Planning Director Bruce Rogers argued
with the proposed reduction in his staff,
saying that the City would have to spend
more money on outside consultants.
Rogers told the Council that eliminating
one of his people would put the Depart-
ment staff back where it had been when he
arrived in February, 1978 - a level he said
had imposed hardships on the City and the
citizens. "You are short-changing the City
and the objectives that you set for your-
self," Rogers stated. He also disagreed
with Council member Butler's contention

council accepts et
that the Planning Department's workload
was more manageable since the adoption
of the Rate of Growth ordinance. "We
have the same peaks and valleys that we
had before (the Ordinance)," Rogers
commented, "based on our experience to
date."

Mrs. Butler also raised the question of
whether or not anyone on the Planning
staff could qualify as an expert witness,
especially since the Council feels that the
current analysis and probable rezoning of
some of the Island's commercial property

will prompt some court battles. "The
heaviest pressures ever brought against us
will be in commercial property," agreed
White. Rogers contended that his staff
member working on the study is qualified
and that the City's outside consultants.
Wallace, McHard, Roberts and Todd, will
be supervising the work. Rogers failed to
prevail and the position was left out of next
year's budget although Mrs. Butler said
that if there is a public outcry next Wed-
nesday, she would take "a long hard look
at it." Hyde said after the meeting that
every attempt will be made to move those

holding the positions the Council dropped
into other City jobs.

The Public Works Departement budget
was restored to the original form Director
Gary Price had requested. Price will be
adding three or four more staff members
and there is about $16,000 in the revised
budget for equipment. The Public Works
Department's budget also includes almost
$100,000 for the Tarpon Bay weir and
planning for the new City Hall.

The budget will be officially presented to
the public Wednesday, September 12 at 8
p.m. in Mackenzie Hall.

Palm Beach reports minor damage and no injuries

By JOHN KANE AND JIM STASIOWSKI

WEST PALM. BEACH - Civil defense
officials in Palm Beach County were
bragging yesterday after a preliminary
check showed no injuries and minimal
property damage associated with the
landfall of Hurricane David, the first
hurricane to slam into Florida's east coast
in 15 years.

Approximately 30 thousand people
evacuated the barrier islands, along the
coast of Palm Beach County with little
difficulty, according to Robert Owen
director of Palm Beach County Civil
Defense.

Packing 75 mph winds Hurricane
David's first Florida landfall was recorded
at about 2 p.m at Singer Island Monday.
Singer Island is a barrier island off Palm
Beach County.

Of the estimated 30,000 people who
evacuated the coastal areas, ap-
proximately 4,000 spent part of Sunday and
most of Monday in Red Cross shelters.

Owen attributed the success of the
evacuation to two factors: the use of the
media to inform the public of the status of
David and "a realistic plan that worked."

Unlike Lee County's hurricane
evacuation plan, the Palm Beach County

plan lays the majority of the responsibility
to responding to an impending hurricane
on six county departments. Each depart-
ment head is assigned the responsibility
for preparing a plan for his own departs
ment. But, in operation, the plan works
very similar to the way Lee County's plan
is supposed to work.

Several hours before Gov. Bob Graham
ordered the evacuation of Palm Beach
County, 80 county employees, along with
National Guard and Red Cross coor-
dinators, assembled at the Palm Beach
County, version of Lee County's
Emergency Operations Center Within 10
minutes of Graham's order, the local
evacuation coordinators had the word out
that the coastal areas might incurr the
fury of David.

"The Governor can order an evacuation,
but when we put it out locally, we didn't
force anybody to leave," Owen said.
"There were about 15 to 18 thousand
people who didn't evacuate and wouldn't
evacuate even for an atom bomb."

Coordinating a hurricane evacuation in
a county of nearly 600,000 residents isn't
the easiest thing in the world, according to
Owen, but complicated by the fact that
there are 37 municipalities in Palm Beach
county, each with its own evacuation plan.

coordinating becomes a matter of im-
mediate communication and im-
plementation.

"Fortunately a lot of people left well in
advance of the storm," Owen said.
Immediately upon the issuance of the
evacuation order, county transportation
buses were dispatched to pre-established
locations along the coastal areas for
persons who needed transportation to the
shelters.

"We couldn't open the shelters im-
mediately, because the Red Cross people
needed time to set up," So, Owen said the
people who wantedrfo-stay at the shelters,
mostly elderly, were loaded into the buses
and driven inland until the bus drivers
received word that the shelters were
open. i

Traffic problems were few in the county,
except for a back up at the toll booth en-
trance to the Florida Turnpike, Owen said

"Next time we will ask the state to allow
evacuating drivers to enter the'Turnpike
free so that traffic won't be backed up."

Evacuation was also aided by the in-
creased gasoline allocations made
available because of expected heavy
automobile use during the Labor Day
weekend. Owen said

continued on page 2
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Even though Palm Beach County was
spared casualties and major property
damage. Owen said he doesn't think people
will be apathatic when another hurricane
threatens the coast.

"I don't care what they say in the state
or Federal government, it's what we do
here that's going to matter to the people. If
people will believe the local people - the
fire chiefs, the police chiefs and the
sheriffs -that 's where the action is. That's
who they really should be paying attention
to."

Palm Beach County Commissioner
Frank Foster agrees with Owen's
reasoning,

"After hearing about the ISO mph winds
that killed all those people in the Carib-
bean, people here were scared. And,
unless we go a long time without another
hurricane coming, these people are going
to remember," Foster said.

County officials met Tuesday morning to
assess the evacuation effort and the
damage caused by Hurricane David.

"We can't help but feel pleased with our
efforts," Owen said. Civil defense in Palm
Beach County employs 7 full-time staff
members, six more than Lee County.

"We don't have the $60,000 plan you guys
have in Lee County, said a Civil Defense
employee of West Palm Beach. "But, we
think we made do."

"Our entire operation was probably the
best in the state." County administrator
John Sansbury said this morning,
referring to comments he heard from
media represententatives covering the
storm.

"We took the proper steps in sufficient
time."

Sansbury ordered the evacuation
process to begin at 2:30 p.m. Sunday, with
the aim of completing all evacuation ef-
forts by nightfall. Sansbury said Graham's
recommendation to evacuate was based on
the estimates that David could slam into
the Coast at Palm Beach as early as 5 or 6
a.m. Monday, which would coinside with
the high tide in the area, and thus increase
the chances of severe flooding.

But, David stalled off the coast and
changed its speed several times before
making landfall, and by the time the storm
lashed the coast, it was low tide.

Referring to the fortuitous timing of
David's arrival, Sansbury said, "The
hurricane worked well with us."

Sansbury could not guess the damage in
terms of monetary loss, but he did say no
major structures with the exception of the
Jai Alai Fronton sustained serious
damage.

The Fronton, which was undergoing
refurbishing, was severely damaged, but
the remainder of the damage attributed to
the storm was in the form of broken glass
and signs, fallen palm fronds and traffic
signal malfunctions.

"I've never seen so many traffic lights
bite the dust," Sansbury told a meeting of
county officials this morning. Among the
projects county officials discussed this
morning was submitting reports to state
and federal governments seeking
disaster relief aid.

continued on page 8

SHOE
For Less

Pre Grand Opening

Galleria
Ladies Dress
Shoes 5-10

Value to 49.99
only 19.99

Mules from Italy ALL COLORS -MANY STYLES

799

Multi Color Bear Traps ® 199

Men Shoes From Spain
6 % - 1 2
other styles
in stock
Val to 49.99
Pigskin

Freeman ® Wheelers
Verde for Men
Men's Hush Puppies «

24.99 Val to $50
20.99-21.99 Valto*50

many styles $ 1 3 "

3E LE SHOE BOX
BRIDGE PLAZA SHOPPING CENTER

Phone 482-6314 Fort Myers

COLLEGE PARK

AT MCGREGOR

Open AAon-Sat 10-6 Fri t i l 9.

Maxwell files
memo in bond

validation
by gwen Stevenson

Sanibel resident and former city em-
ployee Steven R. Maxwell filed a memo
with Judge John R. Schoonover last
Thursday in support of his position that an
error in the legal description of the Algiers
property on the ordinance authorizing the
election makes the election invalid.

"The legal description is legally inac-
curate, therefore causing a vital portion of
said ordinance to be invalid, if not void,"
Maxwell wrote. "The Sanibel electorate
voted for Ordinance 78-38 which contained
an erroneous legal description... they
voted for property which is not the
Algiers."

On the basis of that, Maxwell contends
that the court should invalidate the
mortage indebtedness for the property.

The City contends that, since the error
appeared in only oneof five descriptions in
the ordinance and since the Algiers
property is familiar to most Islanders and
was also described in lay terms in the
same ordinance, that the voters were not
deceived about what property they were
voting to purchase.

Assistant State Attorney Steve Russell
has said that he will not contest the City's
position - the State acts as the adversary
in these types of cases - but a rebuttal has
also been filed by two Sanibel residents.
Stearns and Betty Williamson have
notified Judge Schoonover that he
shouldn't validate the bond because of an
apparent fiscal crisis. According to the
Williamsons, Sanibel will not have enough
money to meet the 1979-80 budget
requirements without raising taxes. (If the
City adopts the current proposed budget,
the total tax millage increase for general
operating expenses and previously in-
curred contracts will run 14 percent.) The
Williamsons are requesting another
referendum in light of the City's financial
situation.

Schoonover will make his ruling after he
reviews all the arguments.

PLAID
SHIRTS
intones of

brown and blue.
Perfect for your
fall wardrobe.

MEN'S CASUAL
WEAR

Periwinkle Place
Shopping Center

In 100% cotton and blends.

SS Cottages
& Marina

On the west tip of Sanibel at Captiva Bridge
A Boat with every Cottage — No Charge.

Full Kitchen, Tackle Shop, Live Bait
Shell Shop, Soft Drinks, Cold Beer and Ice

COTTAGES MARINA
472-4107 472-1334
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7 never want to go through what
I went through in the past day."

Miami Shelters prove inadequate during Hurricane Crisis
By JOHN KANE and
JIM STASIOWSK1

MIAMI BEACH--The Greystone Hotel on
Ocean Boulevard in Miami Beach isn't the
largest hotel on the Beach, nor is it the
most luxurious or the best known. But for
the 60 families who call the Greystone
their home, it was by far the most im-
portant place on Miami Beach this
weekend.

"I went to bed about 2 in the morning
(Monday) and it looked like it (Hurricane
David) was going to be coming in really
hard," said Roy Brma, a resident of the
Greystone who said he has been through
hurricanes before. He was one of the
estimated 30 to 35 occupants of the
Greystone who refused to evacuate in the
face of a threatening Hurricane David."

"I couldn't sleep at all but I wasn't
scared," recalled Brma, who admitted to
being at least 75 years old. "I usually stay
on the second floor but they moved
everybody up, one floor in case of
flooding."

The Greystone is 40 years old, according
to the manager, and has weathered more
than one hurricane. Preparations for
David included masking tape on the
windows, in addition to moving of oc-
cupants to upper stories.

Still, Jean Soury, a 73-year-old resident
of the building for the past four months,
didn't think that was enough, and about 25
other occupants of the Greystone agreed
with her and evacuated.

"I had been worried sick for days," Mrs.
Soury said. "My family is in New York
and I was down here all alone and..."

Visibly shaken by her 24-hour evacuation
ordeal, Mrs. Soury related a tale of an
inadequately equipped shelter and long
bus rides that seemed to be traveling in
circles.

"Sunday morning we heard that there
would be a lot of buses waiting to take us to
shelters. And since I speak a lot of dif-
ferent languages, I tried to talk to some of
the bus drivers to see where they were
going- . • -

"I saw this old man walking around like
he was lost and there were people on street
corners with all their clothes and things,
waiting on the buses. They all looked like
gypsies.

"This old man -I kept asking him if he
was alright, if he felt okay, and then he
wasn't there anymore."

Mrs. Soury said she didn't get into a
shelter until she had taken a 90-minute bus
ride to Miami.

"After I finally got on the bus I tried to
ask the driver where we were going. But
all he could say was he didn't know yet. I
didn't want to go to Miami and they
wouldn't tell me where we were going. I
just didn't know what kind of people I'd
have to face."

"I saw this old man walking

around like he was lost and

there were people on street

corners with all their clothes
and things, waiting on the
buses.

They all looked like
gypsies/'

Once at the shelter Mrs. Soury noticed
there were about l;000 people in two
separate areas of the building.

"I went to a room that was full of
wheelchairs and sick people. I tried to
help a few people; I helped a woman go to
the bathroom so she wouldn't fall in. But
there was so much to do and not enough
people to help. Everyone was lying on the
floor. And there-was only one bathroom

for all the women.
"It was just too much for me. I've lived

in New York and Long Beach and now
here. But I never want to go through what
I went through in the past day.

"It was a humiliating experience (in the
shelter)," Mrs. Soury, a widow for 18
years, said. "I guess I should have taken
more things with me, but I didn't want to
carry sheets and pillow cases. It looks
cheap and humiliating."

Mrs. Soury's tale of her shelter stay was
repeated over and over by many residents
of Miami Beach who were evacuated to
less than posh accomodations in schools
and other public builo'ng* deemed safe
from the fury of David.

And the passing of the storm with
relatively little affect on the resort island
didn't make the shelter experiences any
easier for those used to living in relative
comfort on Miami Beach.

Several hundred of Miami Beach's most
sick and infirm patients were tafcen to
Miami Beach Convention Center fos
special care. And many, according to
reports, complained of inadequate shelter
conditions and lack of medical personnel.

The situation at the Convention Center
apparently arose because of a lapse of
communications between Miami Beach
Fire Department and Dade County Red
Cross.

Fire Chief Bud Goltzene said, "I can't be
too critical because I don't know all the
facts." But he did mention that the Red
Cross was "late in delivering the food "

In addition, Goltzene said, there was "no
Red Cross help" at the Convention Center,
the only shelter on Miami Beach.

But Jim Landrum, disaster service
director for the Dade County Red Cross,
said the mistake was made by the Fire
Department assuming the Red Cross had
any responsibilities at the Convention
Center other than the delivery of food.

"That is not a Red Cross shelter We
provided food, but something got fouled
up,"Landrum said. He admitted the food
was delivered late.

Goltzene said the iast of the evacuees
arrived about 2:30 p.m. Sunday, but the
food wasn't served until around 11 p. m.

"There was no one to prepare the food,"
Goltzene said. But he added that he
commandeered an ambulance service
crew and got some emergency medical
technicians ready. Goltzene said he had
expected the Red Cross to prepare the
meals.

"Vfe will have to get together with the
Red Cross and find out what hap
pened,"Goltzene said. "We'll be more
ready next time." ,

The crowd at the Convention Center
numbered "about 1,000," Goltzene said,
and he estimated the number of people
evacuated to Miami at about 5.000.

Goltzene said the medical staff at the
Convention Center was adquate to handle
the crowd.

Landrum said the important thing is "wo
didn't kill anybody and we didn't get hit by
a hurricane."

Get off
the world

Get onto an island. §[(\
VIPs' new North Captiva branch is
your jumping off place
for true island living. We,
deal exclusively in
out-island properties
including homes
and lots on North
Captiva, Cayo Costa
and beyond. Boat
over this weekend or
call for an excursion
appointment.

REALTORS

^

NORTH CAPTIVA OFFICE
at the north end of North Capliva

Open weekends. Weekdays by appointment.
Contact South Seas Sales Office

472-2523

IDLE HOURS
ffeedlecraft and Hobbies

IDLE HOURS
PRESENTS

NORWEGIAN WOOL
ON SALE

There are 65 subtle
colors available in 100 gram
hanks. This fine yarn is
perfect for Scandinavian patterned
sweaters, Rya rugs, needlepoint
tapestries, and classic knitted sweaters
and afghans. The price was $4.50 a
skein. For the month of September, it,
is $2.50

START YOUR CHRISTMAS PRESENTS NOW

Barbara Boulton
31 ftriwiaklc PUcc. SaBiW. Florid*. 33967

(813)472-1039
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letters to the editor
Allocate boat people to Plains, Ga.

To the Editor:

Now that Jimmy Carter has started to
allocate the boat people to different parts
of the country, he could prove his sincerity
by sending at least 50,000 of them to Plains,
Ga.

William Von Eiff,
Sanibel

causeway speed limits should be enforced

To the Editor:
1 do not live on your beautiful Island but

I have the privilege of working here.
One of the nicest parts of the day has

been the drive over the bridge and the
causeway. Lately, that scenic drive has
been a frustration!

I understand the reasons for the 20 and
30 mile an hour speed restrictions and
respect them. Just wish 1 could say the
same for some others.

Almost daily in my efforts to observe the

law, there is some impatient driver
tailgating dangerously or blowing their
horn madly -- and, many times, crossing
the double line on a bridge to pass and fly
down the road. AH of these, by the way,
have been local cars or trucks.

Surely, if you expect people to drive at
the speed limits posted, it is going to have
to be enforced or it will be ignored.

E Weniger

(SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS SSSSSSSKK SSSSSSSSSSSSKi

JUST PUBLISHED
Beachcombing
on Sanibel

by John Harold Wilson
Brenda Wilson Jerman

95

Macintosh Bookshop
1021 Periwinkle Way . 472-1447 Sanibel

commentary
The last time I did this, I mused last

Saturday morning, trying to decide bet-
ween roast beef or corned beef hash, I was
going camping in the African game parks.
Stocking up for a hurricane just wasn't

quite the same thing. But there was a
different feeling in the air last weekend -
almost like Christmas. Instead of the
usual greetings, people asked, "Staying or

leaving". And there was a similar
singlemindedness of purpose as people
ravaged supplies of batteries and candles
and stocked up shopping carts with spam
and tuna.

Two years ago, then mayor Porter Goss
remarked during a Council meeting that
the Islanders needed a "scare storm" to
force pople to buy their emergency
provisions and make serious preparations

to deal with the onslaught of a killer storm.
Well, he got his wish. Although David

never really affected the Islands' weather
seriously over the Labor Day weekend, he
certainly had an impact on all our lives.
He forced us to really think about our
position in the event of "the big one" and
certainly left the residents of Sanibel and
Captiva in a much better position to deal
with the effects of a major storm than
most of us were this time last week.

It also gave the members of the
Emergency team a chance to actually go
through their tasks in the face of the real
thing. And, perhaps most of all, the
cooperation of the diverse segments of this
Island community reminded us again of
our fragility and our need for the in-
terdependence that helps make Sanibel so
unique. Perhaps, like Christmas spirit,
some of this may linger for awhile.

SANIBEL-CAPTIVA

Islander

plus
4

OMUOE we (rawoi

— Great Island
Living!

THE BAYBERRY
This elevated home optimizes the cool breezes and your view. A fur-
ther bonus is the lower level area which serves as garage, storage
and hobby space. Call us tor information concerning three Bayberry
designs under constructtion on golf course lots in the Dunes.

P.O. Drawer Z, §anifeci, FL 3395?
813-48J -
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Boxed ads in classifieds section $1-00 ex-
tra. Mailing address: P p Pox ?867. Fort
Myers Beach, Florida 33931.

— WHERE TO CALL -
news items 472-5185
classifieds 463-4421:472-5185
subscriptions 549-0123:472-5185

- DEADLINES -
classifieds: Mon., 12 noon
news items: Friday, 5 p.m.
display advertising: Thursday, 5 p.m.

- ADDRESSES -
Mail ing address: P.O. Box 3, Sanibel, FL . 33957
Office location: 2402 Palm Rfdge Road, Sanibel.

SANIBEL-CAPTIVA ISLANDER (USPS 481-400)
Price at newstands: 15' subscription: Lee County, $7 per y.ear; USA, $10
per year; Canada, $12 per year.
Second class postao, permitpaidfor at Sanibel, Florida 33957.

^jst /v. ,•.. : . . ™ "57? B nges of address to P.O. Box 3,
x^nibel, • arid-



The ISLANDER Tuesday, September 4.1979

\

county votes to discuss sole
of causeway to sanibel

by gw«n Stevenson

The Board of Lee County Commissioners voted four to one
last week to open negotiations with the City of Sanibel to
investigate the possibility of selling Sanibel the Causeway
that links the barrier island to the mainland. Since that
time, however, no formal meetings have been set up.
Sanibel Mayor Duane White said yesterday that he had seen
Commission Chairman Dick Steele during County meetings
about Hurricane David and that Steele had indicated a
desire to meet later this week. "I told him I would be
available whenever he wanted to get together," White said,
"but I imagine he is pretty tired."

The County is looking at the sale of the Causeway as a
means to finance much-needed road improvements.
According to Commissioner Harry Rodda, Lee County
needs $40 million for road repairs and Selling the Causeway
would be, in his opinion, one way to accomplish this.
Although noone would commit themselves on price, Rodda
estimated that the Causeway should carry a price tag in the
$25-30 range. The courts recently approved an $18 million
bond to refinance the facility.

White said that he had had "informal" conversations with
County officials about the possibility of Sanibel acquiring
the Causeway but said yesterday that he hadn't discussed
the issue with any other Council members.

In taking their unexpected action last week, the County
stipulated that former County attorney Jim Humphrey
would handle the negotiations and that the toll structure
would remain the same to protect the County residents.

SHNTIVH
MINIMRRT

Grocery - Dairy - Frozen Foods

Meats - Cold Beer & Wine

Post Cards - Magazines
Hats

Health & Beauty Aids

NORTH ENDOF SANIBEL
AT BLIND PASS BRIDGE

SANIBEL

Liquors • Beer • Wine • Mixes
SALE GOOD

TUESDAY — WEDNESDAY — THURSDAY

SEPT. 5,6,7

TEN HIGH BOURBON

SEAGRAMS 7 CROWN

CANADIAN BREEZE

LAUDERS SCOTCH

SCHENLEY GIN 90°

OLD MR. BOSTON VODKA

Qt$5.19
at $5.89
at $ 4 9 9

o!$539
6, $449

BEER SPECIALS
MILLER LITE 6PK. $ 2 . 0 5

MILLER 6PK.N.R.B. $ 2 . 0 5

PABST 6 PK.N .R .B .$1 .79

PLUS MANY UNADVERTISED SPECIALS!!
OPEN EVERY DAY

10% 472-1682
DISCOUNT ON CASE ORDERS

(Excluding Specials)

ISLAND SHOPPING CENTER (Next to Bailey's)

Sun. 12 noor^jfilOO p.m

The Dunes
Cottage

Condominiums
LOFT SECOND FLOOR

1
•HIM! •>
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LIFT
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IILCHT #3
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FIRST FLOOR
CARPORT — SCREENED PORCH —STORAGE AREA

SOUTHERN COAAFORT
SANIBEL STYLE

Every aspect of the Dunes Cottages has been carefully designed by
professionals to assure you the ultimate in convenience and value.
Each unit contains 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, private balconies and plenty
of open space for casual Island living. With a tennis court, swimming
pool and a golf course at your doorstep, a world of pleasure awaits
you in a Dunes Cottage Condominium. Come see our sales represen-
tative in the Dunes Country Club (472-3448) or Qne of our sales of-
fices.

"We Cover the Islands"
Center Island Office: just East of the bank, 1633 Periwinkle Way

472-1549
East Office: in the Huxter's Market Plaza. 1207 Periwinkle Way -

472-T566
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business and real estate

Chadwick's selected as one of Florida's Top 100
Captiva's Chadwick's Restaurant has

been selected by FLORIDA TREND as one
of Florida's "Top 100 Restaurants".
TREND'S annual "Best Restaurants"
listing, as compiled by their Restaurant
Editor-Critic Robert Tolf, includes

Chadwick's as one of 28 "Top 100"
restaurants on Florida's West Coast, one
of four geographical categories in the

August, 1979 listing of Tolf's personal
dining favorites in Florida.

Chadwick's was chosen for its decor,
menu and quality of food with a unique
blending of tastes.

Scott Siler, Vice President for Food and
Beverage Services for the Mariner Group,
Inc., corporate owners of South Seas
Plantation, stated that the resort was

extremely proud to have Chadwick's once
again selected by TREND for "Top 100"
honors.

"Our chefs and service staff, as well as
the general management team for
Chadwick's, deserve the lion's share of
this honor," commented Siler,"for the
dedication and enthusiasm they've in-
vested in making Chadwick's one of
Florida's "Top 100" dining facilities.

VIP named agent for Gulfside Place

Sweat Shop
118 PeriwinklePlace -Sanibel Island -Florida 33957 ||

The OriginalT-Shirt Shop
7000

Unique designs & decals

$5 back
from Kodak!

Now you can get $5.00 back from Kodak.
Just buy and use five packs of KODAK
Instant Film before November 30,1979,
and you become eligible for a $5.00
rebate. See us for details now!

•571 Periwinkle Way at intersection
with Dixie Beach Boulevard

Phone 472-1086
Kodak

Barry M. Chapman, developer of
Gulfside Place, one of Sanibel's luxury
Gulf front residential condominium
communities, has recently appointed
Vacation and Investment Properties,
Inc. (VIP) as the exclusive marketing
agent for the project.

Warren T. Barry, a veteran VIP staffer,
is the Director of Sales for the develop-
ment. Barry will be assisted by Gary
Fluharty and Nancy Mueller.

CAPTIVA EROSION
DISTRICT WILL HOLD THEIR
MEETINGS ON THE FIRST MONDAY
OF EACH MONTH, STARTING AT
3:30 P.M. AT CAPTIVA COM-
MUNITY CENTER.

DAN BURNER
CHAIRMAN

Thinking of Selling?
What's It Worth?
Let our professional staff give you

a FREE MARKET EVALUATION.
THEN, you'll know.

CONTACT US:

NAME.

ADDRESS

CITY STATF ZIP

TELEPHONE

EL

"We Cover the Islands"

FULL SERVICE REALTY «n«.
Home Sites Homes Condominiums
Investment and Business Properties

Rentals - Seasonal & Annual
EAST OFFICE

T207 Periwinkle Way, Sanibel, Florida 33957
472-1566

CENTER ISLAND OFFICE
1633A Periwinkle, Sanibel, Florida 33957

472-1549 or 1540

Building Permits

Ten building permits for construction
valued at $726,860 were issued by the City
of Sanibel during the week ending August
30. Permits were issued to:

Mariner Properties, Inc. for con-
struction of four duplexes on Causeway
Road, which will be called Harbour Cot-
tages. By Construction Managers, Inc.,
for $560,000.

Harry Bell for a single family house on
Hurricane Lane. By David Herzog for
$27,410.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis for a swimming pool
at 683 Durion Court. By Bahama Pools for
$7,200.

Deiter Seifert for a swimming pool on
Welk Drive. By Bahama Pools for $5,500.

Beachview Country Club for paving. By
Custom Paving for $10,000.

Elizabeth Lombardo for a dwelling in
the Dunes.By Custom Builders for $58,000.

Mariner Properties, Inc. for a spa at
Casa Ybel Resort and Beach Club. By
Aladdin Pools for $7,000.

S & M CARPENTRY, INC.
Complete Home Care

Quality Work • Reasonable Rates

936-1486

SUMMER RATES
PRICESSLASHED

CALL OR WRITE FOR
DETAILS.

CAPE CORAL
RENT-A-CAR.

P.O. BOX 291
CAPE CORAL, FLA.

813-542-2025 DAY OR NIGHT
CALL US FOR SPECIAL RATES ON INS. CLAIMS

ALL CARS START W I T H PULL
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Kiwanis kick off

"Highland Fling'

raffle

A true Scotsman, Scotty Wishart: helps the
Sanibel-Captiva Kiwanis kick off their
"Highland Fling" raffle by placing a plaid
and cairngorm on Bob Shakespere. The
Kiwanis are raffling a one week vacation
for two at Scotland's Loch Rannoch at Mt.
Schiehllion near Glasgow and Perth.
Transportation to and in Scotland is in-
cluded. The drawing for the winner of the
vacation, which was donated to the
Kiwanis by Keith Trowbridge, will be held
on Saturday April 5, 1980. Tickets are $1,
or 6 for $5. Proceeds from the raffle will
fund Island projects.

by mark harmel

rtNK D. JOYC6

Bewon iwuRwa PGMCV INC.
1619 PERIWINKLE WAY /SAN I BEL IS., FL 33957

THE WINE
IS ON US!

Eillliiii
975 RABBIT RD. 472-3128 OPEN 7 DAYS 5-10

Present this ad for complimentary
glass of wine with meal.
(Limit 1 per customer)

1

It would have taken
Hurricane David a
lot of huff ing and
puffing to blow down
this hurricane -proof
mailbox I

photo by mark harmel

NOTICE OF TAX INCREASE

The City of Sanibel proposes to increase
your property taxes by five (5%) per cent
over the certified millage, in addition to a
levy required to prevent impairment of
contract

A public hearing on the increase will be
held on September 12, 1979 at 8:00
o'clock P.M, at MacKenzie Hall, 2245 Palm
Ridge Road, Sanibel, Lee County, Florida.

Warren C. Hyde, City Manager -
City Clerk
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Hurricane

SUCCESS STORIES
RECENTLY, ONE OF OUR CLIENTS REDUCED his
monthly payments from $1,546, to just $901.
Another, from almost $2,900, to $1,812. And a
third from $717, to $246.

CALL
RAYNER&

ASSOCIATES
APPLICATION PHONE 334-8081

2180 FIRST ST. SUITE 203
LICENSED MORTGAGE BROKERS FT. MYERS, FLA.

WE CAN DO
THE SAME
FOR YOU!

from page 2

Special 3.00 REBATE
hudson DURALITE
garden sprayer

YOUR NET
PRICE ONLY-

$ 13
Regular Price 16"
Factory Rebate _ 3 ^
Net price 13M

Here's the easy way to protect your flowers,
vegetables, shrubs and lawn from damaging in-
sects and plant disease. It's the Hudson
Ouralite sprayer. Light, rugged, corrosion-
resistant polyethylene for quality and durability.

Unique MiniMax • nozzle provides broad
coverage with minimum amount of spray. Con-
venient 1-galkm size. Buy now at a special low
price an get a $3.00 factory rebate, too!
special low price and get a $3.00 factory rebate.

RID-A-BUG
CONCENTRATED BUG KILLER

Reg.»4»
NOW

75

clearance
lawn and garden needs

Mowers Electric Nylon Trimmers.. .Pruners
garden hand tools.. .Sprayers. -. .everything

you need to make gardening easy.

ALL DRASTICALLY REDUCED

SAVE $30 on famous Hunter Old Tyme
Ceiling Fans$

GALLON SIZE WITH
SPRAY NO
Reg.*?*
NOW

reg.*229.95
while they last —

$199
• Copper Brown Finish
• Classic Styling
• Four Wood Blades
• Quiet operation

• Large 52" size
• Easily Installed
• 2 speed motor
• Factory Warranted

YOUR COMPLETE AND FRIENDLY HOME SUPPLYCENTER

TIM FISHER HARDWARE
28 San Carlos Blvd - Gulf Points Square

NEXT TO PUBLIX MARKET-482-4011

SUMMER STOREHOURS: MON.-FRIDAY8-5:30 SATURDAY 8:30-4:30

Sansbury said David's impact was not
entirely negative in that it mobilized the
county network for handling emergencies
and proved that the county has an effective
plan and capable people to carry it out.

However, he warned against over
confidence, saying, "I hope the one we got
(David) doesn't make people who have
never been through a hurricane in Florida
think' that is it."

Sansbury said he had been in contact
with Graham twice concerning the
progress of David and when the Gover-
nor's evacuation recommendation was
issued Sunday afternoon, the county was
already in the process of implementing its
plan. Consequently, when Graham's
recommendation was received Sansbury
said he was able to immediately initiate
the evacuation.

A key to the plan was to get the people
into the shelters before nightfall.

"There was no way we would move
people out in the middle of the night,
Sansbury said.

Sansbury was lavish in his praise of all
county elements involved in the operation,
especially the Civil Defense network.

"Our attitude was 'this is what needs
to be done, there's no need for loss of life or
energy if we are properly prepared.'"

Sansbury joined many other county
officials in expressing relief that David
was relatively harmless "compared to
what it could have been."

z
A
M
B
O
A
N
G
A

SHELL
LAMP

$3995

Complete

Just
Add Shells

We Ship
Anywhere

HOME
FURNISHINGS

at Tahitian Garden
Periwinkle Way
10-5Mon.-Sat.
472-4035

HAND CRAFTED GIFTS CRAFT SUPPLIES

HOURS: 10 TO 5 CLOSED SUNDAY

2365 PERIWINKLE WAY. SANIBEL ISLAND

M
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The Beachview Men's Association an-
nounced the the pairing of their first round
of the Summer Championship Tour-
nament.

The two players are responsible for
arranging their match which must be
played between Sept. 8-11:

The first round pairings are: Ray
Mckernen vs. Jim Hermes> Matt Asen vs.
Frank Rosen, Larry Simon vs. Larry
Snell, Larr.y Vantil vs. Ken Preston, Ray
Howland vs. John Forester, Bob Gibson
vs. Hank Groh, Bill Casparis vs. Charlie
Uhr, Bob Robertson vs. Elmo McClintock,
Al Duncan vs. Art Corace, Clay Marsh vs.
Roger Osborn. Roy Hull and Elmer Bailey
both receive byes.

The winners of the weekly Tuesday
tournament at Beachview was the
foresome of Roy Hull, Clay Marsh, Elmo
McClintock and Ed Barone. Saturday's
head to head competition ended in a
sudden death play-off between Elmer
Bailey and Clay Marsh. The play-off was
won by Bailey and finishing third was
Elmo McClintock

NEED $ 10,000
(MORE OR LESS)

WE'LL WORK HARDER THAN ANYBODY IN TOWN TO GET IT FOR YOU.
AND WE DONT REQUIRE EXPENSIVE CREDIT LIFE INSURANCE. WE ARE

NOT A SMALL LOAN COMPANY!

Call: CHARLES LASSETER

RAYNER&
ASSOCIATE*

Application Phone 334-8081
2180 FIRST ST. SUITE 203

LICENSED MORTGAGE BROKERS FT. MYERS, FLA

AREN'T GOING ANYWHERE
THIS MONTH!

SO, IF YOU WANT TO, WE'LL
BE HERE TO HELP YOU.

REMEMBER, OUR SERVICES
COST YOU NOTHING-

2418 Palm
Ridge Road,

Sanibel Island
472-3117

tt*C-»- Eve-Weekends
i n — • " • " • • • 472-1856

"'• FORMERLY Ortoff Travel

SANIBEL STANDARD
AIR CONDITIONING SPECIAL

RICHARD B. FRAZIER CERTIFIED MECHANIC

24 H
ROAD SERVICE

NDITIONIN
SERVICE

ON.-SAT. 8 A.M.-5 P.M.

RENT A CAR
MON.-SAT. 472-1468

Tropical

lowest Prices on
Quality Wicker

for your entire home

FROM BASKETS
TO BEDROOM
ooooooooooo

AFTER YOU HAVE
SHOPPED WICKER YOU

WILL STILL FIND
THE BEST SELECTION
QUALITY & PRICE AT

WICKER WORLD

T*. 332-2254

?|PALRWLCK|R« RATTAN -

R WORLD
2224 McGregor Blvd.

Mon.-Sot.
•9:30-5:30

Ft. Myers

INTERVAL OWNERSHIP —it's the
most vacation for our money.

True — we work hard to earn our vacations and we want the most for our
money. Inflation is making resort rentals just too expensive for a family
— and we simply can't afford the year-round ownership and maintenance
of a vacation home.

So we're here at Plantation Beach Club where interval ownership gives
our family the assurance that we can enjoy leisurely vacations each year,
in comfort and luxury, — all at a one-time cost that's easy to afford.

We love the islands — it's a great place for June and me to relax and there's
so much for the kids to do. Our vacation villa is right on the beach, fully
furnished, complete with linens, all the kitchen utensils, magazfnes,—
you name it. We've got two private bedrooms, two bathrooms and a
screened porch, so there's plenty of room for the kids.

With barbecues and a full kitchen, we fix breakfast, lunch,
snacks and dinners — and save enough money to treat the
whole family to nice restaurants once in a while.

There's also an exchange program — so we can change our
vacation times and visit other resorts, all without paying
rent. We believe Interval Ownership providesthe most
vacation for our money.

PLft]SIWFI0]SI
Visit our furnished model at South Seas Plantation,
on Captiva Island — just drop by the Information
Center next to Chadwick's Restaurant for your
Special Guest Pass. • • . - . - .

CLOB
Our brochure has all the facts — get yours today by
phoning (813) 472-4435, or writing Plantation Beach
Club, P.O. Box 217, Captiva Island, Florida 33924.
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on the
water
bycapt. mikefuery

. • . •

Wade fishing has never been a very
popular method of stalking redfish. snook
or trout, but it is really a pretty effective
way to quietly get within range of even the
most spooky, difficult fish to catch.

About the only time you will see any
anglers using this old method of fishing is
during the winter months when you will
notice people along the Sanibel Causeway.
These hardy souls wade out into 60-degree
water temperatures and work the grass
flats that border the Causeway. You would
he surprised to find how well they do on
trout, redfish and snook.

Occasionally, you will watch fishermen
wading out into the Gulf during the war-
mer months to fish the surf, but these are
people more interested in keeping cool
than catching fish.

Wading for salt water fish takes some
special tactics and if you are used to this
(ype of fishing up north in streams, then
you have what it takes to get into Florida
wade fishing.

Here's a look at some wading spots and
some thoughts on what to watch for in the
way of fish: There are several oyster bars
in Pine Island Sound and down south in

Estero Bay. These make excellent spots
for you. The secret to wading is that you
can quietly move within casting range of
«..-»np very big fish. If you can ease your
boiti up n.t :i!?out two feet of water, anchor
it and carefully walk up to the bar, you can
systematically work the drops near it and
the shallow water over the oysters for fish.
Redfish are very fond of the crabs that
hide in the oyster shell beds and when the
reds are in, wade fishing works wonder.

Get yourself one of those small craft
charts for this area - most marinas have
them - and look for the marked oyster
bars.

If you have fished for snook very much
around Redfish Pass, you possibly have
noticed the guys who wade into the waist-
deep water south of the entrance to South
Seas Plantation and work with plugs for
snook. They usually do fairly well and
once again they prove _that getting quietly
into' the water, close to the fish, works
better than drifting in a boat.

There are severaj^great grass beds
around Pine Island Sound where you can
try your luck for trout while wading.
Actually, about any place near the shore,

which has a couple of feet of water and
grass on the bottom will be a good spot to
try for trout while wading.
Many Causeway waders use the popping
cork and shrimp method for trout flats, but
the red-headed, white body Mirrolure
works fine, too.

I can imagine that there are some who
would like to try wading for fish, either
from their boats or along the flats next to
the shore, but there always seems to be
that gnawing question of, "What's going to
be out there with me?" You could quite
possibly catch a black tip shark along with
your trout. And most any time you can see
a ray or two, but don't let this bother you
too much. I've never seen a ray or a shark
who wanted to stick around long enough to
get stepped on - if they-have a chance to
get away.

Try some wade fishing up around the
outside of Blind Pass, on a falling tide for
snook. Also, just west of the free fishing
pier on Sanibel is a great place for wading
and casting for shook.

Give it a try. It's a relaxing, quiet way to
spend time on the water and often the only
way you can get close to the. big ones.

CHARTERS

'SPORTS FISHING
•SHELLING TRIPS
*DRAG SHELL TRIPS
•SIGHTSEEING
•COMBINATION TRIPS

FULL OR HALF DAY

CALL - 549-5530
BRIDGES CHARTERS

23' MAKOBIMINITOP-S/S RADIO-TACKLE SUPPLIED

A SHELL COLLECTOR'S PARADISE'

Specimen Shells — Florida & Worldwide

P.O. BOX 54
SANIBEL ISLAND. FLA. 33957

2422 PERIWINKLE WAY
PHONE (813) 472-1121

(Financial Planning & Management)

pwidet
—bookkeeping and accounting for shops, motels,

condo associations, partnerships, and corpor-
ations Including

—budget preparation, financial statements and
financial analyses as well as an

—executive tax service a division of

Sanibel Center Building, 1711Periwinkle Way,
P.p. Box 194, Sanibel, Florida 33957

(813)472-1439 Elliot Gelberg .

>s

E> She Sells Sea Shells
^ ^fc mA' "AnOr-oan Rmitinno"

• f
'An Ocean Boutique'

SHELLS, CORALS, CRAFTED ITEMS

WE WILL MAIL YOUR PURCHASE

Tahitian Gardens Shopping Center
Periwinkle W ay 472-3991

Sanibel Marina, Inc.
Boat & Motor Sales & Service

Ships Store
Charter Fishing & Shelling

Boat Rentals
Ramp & Dockage

Diesel - Pre-Mix

Sanibel's Only Deep Water Marina

Periwinkle at N. Yachtsman Dr

~**dj£»V

day
w
Th
F
Sa
Su
M
Tu

Date
•5:

6
7
8
9

10
11

5:14 AM L
12:19 AM H
12:40 AM H
1:06 AM H
1:34 AM H
2:07 AM H
2:43 AM H

AUGUST
*'10:58 AM H

6:07 AM L *
7:00 AM L
7:46AML
8:41 AM L
9:37 AM L

10:39 AM L

6:44 PML
•11:53 AM H
* 12:45 PMH

1:34 PMH
2:30 PMH
3:31 PM H
4:44 PMH

7:19 PML
7:49 PML
8:18 PML
8:46 PML
9:11 PML
9:41 PML

Full

• Denotes strong tides.
Denotes very strong tides

Conversion table: The above tides are for the I ighthouse point of Sanibel only. To
convert for Redfish Pass (north tip of Captiva), add 55 minutes to the time shown for
every hi tide subtract two minutes for every low tide (NO we don't know why, but it
works. Instructions following are even lesssensical but as we stated they do work!)

For Captiva island Gulf side, subtract 30 minutes from each high tide, and sub-
tract hour and 16 minutes for each low tide.

For Captiva Island, Pine Island Sound (Bay) side, add 1 hour and four minutes for
each high tide and add 52 minutes for each low tide. .

In between these point gulf or bay - guesstimate and have good fishing and or
shelling.

Lw
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SUPPORT

YOUR

LOCAL

MERCHANTS

DISCOVER A NEW WAY OF ISLAND LIVING

in

THE

DUNES

tfpss

I II II I I l I \

A GOLF AND COUNTRY CLUB COMMUNITY
WHERE YOU CAN OWN A HOMESITE FOR UNDER

$3,500 DOWN, WITH 80% BANK FINANCING, 10 YEAR TERM

We'll be happy to give you the whole story

INC.
Exclusive Sales Representative

"Obtain the HUD Property Report from
developer and read it before signing
anything. HUD neither approves the
merits of the offering nor the value, if
any, of the property."

Come see our sales representative in the Dunes Country Club (472-3448) or one of our sales offices.
Center Island Office: just East of the bank, 1633 Periwinkle Way, 472-1549
East Office: in the Huxter's Market Plaza, 1207 Periwinkle Way, 472-1566

BAILEY'S GENERAL STORE
Island Shopping Center, corner Periwinkle and Tarpon Bay Roads

KMM
VALUE

OF THE: MONTH

Heavy-Duty
Staple Gun

Drives staples quickly and
efficiently with simple,
one-hand lever operation,
i n s t a l l i n s u l a t i o n ,
upholster your furniture,
repair screened windows
and complete many more
indoor and outdoor protec-
ts. Drives five staple sizes
including Locktile.® Built-
in staple remover.

Quantities Limited

now 5,77
While

Supplies
Last

BAILEY'S
GENERALSTORE

8-8 AAon-Sat. 9-6 Sun.
Groceries - M M * Market • Produce • Hardware • Fishing Tackle

Dry Ooodt • Saorliwew

WITH COTTON
INDIA IMPORTS!
Sundresses

Blouses
Long beach covers

All 100% Cotton

BAILEY'S
'CLOTHING CENTER

Is'tind Shopping Center (Nextlo
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In order to provide transportation in the
event of flooding, boats were placed at the
Bowman Beach Firehouse and in eight
other locations on Sanibel.

Flashlight batteries were in big demand
at Bailey's. Tom Walsh and other
customers kept Edward Witkus busy
refilling the battery rack 15 times as early
as Friday morning. D-size, and lantern

Dr. John Willard decided early that he
was going to stay and bought a pair of
boots to keep dry.

pictures may be worth their weight in gold
in the event a hurricane strikesby pat harmel

In the event one of the burgeoning
storms in the Caribbean Sea turns its
wrath on Lee County, a roll of film may be
your best investment towards future
replacement of valuables lost or
destroyed.

According to Joe Coughlin, special
assistant to Federal Flood Insurance
administrator Richard Krimm,
photographs of your home and belongings
can substantially ease the trauma of
returning home to a home that isn't there
and attempting to file an insurance claim.

"When there's no evidence of what you
had it's nearly an impossible task to
document losses," said Coughlin.
"Receipts and records are usually
destroyed in a hurricane. You should take
a snapshot of the outside of your home and
each room inside. Valuables should be
spread out on a bed or chair and

photographed. Then make sure you TAKE
THE FILM WITH YOU WHEN YOU
EVACUATE OR LOCK IT IN A BANK
VAULT.

Upon returning home Coughlin
recommends extreme caution in digging
through refuse. "The rule of thumb," he
says, "is when in doubt - don't. Turning on
a simple light switch could electrocute you
or set off a gas explosion."

Despite the fact that the Federal
Insurance program has 300,000 enrollees in
the state of Florida, Coughlin says most
claims are settled within 30 days after a
disaster. Problems arise when adjusters
are unable to meet eye to eye on cause of
destruction - wind damage is usually
covered by homeowners' or renters'
policies and water damage is covered by
government flood insurance.

Because of the five day waiting period

for flood insurance to go into effect after
application
Coughlin is afraid that Floridians not now
insured will decide it's too late to insure for
Hurricane David. "That's crazy, "he says.
"David could be stalled off Cuba for two
days and not get here for eight. Even if it
should prove too late for David it's not too
late - or too early - for Frederick or
whatever else might come up before the
mid-October end of the hurricane season."

Coughlin also reminds those already
insured that to increase their coverage
only takes one day. If you call your agent
today your coverage increases tomorrow.

"We hate to see these things coming,"
declared Coughlin. "The potential for
payout is in the billions. But we don't hate
to see them coming nearly as bad as you
do. Remember, you're categorized a 'D'
area - as in dangerous place to be."

' \

H

Islanders

i i

Hurricane hurts holiday bu

While other places of business were money. The threat of David also prompted
running low on masking tape, evacuation- many customers to buy travellers checks
minded customers of The Bank of the and to place files and personal belongings
Islands caused the Bank to run low on in the bank vault..

by gwen Stevenson

Hurricane David has come and gone and
the Islands of Sanibel and Captiva are
resuming normal lifestyles, but his
presence, although not immediately
threatening, did cause a few changes over
the Labor Day holiday.

Although the weekend looked pretty
good from a tourist standpoint last week
the picture changed abruptly when East
coast visitors realized mid-Saturday that
Hurricane David could be headed for their
area. According to Chamber of Commerce
Executive Director Walter Klie, the threat
of an east coast touchdown sent visitors
scrambling for home on the first of the
three day holiday. "It was the worst Labor
Day the Islands have seen," Klie said
yesterday. "That storm really, really
hurt." The disastrous weekend came on
top of a slower-than-usual summer due to
the energy shortage.

Although David's course hurt many
Island businesses, the business of
emergency procedures was carried off
"beautifully," according to Sanibel Mayor
Duane White. "I'm grateful that we didn't
have what we could have had," White
commented when the danger had passed,
"but everyone involved with emergency
procedures did an outstanding job." White
pointed out that there had been three

meetings over t
Emergency Prep*
Relief Team(EPI
data. "Their ol
situation was mo

Hurricane prep
into effect last w
The Sanibel
generators, t,— e
MacKenzie Hall
Chief John Butlei
very impressed \
activities. "Evei
they were suppos
Butler said that
portable broad
emergency instri
transmitted over
based radio stati
White said the or
appeared to be a
Saturday when
Center said that
that the storm <
coast. The Cent«
were caused, ace
erratic movemen
cold front. When
on a northerly <
David's Atlantic
more definite.
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eries were some of the more popular
is as were Coleman stoves and lan-
s. Most food items and water were
table, but wide masking tape and
no was hard to find.

The Captiva office of Priscilla Murphy
Realty prepared for Hurricane David by
taping up the windows and removing
typewriters and records. Barbara Chapin
took her typewriter home where her
hurricane preparations started anew.

Harry Ross wasn't among the crowd that packed the lumber
yards for plywood. Ross fit his Seagrape Lane house with
shutters in 1974. "We have been prepared,"said his
wife Isabella. They planned to leave for Sebring Saturday
afternoon.

David:

for the worst

photos by mark harmel

realtors & developers batten down early
bypatharm*!

Sanibel realtors began battening down
the hatches! and readying resort visitors
for possible evacuation last Friday as
Hurricane David continued wending his
way in a northwesterly direction.

Sanibel Realty president Burt Jenks met
early Friday morning with his staff for an
evacuation procedures briefing. Jenks, a
retired Air Force pilot with flight ex-
perience in typhoons, urged his employees
to carry life preservers with them in the
event of evacuation. "I read somewhere,"
said Jenks, "that 9 out of 10 hurricane
deaths are the result of drowning. I'm
more concerned with preventing
drownings than I am with boarding up
windows...We'll be leaving long before the
storm gets here."

The Sanibel Realty office was busily
identifying records and documents Friday
to be removed from the Island during an
evacuation while staff members at

Vacation and Investment Properties,
(VIP) were already in the process of
moving theirs to Cypress Square.

Bob Rauschenberger of VIP (who
manage Casa Yfoel and South Seas
Plantation among others) labeled the
company's hurricane preparedness, "a
finely tuned operation."According to
Rauschenberger, all company manpower
had been marshalled to implement the
operation and everyone had been given an
assignment. "We can't depend on someone
else because people panic," he said.
"Everyone involved, both staff and
visitors, have been told we have a plan.
We're watching the situation on an hourly
basis. We want to be a day ahead of the
storm instead of a day behind."

By last Friday VIP had already stocked
their resorts with plywood for boarding up
windows and safety supplies in the event
David turned his fury on the barrier

islands. "We're ready," said Roschen-
berger, "But we're keeping our fingers
crossed."

Realtors in charge of maintaining island
homes while the tenants where elsewhere
were busily taping or boarding up windows
while David was still 1000 miles from South
Florida. Hurricane shutters were lifted
into place and water and electricity were
being shutdown in vacant homes.

Captran, developer of several interval
ownership resorts on the islands, handed
put assignments to employees and drafted
a letter to visitors explaining evacuation
routes and safety measures. All resorts
said they were prepared to help visitors
without transportation leave the area.

Friday at 11 a.m. the Periwinkle Trailer
Park reported 10 cancellations' and the
Chamber of Commerce noted a
"slackening off" in visitors.
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Last Friday, City Hall staffers removed
irreplaceable files to the Bank of the
Islands vault and City Hall windows were
taped, as were many other establish-
ments,

Butler said that many Islanders had
offered help in the way of chain saws and
equipment. One construction project
supervisor had volunteered the use of
heavy machinery that he had on his Island
job site. Extra issues of the ISLANDER
and Island Reporter Hurricane sup-
plements were distributed by New-Press
carrier Hap Payne and WBBH weather-
man Bill Zeliff was very cooperative and
helpful, according to Butler. White said
that a member of the Police department
attended all of the twice-a-day briefings
held in the Lee County Disaster
Preparedness office in Fort Myers and
reports were regularly relayed to Sanibel
officials and EPERT team members on
Sanibel during the hours before the
hurricane veared north and east.

"I really want to express my thanks to
everyone on the EPERT team," White
said. "Their control of the situation, their
dedication and the time they took to attend
meetings over the weekend was most
impressive." -

A serious EPERT team met Saturday
morning to review evacuation plans.



14 Tnesday, September 4, W9 The ISLANDER

A Brilliant Reason for

V **»•;

French Leaded Crystal and Oneida Stainless Tableware

FREE!
Take your choice of any set of .two pieces of fine
French Leaded Crystal or a five piece place setting
of famous Oneida Stainless Steel tableware when
you open a new savings account for $50 . . . or
add $50 to an existing savings account. (One free
pair or set per family, please.)

After your initial deposit (or account addition),
you can purchase additional pairs of tumblers at
$5.75 and stemware at $6.75 every time you deposit
$50. There is no limit. If you deposit $100, you can
purchase two pairs and so on.
If you prefer, you can build up your Oneida table
settings the same way. For each additional $50

deposit, you can buy additional settings at
tremendous savings.
Elegant 24% lead French crystal. Exceptionally
clear and brilliant to the eye . . . rings to the touch.
Imported from France, it rivals the finest crystal
made anywhere.

Oneida, one of the leading names in tableware.
The exclusive Brookwood pattern will add a grace
and charm to any table.
Visit any of our 14 offices and see the display
You can't believe this offer until you see it for
yourself.

What a brilliant reason for saving at The FIRST!

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND LOAN ASSOCIATION
OF FORT MYERS, FLORIDA

Sooner or later we're going to be YOUR Savings & Loan.
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PORTRAIT

Barbara Hill

Age: 37

Height:5'6"

Last Book Read:
"Walk Across America'

Pleasures: "My work

is my pleasure really, .
but I enjoy racquetball
from time to time.
I enjoy being with
my friends and
family tremendously
and I like to party."

Mentor "As far as my
work is
concerned
it would have
to be my
instructor
Gynthia
Bringlefrom
the Penland
School in

North
Carolina."

Wish:"I wish for Sanibel to become as well
known for its artists and craftsmen as it is for its shells."

Words of Wisdom: "I like what Picasso said; 'Every child is an artist. The problem
is how to remain an artist once he grows up.'"

Barbara Hill, former Brooklynite and
New Englander, ex-fashion illustrator,
model, and executive secretary, has
successfully bridged the eternal gap
between mother-wife-homemaker and

. a r t i s t . ' ' '. . ..'..-• ;•;, . . • .•••/.• •.•:

For Barbara, a lifelong interest in art
and the confines of Housewifedom came to
a head ten years ago, culminating in her
return to school where she enrolled in
sculpture and pottery classes. Clay, in all
its elements, both creative and technical,
soon became a directive force in her life; a
force that miraculously did not conflict
with her domestic identity but indeed
seemed to compliment it. "Having trained
myself as a craftsman," says Barbara,
"added an extra dimension to my
homelife. I enjoyed the children more
because I didn't feel deprived of a career: I
could spend a lot of time in my studio AND
a lot of time with my children without ever I
leaving home." . . . ' * . I

These days Barbara's daytime hours are
spent doing personal work in the two-room
studio in her Dunes home. Nightime hours
four nights a week (except in the summer)
are spent in the studio also, but as in-
structor. She is not a subscriber to the
"Suffering Artist" school of thought,

preferring instead to employ all that
technology has to offer the working world
of clay. The five pottery wheels in her
studio run on electricity as does her kiln.
She orders clay ready mixed from a
distributor by the ton. "Instructors," she
says, "who insist on students digging their

own clay, using kick wheels, and wood
burning their pottery are trying to make
the point, 'Look, this is hard.' But it's
really not necessary because this really IS
hard!"

Despite evidence to the fact that Bar-
bara is a highly respected artist and
commercially successful craftsman she

I quietly demures. "I feel like I'm a craf-
tsman," she says modestly. "It's for
someone else to say whether or not I'm an
artist." When pressed for a distinction-
between the two she declares however that
the differences are actually nonexistent to
her way of thinking. "In pottery," she
maintains, "craftsmen are artists working
in clay. To be a good craftsman you have
to be a good artist and to be a good artist
you have to be a good craftsman!" Bar-
bara is obviously both - an artist whose
work is solicited for invitational shows,
who also serves as area director of the
Florida Craftsmen organization and a
commercially successful craftsman whose
work is purchased by galleries in Maples
and Miami and Burdines department
stores, among others.

Her three children (Kevin 17, Kristina 16,
Sam 14) have chosen not to follow in their
mother's silty footsteps. "Children," she
believes, "want instant gratification. They
want to sit down at the wheel and make a

photos by mark hartnsi

pot and it's just not that simple. From time
to time my kids have worked on hand
building pots but they take it for granted
that I'll be around to teach them the rest if
they ever want to learn." Because of the
discipline and committment needed to
master the pottery trade, Barbara takes
no students under the age of 14. "It was a
real struggle for me to learn," she says
now. "It's a hard thing to do. Being a
potter - if you can get through the
technicalities and basic skills - is one of the
most satisfying careers I can think of, but
it all depends on how hard you're willing to
work."

Most of Barbara's 100 students have
gotten involved with clay, she says, for the
same reason she did - diversion. Despite
the hard work however, many find it ad-
dictive. "Once students get really involved
and succeed in selling some of their work
they can easily become pros," she says,
"It's a challenge. It's creative. I don't
know any potters who hate what they do."
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shelling tips
bycapt. mikefuery

This week I wanted to talk about several
items related to shelling and probably the
most important is this business of finding
"collector" shells.

There are all levels of shellers and they
have their individual expectations for
shells. Some will never be happy with
what is found on Sanibel and Captiva
Islands and others will be thrilled and have
trophies forever. It's a matter of what you
personnally believe is valuable.

So often, when I take groups out for a
morning or afternoon of shelling, I find,
there is always one who expects to find a
shell most of us only dream of. The
junonia is an example. As many years as I
have shelled, I know that it's an accident to
find a junonia on the beach. You don't just
go out and stumble over one.

Someone the other day remarked that
shelling for "collector" shells is a kind of
looking for gold. It's a chance and that's

the same chance you will take while
walking the beaches while you are here.

There's not a reputable shelling guide I
know who would guarantee that you get
any particular shell. How could we? What
that family of shells does is a mystery and
if they show up on the beach when we are
there, well fine, but it's up to the shell.

What I'm getting at is for you not to give
up your search for shells. I've seen so
many people come to Sanibel and Captiva
Islands, walk the beaches for an hour and
announce that the Islands are all "shelled
out". Nonsense!

Check with those who have good shell
collections and you'll find that they have
shelled for years to build up the variety of
species they possess. One trip to Sanibel or
Captiva or even the upper islands isn't
going to do it. (You can use this as
leverage for another trip to our shores, of
course, but that's the story.)

the Unusual Deli
home of

Dear Friends,
No, it's not too early to start planning your holiday schedule for en-

tertaining, especially if it Is to be a large event I
We can offer:

* COMPLETE MENU PLANNING (including international specialties such
as Hawaiian, Hungarian, Greek).

* PARTY RENTAL CENTER all items that make a party special and easy
from silver to disposables, from linens to fountains.

* COOPERATION with sources for liquor, flowers, entertainment and
photography as well as printing and any other needs.

* LOCATIONS as an off premises caterer we are equipped to work any-
where (and we have, from beaches to yachts to breakfast in bed).

* INSTANT PARTIES from our always in stock selection of hors d'euvres,
main courses and deserts.

MOREI Just call for an appointment to discuss your needs. We have 24
hour phone service and will return your call as soon as possible.

J | WE'LL CATER 936-6003

One fallacy we often encounter is the "I
want a big shell". Large-for-large-sake
shells have to be the pinnacle of bad taste
in the best shell collections, but there is
never a shortage of folks who demand they
find a "big shell".

The finest shell displays rarely have
shells over three or four inches in size. The
smaller shells have the best colors and the
best designs.

When you see someone carefully
examining a small mound of shells, you
can bet they are looking for the little gifts
from the sea that are so valued by
collectors.

In short, don't make one trip to the beach
and expect to find all the good shells that
you want. It takes many excursions. ~^d
it takes patience and it takes persists ._>.
Your first assignment when shelling is to
know what to look for. and then get out
there and pound the sand for the shells.

As you perhaps know, or have read, the
Islands of Sanibel and Captiva are the best
for shells in the United States. The shells
are out there so keep at it and don't give
up; you'll find the best sooner or later.

(Mike Fuery offers shelling and fishing
trips daily from Tween Waters Marina,
Captiva Island. Call Mike at 472-5161 for
information.)

5605 S. Tamiami Trail - Dragon Plaza
YOUR PARTY! I

Seiectechasoneof:
BEST Restaurants FLORIDA!

Harbor House
SANIBEL ISLAND'S

First and Finest

SEAFOOD Restaurant]

Dinner Hours
5:00-9:00

Lauded in:
NEW YORK TIMES-CHICAGO TRIBUNE

WASHINGTONIAN MAGAZINE - MIAMI HERALD
CHICAGO SUN TIMES - NATIONAL OBSERVER

JACKSONVILLE TIMES - UNION and JOURNAL
CINCINNATI MAGAZINE - ATLANTA JOURNAL

,1244 Periwinkle Way CLOSED SUNDAY
472-1245

coconut restaurant &
cocktail lounge

21 years of fine food & fine service

SEAFOOD
SPECIALISTS

Local & International Dishes

Luncheon & Dinner Specials

Salad Bar

full menu and cocktails available

Located in the Island Shopping Center
/ . . . . . . .

Xomer of Periwinkle Way & Tarpon Bay Road

472-1366
open every day 11 am - 10 pm
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Bernie Winslow
hooks 23 Ib. redfish

Bernie Winslow was fishing for snook in
the surf across from 'Tween Waters
Marina, where he works, last Monday
night when he hooked on to a 23 pound
redfish. Because of the darkness Winslow
didn't know what-he had caught. Rut."I
was real happy to get him,"said Winslow.

by mark harmel

r CAPTIVA EROSION
DISTRICT WILL HOLD THEIR
MEETINGS ON THE FIRST MONDAY
OF EACH MONTH, STARTING AT
3:30 P.M. AT CAPTIVA COM-
MUNITY CENTER.

DAN BURNER
CHAIRMAN

Island
Gifts

Shells
T-Shirts

Gifts
9 - 5:30 Mon. - Sat.

Sometimes on Sunday

Island

American & Foreign
Car Repair

24 HOUR WRECKER SERVICE

8 - 5 Mon. - S a t .

1609 Periwinkle Way
Sanibel

(813) 472-4318

REALTOR

Ray Hoxsey Realty of the islands Inc., Realtor,

2353 Periwinkle Way 472-1546

COMPASS POINTE
The only Gulf-front condominium with an
attached Cabana. PLUS, the lowest price at
$164,000.00.

POINTE SANTO
You will never get a two-bedroom, two-bath
condominium at beautiful Pointe Santo at a
better price than this! Just $120,000.00 with
a lovely view of the inner court and the Gulf.

SPANISH CAY
First floor unit immaculately clean. Never
rented and in one of the quieter, smaller
condominium communities on Sanibel.
$53,900.00 U.F. Furniture negotiable.

THE DUNES SUBDIVISION
An over-sized lot in this lovely subdivision.
Where else can you have golf and tennis
available when you purchase a lot with all
utilities at $17,500.00?

CAPTIVA HOME
Captiva beach-front home. $325,000.00.

VACANT LOTS
Two lovely lots, 112' x 250' on very wide
canal. Just three minutes from Blind Pass.
Prices: $40,000 and $44,0Q0.

If there was ever a time in your life not
to compromise, it's now. \burnew

home is something you'll be
living with and in for years to
come. So you want everything right.

All the big things and all the little details
that are just as important.

Since 1953, Rutenberg has built over
11,000 homes in Florida with just that attitude,

Certainly, you can buy a less expensive home.
But then you'll be sacrificing the benefits of

quality, style, value, leadership and stability that
make Rutenberg homes superior.

standard
of style, quality
? right. V •' - J . •*

and value

Build on your lot or choose a site from
Rutenberg"s large inventory of lots

in prestige neighborhoods
throughout the Ft.Myers Area.
And to put your own personality

into your new home, Rutenberg designers
will customize any pf our distinctive

copyrighted floor plans to your taste.
Before you make that all important decision on a

new home, you owe it to yourself to visit the
nearest Rutenberg model center.

Rutenberg Model Centers are located at:
3629 Del Prado Boulevard - Cape Coral 549-0164

5771 Reims Place- Fort Myers 481-1221

Rutenberg
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community calendar
Island Lions attend

regional meeting

Lions of Southwest Florida met for a one
day session on August 26 at Riverdale High
School in East Fort Myers. Lions Dee
Amon, who is Deputy District Governor
for the local area, and D. E. Cooperrider
attended.

Reports of activities and goals for the
coming year were discussed. The Florida
Lions Eye Bank reported that they have
furnished tissue for 44 corneal transplants
so far this year. The local club just con-
tributed over $49,000 to its operation last
•year, with 78 percent of the Florida clubs
participating. Nineteen blind or visually
handicapped persons in Florida have
received Leader Dogs up to the present
time. Two additional dogs are currently in
training.

The Lions of Sarasota are in the process
of setting up a Hearing Foundation and
Ear Bank to assist hard-of-hearing and
deaf persons in a manner similar to the
long-standing, familiar Eye Bank.

Kiwanis officers to be installed

The new officers of the Sanibel-Captiva
Kiwanis Club will be installed at a banquet
to be held Friday, September 21 at Sundial,
beinning at 6:30 p.m.

Robert L. Sharkespeare^ current
President, will turn the gavel over to Curt
Keinhardt. who succeeds him for the next

Refuge offers tours

The J.N. "Ding" Darling National
Wildlife Refuge is offering two weekly
tours: a wildlife drive tour Thursday at 8
a.m. which leaves from the entrance on
Sanibel-Captiva Road and a canoe trail
which leaves from Tarpon Bay Fridays at
8 a.m. There is a limit of 10 canoes per
lour and participants must furnish their
own boats.

This schedule will remain in effect from
September 1 through December 1. For
more information, call 472-1100 between
7:30 a.m. and 4 p.m.

Lee County Alliance

of the Arts

sponsors show

The Lee County Alliance of the Arts is
sponsoring a Winner's Show which will be
held at the Art Center, 5111 McGregor
Blvd., October 7 through October 31.

Any Lee County resident may par-
ticipate provided their work of art has
been awarded first, second, third, Best .of
Show or Judge's Choice in a juried show.

Enries should be submitted on Friday,
October 5 between 9 a.m. and noon at the
Art Center. Proof of award must ac-
company entry.

Additional details may be-H)btained by
calling 939-2787 or 542-2233.

season.
Tickets are $25 per.couple; Kiwanians

arc urged to make their reservations
early

o

SUPER SPECIALS
Mon. thru Fri.

Prime Rib $5.95
Egg Plant or Veal Parmesan

with Spaghetti $525

Beef Stroganoff $4.95

Fried Frog Legs $4.95

Vi Broiled Chicken $4.25
Fried Scallops $425

5 oz. Petite Hlet $650

Includes House Salad-Choice of Potato
Bread & Butter—Coffee or Tea

Plus our regular menu

Open for Dinner 5PM till Midnight
Lounge opens at 4 Mon. - Sat.

Closed Sun.

ENTERTAINMENT NIGHTLY
across from Sanibel Seafood

next to 7-11
472-3161 "

2163 Periwinkle Way, Sanibel

THE FINEST FISH HOUSE
IN SOUTHWEST FLORIDA

TRY OUR FAMOUS SHORE DINNER

BEERS AND WINES SERVED
DAILY 5:00TO9:30

Phone 472-5276

Christian Women's Club
The Sanibel-Captiva Christian Women's

Club will have a Day of Inspiration at the
Sanibel Community Association on Sep-
tember 13.

Registration will begin at 9:15 a.m. and
is $2. Please bring a bag lunch - beverage
is provided.

This event is open to the public. For
details and reservations, please contact
Diane Goode, 472-4673 or Ruth Rau, 472-
1218.

Temporary workers

needed by VS. Census Bureau
The United States Census Bureau has

issued another call for all Lee County
residents to apply for temporary jobs that
are now available. The work involves
compiling lists of addresses in the county
for use during the 1980 census.

Temporary census workers usually
work for three to four weeks each and will
be paid on a per-address collected basis.
For an eight-hour day, the average worker
will earn $27 to $30 per day plus 18% cents
per mile for any driving done in a private
vehicle. Applicants for the jobs must be 18
years old, U.S. citizens and pass a written
test.

The work involves driving or walking to
compile lists of addresses of each dwelling
unit in designated areas of the county.
These address lists will play a vital role in
taking the 1980 census. They will be used to
produce mailing labels for the census
questionnaires that will be sent out March
28,1980 to every American household.

County residents interested in applying
for the temporary jobs should contact their
nearest State Employment Office.

Best Restaurant on Sanibel?
Ask a friendly native!

• i-resn Grouper Daily
• Gulf Shrimp.. . right

off the shrimp boat
• U.S.D.A. Choice Iowa

Grain Fed Beef
• Warm, Friendly People

and Atmosphere

V-t-

5:00 to 9:30 Dolly — Children's Menu
^ ^ 1223 Periwinkle
*«* Sonibet

Island Pizza
Our dough is made fresh daily

ITALIAN SUBS
I ' /?A

BF» -.*. ,NV J G O

EAT IN OR TAKE OUT

472-1581 or 472-1582
7 Days 11 A.M. • 11 P.M. 1630 A. Periwinkle Way

w
I

i CAPTIVA ISLAND m
NOW OPEN MON.-SAT. 9 AM-9 PM i$

S EXCEPT SUN. 10 AM-2PM 472-2374 if
Captives Road & Andy Rosse Lane
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Hotline will aid parents

of handicapped children
by betty Johnston

An innovative concept called Hotline will
soon be in effect to enable parents of
mentally and physically handicapped
children to communicate with each other
about solutions to the practical and
emotional problems involved in raising
their children.

Created by IMPACT for Developmental
Education, Inc., a private, non-profit
organization based in Fort Myers, the
Hotline is expected to do much to ease the
trauma experienced by parents who
mddenly learn that they have given birth
to a handicapped child. IMPACT is funded
through donations and some Federal
money.

"Our organization is devoted to helping
children up to age five," said Donna J.
Tomlinson, IMPACT'S Executive
Director, "for these are their formative
years emotionally and these are the years
in which we hope to help them and their

families provide the necessary support to
enable these children to function in as
normal an atmosphere as possible once
they enter school."

IMPACT works closely with the schools
and/day care centers as well as its
Advisory Committee of four pediatricians
to help the children live as normally as
possible without the stigma of a
derogatory label.

They feel that their program has been
gratifyingly successful and that the 66
children whom they have helped to date
have greatly enhanced their chances to
maximize their potential once they enter
the school system.

IMPACT is launching a campaign in the
Fort Myers area to raise the $15,000 needed
for operating expenses until the Federal
funds are forthcoming in the Fall. IM-
PACT is located at the YMCA, 3775 Evans
Avenue.

Christopher Orick has been a client of gating >*«*y *• attend presciool.
Impact for 1% years. Born with cerebral Christopher is the three year old son of Bob
palsy, one year ago Christopher could not a n d V e r l a O r i c k o f I o n a -
sit up, but he is now learning to walk and photo by mark harmel

re

1270 ESTERO BOULEVARD
FORT MYERS BEACH, FLORIDA
RESERVATIONS CALL 463-9551

BREAKFAST 7 A.M. — 11 A.M.
LUNCH 11 A.M. — 3:30 f.M.
DINNER 5 P.M.— 10:00 P.M.

COCKTAILS
LUNCH -r . DINNER — SPECIALS

FRESH LOCAL FISH • STEAKS
VEAL • • DUCKLING • BBQ RIBS

GOURMET SOUP

This weekend and every weekend

JUMBO ALASKAN
KING CRAB LEGS

Plus

The Largest Selection of
Fresh Fish on Sanibel

975 RABBIT RD. 472-3128 OPEN 7 DAYS 5-10

VISA
FULL LIQUOR LICENSE

Guitar / Vocals

Entertains Nightly
Tuesday thru Sunday

8 to Midnight
Easy listening and Dancing

People come thousands
of miles to dine here.
How about you?

You're only a few minutes from one of the finest
restaurants in Florida.

That's not just our opinion either. Chadwicks
has been named one of Florida's top 100 restaurants by
several leading publications.

Chadwick's is an important part of one of the major
resorts on the Gulf Coast and the entire U.S. Award-winning
South Seas Plantation.

And very simply, if we're going to get people to
return to our resort again and again, we have to offer
outstanding food.

That's why Chadwick's is so special. The cuisine,
the atmosphere, the service are unsurpassed anywhere on
Sanibel or Captiva.

Best of all, Chadwick's is open to one and all. On
the tip of Captiva, at the entrance to the Plantation.
Lunch 11:30 to 2:00 Monday thru Saturday.
Dinner 5:30 to 10:00 daily. Entertainment and
dancing nightly till 1 a.m.

Won't you join us soon? You'retoo close
not to take advantage of us often.

COCONUT CRAB CLAWS
Serves 6
25 pieces Snow Crab Claws
11b. Flour
2 bottles Beer •
Vz teaspoon Paprika
1 teaspoon Baking powder
Vz cup Shredded coconut

Combine flour.- paprika, baking powder and
coconut with beer. Stir until smooth and medium
thick. Dust Crab Claws in excess flour. Dip in
batter, then deep fry at 365 degrees for seven
minutes. Serve with cocktail sauce.

On the tip of Captiva Island
at the entrance to
South Seas Plantation.

No reservations required.
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CALEK ;

activities
BINGO MUREX — American Legion Home, Thursday, 8:00

p.m. No minors. Sanibel-Gaptiva Road, 472-9979.
BIRD TOURS - Griffing Bancroft, 472-1447; George

Weymouth, 472- 15TA; Dick Frieman, 472-1315.
FISHING GUIDES FOR CHARTER - Capt. Ted Cote, 472-2723;

Capt. Doug Fischer, 472-1551; Capt. Baughn Halloway, 472-
2802; Capt. Belton Johnson, 472-1122; Capt. Duke Sells, 472-
1784; Capt. John Johnson, 472-1020; Capt. Bob Sabatino, 472-
1784; Esperanza Woodring, 472-1126; Capt. Chic Kennedy,
472-4087; Capt. Herb Purdy, 472-1849; Capt. Jerry Way, 472-
1784 or 472-1007; Capt. Butch CottrjII 472-2917; Capt. Alex
Payne, 472-2913, Tarpon Bay Marina. Fishing, shelling, sight-
seeing, trips to Cabbage Key.

FISHING GUIDE — Bud Dawson (283-0775) Special Pirate
Cruise, Sightseeing, Nature Field Trips, Historical Trips,
Audobon and Photo Tours.

ELLIE MY'SMUSEUM - By appointment, Call 472-2121.
NATIONAL HISTORY FIELD TRIPS - to Sanibel's wildlife

habitats — for reservations, information, times and fees> call
472-2180, with naturalist, George Cambell.

SAILING — (lessons and - or charter) — Southwind, 472-
2531; Paul Taylor, 472-1551; Chic Kennedy, 472-4087; Mike
Fuery, 'Tween Waters, 472-5161; Ft. Myers Yacht Charters,
Roger Nodruff, 463-2320, Twin Palms Marina; Papa Nui, 332-
1200;Off Shore Sailing School, S.S.P., 472-1551, ext. 4141.
Capt. Hugh Alexander, Island Boat Rentals, 472-2228.

SIGHTSEEING TOURS — Herb Purdy, 472-1849; Tarpon Bay
Marina (canoes) 472-1323; Capt. Chic Kennedy, 472-4087;
Capt. Herby Purdy, 472-1849; Mike Fuery 472-1784; Jerry
Way, 472-1784; Capt. Hugh Alexander, Island Boat Rentals,
472-2228.

TENNIS & TACKLE EQUIPMENT (RENTAL) - The Reel Eel,
472-2674.

OFF ISLAND DAY TIME ATTRACTIONS - Edison Home in
Fort Myers, 334-1280; Shell Factory, U.S. 41 North Fort
Myers; Jungle Cruises, 334-7474, Fort Myers Yacht Basin;
Waltzing Waters, 283-0636, Pine Island Road,

Macrame, Weaving^ vCrewejv Needlepoint, Knitting, or
Crocheting lessons IDLE HOURS, 31 Periwinkle Place. By ap-
pointment only, 472-1039.

DUNES TENNIS RACQUET CLUB. Full racquet facilities. 472-
3522.

THE SANIBEL-CAPTIVA CONSERVATION CENTER is now open
from 9-5 daily except Sunday. Exhibits and nature trails.
Members free. Nominal charge to visitors.

SANIBEL-CWTIVA GYMNASTICS PROGRAM — Gymnastics
and ballet classes for children and teens. Beginning, in-

termediate and advanced gym. Sat 9-12 a.m. Beginning
ballet, Friday 3-4 p.m. Adult Ballet exercise, Weds. 8:30-9:30
a.m. Call Lisa 472-5683 Evenings.

BOATS (FISHING) TO RENT - Blind Pass Marina, 472-1020;
'Tween Waters Marina, 472-5161; Tarpon Bay (canoes) 472-
1323.

BOATS (SAIL) TO RENT — Southwind, Inc. 472-2531, Island
Boat Rentals, 472-2228, Capt. Hugh Alexander.

MOTORCYCLE RENTALS.— Sanibel Motorcycle Rentals, 1203
Periwinkle-472-2001.

BICYCLES FOR RENT — Hines Rental, 472-2847, or check the
motel you are staying in.

POWER BOAT RENTALS r - . 15' to 18'. 50 to 85 h.p, Capt. Win
ancCapt. FredComlossy Southwinds, Inc. 472-2531.

SAILING — (lessons and - or charter ) — Southw'md, 472-
2531, Capt. Win and Capt. Fred Comlossy; Chic Kennedy, 472-
4087; Mike Fuery,'Tween Waters, 472-5161; Ft. Myers Yacht
Charters, Roger Nodruff, 463-2320, Twin Palms Marina;
Papa Nui, 332-1200; Off-Shore Sailing School, S.S.P., 472-1551,
ext. 4141.

church
ST. MICHAEL AND ALL ANGELS

EPISCOPAL CHURCH
The Rve. James D.B. Hubbs, Rector
Larry Brunke, Organist-Choirmaster

SUNDAY:
Holy Eucharist, Rite I 7:30 a.m.
Holy Eucharist, or morning prayer

and church school 9:30 a.m.
WEDNESDAY:
Holy Eucharist 9:00 a.m.

ST. ISABEL'S CATHOLIC CHURCH
Father Gerald Beauregard, Pastor

Sunday Mass 8:30 and 10:00 a.m.
Saturday Evening Mass 5:30 p.m.
Daily Mass . . . . . . ; . . . ' . 5:30 p.m.
Vigil Mass preceding Holy Day 5:30 p.m.
Holy Day Mass . 10:00 a.m. and 5:30 p.m.
Confessions Before each Mass and at 3:30 p.m. Saturday

COMMUNITY CHURCH
The Rev. Bruce E. Milligan, Pastor

Worship Service ,.'.' 10 a.m.
Church School Classes 10 a.m.
Nursery through second grade 10 a.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Pastor, Jamie Stilson

SUNDAY SERVICE:
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00a.m.
Evening Services . . . . : 7:00 p.m.
WEDNESDAY EVENING: ;
Prayer Meeting .'. 7:00 p.m.

clubs & civic groups
SANIBEL-CAPTIVA LIONS CLUB meets on the first and third

Wednesdays at the Sanibel Community Center.
SANIBEL-CAPTIVA BOY SCOUTS - meet at Sanibel Elemen-

tary School every Tuesday at 7 p.m. Visiting Scouts are
welcome. • .

AMERICAN LEGION POST NO. 123
Meetings secondTuesday of the month •; 8:00 p.m.
Open: Monday-Friday.. 3 p.m.-10 p.m.
Saturday 3 p.m.-i2 p.m.
Sunday . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12 p.m.10 p.m.
Bingo Thursday . . 8 p.m.

SANIBEL COMMUNITY ASSOCIATION, INC. — Sanibel Com-
munityHouse, 1st Tuesdays, 6:30 p.m.

SANIBEL-CAPTIVA KIWANIS — Top O Mast I I , Breakfast
Meeting each Wednesday, 7:30 a.m.

AMERICAN BUSINESS WOMEN'S ASSOCIATION. Regular
meeting the second Thursday of every month at 6:30 p.m.
Call BetteParke 472-2946 for location.

CHIRSTIAN SCIENCE SERVICES
Phone 472-4449

Sunday 11 a.m. at the Sanibel Library
Wednesday 8 p.m. at the Sanibel Librarv

CAPTIVA CHAPEL-BY-THE-SEA
Services wil l resume in mid November

SANIBEL CONGREGATIONAL
UNITED CHURCH OF CHRIST

Rev. Dr. James W. Lenhart, Minister
472-5290

Sunday Worship at
The Dunes Golf & Country Club Clubroom 10:30 a.m

JEWISH COMMUNITY CENTER
of Lee County

915 SE 47th Terrace, Cape Coral, Fla.
Rabbi: Samuel Silver, D.D.

549-1967
Friday evening . > , . 8:00 p.m.
Saturday Service 10:00a.m.

GREEK ORTHODOX CHURCH
The Rev. Fr. Arthur Kontinos

Cypress Lake Drive - 482-2099
Orthos . . . 9:30a.m.
Divine Liturgy 10:00 a.m.

SEVENTH-DAY ADVENTIST CHURCH
Fort Myers - 2663 Second Street

Fort Myers Shores • Highway 80, East of Fort Myers -
Pastor: Philip A. Parker

936-0775
Saturday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sabbath School .-. 9:30 a.m.
Evening Vespers One hour before Sunset - Saturday
Prayer Meeting Wednesday, 7:30 p.m.

Palmett
Federal V _ B B - B
Savings and L ^ A S I W T

• FORT MYERS OFFICE •
8800 South Tamiami Trail
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA

939-0221

CAPE CORAL LEGAL CLINIC
*W!LLS (SIMPLE) $20.00... 2 for $35.00
•DIVORCES (U NCONTESTED) $100.00
*REAL ESTATE CLOSINGS : . . . , . from $100.00
•LANDLORD — TENANT CONSULTATION
*COURT COSTS IF NECESSARY ARE ADDITIONAL

Many Other Legal Services Available
Based On Prices You Can Afford.

James M. Jerrell, Attorney
*Sat. and Evening By Appt. Only 5 4 9 - 5 3 1 1

• , 1411 S.E. 47 th TERR.
<bik*a,,of CAPE CORAL, FL. 3 3 9 0 4

BigJohiis.

Off lCI HOURS: MON.-FRI. 9 A.M..5 P.M. NO APPT. NICISSARY
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SOUTH FORT MYERS

-Phone: 481-3603
Hours: 9-5 Daily and

9-3 Saturdays

INC

GULF POINT'S SQUARE
"Behind Miner's Rare"

Sale - Fashion Frames
Choose from such famous names

as Norell...Diane Von Furstenberg
Ralph Lauren...Optique Du Mode...

and many others

25%

SEE US FOR RLL YOUR OPTICRL NEEDS.

PRESCRIPTION EYEGLASSES

FASHION SUNGLASSES

REPAIRS ON FRAMES

LENSES REPLACED

Nancy Fullenkamp -Tarri Smith Optical Stylists

VISA and MASTERCHARGE Accepted

514 % INTEREST
per annum, compounded daily, on all
passbook savings beginning July 1st. An
annual yield of 5.65%. Earn from day of
deposit to day of withdrawal.

MINIMUM
balance requirement for all Palmetto
Federal Savings Certificates, except six-
month "Money Market" Certificates, ef-
fective July 1st. Now higher earnings for a
lower balance.

"PFS" CERTIFICATE
Our new Palmetto Federal "SECURITY"
Certificate is for a four-year term, $500
minimum. The monthly rate quote is based
on U.S. Treasury securities and will be
determined and announced by the
Treasury Dept. This new high yield cer-
tificate available July 1st.

MONTHLY INTEREST
on-"MONEY-MARKET" Certificates. We
will mail you a monthly check or transfer
your interest to your daily interest bearing
savings account where it is always im-
mediately available.

Federal regulations impose a substantial penalty for
early withdrawal on any certificate.

FSLICPalmetto
Federal
S a v i n g s and Loan Association

FORT MYERS OFFICE
8800 South Tamiami Trail
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA

939-0221

Glass Doors & Windows need help —
our Security Shutters provide it!

PolLaway
^ • • % SECURITYSHUTTERS# i

• Controls light
• Controls heat & noise
• Gives Security & Protection
• Hurricane and

Storm protection
• Conserves Energy

CALL
481-4180
FOR A FREE
ESTIMATE

Easily controlled
from the inside
of your home...
Cannot be raised
from the outside

SHUTTER C O
off San Carlos Blvd. on Chltwood Drive, S.W.

i O 1 i 1 f l n IN NAPLES CALL GARRY'S
481-4180 GUSS262-3999

Cadence Music Co.

<>' '
„*-. „<-.

Sales • Repairs • Rentals
Band Camps & Clinics • Hand Rifles

Uniforms • Hags for Bands & Drum & Bugle Corps'
Instrument Accessories • Music • Arrangements

Lessons

BAND INSTRUMENT RENTAL PURCHASE
PLAN FOR SCHOOL INSTRUMENTS

The student may select his own instrument with the approval of his Music Instructor
Unlimited time rental plan
1. Rental may continue until the instrument is paid or the instrument may be purchas-
ed outright at any time.
2. 1 % per month will be charged on the rental program
3. Students may return rental instrument, with no further charges, at any time, provid-
ed rental fees are current
Monthly rental fees are as follows
1. The first two months rental is $25 00 plus tax and $15 00 plus tax each month
thereafter on the following instruments flute, clarinet, trumpet, trombone, oboe alto
saxophone, tenor saxophone, and drum kit
Maintenance Coverage
1. An optional maintenance coverage of $2 00 per month covers all maintenance due
to normal wear and tear, excluding finish and major overhauls for the duration of the
rental period. It does not cover deliberate, self-inflicted damage
Parents may exchange the original rented instrument for another instrument, if the in-
structor feels the student is not suited for the original instrument, within 90 dayr of
date of the rental contract, with rental monies still applying to the second instrument
Discounts
1. A 20% discount will be given on student, intermediate, and top line band in-
struments if purchased outright

2 A 10% discount will be deducted from the unpaid balance of the rental
instrument at such time the parents decide to pay the instrument in full y

G Free Maintenance Clinic on The Care
of Your Instrument

Port Myers, FiotKUu

k W - • >v. -
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PuisciWa

Realty. Inc.

An excellent in-
vestment opportunity
offering long term com-
mercial and residential
rental income and ap-
preciation potential.
This plaza is
strategically located in
the heart of Sanibel's
commercial center
along the major
throughfare to Captiva
Island. Nearby are the
C i t y ' s m e e t i n g
facil i t ies, the ptiblic
library, police and fire
stations and a variety of
private commercial en-
terprises. The building
is on just over .6 of an
acre with about 250' of
road frontage. It
features seven apart-
ments on the second
floor (total of 3,000 sq.

, ft.) All shops and apart-
ments are fully leased.
The owners are asking
$415,000 for this proper-
ty with liberal financing
available.

Stanley E. Johnson, Jr.. G.R.I

President & Owner

Sheila B. Snell, G.R.I.

Vice President

and associates

. . Main Office:
P.O. Box 57

Periwinkle Wcy,
Sanibel Island,

Florida 472-1511

Branch Office:
Causeway Road,

472-4121

Captiva Off ice:
Andy Rosse Lane

472-5154 472-1149

Island
Accommodations

Rental Office
472-4113

L 1

FOR RENT: Newly
furnished one bedro-
om apartment.

Palm Ridge Road.
Ideal for working
couple. $275/month.
Lease required.

472-1682, days.
472-1230, evenings.

APPRAISALS
RESIDENTIAL, COMMERCIAL

and INVESTMENT
ReaI estate appraisaI,

Prompt reasonable ser-
vice.

SANIBEL REALTY,
INC. Realtors
1633 Periwinkle

(Just E. of Bank of
The Islands) Sanibel

472-1549

WOULD LIKE

TO SWAP
TWO BEDROOM APART-
MENT IN BOOTH BAY HAR-
BOR, MAINE FOR EQUAL AC-
C O M M O D A T I O N S IN
SANIBEL, FLORIDA. MY
APARTMENT IS AVAILABLE
FROM MAY 1ST THRU OC-
TOBER 15TH. WILL ACCEPT
SWAP IN SANIBEL DECEM-
BER THRU MARCH. IF IN :

TERESTED LET'S TRADE PAR-
TICULARS. CALL 804-428-
6818 OR WRITE ERVIN, P.O.
BOX 716, VA. BEACH, VA.
23451.

Financing

Debts
Pressing?

We Can Help You!

Applications taken by
telephone. We represent
a direct lender for second
mortgage loans on
residential and com-
mercial property. $4000
up. Terms 10 years, and
up with liberal credit
policies. Call Now!
Frank T. Rayner,
Registered Mortgage
Broker, 2180 W. First
Street, Fort Myers, Fla.
334-8081.

GARAGE DOORS
by ROY NORTH

Wood-Fiberglass-Steel
Rough Sawn Woodgrain

SALES • INSTALLATION •

MOOREQ MATIC

GARAGE DOOR OPENERS
2016 BEACON MANOR DRIVE, SO. FORT MYERS

936-2500

EXECUTIVE GOLF COURSE
$400 Green Fee *500 Cart Fee

* 12°° Package (2 Players One Cart)

CALL FOR TEE TIME

995-5434

Lakes
COUNTRYCUW

MOMIE HOMt ESTATES
4066 Littleton Rd.

N. Ft. Myers
•A m I* South of

Shall Factory

NEW
MOBILE HOMEi

on
DISPLAY
995-0595

Resort Wear
Mexican Imports,
Gifts from
35 Countries,
Antiques, Toys,
Penny Candy,
Salmagundi,
Prints

HOURS 10-5

THE
RED

PELICAN
SANIBEL ISLAND,

FLORIDA

Next to Tarpon

Bay Marina

472-4449

SAVE ENERGY - SAVE MONEY
By CUTTING YOUR ELECTRIC BILL

ON YOUR HOME OR MOBILE HOME!
INSULATED TEXTURE COATING FOR ANY SURFAI

• CONVENTIONAL HOMES
• MOBILE HOMES

Ask about our Hoof

Coating Program ^^^WATERPROOFS

• 16 BEAUTIFUL COLORS!
• 20 YEAR GUARANTEE

(LABOR ft MATERIALS)

ACT NOW?
SAVt UP TO 25%

& CHUN STAMPS WITH

IRK ISTHKATI

BEWARE OF IMITATORS!
QQK.Ij/IjA • • • a complete Painting Service

OR E ^ A f e l A PAINTING*
629-3243 ^ V V l l V TEXTURE COATING INC.

CHARLOTTE 705 G. PONDELLA RD. N. FORT MYERS

Licensed, Bonded

We Serve All 5 Counties

SUBSCRIBE TO THE ISLANDS'

oldest newspaper

THE
SANIBEL-CAPTIVA

Islander
SINCE1961

MAMF

ADDRESS

CHECK ENCLOSED •' • • " ' '

LOCAL $7.00/YR. U.S.A. $10.00/YR. CANADA $12.00/YR.

MAIL TO:
SANIBEL-CAPTIVA ISLANDER, P.O. BOX 3, SANIBEL, FL 33957
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HASSIFIED ADVE
LEGAL
NOTICE

NOTICE OF
INTENTION TO REGISTER

FICTITIOUS NAME

The undersigned does hereby
certify that they are conducting
a modeling agency at Tennessee
Street, Hogue Building, Suite
No. 5, Bonita Springs, Florida,
under the fictitious name of
W E R N E R , THOMAS,
BIOLCHINI M O D E L I N G
AGENCY, and that said firm is
composed of the following
people whose names and places
o* -•sidences are as follows:

k^.-€N WERNER
Apartment 6, 222 Fairweather
Lane
Fort Myers Beach, Florida 33931
ART, PHOTO, GRAPHIC
PRODUCTIONS, INC.
P.O. Box 1044

: Tennessee Street,
Hogue Building, Suite No. 5
Bonita Springs, Florida 33923

Ownership of WERNER,
THOMAS, B IOLCHIN I
MODELING AGENCY Is as
follows: •

r I N WERNER SO percent.
* j PHOTO GRAPHIC

PRODUCTIONS, INC. 50per-
cent.

It is our Intention to apply to
the Clerk of the Circuit Court in
and for Lee County, Florida to
register the said name of
W E R N E R , THOMAS,
B IOLCHIN I M O D E L I N G
AGENCY under the provisions
of Section 865.09, Florida
Statutes,1943.

Witness my hand, this 31st day
of May, 1979.

Ellen E. Werner

Sworn and subscribed to by
ELLEN WERNER before me
this 31st day of May, 1979.

Charles MMilligan
NOTARY PUBLIC

< )ss my hand, this 4th day
of—..^ 1979.

R. Stephen Thomas

Sworn and subscribed to by R.
STEPHEN THOMAS before me
this 4th day of June, 1979.

Rose Marie Hohha
NOTARY PUBLIC

Witness my hand, this 4th day
of June, 1979.

Michael Biolchlni

Sworn and subscribed to by
MICHAEL BIOLCHINI before
me this 4th day of June, 1979.

Barbara Jean Price
NOTARY PUBLIC

1-23,30, 9-6,13,1979

NOflCEOF
INTENTION TO REGISTER

FICTITIOUS NAME-"

The undersigned does hereby
<xf"" that they are conducting
I itery Business at Route
b. 423 Fort Myers, Florida,
ider the fictitious name of
VTTO UPHOLSTERY and
at said firm is composed of the
Ifowing people whose names
d places of residence are as
lows:
OLD 41, INC. Route 3, Box
>C, Heidi Lee Lane, Fort
fers, Fl. 33908
Jwnership of HATTO
•HOLSTERY is as follows:
1LD41,INC. 100 percent
t is our intention to apply to
; Clerk of the Circuit Court in
i for Lee County, Florida to
lister the said name of
TTO UPHOLSTERY under
• provision of section 865.09,
irida Statutes,
Vitness my hand, this 1st day
Vug., 1979.

Milliard P.Hatto
OLD41, INC., PRESIDENT

worn and subscribed to by
»re me this 1st day of August,

Charles Milligan
NOTARY PUBLIC

,30,9-6,13,1979 '

REQUEST FOR BIDS

Notice is hereby given that
sealed bids will be received by
the Fort Myers Beach Fire
Control District, P.O. Box 5086,
33931 on or before October 1,1979
for the complete insurance
coverage for the District.

Specifications and in-
formation may be obtained from
the office of the Fort Myers
Beach Fire Control District at
3043 Estero Boulevard, Fort
Myers Beach, Florida 33931.

The District reserves the right
to waive informalities in any
bids, to reject any or all bids
with or without cause, and-or to
accept the bid that in Its
judgement will be for the best
interest of the Fort Myers Beach
Fire Control District.

bone by order of the Board of
Fire Commissioners of the Fort
Myers Beach Fire Control
District.

John H. Duke
Fire Chief

Aug. 30, sept.6, 13,1979.

CLASSIFIED
INFORMATION

aASSIFIED ADVERTISING
$1 for the first ten words, five
cents each extra word.
BOXED ADS in classified
section — $1 extra.

SERVICE DIRECTORY—
$1.75 an inch with each
weekly insertion.
FOUND ADS Those ads
reporting found aricles are
free.

OFFICE PHONES
Fort Myers Beach, 443-4421
San ibel, 472 5185
MAILING ADDRESS
P.O. Box 2867, Fort Myers
Beach, FL 33931.

Pets
FREE puppies, 6 weeks old. 117
Hibiscus Drive, FMB. 463-4077.

8-30

WELSH CORGI PUPS. To
select homes only. KARAHAN.
694-6756. Ft. Myers.

8-28

Need desperately - home for
abandoned cat. Loveable,
housebroken, neutered, male
tabby. Call after 6 p.m. 472-
5587.

8-21

Lost & Found

1980 Eastern Hills High School
Class ring - white gold with
blue stone. Will offer $25
REWARD, if found call 463-
4261.

8-30

CAMERA (with name Frank
Campbell) near White House
Tower on Sanibel. Call 1-401-
233-7835.

8-21

Miscellaneous

CAPTAINS COURSE, USCG
Prep course. Sept. 11-20. 98
percent passing record. Call
Capt. Henry F 332-3736 or MTS
1-800-535-8803.

8-16,23,30,9-6

WANTED
TO RENT

2 bedroom condo or
small home. Dec. to
April. Near Beach on
Sanibel or Captiva.
Would consider
Houseboat or large
sail boat. Write
George Breen, Box
913, Manchester
Center, Vermont
.05255. -,

8/2,9,16,23,30,
9/6,13,26

BUY, SELL, TRADE. Stoves,
refrigerator, furniture, most
anything. Frank and Bob's
Swap Shop. 2170 San Carlos
Blvd. Open Tues. Sat. 8 a.m. to

• TFN

Air brushed T-Shlrts.
Anything you want. Your
car, any picture or Idea hand
painted by Atom. Hours 10-1,
3-6. Tuesday through
Saturday. At SUNRISE
SHIRT SHOP, 1801 Estero
Blvd. FMB.

Merchandise

For Sale

Tank type Eureka sweeper,
like new with attachments.
463-6712.

8-30

Breakfast table and 4 orange
chairs. $40.463-5224.

8-30

"GARAGE SALE"

Sat., Sun., Mon. 9 to 5, bicycles,
golf clubs, clothing, toys,
dishes and miscellaneous.
Great buys. 3 Glen view Manor.
FMB.

8-30

5 Diamond ramshead ring
unclaimed - selling for cost.
Don't call unless interested in
purchase. 463-0367.

8-30

Like new. Hoover Convertible
Sweeper with attachments,
antique Queen Anne lady's
desk, turn of century sawed
oak stand, cut velvet wing back
chair, barrel back overstuffed
chair, two mahogany twin beds
complete with mattress and
springs, complete Italian
Provencial (Stanley) bedroom
suite - off white, trimmed with
gold. Baby's car seat, lamps,
pictures, miscellaneous. 463-
5261.

8-30

1 coin operated Speed Queen
washer. 4 coin operated Speed
Queen dryers. SANDPIPER
GULF RESORT, 5550 Estero
Blvd. FMB 463-5721.

TFN

Wanted

17' Boat trailer. Call 463-4896
day or evening.

9-13.

Young man would like to share
condo OR rent private room
with private bath and private
entrance overlooking Gulf of
Mexico. 472-3223.

9-4

Marine

'68 Starcraft Bowrlder with 65
H.P. Evinrude. Good condition.
A buy at $750. Call 463-4708 or
463-6824.

TFN

12' Ted Williams Game Fisher
with 7-1-2 H.P. $550 Firm. 463-
2345.

TFN

25' cruiser 1977 'Fly bridge,
USCG approved $8000firm. 463-
6457.

TFN

Will sell or trade for van of
equal value a mullet skiff with
70 HP Johnson motor, CB
radio, depthfinder and 20
gallon built in gas tank. 463-
4106.

9-6

Cars For Sale

1975 Grand Prix Wagon, full
power, air conditioning, new
tires, Shelby rims. Excellent
condition,$2750. Call 482-2736.

TFN

'75 Chevy Impala, A/C
good condition $1800. Call
463-5825.

•: TFN.:.

463-4421 472-5185
FORT MYERS BEACH SANIBEL

1972 Olds Station Wagon. Full
power, air, radio; heat. $1200.
Phone 327-9650.

8-23,30, 9-6

Cash for your car, mobile home
or travel trailer. BEACH
MOBILE HOMES, 789 San
Carlos, Fort Myers Beach. 463-
9357.

TFN

1977 Chevrolet Impala, 4 door
sedan, ps, pb, ac, excellent
condition. $3375.481-4395.

8-30

1975 Dodge Dart "Swinger"
Coupe. Excellent condition,
excellent gas mileage, 225
C.l.D. 6 cyl. engine, power
steering, cruise control, auto
transmission, AC, many other
extras. Must be seen. $2300.
481-4395.

8-30

Help Wanted

TROPICAL HUT REALTY,
INC, is now Interviewing Sales
Associates. Let us teach you
how to make real estate fun
and profitable. If you are
licensed or soon will be and are
interested In getting active,
contact Jack Moore,
REALTOR, Tropical Hut
Realty, Inc., 1600 Estero
Boulevard 463-4424.

TFN

Mechanically inclined person
to learn boat rigging. FISH
TALE MARINA. 463-4448.

8-30

Person to work in tackle shop,
retail sales. FISH TALE
MARINA. 463-4448.

8-30

TITLE INSURANCE CLERKS
CLOSER

Title Insurance Company is
interviewing for title clerks
and closers for FMB office.
Must be good typist and
available soon. Previous title
insurance experience most
helpful. This company has
normal benefits and your
salary will be commensurate
with experience.sHours 8:30
a.m. to 5 p.m. Monday through
Friday. Call Mr. Grice 463-3128
for appointment.

9-6

Housekeepers for FMB condo,
10 a.m. to 3 p.m. daily. Start
$3.25 hour plus tips, full and
part-time needed. Call after 7
p.m. 549-4271.

8-30

General office and medical
with experience preferred.
Family practice office on
Beach. 463-5741.

8-23,30

Yard maintenance, inquire in
person, OUTRIGGER BEACH
RESORT, 6200 Estero Blvd.
FMB.

TFN

Maintenance manager for
FMB condo. 4-5' hours a day.
Reply: Box 5090 FMB, 33931.

8,9,16,23,30

Secretary for weekly
newspaper on Sanibel - good
typing required. 472-5185.

: TFN

DRIVER WANTED Clean
appearance,chauffer's license,
good pay. Would like ex-
perienced person, but not
necessary. ESTERO ISLAND
CAB CO. INC.463-9466.

TFN

Needed part-time mature
woman to assist housekeeper
and help with cleaning and
laundry. Call 463-6292.

9-6

$$$
EXPANDING

We need aggressive Sales
Associates for Our expanding
sales operation. We will
train. Incentive Commission
structure, and superb
working envrionment with
well established constantly
growing firm. Contact Bert
Jenks 472-1.549.

SANIBEL REALTY, INC.
1633 Periwinkle

Sanibel, Fla. 472-1549

Real Estate

Am now hiring maids and
laundry workers. LAN I KAI
ISLAND RESORT, 1400 Estero
Blvd. FMB.

TFN

Systems manager. Salary
range $10,000 to $12,000.
Accounting background, some
computer experience, ability to
interact with people, able to
supervise limited number of
personnel. High school
graduate, supplemented with
college courses. Contact Ms.
Ashville or Mr. Nungester in
person or by phoning 472-5177,
Captran 1517 Periwinkle Way,
Sanibel Island, Fl. 33957. An
equal opportunity employer.

8-30

Services

CARPENTER, experience;.
Looking for small or big lobs.
482-3745.

TFN

SERVICES OFFERED:
Dressmaking, alteration*,
custom flttina. Destrier of
Custom Fashion Your M M
or mine. Reasonable Price*.
Call463-4»2t.

tfn

Starter, generator, alter-
nator services, Batteries •
Cars - Trucks • Boats and
Heavy Equipment.
Specializing in marine and
heavy equipment electrical
parts.
AUTO MARINE ELECTRIC

4531 Del Prado
Cape Coral $42-5540

TFN

Auto • truck • motor home
Air Conditioning Service
Installations • Quality Work •
Low Prices

AUTO MARINE ELECTRIC
4533 Del Prado

Cape Coral-542-5540
TFN

Mobile Homes

For Sale

12 x 60' Mobile Home, 12 x
20 built up enclosed patio.
2 bedrooms, A/C, 1 foil
size double basin bath
plus V? bath. On canal
minutes from Public
Beach. 28 Doubloon Way,
San Carlos Cove, FMB,
463-5081.

8/23,30

For Rent

SANIBEL BEACH, executive
2-bedroom, 2-bath deluxe
furnished condo on gulf
waterfront. Tennis, pool,
clubhouse. Sleeps 2-6. $200
weekly now; $385 weekly Dec. -
May, '80. Telephone collect 1-
519-534-2141 or 1-519-472-0979
(Sanibel Chamber Member).

Aug. 28, Sept. 4,11,18,25

Beach efficiency cottages from
$170 a month. Mature adults, no
pets. Includes utilities. Also
weekly rates. 463-6554.

TFN

Furnished 1 bedroom apart-
ment and 1 efficiency. Close to
shopping, banks, restaurants,
bus and Beach access. Yearly,
adults, no pets. 463-0587.

9-6

1 - 2 bedroom apartments
furnished and unfurnished.
Case Rigby 463-5768.

TFN

FMB 1-bedroom, 2-bath
townhouse on water, boat dock,
adults, no pets, yearly. 463-
9617.

TFN

Till Dec. 15, one bedroom
furnished apartment. TV,
linens, etc. Beach access. $250
month plus electric. WHITE
CAP APTS. 463-2464.

TFN
Furnished Private room and
Bath with house prlviledges.
Call 992-4158
TFN
2 Bedroom furnished apart-
ment on BEACH side. 6061 Gulf
Road. 463-5815.

TFN

NEXT SEASON RENTAL. 2
bedroom, 2 bath duplex
apartment. Bayview. 6 mo.

rental. $3,000 and electric. 463-
6791.
TFN

BEACH I New deluxe 2
bedroom, waterfront condo,
over 1,500 sq. ft., unfurnished,
annual lease. Boat 8. fishing
dock, pool, clubhouse, saunas.
463-2084.

TFN

Available for annual rent, <
bdrm. apartment. Blue Chip
Realty, Realtor, Inc. 463-5771.
TFN

One bedroom, living, kit-
chenette, bath, deck, beachside
duplex. Call 463-0151 after 5.

8-3C

Furnished downstairs ef-
ficiency apartment. Gulf view.
Walk to Winn Dixie. Sleeps two.
Utilities furnished. Adults, no
pets. $200 month until Dec.
15th. $50. deposit. 463-4070.

830

For Sale

Choice Sanibel apartment,
newly furnished, 2 bedroom, i
bath, enclosed family room.
Second floor corner apartment.
Good investment property.
Principals only. No realtors.
Firm price, $59,750. No
children or pets allowed. Call
334-4695 or area 312-367-9433 for
information.

TFN

Building lot In subdivision 90 x
100, utilities In, ready to build
on. Only $8750. BLUE CHIP
REALTY, INC. 463-5771

TFN

3 Bedroom piling house, 100 ft. of
Gulf Beach. Captiva Island,
Only $90,000. Blue Chip Realty,
Realtors, inc., 340 San Carlos
Blvd. F.M. B. 463-5771.
T F N

Business Building for Sale on
San Carlos Blvd. Blue Chip
Realty, 340 San Carlos Blvd.,
F.M.B. 463-5771.
T F N

SANIBEL ISLAND
3 bedroom, 2 bath, or i -0X220 ft.
Bayfront lot, very ;••' - loaded
with extras. Blue Cr.;p Realty,
Realtors. 340 San •;:ario»3!vi5.
F.M.B.
T F N

Two story, 2880 sq. ft. of en-
closed area, including two car
gar. on 80x100 Ft. lot with fruit
and oak trees. Plenty of
privacy in a nice neighborhood.
Only $75,000. Buyer can
assume mortgage. Call 463-
6382.

TFN
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The Finest
Interval Ownership Resort

on Sanibel Island
Welcomes

Your Inspection

CAPTIVA

FURNISHED MODELS

OPEN 9 AM-6 PM EVERY DAY

Causeway Road

Ybel Beach &
Racquet Club

GASAYBEL ROAD AT WESTGULF DRIVE
(813)472-1531

P.O. BOX353, SANIBEL ISLAND, FLORIDA 33957


